PD-021-049
Bid Opening 10/29/21 at 10:00 a.m.

SPECIFICATIONS AND PROPOSAL FORM FOR EMS

CONSUMABLES FOR THE GLOUCESTER COUNTY EMS

DEPARTMENT AND EXISTING UNITS WITHIN THE
COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER AS ALLOWED THROUGH THE
COUNTY CONTRACT SYSTEM NUMBERS CK-01-GC & 16GLCP

201-997-2400

V.E. Ralph & Son, Inc.
320 Schuyler Avenue, P.O. Box 63:
Kearny, NJ 07032-0633

Vernon J. Ralph, President

Bound Tree Medical, LLC
5000 Turtle Crpssomg Blvd
Dublin, OH 43016

Brian LaDuke, President
800-533-0523

Common Cents EMS Supply, LLC
304 Boston Post Road
Old Saybrook, CT 06475

John T. Dunn, President
860-388-4599

M Q . . M M M
a u Substitution s s s
ITEM DESCRIPTION 3 MFG. Part # ﬁ Pe:/:/?tlated i Vendor # A i Vendor # A f Vendor # A
f t Approved "Or] ¢ t t
a i Equal”? : ; :
C t f ? ?
1 Adult BVM w/peep Ambu/Spur 520 211 001 12/box NO 12-520211001 [ $172.20 065-520211001EA | $160.56 520211001 $166.32
2 Peep Valve Ambu/Spur 1199002020 20/cs NO 12-199002 $66.60 D4177 $77.60 199002020 $57.50
3 Baterial/Viral Fitler Ventlab |FH603003 50/cs NO NO BID NO BID 87-FH6030003EA $35.00 1605 $42.25
4 Pediatric BVM Ambu/Spur 530 213 000 12/box NO 530213000 $175.00 2442-53213 $153.36 530213000 $169.07
5 | Infant BVM Ambu/Spur 540 212 000 12/box NO 540212000 $175.00 065-540212000eA__ | $153.36 540212000 $169.07
6 Oxygen Cylinder Wrench Western Medic ]MCW-2BC l/ea yes MCW-2BC $3.65 96-MCW-2BC $3.16 MCW-2BC $3.08
7 Oxygen Cylinder Wrench Western Medic‘IMCW-sP llea yes MCW-3P $1.05 A4071 $0.91 12486C-0-10 $1.59
8 Medical Dust Cap |Ratermann |MP-PoPK100 100/pk NO NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 180-4100-1000 $10.98
9 Adult Partial Non-rebreather Mask IHudson RCI 1059]50/cs NO 12-001059 $56.00 020603 $60.00 1059 $47.99
10 | AduitNasal canula JHudson R 1103|50/cs NO 1103 $18.20 36-1103EA $17.50 1103 $19.10
11 Pediatric Partial Non-rebreather Mask IHudson RCI 1058]50/cs NO 12-001058 $60.00 D6141 $54.50 1058 $53.35
12 | Pediatric Nasal Canula IHudson RCI 1838|50/cs NO 1838 $67.30 NO BID NO BID 1838 $57.65
13 | 02 Supply Tubing JHudson Re 1115[50/cs NO 12-001115 $27.50 87-1115 $29.88 1115 $33.20
14 Oxygen Prefilled Humidifier IHudson RCI  003-40 20/cs yes 003-40 $41.40 410340 $28.40 003-40 $24.96
15 | Adult Trach Collar IHudson RCI 1075|1/ea NO 1075 $1.49 D6150 $0.96 1075 $39.99
16 Pediatric Trach Collar IHudson RCI 1076|1/ea NO 1076 $1.87 411076 $1.21 1076 $48.54
17 | Swivel Christmas Tree [Medez AGI-SH75 lea yes 12-002555 $0.39 11187 $0.28 200-0130 $0.48
Nasal Airways: (Robertazzi style)
18 12 fr JRusch 12331210/bx NO 123312 $25.95 D4266 $18.80 123312 $22.43
19 14 fr JRusch 123314f10/bx NO 123314 $25.95 D4267 $18.80 123314 $22.43
20 16 fr JRusch 123316{10/bx NO 123316 $25.95 D4268 $18.80 123316 $22.43




271 18 fr IRusch 123316]10/bx NO 123318 $25.95 D4270 $18.80 123318 $22.43
22 20 fr IRUSCh 123120}10/bx NO 12-123020 $25.95 023120 $18.80 123320 $22.43
23 22 fr IRUSCh 123222]10/bx NO 12-123022 $25.95 023122 $18.80 123322 $22.43
24 24 fr IRUSCh 123124]10/bx NO 12-123024 $25.95 023124 $18.80 123324 $22.43
25 26 fr IRUSCh 123126]10/bx NO 12-123026 $25.95 023126 $18.80 123326 $22.43
26 28 fr IRUSCh 123128]10/bx NO 12-123028 $25.95 023128 $18.80 123328 $22.43
27 30 fr IRUSCh 123230}10/bx NO 12-123030 $25.95 023130 $18.80 123330 $22.43
28 32 fr IRUSCh 123132]10/bx NO 12-123032 $25.95 023132 $18.80 123332 $22.43
29 34 fr IRUSCh 123234]10/bx NO 12-123034 $25.95 023134 $18.80 123334-CS $22.43
30 36 fr |RUSCh 123236]10/bx NO 12-123036 $25.95 023136 $25.00 123336 $22.43
31 Sterile Lubricating Jelly (for above) IDynarex 1250)12/bx NO 10-1250 $6.65 1340-67507 $2.16 1250 $5.74
Oral Airways: (Color Coded, Berman style)
32 #00 (40 mm) IRusch 121801]50/bx yes 121801 $9.98 2010-34040 $7.50 121801 $8.63
33 #0 (50 mm) JRusch 121850[50/bx yes 121850 $9.98 2010-34050 $7.50 121850 $8.63
34 #1 (60 mm) |Rusch 121802}50/bx yes 121802 $9.98 2010-34060 $7.50 121802 $8.63
35 #2 (70 mm) JRusch 121870[50/bx yes 121870 $9.98 2010-34070 $7.50 121870 $8.08
36 #3 (80 mm) JRusch 12180350/bx yes 121803 $9.98 2010-34080 $7.50 121803 $8.63
37 #4 (90 mm) IRusch 122804{50/bx yes 122804 $9.98 2010-34090 $7.50 121804 $8.63
38 #5 (100 mm) |Rusch 121805}50/bx yes 121805 $9.98 2010-34100 $7.50 121805 $8.63
39 #6 (110 mm) JRusch 12180650/bx yes 121806 $9.98 2010-34110 $7.50 121806 $8.63
Suction Canisters:
40 | ©n-Board (Sccor) |Bemis 484410)48/cs NO 12-484910 $195.84 2212-20048 $145.92 484410 $161.18
41 Portable Tubing & Catheter Sscor 2480-36 10/cs NO 2480-36 $38.00 2480-36 $32.20 NO BID NO BID
42 Replacement Canister for Quickdraw Sscor 2480-20 20/cs NO 2480-20 $399.00 2211-82017 $655.40 NO BID NO BID
Soft Suction Catheters:
43 6 fr |oynarex 480650/cs yes 12-250737 $14.00 533-MS-SCO6EA $10.50 4806 $12.56
44 8 fr |Dynare>< 4808]50/cs yes 12-250738 $14.00 533-MS-SCOBEA $10.50 4808 $12.56
45 10 fr [pynarex 4810]50/cs yes 12-250746 $14.00 533-MS-SC10EA $10.50 4810 $12.56
46 12fr [oynarex 4812|50/cs yes 12-250753 $14.00 s33-Mssc12eA | $10.50 4812 $12.56
47 14 fr IDynafex 4814]50/cs yes 12-250357 $14.00 533-MS-SC14EA $10.50 4814 $12.56
48 16 fr [oynarex 481650/cs yes 12-250358 $14.00 533-MS-SC16EA $10.50 4816 $12.56
49 18 fr [oynarex 4818|50/cs yes 12-250385 $14.00 s33-Msscigea | $10.50 4818 $12.56
50 Suction Tubing IMed”ne JPYND50216 50/cs yes 12-250776 $49.50 325021 $28.50 4682 $22.43
51 | vemtery e Juecine  Jovwososar 20fcs NO 12-YKZO $27.80 D4804 $44.00 MS-YK20 $36.11
52 Sscor Quickdraw replacement Battery Sscor 80613-100 l/ea NO 80613-100 $39.95 80613100 $36.75 NO BID NO BID
53 Sscor VX2 replacement Batteries Sscor 80635]1/ea NO 80635 $65.29 5980635 $59.74 NO BID NO BID




54 2 X 2's Individually wrapped IDynarex 3322]30/bx NO 3322 $46.50 NO BID NO BID 3322 $49.20
55 3 X 3's Individually wrapped IDynarex 3333]48/bx NO 3333 $74.65 NO BID NO BID 3333 $90.74
56 4 X 4's Individually wrapped IDynarex 3342)24/bx NO 3342 $38.60 NO BID NO BID 3342 $52.99
57 | 5x9s Individually wrapped [pynarex 3501 [20/bx NO 10-1000509 $57.40 NO BID NO BID 3501 $51.43
58 | 8X10's Individually wrapped [pynarex 3503[15/bx NO 10-1000810 $78.75 NO BID NO BID 3503 $70.55
59 | Triangular Individually wrapped [pynarex 3680[12/bx NO 10-000082 $5.60 1124-36800 $5.62 3680 $5.38
60 | 2'Kiing Individually wrapped [oynarex 3112f/es NO 10-1002041 $22.64 NO BID NO BID 3112 $27.69
61 | 3'Kiing Individually wrapped [oynarex 3113[1/cs NO 10-1003041 $26.56 NO BID NO BID 3113 $32.10
62 | 1" Tape [oynarex 3572|12/bx yes 10-3572 $96.00 1110-08402 $6.95 3572-CS $85.86
63 | 2" Tape [pynarex 357312/ yes 10-3573 $96.00 1110-08403 | $13.90 3573-CS $85.86
64 | 3 Tape [oynarex 3574]12/bx yes 10-3574 $96.00 1110-08404 | $20.85 3574-CS $85.86
65 | EyePads [pynarex 3360[12/bx yes 10-3360 $56.28 80841 $1.35 3360 $59.80
66 | "sam"spiint Sam Splint 1121]1/cs of 60 NO 17-001050 $459.00 661121 $7.25 3533 $195.50
67 | Adhesive Bandage 3/4 X 3 |Pynarex 3611]24/bx yes 10-3611 $47.04 279-3611BX $0.39 3611 $40.25
68 | pynastopper [pynarex 353560/cs NO 10-3535 $91.20 9854 $75.00 3535 $78.09
69 Trauma Dressing 12 X 30 IDynarex 3532]50/cs NO 10-001101 $67.50 NO BID 3532 $58.08
70 | Burn Sheets 60 X 96 |R0€hampt0n 95-312 1l/ea yes 10-000701 $2.99 30061MS $2.12 3520 $2.59
71 | Petroleum Gauze Jkendal 41360512/bx yes 10-013110 $10.87 150066K1 $10.20 3039 $0.45
72 | Asherman Chest Seals JRusch 849100§10/bx NO 10-849100 $101.30 718491 $81.50 849100 $87.40
73 | combat Gauze Quickclot  [30-0109 1/ea NO 10-350 $37.95 G1284 $36.79 350-CS $34.52
Sterile Water:
74 250 cc [Baxter 2F7112 24/cs yes 10-006260 $35.28 607112 $69.60 6139-22 $77.83
75 1000 cc [paxter 2F7114 12/cs yes 10-006291 $23.78 607114 $39.84 7139-09 $46.92
Saline:
76 250 cc [Baxter 2F7122 24/cs yes 10-006270 $36.48 358002 $71.52 6138-22 $85.01
77 1000 cc Baxter PF7124 12/cs yes 10-006281 $24.90 7800-09 $38.64 7138-09 $56.17
Gloves
78 Small |Ha|yard Health 55081}10/cs NO NO BID NO BID 295201 $264.50 55081-CS $241.00
79 Medium |Ha|yard Health 55082]10/cs NO NO BID NO BID 295202 $264.50 55082-CS $241.00
80 Large |Ha|yard Health 55083)10/cs NO NO BID NO BID 295203 $264.50 55083-CS $241.00
81 X-Large [Hatyard Health 55084]10/cs NO NO BID NO BID 295204 $264.50 55084-CS $241.00
82 Infection Control Kits Common CentsNo Part Number lea yes 10-006300 $7.65 670199-KT $6.52 PIK $3.49
83 | Cover Gowns |Pynarex 2141]1/cs NO NO BID NO BID R5029 $29.95 2141-CS $32.20
84 | Shoe Covers [oynarex 2132)1/cs NO NO BID NO BID 290540 $0.25 2132-CS $31.05
HEPA Masks: (N95)
85 small aM 1860S 20/bx NO | 18605 | $22.79 | | 2918605 | $27.99 | | 1se0s | $21.07 |




86 Regular &Y 1860f20/bx NO 1860 $22.79 291860 $27.99 1860R $21.07
87 Small |'V|0|de>< 1510 N95 20/bx NO 1510 $28.95 1031-87010 $27.99 NO BID NO BID
88 Medium [moldex 1512 N95 20/bx NO 1512 $28.95 1512 $24.25 NO BID NO BID
89 Large [Moldex 1513 N95 20/bx NO 1513 $28.95 1513 $24.25 NO BID NO BID
90 Ear Loop Mask w/ Extended Face Shield |Ha|yard Health 47137§25/pkg yes 10-047080 $27.89 108-4713TBX $32.29 47147 $22.40
91 Safety Glasses Crews/Excalibu 99910f1/ea yes 10-25676 $3.20 660274 $2.25 2198 $0.99
92 | Vionex Liquid Soap 180z [Metrexivionex Jro-1518 l/ea NO 10-025017 $10.85 205017 $13.99 10-1518 $10.50
93 Vionex No Rinse Gel [Metrexivionex |r0-1624 l/ea NO NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 10-1624 $4.20
95 Equipment Disinfection Wipes Pynarex/Sani-CJP-Q08472 1/cs NO NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
96 | sani-Hands wipes |Poi Heatthcare|P-13472 1/cs NO 10-035372 $71.40 Q20372 $78.60 P13472 $56.53
97 | Disinfectant Spray Metrex/Cavicide]13-5024 l/cs NO 13-5024 $125.40 1061-13524 $143.04 13-5024 $10.20
98 Spray Cleaner Spartan Chemi} 6520 1/cs NO SD-20 $78.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
99 | !ce Packs5 X 9 (loose) Dynarex 4512|1/cs yes 10-4512 $13.60 220227 $13.90 4512 $12.86
100 | Hot Packs 5 X 9 (loose) [pynarex as16f1/cs yes 10-4516 $15.35 1432-67000 | $22.00 4516 $13.75
101 | Adult B/P Cuff Mabis Healthca09-149-011 llea yes 18-7107 $7.35 36012 $6.40 7107-CS $7.10
102 Lg. Adult B/P Cuff Mabis Healthca09-149-016 l/ea yes 18-7108 $13.20 36013 $6.40 7108-CS $13.10
103 | chid B/P Cutf Mabis Healthcaf09-149-015 1/ea yes 18-7106 $10.65 36011 $6.40 7106-CS $11.20
104 | !Infant B/P Cuff Mabis HealthcaJ09-149-013 llea yes 18-7105 $9.35 36010 $6.40 7105-CS $11.20
105 Stethoscope (Sprague Rappaport) Mabis Healthca}10-419-3601 l/ea yes 18-007135 $4.80 36020 $3.92 7135 $4.76
106 | AED Electrodes (LP 12/15 Compatible) [Kendall/Meditra 31319281)1/cs NO 12-001310 $288.40 541310 $317.90 31319281 $203.03
107 | Bulb Syringe |Medline |PYND70280 1l/ea yes 10-002194 $0.96 044-AS00502EA [ $0.31 5910 $0.90
108 | Bite sticks Grafco 3789]10/bx yes 12-000420 $3.60 020010 $3.60 4010T $2.93
109 | safety Razors [oynarex 4251]50/bx yes 4251 $20.50 084846 $7.50 4251 $17.25
110 | Ring Cutter [Moore Medical 11702|1/ea yes 18-004100 $10.55 400010 $6.98 814 $3.74
111 | PentLights [primacare  |pL-9223 | yes 18-000211 $4.20 32762 $3.89 PENLIGHT6 $7.65
112 | EMS Sheers (Medicut 7 1/4") American Diagr [320NP ea yes 18-00139PK $2.20 1071-36713 $0.68 83-184BK $0.75
113 | Convenience Bags GKR Industries|1000/7000 1/cs NO 10-007804 $319.00 279-1407 $14.23 4708 $126.50
114 | Bee Sting/Medicaine Swabs IMoore Medical 15991 ]1/bx yes 10-014401 $3.99 1423-03015 $3.65 1407-CS $2.82
115 | oral Glucose Paddock Labori0574-0070-30 3/pk NO 10-006930 $17.15 7820 $11.75 574006930 $12.95
116 | Compartment Seals HealthCare Log 7810|1/bag of 10¢ yes 7810 $17.25 2750-15003 | $19.95 6323REDNUM |  $17.05
117 | "AA" Batteries Duracell/Procel [PC1500 Joox of 24 yes PC1500BKD $7.39 113-PC2400 | $10.80 PC1500BKD $7.88
118 | "Aaa"Batteries Puracel/Procel [Pc2400 Joox of 24 yes PC2400BKD $7.39 2750-16043 | $20.40 PC2400BKD $7.00
179 | © VoltBateeries PriacerProcellecisos Jpox ot 12 ves PC1604BKD | $12.48 8600-014631 | $12.54 PC1604BKD | $12.65
120 | ©OBKit (NJ OEMS Approved) VE Ralph 10-007805 l/ea NO 10-007805 $15.65 44200101 $3.48 NJOB $9.79
121 | Baby Bunting JPrimaCare CB-6835 1/ea yes 18-608123 $2.35 NO BID NO BID CS-6835 $2.72
122 Emergency Blankets IPrimaCare CB-6821 1/carton NO 18-CB6821 $122.00 NO BID NO BID 3 $81.65




123 | Red Bags small (24 X 24) IMedIine INON122424 1/cs yes 47-50 $65.29 F558612 $109.90 $89.10
124 | Red Bags large (30 X 44) [Medine [NoN153044 1/cs yes NON153044 $37.00 13072 $41.47 NO BID NO BID
125 | Mega Mover Graham Medic: 51926]each NO 16-51926 $20.65 111500 $23.21 51926 $21.09
Medications:
126 | Narcan 4mg Twin Pack Adapt Pharma INDC 69547-353-02 [Twin Pack NO 10-NARCAN4AMG $95.00 0353-02 $93.01 $84.95
Adult Low Strength Chewable Apsirin 81 .
127 | mg ercare[noc 5789691136 [ yes 10-700317 $0.85 911316 $0.76 $0.84
128 Alberterol 3.0 ml vial (Individually pkged) Ipkg/25 yes 1161818 $6.48 9501-25 $3.12 $5.96
Handheld nebuli / updraft T and 7ft. Of
129 fuping e P T and T O Jrudson S No 1884 $1.45 D4155 $0.90 $0.84
130 Adult elongated mask for above nebulizerlHudon 1083|1/ea NO 1083 $0.48 A03751-1 $0.43 $0.43
131 | Pediatric Mask for above IHudson 1085]1/ea NO 1085 $1.05 411085 $0.71 $0.68
132 | P2 Sharp Shuttle [pynarex 1/ea NO 10-000970 $1.65 NO BID NO BID $1.59
Cervical Collars:
133 Stifneck Select Adult Jaerdal 980010}1/cs NO 17-980010 $264.50 1980010 $257.50 980010 $307.63
134 Stifneck Select Pediatric |Laerda| 980020{1/cs NO 17-980020 $105.80 1980021 $103.00 980020 $123.05
135 Stifneck Pediatric ||-aefda| 980200}1/cs NO 17-000177 $264.50 260202 $262.50 980200 $244.38
136 Stifneck Baby No Neck |Laerda| 980100]1/cs NO 17-000187 $264.50 260201 $262.50 980100 $488.75
137 | Phillips AED Pad cartridge [Pritips [mso71A 1/ea NO 24-M5071A $48.30 ATM5071A $45.99 M5071A $61.64
138 | Phillips AED Pad Cartridge - Pedi [Pritips [ms072a lea NO 24-M5072A $77.85 ATM5072A $74.99 M5072A $99.36
139 | Phillips AED Battery |Phi"iPS Jms070A 1/ea NO 24-M5070A $121.85 ATM5070A $115.99 M5070A $139.94
. . Morrison
140 | Padded Board Spiint (small) 15 inch |Medica| 1815|1/ea yes 17-001815 $2.55 56-1815 $2.91 IS-5116 $2.80
. . . Morrison
141 Padded Board Splint (medium) 36 inch |Medica| 1836]1/ea yes 17-001836 $4.35 56-1836 $4.78 1S-5136 $3.40
. . Morrison
14 | Padded Board Splint (large) 54 inch IMedicaI 1854]1/ea yes 17-001854 $6.05 56-1854 $6.85 1S-5154 $5.98
Tactical
Soft-W Tactical Tourniquest Medical SOFTT-W 1/ea NO
143 Solution 10-400005 $26.15 1880-19231 $25.75 SOFTT-W $23.51
Posey Non- Locking Twice as tough .
144 | curFs wrist Posey 2750fPair NO 2750 $26.05 562750 $22.95 P2750 $29.00
Posey Non- Locking Twice as tough .
145 | cUFFs Ankie Posey zrsspair NO 2755 $26.35 562755 $23.14 2755 $29.00
C-PAP:
146 |02 RESQ Inline Filter 02 RESQ 313-7043 10/cs NO NO BID NO BID 313-7043EA $21.80 NO BID NO BID
02-MAX CPAP System w 3-SET O2-CPAP|
147 |valve, Adult Medium PULMODYNE |313-7556XNEA 10/CS NO NO BID NO BID 313-7556XNEA | $400.00 NO BID NO BID
148 |BiTrac ED Mask and Head Strap Adult Larg[PULMODYNE |313-7030EA 10/CS NO NO BID NO BID 313-7030EA | $219.80 NO BID NO BID




DELIVERY 2-7 DAYS ARO 2-3 (instock items) days
Variations NONE NONE

Will you extend your prices to local government entities within the County YES NO
This is a one (1) year contract from Date of Award with the County having the option to extend for one (1) two (2) year term or two (2) one (1) year terms.

Bid specifications sent to: Public Safety Unlimited, Camden Bag and Paper, Unipak, Deltek, ASE, Inc., Safeguard Medical, Prime Vendor, PPE Platoon,
Based upon the bids received, the following vendors are awarded for the following items be awarded the contract as the lowest responsive, responsible bidder.

V.E. Ralph & Sons: For items 13, 42, 51, 54, 55, 56, 60, 61, 74, 75, 76, 77, 119, 121, 123, 125 and 140.

Boundtree: Foritems1, 3, 4,5, 7,10, 17,18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28, 29, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39, 40,
41,43, 44, 45, 46, 47, 48, 49, 52, 53, 62, 63, 64, 65, 67, 68, 70, 72, 83, 84, 101, 102, 103, 104, 105, 107, 111, 112, 113, 115,
127,128, 130, 133, 134, 136, 137, 138, 139, 144, 145, 146, 147 and 148

CommonSense: Foritems 2,6, 8, 9, 11, 12, 14, 15, 16, 30, 50, 57, 58, 59, 66, 69, 71, 73, 78, 79, 80, 81, 82, 85, 86, 90, 91,
92, 93, 96, 97, 99, 100, 106, 108, 109, 110, 114, 116, 118, 120, 122, 126, 129, 130, 131, 132, 135, 141, 142 and 143.

Sincerely, Kimberly Larter, QPA

7 DAYS ARO
NONE
YES
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