PD 22-031

10/26/2024

Bid Opening 08/25/22 10:00am

SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE SUPPLYING AND DELIVERY OF
FLAGS TO BE UTILIZED BY THE GLOUCESTER COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF BUILDINGS AND GROUNDS AND
VETERAN'S AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT AND THE
PARTICIPATING CONTRACTING UNITS UNDER THE
COUNTY'S COOPERATIVE PURCHASING PROGRAM
NUMBERS CK-01-GC & 16-GLCP

\Vendor: \Vendor: Vendor: \Vendor: \Vendor:
East Coast Flag & Banner Co., South Jersey Business Solutions,
Conserv Flag Inc. LLC Office Penny, LLC A&A Sales

1003 lllinois Street

P.O. Box 113

681 Jackson Road

371 Hoes Lane, Ste 200

1715 Kumry Road

Sidney, NE 69162

\Wildwood, NJ 08260

Mullica Hill, NJ 08062

Piscataway, NJ 08854

Quakertown, PA 18951

Kenny Gudabhl, Director Mkting

John Ranieri, President

Jessica Harrison

Santo Gonzalez, CEO

Keith Dyer, President

308-254-4720

800-347-6592

856-371-7360

732-820-9697

215-852-9651

ESTIMATED
ITEM |DESCRIPTION USE COST COST COST COST COST

1 3’ x 57 100% Nylon County Flag (5-Colors) with brass Grommets, Single

" [Thickness with Reverse Image on Back 40 Each  |$50.89 each x 40=$2,035.60 $46.40 each x 40=$1,856.00 $44.37 each x 40=$1,774.80 $46.00 each x 40=$1,840.00 $85.00 each x 40=$3,400.00
2. 5’ x 8 100% Nylon United States Flag with Brass Grommets 100 Each  $40.89 each x 100=$4,089.00 $44.80 each x 100=$4,480.00 $57.93 each x 100=$5,793.00 $48.00 each x 100=$4,800.00 $53.00 each x 100=$5,300.00
3 3’ x 5’ 100% Nylon P.O.W. Flag with Brass Grommets, Single Thickness

" with Reverse Image on Back 70 Each $32.89 each x 70=$2,302.30 $26.60 each x 70=$1,862.00 $23.42 each x 70=$1,639.40 $42.00 each x 70=$2,940.00 $26.50 each x 70=$1,855.00
4 3’ x 5’ 100% Nylon New Jersey State Flag with Brass Grommets, Single

" [Thickness with Reverse Image on Back 25 Each  [$24.89 each x 25=$622.25 $27.80 each x 25=$695.00 $17.88 each x 25=$447.00 $32.00 each x 25=$800.00 $34.00 each x 25=$850.00
5 2°x 3’ 100% Nylon P.O.W. Flag with Brass Grommets, Single Thickness

" with Reverse Image on Back 6 Each  $21.89 each x 6=$131.34 $19.70 each x 6=$118.20 $17.88 each x 6=$107.28 $39.00 each x 6=$234.00 $25.75 each x 6=$154.50
6. |5’ x 8’ 100% Nylon US Air Force Flag with Brass Grommets 12 Each  $62.89 each x 12=$754.68 $66.80 each x 12=$801.60 $57.93 each x 12=$695.16 $106.00 each x 12=$1,272.00 $69.00 each x 12=$828.00
7 3> X 5’ 100 Nylon P.O.W. Flag with Brass Grommets, Single Thickness

" with Reverse Image on Back 70 Each  |$32.89 each x 70=$2,302.30 $32.80 each x 70=$2,296.00 $20.30 each x 70=$1,421.00 $41.00 each x 70=$2,870.00 $26.50 each x 70=$1,855.00
8. |5’ x 8 100% Nylon US Coast Guard Flag with Brass Grommets 12 Each  |$62.89 each x 12=$754.68 $66.80 each x 12=$801.60 $57.93 each x 12=$695.16 $106.00 each x 12=$1,272.00 $69.00 each x 12=$828.00
9. |5’ x8’100% Nylon US Navy Flag with Brass Grommets 12 Each  |$62.89 each x 12=$754.68 $66.80 each x 12=$801.60 $57.93 each x 12=$695.16 $106.00 each x 12=$1,272.00 $69.00 each x 12=$828.00
10. |5’ x 8’ 100% Nylon US Marine Corps Flag with Brass Grommets 12 Each  |$62.89 each x 12=$754.68 $66.80 each x 12=$801.60 $57.93 each x 12=$695.16 $106.00 each x 12=$1,272.00 $69.00 each x 12=$828.00
11. |5’ x 8’ 100% Nylon US Space Force Flag with Brass Grommets 12 Each  [$62.89 each x 12=$754.68 $69.70 each x 12=$836.40 $57.93 each x 12=$695.16 $106.00 each x 12=$1,272.00 $69.00 each x 12=$828.00
12. 5’ x 8’ 100% Nylon New Jersey Flag with Brass Grommets 12 Each  |$62.89 each x 12=$754.68 $66.80 each x 12=$801.60 $57.93 each x 12=$695.16 $95.00 each x 12=$1,140.00 $73.00 each x 12=$876.00
13 5" x 8’ 100% Nylon P.O.W. Force Flag with Brass Grommets, Single

" [Thickness with Reverse Image on Back 12 Each  |$62.89 each x 12=$754.68 $64.80 each x 12=$777.60 $57.93 each x 12=$695.16 $106.00 each x 12=$1,272.00 $75.00 each x 12=$900.00
14. 8’ x 12’ 100% Nylon United States Flag with Brass Grommets 12 Each |$117.89 each x 12=$1,414.68 $139.00 each x 12=$1,668.00 $167.01 each x 12=$2,004.12 $145.00 each x 12=$1,740.00 $150.00 each x 12=$1,800.00
15 5> x 8’ 100% Nylon County Flag (5 Colors) with Brass Grommets, Single

" [Thickness with Reverse Image on Back 12 Each  |$134.89 each x 12=$1,618.68 $84.00 each x 12=$1008.00 $105.13 each x 12=$1,261.56 $95.00 each x 12=$1,140.00 $180.00 each x 12=$2,160.00




10/26/2023
16. @’ x 6’ 100% Nylon United States Flag with Brass Grommets 100 Each  [$29.89 each x 100=$2,989.00 $32.80 each x 100=$3,280.00 $30.20 each x 100=$3,020.00 $41.00 each x 100=%$4,100.00 $37.00 each x 100=$3,700.00
17. 3’ x5’ 100% Nylon United States Flag with Brass Grommets 100 Each  $19.89 each x 100=$1,989.00 $23.60 each x 100=%$2,360.00 $20.30 each x 100=$2,030.00 $30.50 each x 100=$3,050.00 $25.50 each x 100=$2,550.00
18. |5” x 8’ 100% Nylon Merchant Marines Flag with Brass Grommets 10 Each  |$62.89 each x 10=$628.90 $66.80 each x 10=$668.00 $57.93 each x 10=$579.30 $108.00 each x 10=$1,080.00 $54.00 each x 10=$540.00
19. |12” x 18” 100% Nylon, Double Sided P.O.W./MIA Flags with Wooden Staf 50 Each  |$14.89 each x 50=$744.50 $1.89 each x 50=$94.50 $11.72 each x 50=$586.00 $40.00 each x 50=$2,000.00 NO BID
20. 2’ x3’100% Nylon “Honor & Remember” Flag with Brass Grommets 5Each  $33.89 each x 5=$169.45 $33.60 each x 5=$168.00 $24.04 each x 5=$120.20 $59.00 each x 5=$295.00 $34.00 each x 5=$170.00
21. B’ x5’ 100% Nylon “Honor & Remember” Flag with Brass Grommets 5Each  |$43.89 each x 5=$219.45 $46.80 each x 5=$234.00 $32.05 each x 5=$160.25 $71.00 each x 5=$355.00 $45.00 each x 5=$275.00
22. W x 6’ 100% Nylon “Honor & Remember” Flag with Brass Grommets 5Each  $51.89 each x 5=$259.45 $59.90 each x 5=$299.50 $46.23 each x 5=$231.15 $85.00 each x 5=$425.00 $55.00 each x 5=$275.00
23. |5’ x 8 100% Nylon “Honor & Remember” Flag with Brass Grommets 5Each  $144.89 each x 5=$724.45 $84.80 each x 5=$424.00 $67.79 each x 5=$338.95 $106.00 each x 5=$530.00 $85.00 each x 5=$425.00
24, R’ x 12’ 100% Nylon “Honor & Remember” Flag with Brass Grommets 5Each  $359.89 each x 5=$1,799.45 $298.00 each x 5=$1,490.00 $154.06 each x 5=$770.30 $130.00 each x 5=$650.00 NO BID
144 Flags/Gross, Unites States of America Memorial Flags. MUST BE
25 MADE IN THE USE. 30"x3/8" Staff, 12"x18" US Cotton Hemmed with
" [Gold Finial. A delivery date of May 9, 2023 will be required by our
Veteran's Affairs Department. 145 Gross  |$249.00 gross x 145=$36,105.00 |$168.48 gross x 145=$24,429.60 $243.36 gross x 145=$35,287.20 |$387.36 gross x 145=$56,167.20 NO BID
26 Grave Flags - 12” x 18” U.S. Poly Cotton Flags mounted on 3/8" x30"
" [Wood Dowl. MUST BE MADE IN THE USA. 16,650 Each $1.73 each x 16,650=$28,804.50 [$1.17 each x 16,650=$19,480.50 |$1.60 each x 16,650=$26,640.00 |$1.69 each x 16,650=$28,138.50 NO BID
27 3’ x 57 100% Nylon County Flag (5-Colors) with additional grommet 30
" linches down from fly end across the 60" bottom. 12 Each  |$65.89 each x 12=$790.68 $58.00 each x 12=$696.00 $36.32 each x 12=$435.87 $48.00 each x 12=$576.00 $100.00 each x 12=$1,200.00
28. W& x 6’ US Flag with additional grommet 30” from fly end across the 72” bo| 12 Each |$37.89 each x 12=$454.68 $44.60 each x 12=$535.20 $40.06 each x 12=$480.72 $68.00 each x 12=$816.00 $58.00 each x 12=$696.00
GRAND TOTAL $95,477.42 $73,764.50 $89,994.22 $123,318.70 DID NOT BID ON AL ITEMS
ariations: (if any) None None None None None
Will you extend your prices to local government
entities within the County YES NO YES YES NO
This contract shall be for a period of one (1) year from date of award, with
the County having the option to extend for one (1) two (2) year period or two
(2) one (1) year periods.
Bid Specifications sent to: Allied Solutions Enterprise Prime Vendor US Flag Maker Blink Signs
Rocky Mountain Flag Company |Deltek IAGAS Manufacturing Group
Based upon the bids received, | recommend East Coast Flag & Banner Co., Inc. as the lowest responsive, resppnsible bidder.
Sincerely
Kimberly Larter
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