PD 22-024

10/26/202¢

Bid Opening 06/15/22 10:00am

SPECIFICATIONS FOR PROVIDING TEMPORARY EMPLOYMENT
SERVICES TO THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER AND EXISTING
UNITS WITHIN THE COUNTY AS ALLOWED THROUGH THE
COUNTY CONTRACT PURCHASING SYSTEM NUMBERS CK-01-GC
& 16GLCP

Vendor:

Vendor:

Vendor:

Industrial Staffing Services, Inc.

Anytime Staffing, LLC

22nd Century Technologies, Inc.

25 Kennedy Blvd., Suite 200

2403 39th Street

500 College Road East

East Brunswick, NJ 08816

Pennsauken, NJ 08110

Princeton, NJ 08540

Jourdan Block, COO

Troy Brady, Owner

Anne Marie Eaton, Administrator

646-652-0985

609-868-1378

888-998-7284

ITEM DESCRIPTION Hourly Rate Hourly Rate Hourly Rate
1. (Clerical $35.89 $21.00 $21.13
2. |Dispatchers $34.10 No Bid $21.13
3. |General Labor $34.10 $24.00 $21.13
4. |Skilled Labor or Ship Labor $46.40 $26.00 $22.10
5. Movers No Bid No Bid $22.10
6. |CDL Class A No Bid $30.00 $28.60
7. |CDL Class B No Bid $28.00 $31.20
8. Janitorial $33.35 $22.00 $22.10
9. [Truck Unloaders $33.35 No Bid $22.10
10. [Forklift Driver $36.25 $24.00 $28.60
11.  (Industrial $33.35 $24.00 $23.40
12. |Packers $33.35 No Bid $22.10
13. |ICNA's $49.00 No Bid $39.00
14. |Load Rate No Bid No Bid $26.00

\Variations: (if any) None None None
Will you extend your prices to local government YES YES YES
entities within the County

This contract shall be for a period of two (2) years from date of

award.

Bid Specifications sent to: Bloc Digga SoftHQ Olan Associates

Life Tree Healthcare

Cynet Systems

HB Staffing

Nova Technologies Group

Center for Family Services

R.L. Klein & Associates

Total Healthcare Staffing

Rang Technologies

Staffing Etc.

Abacus Service Corp.

Changing Technologies

Iron Rock Security

Cogent Infotech Corp.

Rotator Staffing Services

Compunnel

FAAZ Consulting

AgreeYa Solutions

Diskriter, Inc.

US Tech Solutions

A&A Associates

Instant Serve

Based upon the bids received, | recommend Anytime Staffing be
awarded items #1, 3, 7, 8 and 10 and 22nd Century Technologies be
awarded items #1, 2, 3, 5, 7, 8, 10, and 13 as the lowest responsive,
responsible bidder.

Lancesort

Sincerely, Kimberly Larter
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