PD 022-012

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

Bid Opening 03/02/22 at 10:00 am

Rasik Computer Center, Inc. dba

Academic Supplier

W.B. Mason Co., Inc.

The Tree House

Allied Document Solutions & Svcs

Office Depot, LLC

SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY

3519 Main St., Suite 401

151 Heller Place

PO Box 413

200 Church Street

6600 North Military Trail

OF PRINTER RIBBONS, PRINTER INK JET

Chula Vista, CA 91911-0801

Bellmawr, NJ 08031

Norwood, MA 02062

Swedesboro, NJ 08085

Boca Raton, FL 33496

AND TONER CARTRIGES,FAX MACHINE

Sumit A. Shah, Director

Daniel Orr, Jr., Senior V.P.

David Rizzo -Sales

Robert Richardson, President

Matthew Shedlock, VP

TONER AND DRUM UNITS TO BE

800-266-2892 x 102

888-926-2766

800 595-6651

856-241-2000

561-438-4800

UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

866-540-3292 - Fax

888-598-1788 - Fax

781 278-0706 Fax

856-241-2290

800-593-8830-Fax

IN THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER

BID REJECTED-BID WAS
CONTINGENT UPON GC
AGREEING TO TERMS AND
CONDITIONS OF MASTER
AG 19-12R.. THE COUNTY
DOES NOT ACCEPT THESE

Iltem |Individual Prices TERMS
Brother
1 |DR420 Drum $72.00 $75.71 $72.75 No Bid
2 |TN420 Drum $31.00 $32.75 $31.15 No Bid
3 | TN430 Fax Toner $53.00 $56.99 $54.20 No Bid
4 | TN450 Fax Toner $47.00 $49.95 $47.50 No Bid
5 |TN460 Toner $75.00 $77.82 $76.40 No Bid
6 __|TN460DCP Toner $75.00 $77.82 $76.40 No Bid
7 | TN550 Toner $71.00 $74.66 $74.50 No Bid
8 | TN850 Black $89.00 $93.17 $90.70 No Bid
9 |BRT-TN436BK $68.00 $73.34 $69.75 No Bid
10 |BRT-TN436C $144.00 $154.11 $146.55 No Bid
11 |BRT-TN436M $144.00 $154.11 $146.55 No Bid
12 [BRT-TN436Y $144.00 $154.11 $146.55 No Bid
13 |BRT-TN760 $63.00 $60.59 $63.10 No Bid
14 |TN850 Black $89.00 $93.17 $90.70 No Bid
15 |NJ450 Toner $47.00 No Bid $47.50 No Bid
16 |NJ450 Drum $72.00 No Bid $72.75 No Bid
17 |LC201Y $7.00 $6.71 $6.65 No Bid
18 |LC201BK $10.00 $10.26 $10.15 No Bid
19 |LC20IM $7.00 $6.71 $6.65 No Bid
20 |LC201C $7.00 $6.71 $6.65 No Bid
21 |LC2013PCS (Magenta/Cyan/Yellow) $20.00 $18.67 $18.40 No Bid
Canon
22 |1977BO01AA Yellow No Bid $81.10 $59.95 No Bid
23 [1978BO01AA Magenta No Bid $81.10 $59.95 No Bid
24 |1979B001AA Cyan No Bid $81.10 $59.95 No Bid
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25 [2659B001AA Yellow No Bid $104.58 $101.25 No Bid
26 |2660BO01AA Magenta No Bid $104.58 $101.25 No Bid
27 |2661B001AA Cyan No Bid $104.58 $101.25 No Bid
28 |2662B001AA Black No Bid $104.66 $97.30 No Bid
29 |3500B001 Black No Bid $76.31 $86.00 No Bid
30 |6269B001 Yellow No Bid $92.27 $81.80 No Bid
31 |6270B001 Magenta No Bid $92.27 $81.80 No Bid
32 |6270B001 Cyan No Bid $92.27 $81.80 No Bid
33 |6272B001AA Black No Bid $60.87 $67.25 No Bid
34 |9435B001 No Bid $71.24 $72.15 No Bid
35 |CL1-281 No Bid No Bid $10.90 No Bid
36 |CNM 3500B001AA No Bid $85.42 $86.00 No Bid
37 |116 Black 1980B001AA No Bid $86.00 $61.20 No Bid
38 |116 Cyan 1979B001AA No Bid $81.10 $59.95 No Bid
39 |116 Magenta 1978B001AA No Bid $81.10 $59.95 No Bid
40 |116 Yellow 1977B001AA No Bid $81.10 $59.95 No Bid
41 |118 Black No Bid $104.66 $97.30 No Bid
42 |118 Colors No Bid $104.58 $101.25 No Bid
43 |137 No Bid $68.35 $72.15 No Bid
44 188 Black No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
45 188 Magenta No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
46 |188 Yellow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
47 ]188 Cyan No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
48 |PG1-280XL No Bid $23.53 $23.10 No Bid
49 |Color Imageclass LBP7660Cdn No Bid No Bid Bk: $97.30; Clrs: $101.25 No Bid
Colorwave
50 |3500C No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
51 |3500 M No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
52 |3500Y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
53 [3500 BK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hewlett Packard
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54 |414A Black W2020A $68.00 $56.92 $57.60 $78.00
55_|414A Yellow W2022A $89.00 $73.75 $72.50 $99.75
56 |414A Cyan W2021A $89.00 $73.75 $72.50 $99.75
57 |414A Magenta W2023A $89.00 $73.75 $72.50 $99.75
58 [902XL Yellow T6M10AN#140 $21.00 $16.23 $18.80 No Bid
59 [902XL Black T614AN#140 $27.00 $29.40 $34.00 No Bid
60 |902XL Magenta TEMO6AN#140 $21.00 $16.23 $18.80 No Bid
61 |902XL Cyan T6MO2AN#140 $21.00 $16.23 $18.80 No Bid
62 |910XL Black $33.00 $32.09 $30.00 No Bid
63 [910XL Cyan $18.00 $17.99 $17.40 No Bid
64 |910XL Yellow $18.00 $17.99 $17.40 No Bid
65 |910XL Magenta $18.00 $17.99 $17.40 No Bid
66 _|935XL Yellow $20.00 $15.85 $18.00 No Bid
67 [935XL Cyan $20.00 $15.85 $18.00 No Bid
68 |935XL Magenta $20.00 $15.85 $18.00 No Bid
69 [950XL Black $39.00 $30.10 $31.40 No Bid
70 |951XL Cyan, Magenta, Yellow No Bid $24.02 $23.70 No Bid
71 |952XL Black F6U15AN $27.00 $22.44 $23.10 No Bid
72 |952XL Color LOS49AN $19.00 $15.42 $15.25 No Bid
73 |952 Cyan LOS49AN $19.00 $15.42 $15.25 No Bid
74 ]952XL Cyan LOS61AN $31.00 $25.42 $24.60 No Bid
75 _|952 Magenta LOS52AN $19.00 $15.42 $15.25 No Bid
76 _|952XL Magenta LOS64AM $31.00 $25.42 $24.60 No Bid
77 952 Yellow LOS55AN $19.00 $15.42 $15.25 No Bid
78 |952XL Yellow LOS67AN $31.00 $25.42 $24.60 No Bid
79 [952 3 (Color Combo)N9K27AN No Bid $53.33 No Bid No Bid
80 |962XL Black and Colors No Bid No Bid Black-$31.00; Colors-$25.10 No Bid
81 |C2P04A Black $15.50 $12.89 $13.00 No Bid
82 |C6578D Tricolor No Bid $32.67 No Bid No Bid
83 |C6578DN Tricolor No Bid $32.67 No Bid No Bid
84 |C6656AN Black $31.00 $21.03 $26.60 No Bid
85 |C6657AN Tri Color $52.00 $33.87 $43.50 No Bid
86 _|C8543X $220.00 $229.02 $235.00 $134.00
87 |C8766WN Black $38.00 $30.92 $31.00 No Bid
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gg |C8767WN Black No Bid $27.99 No Bid No Bid
89 |C9363WN Tri Color $32.00 $41.92 $43.00 No Bid
90 |C9364WN No Bid $20.42 $26.10 No Bid
91 |C9369WN Photo No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
92 |C9382A No Bid $68.81 No Bid No Bid
93 |C9385AN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
94 |C9730A Black $290.00 $213.97 $221.00 $165.50
95 [C9731A Cyan $290.00 $315.04 $315.00 $218.00
96 _|C9732A Yellow $290.00 $315.04 $315.00 $218.00
97 |C9733A Magenta $290.00 $315.04 $315.00 $218.00
98 |CB322WN Photo XL $25.00 $19.67 $20.00 No Bid
99 |CB323WN Cyan XL $25.00 $19.67 $20.00 No Bid
100 |CB324WN Magenta XL $25.00 $19.67 $20.00 No Bid
101 |CB325WN Yellow XL $25.00 $19.67 $20.00 No Bid
102 |CB401A Cyan $240.00 $219.34 $213.25 $146.00
103 |CC364A $140.00 $124.80 $121.00 $94.00
104 |CC530A Black $75.00 $92.46 $75.00 $55.00
105 |CC531A Cyan $75.00 $92.46 $79.00 $59.00
106 |CC532A Yellow $75.00 $92.46 $79.00 $59.00
107 |CC533A Magenta $75.00 $92.46 $79.00 $59.00
108 |CE255X $130.00 $159.19 $166.60 $125.00
109 |CE255XD $330.00 $297.53 $287.10 $250.00
110 |CE390A $145.00 $122.92 $123.00 $94.00
111 |CE390X $170.00 $206.44 $204.00 $160.00
112 [CE410A Black $70.00 $59.82 $59.00 $58.00
113 [CE410X Black $70.00 $69.88 $66.00 $58.00
114 |CE411A Cyan $73.00 $81.71 $76.00 $60.00
115 [CE412A Yellow $73.00 $81.71 $76.00 $60.00
116 |CE413A Magenta $73.00 $81.71 $76.00 $60.00
117 |CE505A $50.00 $63.25 $65.00 $49.75
118 |CES05AC $50.00 $63.25 $65.00 $49.75
119 |CE740A Black $130.00 $112.89 $108.00 $75.00
120 |CE741A Cyan $224.00 $198.91 $193.00 $147.50
121 |CE742A Yellow $224.00 $198.91 $193.00 $147.50
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122 |CE743A Magenta $224.00 $198.91 $193.00 $147.50
123 |CF217A $55.00 $51.06 $42.00 $41.75
124 |CF219A Drum $62.00 $57.53 $50.00 $47.75
125 |CF2170A $55.00 $51.06 $42.00 $42.50
126 |CF226A $103.00 $84.94 $78.00 $78.75
127 |CF226AD1-Black $192.00 $179.25 $151.00 $148.00
128 |CF226X $120.00 $163.57 $139.00 $106.00
129 [CF230A $56.00 $47.30 $44.00 $57.75
130 |CF237A $154.00 No Bid $124.00 $119.75
131 |CF237X $238.00 No Bid $194.00 $199.75
132 |CF258X $179.00 $167.25 $135.00 $127.50
133 |CF280A $86.00 $73.22 $69.00 $64.00
134 [CF280X $110.00 $123.68 $122.00 $84.75
135 |CF281X $170.00 $205.40 $199.00 $149.75
136 _|CF287X $170.00 $204.29 $203.00 $149.00
137 |CF287XC $170.00 $204.29 $203.00 $149.00
138 |CF350A $50.00 $112.89 $39.00 $36.25
139 [CF351A $50.00 $41.92 $40.00 $37.75
140 |CF352A $50.00 $41.92 $40.00 $37.75
141 |CF353A $50.00 $41.92 $40.00 $37.75
142 |CF360A Black $130.00 $112.89 $106.00 $89.75
143 |CF360XC $192.00 $178.82 $145.00 $109.75
144 |CF361A Cyan $155.00 $140.85 $132.00 $107.00
145 |CF361XC Cyan $266.00 $247.56 $206.00 $149.00
146 |CF362A Yellow $155.00 $140.85 $132.00 $107.00
147 |CF362XC Yellow $266.00 $247.56 $206.00 $149.00
148 |CF363A Magenta $155.00 $140.85 $132.00 $107.00
149 |CF363XC Magenta $266.00 $247.56 $206.00 $149.00
150 |CF400X Black $82.00 $61.28 $61.00 $68.75
151 |CF401A Cyan $72.00 $57.09 $54.00 $68.75
152 |CF401X Magenta $90.00 $70.96 $67.00 $68.75
153 |CF402A Yellow $72.00 $57.09 $54.00 $68.75
154 |CF402X Cyan $90.00 $70.96 $67.00 $68.75
155 |CF403A Magenta $72.00 $57.09 $54.00 $68.75
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156 |CF403X Yellow $90.00 $70.96 $67.00 $68.75
157 |CF410A Black $77.00 $63.20 $60.00 $75.00
158 [CF410X $127.00 $108.88 $95.00 $89.75
159 |CF411X $171.00 $145.75 $132.00 $128.75
160 |CF411XC Cyan $171.00 $145.75 $132.00 $128.75
161 |CF412X $171.00 $145.75 $132.00 $128.75
162 |CF412XC Yellow $171.00 $145.75 $132.00 $128.75
163 |CF413XC Magenta $171.00 $145.75 $132.00 $128.75
164 |CF4l $127.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
165 [CF413X $171.00 $145.75 $132.00 $128.75
166 |CF411A Cyan $98.00 $76.33 $73.00 $107.75
167 |CF412A Magenta $98.00 $76.33 $73.00 $107.75
168 |CF413A Yellow $98.00 $76.33 $73.00 $107.75
169 |CF460X-Black $255.00 $259.80 $225.00 $254.00
170 |CF461X-Cyan $366.00 $366.59 $330.00 $358.25
171 |CF462X-Yellow $366.00 $366.59 $330.00 $358.25
172 |CF463X-Magenta $366.00 $366.59 $330.00 $358.27
173 |CNO45AN Black $39.00 $30.10 $32.00 No Bid
174 |CNO46AN Cyan $30.00 $24.02 $25.00 No Bid
175 |CNO47AN Magenta $30.00 $24.02 $25.00 No Bid
176 |CNO48AN Yellow $30.00 $24.02 $25.00 No Bid
177 |CNOS3AN Black $32.00 $25.90 $25.00 No Bid
178 |CNO54AN Cyan $17.00 $13.38 $26.00 No Bid
179 |CNOS5AN Magenta $17.00 $13.38 $14.00 No Bid
180 |CNO56AN Yellow $17.00 $13.38 $14.00 No Bid
181 |CNOS8AN Cyan $11.50 $9.13 $14.00 No Bid
182 |CNO59AN Magenta $11.50 $9.13 $9.90 No Bid
183 |CNO60AN Yellow $11.50 $9.13 $9.90 No Bid
184 |Q1339A No Bid $181.71 No Bid $91.75
185 |Q2612A $45.00 $53.75 $52.00 $38.25
186 |Q2613X $112.00 $91.39 $87.00 $49.75
187 |Q5942A $150.00 $134.40 $127.00 $86.00
188 |Q5949A $84.00 $65.58 $70.00 $49.00
189 |Q5949X $143.00 $128.22 $128.00 $118.00
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190 [Q7553A $80.00 $70.96 $69.00 $58.00

191 |HP81X $170.00 $205.40 $199.00 $141.00

192 |HP202X $80.00 No Bid Black-$62.00; Colors-$65.50 No Bid

193 |Inkjet 6940 No Bid $17.48 No Bid No Bid

194 |Black 96 No Bid $27.99 No Bid No Bid

195 [Tricolor 97 No Bid $41.92 $43.00 No Bid
Kyocera

106 |TK-572C $118.00 $122.67 $122.25 No Bid

197 |TK-572K No Bid $94.52 $93.00 No Bid

198 |TK-572M No Bid $122.67 $122.25 No Bid

199 [TK-572Y No Bid $122.67 $122.25 No Bid

200 |TK-582C No Bid No Bid $67.90 No Bid

201 |TK-3102 No Bid No Bid $61.20 No Bid

202 |TK-5242 Yellow No Bid No Bid $71.50 No Bid

203 |TK-5242 Cyan No Bid No Bid $71.50 No Bid

204 |TK-5242M Magenta No Bid No Bid $71.50 No Bid

205 | TK-5242K Black No Bid No Bid $58.30 No Bid
Lexmark

206 |78C10KO Black $60.48 No Bid $58.80 No Bid

207 |78C10YO Yellow $71.12 No Bid $70.10 No Bid

208 |78C10MO Magenta $71.12 No Bid $70.10 No Bid

209 |78C10CO Cyan $71.12 No Bid $70.10 No Bid
OCE

210 1060016924 Black No Bid No Bid $175.00 No Bid

211 |1060016925 Yellow No Bid No Bid $175.00 No Bid

212 |1060016926 Cyan No Bid No Bid $175.00 No Bid

213 |1060016927 Magenta No Bid No Bid $175.00 No Bid

214 |3281C001-Yellow Pearls No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

215 |3281C002-Cyan Pearls No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

216 |3281C003-Magenta Pearls No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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TONER AND DRUM UNITS TO BE

800-266-2892 x 102

888-926-2766

800 595-6651

856-241-2000

561-438-4800

UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

866-540-3292 - Fax

888-598-1788 - Fax

781 278-0706 Fax

856-241-2290

800-593-8830-Fax

IN THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER

217 |3281C004-Black Pearls No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

XEROX
218 |106R02309 No Bid No Bid $91.25 No Bid
219 |106R02311 No Bid No Bid $146.95 No Bid
220 |106R03859 Cyan No Bid No Bid $124.90 No Bid
221 |106R03860 Magenta No Bid No Bid $124.90 No Bid
222 |106R03861 Yellow No Bid No Bid $124.90 No Bid
223 |106R03862 Black No Bid No Bid $135.80 No Bid
224 |106R03690 Cyan No Bid No Bid $156.60 No Bid
225 |106R03691 Magenta No Bid No Bid $156.60 No Bid
226 |106R03692 Yellow No Bid No Bid $156.60 No Bid
227 |106R03480 Black No Bid No Bid $122.90 No Bid
228 |108R00926 Cyan No Bid No Bid $147.80 No Bid
229 |108R00927 Magenta No Bid No Bid $147.80 No Bid
230 |108R00928 Yellow No Bid No Bid $147.80 No Bid
231 |108R00930 Black (4 Pack) No Bid No Bid $145.95 No Bid
232 [108R01417 Cyan Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
233 |108R01418 Magenta Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
234 |108R01419 Yellow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
235 |108R01420 Black No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

VARIATIONS NONE NONE NONE NONE

THIS IS A ONE YEAR CONTRACT

Will you extend your prices to local government

entities within the County YES YES YES YES

Bid specifications sent to:

Fraser Advanced Information Systems

BTEK Holdings

Prints Charles Reprographics

Allied Solution Enterprise

Integrated MicroSystems

Global Data Products

Deltek

Prime Vendor

Quality Imaging Solutions

Diverse Enterprise

Zones Connect

1D Wholesaler

B2B Supplies




PD 022-012

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

Bid Opening 03/02/22 at 10:00 am

Rasik Computer Center, Inc. dba
Academic Supplier

W.B. Mason Co., Inc.

The Tree House

Allied Document Solutions & Svcs

Office Depot, LLC

SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY

3519 Main St., Suite 401

151 Heller Place

PO Box 413

200 Church Street

6600 North Military Trail

OF PRINTER RIBBONS, PRINTER INK JET

Chula Vista, CA 91911-0801

Bellmawr, NJ 08031

Norwood, MA 02062

Swedesboro, NJ 08085

Boca Raton, FL 33496

AND TONER CARTRIGES,FAX MACHINE

Sumit A. Shah, Director

Daniel Orr, Jr., Senior V.P.

David Rizzo -Sales

Robert Richardson, President

Matthew Shedlock, VP

TONER AND DRUM UNITS TO BE

800-266-2892 x 102

888-926-2766

800 595-6651

856-241-2000

561-438-4800

UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

866-540-3292 - Fax

888-598-1788 - Fax

781 278-0706 Fax

856-241-2290

800-593-8830-Fax

IN THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER

Based upon the bids received | recommend the bid
be awarded to each vendor as follows as the lowest
responsive, responsible bidder:

Rasik Computer Center, Inc. dba Academic|

Supplier is awarded item numbg

rs1,2,3,456,7,8,9,10,11 12,

14,15, 16, 18, 59, 89, 164 and 196.

W.B. Mason is awarded item numbers 13, 29, 33, 34, 36, 43, 54, 58, 60, 61, f

181, 182, 183, 193, 194, and 195.

6, 67, 68, 69, 71, 79, 81, 82, 83, 84,

85, 87, 88, 90, 92, 98, 99, 100, 101, 173,

174, 175, 176, 178, 179, 180,

The Tree House is awarded item numbers 17, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 2
80, 125, 126, 129, 131, 150, 151, 152, 153, 154, 155, 156, 157, 166, 167, 168,

213, 218, 219. 220, 221, 222, 223, 224, 225,

226, 227, 228, 229, 230, and 231

7, 28, 30, 31, 32, 35, 37, 38, 39, 40,
169, 170, 171, 172, 177, 192, 197, 1

41, 42, 48, 49, 55, 56, 57, 62, 63, 64, 65,
98, 199, 200, 201, 202, 203, 204, 205, 2

70,72,73,74,75,76, 77,78,
6, 207, 208, 209, 210, 211, 212,

Allied Document Solutions & Svcs is awarded item numbers 86, 94, 95, 96, 9

123, 124,127, 128, 130, 132, 133, 134, 135,
191.

136, 137, 138, 139, 140, 141, 142

7,102, 103, 104, 105, 106, 107, 108, 109, 110, 111, 112, 113, 114, 115, 116,
158, 159, 160, 161, 162, 163, 165, 184, 1

, 143, 144, 145, 146, 147, 148, 149,

117, 118,119, 120, 121, 122,
185, 186, 187, 188, 189, 190,

Sincerely, Kimberly Larter, OPA
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