PD-022-004

Bid Opening 12/22/2021 10:00am

SPECIFICATIONS AND PROPOSAL FORM COVERING

TRANSMISSION OVERHAULS ON AUTOMOBILES AND

TRUCKS FOR THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

First Quality, Inc T/A Cottman Transmission

Johnson & Towers, LLC

230 Glassboro Rd.

500 Wilson Point Road

Woodbury Heights, NJ 08097

Baltimore, MD 21220

Austin Bombaro, President

Paul Amalfitano, Government Sales Mgr

856-845-0070

443- 425-7647

856-845-8651-Fax

ITEM DESCRIPTION
MFGR MODEL UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

1Ford AX4S $1,300.00 No Bid

2Ford 5R55E $1,895.00 No Bid

3[Ford AXA4AN $1,350.00 No Bid

4Ford AR70W $1,695.00 No Bid

5Ford 6F50N $2,600.00 No Bid

6Ford 4AR75W $2,195.00 No Bid

7Ford 4R100 $2,200.00 No Bid

8Ford 5R110W $2,600.00 No Bid

9Ford 4F50N $1,895.00 No Bid
10Ford 5R55W $2,395.00 No Bid
11/Chevrolet ATAS5E $1,200.00 No Bid
12Chevrolet AT65E $2,050.00 No Bid
13Chevrolet 41 80E $2,395.00 No Bid
14 Chevrolet 41 85E $2,295.00 No Bid
15Chevrolet 6L90 $2,700.00 No Bid
16/Chevrolet 4L 60E $1,895.00 No Bid
17/Chrysler 45RFE $1,895.00 No Bid
18/Chrysler 604 $1,995.00 No Bid
19Chrysler 606 $1,300.00 No Bid
20/Chrysler 5-45RFE $2,195.00 No Bid
21Chrysler 42RLE $2,100.00 No Bid
22Allison Series 1000 $3,600.00 $4386.36 2nd year Base
23Allison Series 2000 $3,600.00 $4386.36 2nd year Base
24Allison Series 3000 $5,400.00 $7739.34 2nd year Base
25HOURLY RATE $95.00 per hour $150.00 2nd Year Base

Variations: (if any)

NONE

Johnson & Towers will elect to quote removal of
organic transmission and complete the
replacement with a "factory" re-manufactured
Allison transmission". Quote does not include
overhaul organic/existing transmission.
Includes Factory Remanufactured Allison
Transmission; Removal of Existing
Transmission; Installation of Factory
Remanufactured Allison Transmission and
includes 24 month factory warranty.




Will you extend your prices to local government YES YES

entities within the County 10/26/202

Bid specifications sent to: Nova Technologies Group Prime Vendor Ford Motor Co.

The term of the contract shall be for two years from date of award with with the option to extend for 1 two year period or 2 one year periods.

Based upon the bids received, | recommend First Quality, Inc. dba Cottman Transmission be awarded the contract as the lowest responsive, responsible bidder.

Sincerely, Kimberly Larter, QPA
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