| PD 020-055 |
| Bid Opening 11/09/2020 10:00am
ISPECIFICATIONS AND PROPOSAL FORM FOR THE DELI\*ERY
[OF JANITORIAL ITEMS AND SUPPLIES FOR THE COUNT
IOF GLOUCESTER AND EXISTING UNITS WITH THE COUNTY
|AS ALLOWED THROUGH THE COUNTY CONTRACT
IPURCHASING SYSTEM NUMBERS CK-01-GC & 16GLCP
IENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDQR: ENDOR VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR:
W.B. Mason Company, Inc General Chémical and Supply, Inc. Sprlice inc. Camden Bag|& Paper Co., LLC Cooper Friedman Electric Supply dba Cooper Electric UNIPAK United Sale$ USA Group Interboro Packaging Central Pply Bag Corp
151 Heller Place 858 N. Lenola Road, Unit 1A 759 East Lincoln Avenue 200 C Drive 1 Matrix Drive 2759 Strickland Avenue 185 30th Street 114 Bracken Road 2400 Bedle Place
Bellmgwr, NJ 08031 Moorgstown, NJ 08057 Rahway, NJ 07065 Burlingtpn, NJ 08016 Monroe, NJ 08831 Bmé}(\yn, NY 11234 Brooklyn|NY 11232 NY 12549 Linder), NJ 07036
888-926-2766 '78-5550 732-388-9091 856-727-3313 908-296-7441 888-808-5120 718-709-5900 845-782-6800 908-B62-7570
888-54 788 - Fax 856-778-7381-Fax 732-388-9585 - Fax 856-727-4114 - Fax 732-308-4606 - Fax 718-709-1705 - Fax 845-781-2450 - Fax 908-862-9019 - Fax
Daniel Orf, Jr., Senior V.P. David McDonough, President Daniel| Josephs, Ex VP/ICOO Robert Thgmas, President Tania Rodriguez, Goverjment Solutions Mgr Bijian Marcus Chumy Zipger, Sec. Fradie|Fried Andrew Hoffer, President
ITEM [DESCRIPTION EST. QTY Brand Proposed Unit Price_ Total Brand Proposed Unit Price_ Total Brand Proposed Unit Price_ Total Brand Proposed Unit Price__ Total Brand Proposed Unit Price_ Total Brand Proposed Unit Price_ Total Brand Proposed Unit Price_ Total JBrand Proposed Unit Price _ Total _JBrand Proposed Unit Price _ Total
1 |ALL PURPOSE, DEGREASER, CLEANER, ALL BOTTLES
[MUST HAVE SPRAY TRIGGER-32 OZ, 12/CASE
5 CASES NO BID NO BID NO BID MAVERICK $2670  $13350 NO BID NO BID pi $3000  $150.00 NO BID NO BID
2 |AUSTINS A-1 BLEACH, 1GAL., 6/CASE 40 CASES PURE BRIGHT $12.20 $491.60 KIK $12.00 $480.00 NO BID PUREBRIGHT 6% $15.20 $608.00 NO BID NO BID AUSTIN $14.50  $580.00 NO BID NO BID
3 [BAB-OPOWDERED CLEANSER, 2107, 30/CASE 10 CASES AIAX 52072 $207.20 AIAX 52300 480,00 NO BID BABO 52420 $242.00 NO BID NO BID BAB-O $1000  $190.00 NO BID NO BID
4 [PINE SCENTED CLEANER/IDEORDIZER, 1 GAL, 4/CASE NATIONAL CHEMICAL
60 CASES LABORATORIES $19.90  $1199.40 ASPIRE $1575  $045.00 NO BID JEWEL $1545  $927.00 NO BID NO BID UNIFIED $1450 _ $870.00 NO BID NO BID
5[5 WHEEL DOLLY FOR 4 GAL, RUBBERMAID TRASH CAN,
[12643-G 12 EACH RUBBERMAID #2643G $29.27 $351.24 ASPIRE $24.90 $298.80 NO BID $21.80 $261.60 RUB F626400BCA $22.75  $273.00 NO BID JANICO $26.37 _ $316.44 NO BID NO BID
6 [STAINLESS STEEL CLEANER, 18 OZ, 12/CASE NATIONAL CHEMICAL
20 CASES LABORATORIES $2929  $585.80 CHASE $2750  $550.00 NOBID CHASE $27.30  $546.00 NO BID NO BID CHASE $25.19 _$503.80 NO BID NO BID
AMERICAN
7 [BOWL CLEANER, LIQUID CONCENTRATE, 1QT, 12ICASE NATIONAL CHEMICAL CLEANING
150 CASES LABORATORIES $1628  $2442.00 ASPIRE $17.75  $2662.50 NOBID REST STOP DISINFECTING $27.98  $4197.00 NOBID NO BID SOLUTIONS 51965 $2.047.50 NO BID NO BID
8 [BROOMS, 48" HANDLE, ANGLE POLYSTYRENE BRISTLES
72 EACH BOARDWALK $6.24  $449.28 NO BID NO BID OC-6410/ACS 12" WIDE $4.60  $331.20 RUB FG6375006RAY $7.40  $532.80 NO BID JANICO $5.07_$365.04 NO BID NO BID
9 [CHEWING GUMICANDLE WAX REMOVER 6 CASES BOARDWALK $2923  $17538 CHASE $2395  $143.70 NO BID CHASE $2525  $151.90 NO BID NO BID CHASE $29.00 $174.00 NO BID NO BID
10 [DRAIN OPENER, 1QT, 12/CASE NATIONAL CHEMICAL
20 CASES LABORATORIES $21.88  $437.60 ASPIRE $2475  $495.00 NO BID As101 $31.05 $621.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
11 [FLOCK-LINED RUBBER GLOVES, 12" LENGTH
W/EMBOSSED NON-SLIP GRIP, MEDIUM 12BAGS NO BID IMPACT $1425  $171.00 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1> [FLOCK-LINED RUBBER GLOVES, 12" LENGTH,
W/EMBOSSED NON-SLIP GRIP, LARGE 12 BAGS NO BID IMPACT $1625  $10500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13 |WET MoP HEADS, 1207 TRIPLE S #37656 14 HANDY KLENZE DECK MOP W/
96 EACH NO BID NO BID CASES SL70  $163.20 HANDLE $2.49  $239.04 NO BID NO BID JANICO $250  $240.00 NO BID NO BID
14 |WET MOP HEADS, 24 0Z 144 EACH ABCO $244  $351.36 WORLD & MAIN $310  $446.40 TRIPLE S #37659 $2.82  $406.08 HANDY KLENZE $2.60 $374.40 RUB FGE13800WHO $3.80  $547.20 NOBID JANICO $4.30  $619.20 NO BID NOBID
15 _[WET MOP HEADS, 16 0Z 120 EACH ABCO $176  $211.20 WORLD & MAIN 5286 $343.20 TRIPLE S #37657 5199 5238.60 HANDY KLENZE $2.00  $430.56 RUB FGE13600WH $310 $372.00 NO BID JANICO $3.10 $372.00 NO BID NO BID
16 _[WET MOP HEADS, 16 0Z, RAYON ONLY 144 EACH BOARDWALK $311 544784 NORSHEL 5295  $424.80 TRIPLE S #37002 5202 $42048 $87.00  $261.00 RUB FGE43600WHO $6.25 $900.00 NO BID JANICO $3.08 $44352 NO BID NO BID
17_[IOHNNI MOPS, SOFT TOILET BRUSHES, 100/CASE 3 CASES BOARDWALK 59672 $29016 IMPACT $57.00  $171.00 NO BID HANDY KLENZE $631 §75.72 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
18 [SIGNS. "CAUTION, WET FLOOR", YELLOW PLASTIC JANICO 1012 W/ DOWN PRESS
12 EACH CONTINENTAL s752  $90.24 WORLD & MAIN $5.74  $68.88 NO BID WRINGER $19.20  $590.40 RUB FGBL1277YEL $6.45  $77.40 NOBID JANICO $9.65  $115.80 NO BID NOBID
1o PLASTIC WET MOP BUCKET WIWHEELS AND WRINGER,
[YELLOW, 35 QT. CAPACITY 12 EACH CONTINENTAL $3320 30048 WORLD & MAIN $56.00  $672.00 NO BID SHORE 87009 $3130  $313.00 RUB F6758088YEL $49.70 _ $506.40 NO BID JANICO $4450 _ $534.00 NO BID NO BID
20 |HAND WIPES, DISPOSABLE, DOUBLE RE-CREPED
[100CT/BOX TYPALL L40 #05790 OR EQUAL 10 CASES KIMBERLY CLARK $6048  $604.80 WORLD & MAIN $92.00  $920.00 NO BID SHORE 87009 $3130  $313.00 NO BID NO BID BOARDWALK $54.99 $549.90 NO BID NO BID
51 [CLARIO TF FOAMING, WHITE, TOUCH FREE DISPENSER
[191866-00 (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 24 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID $31.20 $748.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
22_|LIQUID HAND SOAP, PINK 1 GAL, 4ICASE 40 CASES NO BID AUSTIN $1310  $524.00 UNIFIED #1001 $14.39 57560 STARCO | $15.90 $636.00 NO BID NO BID CERTO 51450 $58000 NO BID NO BID
[CLARIO ULTRABLUE ANTI-CACTERIAL FOAMING SKIN
23 [CLEANSER FOR CLARIO TF DISPENSER #75929-00 (NO
[SUBSTITUTIONS) 120 CASES NO BID NOBID NO BID $67.80 _ $8136.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID
24_|WASP & HORNET SPRAY. 12 07, 12/CASE 8 CASES SC JOHNSON 55008 $479.84 CHASE $38.90  $31120 NO BID [ NO BID NO BID NO BID CHASE $47.00 _$376.00 NO BID NO BID
25 |DUST BRUSH, 8 INCH
24 EACH BOARDWALK $486  $11664 SHEPPARD $380  $91.20 NOBID ACS $314 7536 RUB FG63A00BCA $325  $78.00 NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID
26 [FLOOR STRIPPER NON-AMMONIATED, NON-RINSE. 5 GAL| BUCKEYE PACKED 4/1
[CONTAINER 20 CONT. NCL $5330 5106780 S4380/GAL  $876.00 NO BID STARCO F510 $3120  $624.00 NO BID NO BID Amcs $50.00 _$1.00000 NO BID NO BID
27 [FLOOR FINISH, LIQUID ACRYLIC 5 GAL, CONTAINER
40 CONT. NCL $60.25  $2410.00 SIMONIZ $44.005GAL  $1760.00 UNIFIED #1185 $6000 _$2400.00 JEWEL SCRUBBABLE $5690  $2276.00 NO BID NO BID AMCS $51.50 $2.060.00 NO BID NO BID
28 |3 M SPOT REMOVER, 18 0Z, 12/CASE 8 CASES NO BID CHASE $29.00/CASE OF 12 $323.00 NOBID CHASE $38.40  $307.20 NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID
29 _|POWDERED CARPET DEODORANT, 14 OZ, 12/CASE 20 CASES NO BID NO BID NO BID CARPET FRESH $24.80 _ $496.00 NO BID NOBID LOVE MY CARPET _ $19.99 _$399.80 NO BID NOBID
30 [BASEBOARD & FLOOR STRIPPER SPRAY 19 0Z, 12/CASE
12 CASES NOBID CHASE $2675/CASE__ $321.00 NOBID CHASE $2975  $357.00 NOBID NOBID CHASE $28.00$336.00 NOBID NOBID
51 [SPRAY BUFF CLEANER POLISH & MAINTAINER, 1GAL ,
larcase 10 CASES NCL $2236  $223.60 MAINTAIN $28.50 28500 NO BID STARCO CITRAGLO $3145  $31450 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
32 [BPIC & SPAN CONCENTRATED POWDER CLEANER, 27 OZ,
[12/CASE 20 CASES $96.28  $1985.00 PROCTOR GAMBLE $95.00  $1900.00 NO BID $11600 _$2320.00 NO BID NO BID $94.00 $1880.00 NO BID NO BID
33 POHNSON'S LEMON SHINE-UP FURNITURE WAX, 15 ‘
[0Z.12/CASE 10 CASES BOARDWALK $23.90 $239.00 CHASE $26.90  $269.00 NO BID CHASE 17 0Z $30.60  $306.00 NO BID NO BID CHASE $33.00  $330.00 NO BID NO BID
34 |NOXON METAL POLISH #7, 12 OZ. 6/CASE 3 CASES NO BID CHASE $27.75  $83.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID [ BID NO BID NO BID
35 |RUG SHAMPOO/EXTRACTION CLEANER, 1 GAL, 4/CASE
4CASES NCL 52879 $11516 NO BID NO BID HANDY KLENZE $4600 _ $184.00 NO BID NO BID SIMONIZ $27.30 _ $109.20 NO BID NO BID
36 [ENVIROX CONCENTRATE¥118 471 GAL. CS. #ENV-118-048
|(NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 40 CASES NO BID ENVIROX $137.00  $5480.00 NO BID $146.00 _$5840.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
37 [ENVIROX CONCENTRATEA117 4/1 GAL. CS. #ENV-117-048
|(NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 40 CASES NOBID ENVIROX $137.00  $5480.00 NO BID $146.00 _$5,840.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
35 [FAST ORANGE HAND CLEANER, 7.5 0Z BOTTLES #25108
12 BOTTLESICASE 12 CASES NOBID GOJO-1 GALLON $3000  $360.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID G090 $4342  $521.04 NO BID NO BID
48 _|INSECT REPELLANT, SKIN, 5 OZ CANS, E/CASE 5 CASES NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4o |WOODEN APPLICATOR BLOCK, LAMBSWOOL PAD 14
INCH 12 EACH NO BID BOARDWALK $1486  $227.76 NOBID PAD SOLD SEPARATE $450 _$54.00 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
51 |WOODEN APPLICATOR BLOCK, LAMBSWOOL PAD 18
INCH 12 EACH NO BID BOARDWALK $1808  $227.78 NO BID PAD SOLD SEPARATE $6.50 $78.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
52 |WAX APPLICATOR, REFILL, LAMBSWOOL PAD. 14INCH | 55 gacy NOBID BOARDWALK ‘ $1105  $208.75 NO BID HANDY KLENZE $2.60 $65.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
58 |VAXAPPLICATOR, REFILL, LAMBSWOOL PAD. 18 INCH | 56 gach NOBID BOARDWALK ‘ $1385  $346.25 NO BID HANDY KLENZE $365 $91.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
51 |VACUUM BAGS CLEAN MAX PRO (CMPS-QD) 12 PER
[CASE OR EQUAL 20 CASES NOBID CLEAN MAX PRO $1075  $215.00 NO BID CLEAN MAX $1090 _$218.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 _[WASTE BASKETS, 28-1/8 QT BLACK 12/CASE 4CASES CONTINENTAL $3456  $13824 MPACT $58.00 232,00 NO BID J NO BID FG295600 BLA $46.80  $187.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
56_[BROOM-HEAVY, PALMYRA FIBER, 24 INCH 12 EACH BOARDWALK $8.78  $10535 NOBID NO BID $820  $98.80 2040041 RUB 51690 $202.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
57 [BROOM-FINEIMEDIUM, 24 INCH
12 EACH BOARDWALK $1198  $14376 NORSHEL $1350  $162.00 NO BID $8.40  $10080 204000 RUB $18.70 $224.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 [SCRUB BRUSH, MEDIUMISTIFF W/2 THREADED HANDLE
[HOLES 24 EACH BOARDWALK 3449 $107.76 NOBID NOBID $298  $7L52 FGG33700 BLUE $615  $147.60 NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID
5o [TOILET SEAT COVER DISPENSER, HALF FOLD, HOSPITAL SPECIALTIES SOLD 2
[RESTASSURED, WHITE 10 PERS. CS. OR EQUAL 2CASES NO BID IMPACT $66.00  $132.00 NO BID PER PACK $52.50/10 _$105.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
oo [TRASH CAN, RUBBERMAID, 44 GAL, #2643-G WITH LID ‘
[#2645-G 12 EACH NO BID IMPACT $48.00 _ $576.00 NO BID CONTINENTAL $4050  $486.00 F6264560 GRAY/F626V360 GRAY $3325  $399.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
51 [FANJAMAR ELECTRONIC TOWEL CABINET
|(#SAN-T1300TBK) BLACK PEARL OR EQUAL 15 EACH NO BID SAN JAMAR $11800  $1770.00 NOBID NITTANY $86.30  $1204.50 NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
A — ‘
100 EACH NO BID MaM $1.27  $127.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
63 |BROOM HANDLES, 60 INCH W/IMETAL-TIP 72 EACH BOARDWALK $3.04  $218.88 WORLD & MAIN $7.50  $540.00 NO BID $2.84  $204.48 F6635700BLA $3.55 _ $255.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
64_|[BROOM, STREET, 16 INCH WITH HANDLE 12EACH NO BID NORSHEL $1090  $130.80 NOBID ] $1145  $137.40 FGIB2200BRN $950 $114.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
65 [BRUSHES, TOILET BRISTLE
100 EACH RUBBERMAID $104  $194.00 ESSENDANT 5285 $285.00 NO BID $136  $136.00 FGE31000WHT $100  $10000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 [BUCKETS, 10 QT, WHANDLE 24 EACH CONTINENTAL 3444 $10656 IMPACT $6.75  $285.00 NO BID $5.98  $14352 D $3.35  $80.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
67 VACUUM BAG "MM" FOR EUREKA, #60295C-6 OR EQUAL
3 CASES NOBID Mam $2.10/EA; $75.60/CASE ~ $226.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID
g6 |FLOOR & CARPET SWEEPER, (LOW PILE CARPET) MOTOR
[FREE 12 EACH $3108  $38376 RUBBERMAID $56.00  $672.00 NO BID CONTINENTAL $54.30  $651.00 FG421288BLA $40.55  $486.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
g9 |DISPENSERS ROLL TOWEL PULL-N-TEAR TOUCH FREE
[OR EQUAL 12 EACH NO BID SANITAIRE $11800  $1416.00 NO BID NITTANY PC-0563 $55.00  $660.00 NO BID NO BID JANICO $100.33  $1203.96 NO BID NO BID
70 |DUSTERS, SWIFFER DUSTER STARTER KIT, #PGC 40509
|OR EQUAL 50 EACH NO BID PROCTOR GAMBLE $8.98  $449.00 NOBID P&G 12ICASE $3230  $1615.00 NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID




71 _|DUSTERS, EXTENSION, 70" 36 EACH BOARDWALK $7.08  $254.88 OCEDAR $995  $358.20 NO BID $580  $208.80 FGT110006K00 $848  $30528 NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID
72 [DISPENSER, BLEND BUDDY FOR ENVIROX
|CONCENTRATE #ENV-8-252-117 NO SUBSTITUTIONS

12 EACH NO BID ENVIROX $12000 _$1440.00 NO BID $11500  $1380.00 NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID

73 |DISPENSER - TOILET TISSUE, STANDARD 2 ROLL, DARK

[TRANS 30 EACH NO BID NITTANY PAPER $26.00 _$780.00 NO BID JANICO 2110 $17.70  $531.00 NOBID NO BID JANICO $40.00 _$1.20000 NOBID NOBID
74_|RECEPTACLE, SANITARY NAPKIN 12 EACH HOSPECO $37.79  $453.48 IMPACT $1310  $157.20 NO BID HANDY KLENZE | $17.85  $214.20 FG614000WH7 RUB $18.18  $218.16 NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID
75 |WAXED SANITARY LINER FOR SANITARY RECEP.

[7.5"X3"X10" 5001CS 24 CASES HOSPECO $1578  $378.72 SHEPPARD $1690  $40560 NO BID SANISAC $2120  $508.80 FG6141000000 RUB 250 IN CASE $1405 $337.20 NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID
76 |DISPOSABLE TOILET SEAT COVERS, PAPER, 250/PKG, 20

[PKGS/CASE 50 CASES BOARDWALK $3241  $162050 IMPACT $31.80 _ §1500.00 NO BID CRYSTAL $3170  $1585.00 NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID
77_|DUST MOP FRAME, 36" X 5" 24 EACH BOARDWALK $4.76  $114.72 NORSHEL $5.35  $128.40 NO BID [ $4.15  $99.60 FGM255000000 $365 $87.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
78_|MATS, WALKOFF, 3 FT X 5 FT, COLOR: GRAY 12 EACH GUARDIAN $5248  $629.76 M&A $3300  $396.00 NO BID AMERICO | $4660 _$550.20 NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
79 _|MATS, WALKOFF, 4 FT X 6 FT, COLOR: GRAY 12 EACH GUARDIAN $6648  $797.76 M&A $5200  $624.00 NO BID AMERICO J $67.79  $813.48 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
81_|DUST MOP FRAME, 24" X 5" 24 EACH BOARDWALK $338  $81.12 NORSHEL $395  $94.80 NO BID 5299  S71.76 $245  $58.80 NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID
82 [MOP HANDLE, 60 INCH, WING NUT 72 EACH BOARDWALK $628  $452.16 NO BID TRIPLES #37694 $6.18 $444.96 HANDY KLENZE $552  $397.44 FGM116000000 $8.10  $583.20 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
83_|DUST MOP DISPOSABLE HEAD, 36" X 5~ 72 EACH BOARDWALK $638 45036 NORSHEL $5.75  $414.00 TRIPLES #37514 $500  $366.48 HANDY KLENZE | $496  $357.12 FGL2550000H00 $400  $288.00 NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID
84_|DUST MOP DISPOSABLE HEAD, 24X5" 72 EACH BOARDWALK 8456 $328.32 OCEDAR $410  $20520 TRIPLES #37512 $381 $274.32 ACS $357 _ $257.00 FGL25300WHOO $315 $226.80 NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID
85_[FLOOR SQUEEGEE, CURVED DUAL EDGE, 18 INCH 6 EACH NOBID NO BID NO BID J NO BID FGYC3400BLA $1180 $7080 NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID
86 [DUST MOP DISPOSABLE HEAD, 18" X 5" 48 EACH BOARDWALK $4.38  $21024 NORSHEL $285  $136.80 TRIPLES #37571 $2.99  $14352 $275  $132.00 NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID
87 _|DUST MOP FRAME, 18"X5" 24 EACH BOARDWALK $3.56  $85.44 NORSHEL $3.10  $74.40 NO BID $2.60  $62.40 $210 $50.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
83_[OIL DRY, 40 OR 50LB BAGS, LBS/BAG 208AGS | MOLTON-25 LB BAGS $2694  $538.80 ABSORB-50LB $12.90/50LB BAG _$258.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID
89 [PADS, BUFFING/POLISHING, 16 INCH. RED. S/CASE 10 CASES BOARDWALK $1138  $56.90 TRELEONI $9.90/CASE __$99.00 AMERICO #404416 $939  $93.90 NO BID 3M5100-16 $2120  $212.00 NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID
9 [PADS, BLACK, SCRUBBING, 16 INCH, THICK LINE, S/CASE

5 CASES BOARDWALK $1138  $56.90 TRELEONI $9.90/CASE __$49.50 AMERICO #400116 $930  $46.95 NO BID 3M7200-16 $21.80 $100.00 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID
91_[DUST PANS, METAL 24 EACH BOARDWALK $656  $157.44 IMPACT#6 $4.99 511976 NO BID JANICO $383 $91.92 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
92 |PADS, WHITE POLISH, 20 INCH, SICASE 15 CASES AcCs $1046  $261.50 TRELEONI $13.10  $196.50 AMERICO #401220 $1345  $201.75 $14.95  $224.25 3M 4100-20 $30.40  $456.00 NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID
93 |PADS, BUFFING, SCOTCH BRITE RED, 20 INCH, SICASE

10 CASES Acs $1046  $104.60 TRELEONI $1310  $131.00 AMERICO #404420 §$1345 $134.50 $1495  $149.50 3M5100-20 $30.40 _$304.00 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID
94 |PADS, BLACK, SCRUBBING, 20 INCH, 5/CASE 25 CASES ACS $10.46  $261.50 TRELEONI $13.10  $327.50 AMERICO #400120 $1345  $336.25 $14.95 $373.75 3M 7200-20 $31.25  $781.25 NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID
95 |PADS, WHITE POLISH, 16 INCH, S/CASE 25 CASES BOARDWALK [ $11.38  $284.50 TRELEONI $13.10  $327.50 AMERICO #401216 $9.39  $234.75 NO BID 3M 4100-16 $21.20 $530.00 NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID
9 [SQUEEGEE REFILL RUBBER, WICHANNEL, 18 INCH

24 EACH UNGER $280  $67.20 NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
97 |RAGS, TERRI, WHITE 50LB CASE $25.50125 LB CASE $153.006125L8 BA]

6 CASES HOSPECO $10216  $612.96 RAGS-GCS 25LB NO BID ALPHA SOURCE $5070 $358.20 NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID
98_[WINDOW SQUEEGEE HANDLE 12 EACH $858  $102.96 [ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
99 [SQUEEGEE REFILL RUBBER, WICHANNEL, 12 INCH ‘

24 EACH UNGER $216  $51.84 NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID
100 |HANDLE DUST MOP, 60 INCH 12 EACH BOARDWALK $960  §11544 CAROLINA $425 5100 NO BID $6.17 $74.04 FGM13600000 $9.40 $112.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
101_[DIXIE #302 PAPER CUPS, 707, 2500/CASE 6 CASES NO BID [ NO BID NO BID DA-Y7 TRANSLUCENT $49.80 $298.80 NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID
102 [DIXIE #701 PAPER CUPS, 30Z, S000/CASE ‘

6 CASES NO BID NOBID NO BID DA-Y35 TRANSLUCENT 2500/CASE $52.00  $312.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
103 [ROLL TOWELS, SCOTT #414 PRE-EMBOSSED Wi 2" CORE MARCAL-8x11 sheets|

100 CASES MARCAL 4800 LF $3272  $3272.00 NITTANY PAPER $17.50-80/CASE ~ $1750.00 VONDREHLE#4100 $2622  $2622.00 NITTANY 4800 $17.98  $1798.00 NO BID NO BID 85 sheetsiroll $20.00 _$2.000.00 NOBID NOBID
104_|URINAL SANI-SCREEN 240 EACH HOSPECO $073  $175.20 IMPACT $110  $264.00 NO BID FRESH-MANGO SOLD 10 PER BOX $188  $457.20 NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID
105 _|[URINAL MAT, WASHROOM, WIFRAGRANCE 6/CS 12 CASES BOARDWALK | $3324  $308.88 ASPIRE $3195  $383.40 NO BID FRESH $4355  $522.60 NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID
106_[DELUX-WAX COTE, 1 GAL, 6/CASE 12 CASES [ NOBID SIMONIZE $324.00-54.00/GAL __$3888.00 NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
107 [BLASS & HARD SURFACE DISOLVABLE CONCENTRATE

[PODICAPSULES 1 QUART YIELD/POD
25 BOXES AQUA CHEM $1646  $41150 NOBID NO BID AQUA CHEM 80/TUB $49.88  $1247.00 NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
108 |[FLEXIBLE AIR FRESHENER-FRESH PRODUCTS HANG TAG|
IMANGO PARTAHT-F-0121072M-04 12/CS
36 CASES NOBID NO BID NO BID FRESH $17.66  $635.76 NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID
[QUART CONTAINERS WITH SPRAY TRIGGER FOR GLASS
109 |& HARD SURFACE DISOLVALE POD WITH
[RIGHT-TO-KNOW INFO ON CONTAINER 36 EA. CONT. NO BID NO BID NO BID AQUA CHEM SOLD PER 12/CASE $2.30  $82.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
20 [FLOCKCLINED RUBBER GLOVES, 12" LENGTH ‘
[W/EMBOSSED NON-SLIP GRIP, EXTRA LARGE 4 CASES NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
111 [BLOVES EXAM, NITRILE POWDER FREE, 100/B0X, 10 TRADEX OR NETAVILE (VINYL NOT ‘ [AURELIA-M, L, XL-NPFG-E
[BXICS, AMBITEX OR EQUAL MED/LGJXLG, 72 CASES NO BID NO BID NO BID NITRILE) $69.99  $5039.28 NOBID upc $168.00  $12,096.00 NO BID MFR SUPERMAX $298.00 _$21.456.00 NOBID
112 |HOT DRINK CUPS 8 0Z 8 CASES $3638  $291.04 NO BID NO BID 818 $2598  $207.84 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID
113 [DISH DETERGENT 1QT. 8 CASES NO BID CASCADE $1225  $98.00 NO BID JOY DISH 8/38 07 $42.60 _$340.80 NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID
114 3M BRAND SCRUBBER SPONGES, 20/B0X 4 CASES $507  $20.28 NO BID NOBID $12.98  $51.92 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID
115 |ROLL TOWEL WHITE #6820 NORTH RIVER OR EQUAL 2"
ICORE, 8"XB00FT 6 ROLLS TO CASE 300 CASES MARCAL $17.88  $5364.00 NITTANY PAPER $2175  $6525.00 VONDREHLE-880-8 $2634  $7.902.00 NITTANY - NP 6800EW $2130  $6390.00 NOBID NOBID MORCON $17.70  $5310.00 NOBID MARCAL $1877  $5,631.00
116 |[CEORGIA PACIFIC WHITE ROLL #63460 OR EQUAL
"X40" 60 CASES GEORGIA PACIFIC $46.11  $2766.60 NITTANY PAPER $44.00  $2640.00 NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID NITTANY 54000 §2400.00 NOBID VONDREHLE $58.00  $3.480.00
117 SEORGIA PACIFIC BROWN TOWEL OR EQUAL #9440
/8.25"X700 SKID OF 55 TORK-290088 (DISPENSERS NO

120 CASES | GEORGIA PACIFIC $4362  $5234.40 NITTANY PAPER 1750 $210000 NO BID CHARGE) $4160 $4992.00 NO BID NOBID GEORGIA PACIFIC | $62.00 _$7.440.00 NO BID NO BID
118 WET MOP HEAD (NO LINT) MED. NONWOVEN LOOP

48 CASES NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID FGT200006WHOO $815 $391.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
119_|LOBBY BROOM AND DUST PAN COMBO 12 EACH NO BID IMPACT [ $1875  $225.00 NO BID IMP-2601/67 $11.00  $132.00 FG253100BLA & FG637400 BLA $1065 $127.80 NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID
120 |VASTE CONTAINER, ROUND, BEIGE APPROXIMATELY 22

lGAL 12 EACH NO BID IMPACT $1895  $227.40 NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
121 |ROUND SWING TOP LID, BEIGE FOR BID #127 12 EACH NO BID BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
122 |RECYCLING CONTAINER, RECTANGULAR BLUE,

|APPROXIMATELY 23 GAL. 12 EACH RUBBERMAID $3034  $364.08 IMPACT $20.80  $357.60 NO BID CONTINENTAL $25.60 _$307.20 FG354007BLUE $24.55 $294.60 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
123 [BOTTLE & CAN RECYCLING TOP FOR BID#129 12 EACH RUBBERMAID $2544  $305.26 NO BID NO BID CONTINENTAL $12.40  $19880 2018258 $29.60 _$355.20 NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID
124 |[PLASTIC WET MOP BUCKET W/WHEELS AND WRINGER,

[YELLOW, 26 QT. CAPACITY 12 EACH CONTINENTAL $33.84 $406.08 NO BID NO BID JANICO $4260  $511.20 $4960_$505.20 NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID
125 |STANDARD MICROFIBER CLOTH 12" 200 POUNDS NO BID M-FIBER 16X18 $12.96 PER DOZEN NO BID SOLD PER DZ 16X16 $8.52/DZ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
126 [TORK SOAP 401211 EXTRA MILD FOAN 6/1L PER CASE

40 CASES NO BID NO BID NOBID $63.00  $2520.00 NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID

127 |TORK DISPENSER 571600 FOAM AUTOMATIC WHITE NO CHARGE WITH SOAP SANITIZER

cAsE 60 CASES NO BID NO BID NO BID PURCHASE NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID
126 [TORK SANITIZER FOAM 400216 WI72% ALCOHOL 6-950ML SUBJECT TO AVAILABILITY DUE TO

[PER CASE 8 CASES NO BID NO BID NO BID covip $88.00  $5280.00 NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID
120 |TORK HAND SANITIZER STAND BLACK 7570038 NO

[SUBSTITUTIONS 12 CASES NO BID NO BID NOBID $75.00 $900.00 NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID
120 |FASTORAW W DISPENSER SINGLE ¥BET-91043 NO

[SUBSTITUTIONS 12 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID $110.00  $1320.00 NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID
131 [PH7Q ULTRA DISINFECTANT #BET-35547 4/CASE NO

[SUBSTITUTIONS 36 CASES NO BID NO BID NO BID $121.00 $4356.00 NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID
132 |PISINFECTANT WIPES MONK OR EQUAL 80 WIPES PER

[CONTAINER 6/CASE 48 CASES NO BID FLEX $23.90/CASE _$1147.20 NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID SANI $70.00 _$3360 NOBID NOBID

[Variations: (if any) PLEASE SEE ATTACHED NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE

1 day stock; up to 10 days
IARO 3-5DAYS 7-10 DAYS 5DAYS 10TO 14 DAYS 3.5 DAYS 3-5 DAYS 14 BUSINESS DAYS
[Start up date: _Date of Award
il you extend your prices to local government YES NO YES NO YES YES NO YES YES

lentities within the County

[This is a two (2) year contract from the date of award.

Bid sent to: [TheoChem Llaboratories, Bid Desk Analytics, Prime Vendor, Tgch Zone Visual, Bidret, ASP, LLC, Deltek, School Supplies, Rualmax Supplies, Inkjet, Alan Enjvironmental Products, Stalwar} Medical Supplies.

Based upon the bids received, | r lamden Bag |& Paper Co, LLC, be awarded Item # 1, 5, 8, 17, 19} 20, 21, 23, 25, 26, 52/ 53, 56, 57, 58, 59, 61, 63, 69, 71,[72, 73, 76, 82, 86, 91, 97, 101, 102, 108, 109, 112, 123, 125, 126, 127, 128, 129, 130 anjd 131 as the lowest r r bidder.

Based upon the bids received, | r General Chenical & Supply, Inc. b¢ awarded Item # 2, 9, 11, 12,22, 24, 27, 28, 30, 34,[36, 37, 38, 49, 51, 54, 62, 67, 70, ¥4, 78, 79, 88, 100, 103, 105, 106, 113, 117, 120, and 182 as the lowest r r bidder.

[Based upon the bids received, It B. Mason Gompany, Inc., be awgrded Items # 7, 10, 14, 15, 1§, 31, 33, 55, 68, 75, 92| 93, 94, 96, 98, 99, 104, 107, 114] 116 and 124 as th lowest responsive Hidder.

Based upon the bids received, | r Spruce Indusjries, be awarded Itenps # 13, 89, 90 and 95 as the |owest responsive bidder.

Based upon the bids received, | r ooper Friedinan, be awarded Iten]s # 60, 64, 65, 66, 77, 81, 83,}84, 85, 118, 119, and 22 as the lowest r regponsive bidder.

[Based upon the bids received, I 1 Unipak be awprded Item # 111 as the lowest resp. bidder.




[Based upon the bids received, It

United Sales pe awarded Items #3[ 4, 6, 16, 29, 32, 35, and 115 fs the lowest r

bidder.

[Sincerely. |Kimberly Larter. QPA [
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