
PD-20-054 Supply and Delivery of Electrical Parts
And supplies for the County of Gloucester, and existing
Units within the County as allowed through the County
Contract Purchasing System Numbers CK-01-GC and
16GLCP

Vendor: Graybar Electric Co., Inc. Vendor: Cooper Friedman
  800 Huyler Street Electric Supply Co., Inc.
  Teterboro, NJ 07608 1 Matrix Drive
  (201) 596-2619 Monroe, NJ 08831
  (201) 596-2653 (908) 296-7441 – (732) 308-4605-Fax
   Kyle Koch, Director of Finance Tania Rodriguez, Government Solutions

Mgr

ITEM      DESCRIPTION                 EST. QTY.    GRAYBAR COOPER-FRIEDMAN

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

001              CUTLER-HAMMER PART# C0100E3A SERIES A1 
             INDUSTRIAL CONTROL TRANSFORMER
             (208V PRIMARY 120V SECONDARY)   20        NO BID $144.61

002 BOX – JUNCTION #2100 RACO 257 4 11/16”   50          $23.40 $1.60
                 

003 BOX – JUNCTION 1900 RACO 192       100     $2.25 $.73

004 EXTENSION BOX 1900 RACO       100     $2.31 $1.27

005 BOX RACO #570RAC (2-3/4” DEEP ARMORED CABLE      50     $3.33 $1.89

                  BOX SQUARE FOR STEEL STUD 4”x1.5”

006       BOX-LOC (RACO 227) OR EQUAL   50        NO BID $2.83

                          BOX SQUARE FOR STEEL STUD 4”x2-1/8”

007      BOX-LOC (RACO 238) OR EQUAL                                 50           NO BID $3.54



008 BELL BOX WP 2 GANG W/3 1 ½” THREADED OUTLETS   50     $6.70 $5.06

009 BELL BOX WP 2 GANG W/4 1 ½” THREADED OUTLETS       50     $7.23 $6.20

010 BELL BOX WP 2 GANG W/5 1 ½” THREADED OUTLETS       50     $7.85 $6.08

011 BELL BOX WP 2 GANG W/7 1 ½” THREADED OUTLETS      50     $9.43 $8.57

012 RACO 686 3G BOX 2-1/2 DP ½-3/4K FMBKT   50          NO BID $13.84

013 RACO 5320-0 WP BOX 1G 3 (1/2 OUTLETS) GRY   50     $2.84 $2.35

014 RACO 232 4SQ 2-1/8D BOX COMB KO   50     $19.45 $1.15

015 GALV SC ENCL W/O KO 12X12X8   10     $27.25 $24.00

016 CONNECTORS – ½” EMT COMPRESSION TYPE 200           $.25                                   $.26

017 CONNECTORS – ¾” EMT COMPRESSION TYPE          200           $.44 $.35

018 CONNECTORS – 1” EMT COMPRESSION TYPE 200           $.69        $.56

019 CONNECTORS – ½” LIQUID TIGHT 90º METALLIC             200           $2.51 $1.46

020 CONNECTORS – ¾” LIQUID TIGHT 90º METALLIC             200           $3.67 $2.20

021 CONNECTORS – 1” LIQUID TIGHT 90º METALLIC             200           $7.18 $4.39

CONNECTORS – ½” STRAIGHT LIQUID TIGHT
022 FOR FLEX CONDUIT METALLIC 200           $1.56 $.98

CONNECTORS – ¾” STRAIGHT LIQUID TIGHT
023 FOR FLEX CONDUIT METALLIC 200        $2.16 $1.33

CONNECTORS – 1” STRAIGHT LIQUID TIGHT



024 FOR FLEX CONDUIT METALLIC 200        $3.28 $1.93

025 CONNECTORS – ½” EMT W/SET SCREW TYPE 200        $.09 $.12

026 CONNECTORS – ¾” EMT W/SET SCREW TYPE 200        $.15 $.17

CONNECTORS – 1” EMT W/SET SCREW TYPE
027 ARL 802 MUST BE EQUAL 200 $.25 $.33

DUPLEX CONNECTOR 3/8” SINGLE SCREW
TYPE FOR FLEX/AC & MC CABLE ZINC 

028 ARLINGTON#846 MUST BE EQUAL 200 $.65 $1.14

             CONNECTORS ½” SQUEEZE TYPE FOR FLEX/BX
029 AND MC CABLE                  200      $.49 $.40

CONNECTORS ¾” SQUEEZE TYPE FOR FLEX/BX
030 AND MC CABLE                  200      $.19 $.71

CONNECTORS 1” SQUEEZE TYPE FOR FLEX/BX
031 AND MC CABLE                  200      $.49 $1.32

032 CONNECTORS – 1/2” ROMEX 200 $.19 $.16

ARLINGTON NM 94 PLASTIC ROMEX CONN
033       SNAP IN ½” 200 $.13 $.12

ARLINGTON NM 96 PLASTIC ROMEX CONN
034       SNAP IN ¾”      200 $.26 $.24

ARLINGTON NM 96 PLASTIC ROMEX CONN
035       SNAP IN 1” 200 $.26 $.24

036 3M B/G+POUCH (B/G+BOX) BLUE/GRAY CONN 200 $26.89 per box of 100 $13.50/BOX

3/8” 90º FLEX AC/MC SQUEEZE CONNECTOR,



037 UNINSULATED 200 NO BID $.40

½” 90º FLEX AC/MC SQUEEZE CONNECTOR,

038 UNINSULATED 200 NO BID $.62

¾” 90º FLEX AC/MC SQUEEZE CONNECTOR,

039 UNINSULATED 200 NO BID $1.62

040 CLOSURE PLUG ½” NPT, RACO 5269-0      200 NO BID $1.36/BAG (4 IN)

041 BELL WP COVER 2 GANG RACO 5175-0 100 $1.40 $1.20

042 BELL WP COVER 1 GANG RACO 5173-0  100 $1.49     $.71

043 COVER 2 GANG 1900 BOX                                                  20       $.39 $.45

044 4-11/16” SQUARE COVER W/1/2” KO 100     $.88 $.78

045 RACO 5173-0 WP COVER 1G VERT DM BLANK GRY 100 $.68 $.78

046       CRS TP568 4-11/16SQ FLT BLANK CVR 100 $.44 $1.16

047      MULB 11402 4IN SQ ½ RSD 1DPLX CVR 100 $1.13 $1.92

048       MULB 11411 4IN SQ ½ RSD 2DPLX CVR 100 $1.25 $.33 – CRS6615

049 MUL 11502 4-11/16 SQ RAISED DUP COVER 100 $2.85              $.27–CRS6605

050 MUL 11522 4-11/16 SQ SURFACE COVER RAISED ½” 100  $2.41 $1.92

051 COUPLING ¾” EMT COMPRESSION TYPE                50        $.29 $.33

052 COUPLING ½” EMT COMPRESSION TYPE                          100        $.21   $.27

053 COUPLING 1” EMT COMPRESSION TYPE             100        $.43 $.54



COUPLING ½” HEAVY WALL THREADED FOR

054 RIGID CONDUIT             100        $2.15 $.95-012GC

COUPLING ¾” HEAVY WALL THREADED FOR
055 RIGID CONDUIT             100        $2.57 $1.13-O34GC

COUPLING 1” HEAVY WALL THREADED FOR
056 RIGID CONDUIT             100        $3.88 $2.07-100GC
             
057 PLATE – 1900 SINGLE RECEPT. IVORY                                 200        NO BID $2.07

PLATES – 2 GANG 1 TOGGLE DUPLEX
058 IVORY  50         NO BID $.81

059 PLATES – 2100 BLANK IVORY                                      100         NO BID $1.20

060 PLATE-BELL BLANK 1 – GANG, # 240-AL                        100         $.69 $.71

061 PLATE-BELL BLANK 2 – GANG, # 240-2AL                        100         $1.69 $1.20-84852

PLATES – BLANK DOUBLE RECEPTACLE             
062 IVORY             50       $.85 $.83-Mulberry-99102

063 PLATE – 1 GANG DUPLEX, MAXI IVORY                          100      NO BID $.58

064 PLATES – 1 GANG DUPLEX, IVORY, METAL                     100      NO BID $.40

065 PLATES – 1 GANG BLANK, IVORY                        100     NO BID $.40

066 PLATES – 1 GANG TOGGLE, IVORY                        100     NO BID $.40

067 PLATES – 1900 DUPLEX, SINGLE IVORY            100   NO BID $2.07

068 PLATES – 1900 RECEPT, 2 GANG            100 $.79 $.78-11403



069 PLATES – 1900 BLANK W/KO, 4” SQ                         100 $.36 $.31-11203

070 PLATES – OCTAGON BLANK            100 $.29 $.30-11101

071 PLATE – DOUBLE SWITCH, IVORY MAXI            100 NO BID $.84

072 PLATE – SINGLE RECEPT. 1 GANG IVORY
STEEL            100 NO BID $.58

073 PLATES – 2 GANG DUPLEX REC.                   
IVORY, STEEL 100 NO BID $.84

     PLATE 1900 SINGLE SWITCH COVER
074              (STEEL-CITY RS9 4” SQ.)    100 NO BID $.78

RECEPTACLE – GFI DUPLEX 
075 20 AMP, IVORY 150 NO BID $12.12

076 DUPLEX RECEPTACLE 15 AMP, IVORY 100 NO BID $.85

RECEPTACLE – DUPLEX 20 AMP
077 125 VOLTS, IVORY           200 NO BID $.88

IVORY RECP L5-30R 30A/125V 2P3W
078      W/GRND             200 NO BID $14.06

        RECEPTACLE 20AMP SINGLE 3-WIRE
079                     GROUNDING TYPE IVORY                                                  30 NO BID $2.48

CWD 1258-SP 50A 4W FLUSH RANGE RECEPT
080     125/250V NEMA 14-50R   200 NO BID $8.40

RECEPTACLE – GFCI DUPLEX WEATHER RESISTANT
081      20A 125VAC 60HZ (WHITE)   200 NO BID $13.94



082 P&S WR20-TRI 20A 125V RCPT   200 NO BID $5.14

    SINGLE GANG CLEAR PLASTIC IN-USE COVER 2-3/4”

083     DEPTH FOR DAMP/WET LOCATIONS   150 NO BID $5.41

WIREMOLD WIRV20GB306TR V20GB306TR TAMPER
084 RESIST WH20GB 30GTR 3’ STEEL   200  $44.10 $41.66

      WIREMOLD WIRV20GB506TR V20GB506TR TAMPER
085 RESIST WH20GB 50GTR 5’ STEEL   200 $67.55 $64.03

086       WIREMOLD V20GB606TR 6FT PLUGMOLD IVORY   200 $75.73 $71.65

       WIREMOLD ‘W – MOLD V2010A3 ENTRANCE END
087 FITTING     75 $13.64 $12.86

088 WIREMOLD WM V700 10FT STL RACEWAY-P/FT-IVORY     75 $11.60 $11.00/per 10’

089 WIREMOLD WM V500 10FT STL RACEWAY-P/FT-IVORY     75 $10.04 $9.60/per 10’

090 WIREMOLD BOX – V5741 SHALLOW SW. & REC.            50     $6.90 $6.51

091  WIREMOLD V5752 2 GANG ALARM BOX, IVORY     50     $10.63 $10.03

WIREMOLD V5751 A EXTENSTION ADAPTER,
092 1 GANG, IVORY     50     $5.85 $5.51

093 WIREMOLD 5781 ½” BOX CONNECTOR GALVANIZED          50     $2.80 $2.64

WIREMOLD V517 V500 90º INTERNAL ELBOX,

094 STEEL, IVORY     50     $1.88 $1.77

095 WIREMOLD V511 90º FLAT ELBOW, IVORY     50     $1.51 $1.43

096 WIREMOLD 502 500 SERIES, BUSHING     50     $.25 $.23



097 WIREMOLD 702 700 SERIES, BUSHING     50     $.33 $.30

098 WIREMOLD V5703 500/700 SUPPORT CLIP, IVORY, STEEL  100     $.43 $.40

099 WIREMOLD V5715 TEE FITTING, IVORY     50     $3.64 $3.43

100 WIREMOLD V504 STEEL STRAP 500, IVORY   100     $.28 $.25

101 WIREMOLD V704 STEEL STRAP 700, IVORY   100     $.43 $.40

WIREMOLD V5748 SWITCH & RECEPTACLE BOX
102 1 ¾” DEEP, IVORY     50     $6.55 $6.18

WIREMOLD V5741 SWITCH & RECEPTACLE BOX
103 1 3/8” DEEP IVORY     50     $6.90 $6.51

WIREMOLD V5751-2 EXTENSION ADAPTER,
104 2 GANG, IVORY     50     $11.43 $9.92

WIREMOLD V5747-2 SHALLOW SWITCH & RECEPTACLE
105 BOX, 2 GANG, 1 3/8” DEEP, IVORY     50     $13.62 $9.92

WIREMOLD V5744-2 DEEP SWITCH & RECEPTACTLE
106 BOX, 2 GANG, IVORY, 2 ¾” DEEP     50     $25.60 $18.48

107 DUCT SEAL – ELECT. PUTTY, 5 LB BLOCKS     15     $14.66 $9.68 -IDEAL31-605
    

108                  CONDUIT – FLEXIBLE ¾” LIQUID TIGHT NON METALLIC 100     $1.54 $.66 -CARLON-15007

109                CONDUIT – FLEXIBLE 1” LIQUID TIGHT NON METALLIC  100     $1.79 $1.01 -CARLON-15008

110 CONDUIT LIQUID TIGHT FLEXIBLE ½” NON METALLIC    100     $.77 $.39 -CARLON-15005

111 CONDUIT FLEXIBLE ½” LIQUID TIGHT METALLIC   100     $1.46 $.82 -012VA
    



112 CONDUIT FLEXIBLE ¾” LIQUID TIGHT METALLIC   100     $1.99 $1.12 -034VA

113 CONDUIT FLEXIBLE 1” LIQUID TIGHT METALLIC   100     $3.58 $1.98 -100VA

114 CONDUIT GREENFIELD FLEXIBLE STEEL ½”    100    $.77 $.42 -012GF

115 CONDUIT GREENFIELD FLEXIBLE STEEL ¾”    100    $1.05 $.56 -034GF

116 CONDUIT GREENFIELD FLEXIBLE STEEL 1”    100    $1.90 $1.03 – 100GF

117 PIPE EMT ½”              1,000’ NO BID $4.20/PER 10’

118 PIPE EMT 1”              500’ NO BID $12.80/PER 10’

119 PIPE EMT ¾”                                         1,000’ NO BID $7.40/PER 10’

120 ½” STL SET SCREW EMT COUPLING    150 $.12 $.14

121       ¾” STL SET SCREW EMT COUPLING    150 $.18 $.18  CRS-461

122       1” STL SET SCREW EMT COUPLING    150 $.28 $.32

123       ½” EMT CONDUIT HANGER    200 $.19 $.24-ERICO CDOB

124       ¾” EMT CONDUIT HANGER    200 $.21 $.26

125       1” EMT CONDUIT HANGER    200 $.29 $.34

126 IDEAL 31-340 6500FT 200LB PULL LINE                            10 $44.32 $28.29

127 ARL SG38 3/8 SADDLE GRIP                  30 $.54 $.49

128 IDEAL 1 GAL. WIRE PULLING LUBRICANT                   5 $26.55 $16.10 – 31-371

129 STRAPS 3/8” ONE HOLE FOR MC CABLE                   200  $.05 $.05 – CRS567BX



130 PLUG – MALE 15 AMP, BRYANT 5266-N                   75 $15.34 $4.32-PAS-P55266-X

131 PLUG-MALE 20 AMP, NEMA 5-15P     75 $23.23 $10.85-P55-366-X

132 PLUG – FEMALE 15 AMP, BRYANT 5269-N           75 $30.72 $7.80-P55-269-X

133 PLUG – FEMALE 20 AMP, NEMA 5-15P     75        $40.30 $17.79-P55269-X

134 SWITCH – 1 POLE 20 AMP, IVORY                    20 $3.26 $1.71-CSO20I

135 SWITCH – 3 WAY 20 AMP, IVORY                     20 $4.25 $2.68-C520AC3-I

136 SWITCH – 2 POLE 20 AMP, TOGGLE IVORY    20 NO BID $5.20

137 SENSOR SWITCH MODEL# WSD IV OR EQUAL          30     NO BID $33.32

138 SWITCH TIMER T101, 24 HOURS           50        NO BID $44.96

MECHANICAL TIME SWITCH INTERMATIC
                    MODEL# T104P 208-277V AC 60HZ DOUBLE             
139        POLE SINGLE THROW 40AMP    12     NO BID $79.12

140 TAPE – GREEN MARKING, ½” X 20’         10 NO BID $1.31

141 TAPE - ELECT. SCOTCH 88, ¾” X 66’ BLACK                        100        NO BID $5.04

142 TAPE-WHITE ELEC., ½” X 20’                 10        NO BID $1.31

143 3M 1700C-BLUE 3/4X66FT VIN CODE TAPE    10 NO BID $.86

144      3M 1700C-RED 3/4X66FT VIN CODE TAPE   10 NO BID $.86

3M R/Y BULK PLUS RED/YELLOW CONN
145     (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)                      2,000 NO BID $40.00/CONTAINER

500 IN CONTAINER

146 WIRE MARKERS, 1 THRU 10                                         20 NO BID $2.44



147                 WIRE NUTS – BLUE FOR # 8 WIRE                            2,000         NO BID $8.25/PACK25
 
148                  WIRE NUTS – GREEN FOR # 6 WIRE                   2,000         NO BID $17.10/BOX 100

149                    WIRE - #12 GREEN THNN, STRANDED                   2,000         NO BID $63.00/ROLL

150                     WIRENUTS – GRAY SMALL                                    2,000         NO BID $6.40/BOX 100

151                    WIRE NUTS – RED LG.                    1,000         NO BID $13.60/BOX 100

152                   WIRE NUTS – ORANGE SMALL                    2,000         NO BID $8.00/BOX 100

153                   WIRE NUTS – SM. BLUE, 72B                                2,000         NO BID $6.90/BOX 100

154       WIRE NUTS – YELLOW                        2,000 $9.63 per box  $9.00/BOX 100

155       WIRE – 12/2 ROMEX                  500’       $.48 $81.25/COIL-250’

156       WIRE #10 THNN STRANDED (MULTI COLORS)              2,000’      $.27 $96.50/ROLL-500’

157       WIRE #10 THNN SOLID (MULTI COLORS)                     2,000’      $.26 $92.00/ROLL-500’

158       WIRE - #12 THNN STRANDED (MULTI COLORS)            2,000’      $.18 $63.00/ROLL-500’

159       WIRE - #12 THNN SOLID (MULTI COLORS)                      2,000’      $.17 $59.00/ROLL-500’

160 WIC. THHN 1/0 STR GRN MR                      2,000’    NO BID $1.80/FOOT

161 CABLE – 12 – 2 MC                       5,000’    $.57 $100.00/COIL

162 CABLE – 12 – 3 MC                    2,000’    $.99 $171.25/COIL

163 CABLE – 12 – 4 MC         2,000’      $1.40 $241.25/COIL

164 CABLE – TIES 11 ½” PLASTIC, ¼” WIDE                     3,000’    $.04 $5.00/PACK



165 CABLE – 10 – 3 MC ROLL=250 FT                      4,000’    $1.79 $312.50/COIL

166 CABLE – 10 / 2 MC                                4,000’    $1.26 $212.50/COIL

   CABLE CONNECTOR 3/8”MC             
167 TWO SCREW ARLINGTON 8400 OR EQUAL             250   $.97 $.43-BRI 560-DC2
                    
168 14/3 SEOOW/STOOW CORD                                                1000’       $.81 $144.25/COIL

169 6/2/ 8/2 RANGE CORD BLACK 50AMP 4FT LONG          1000’       NO BID $40.00 EA

170 SCHEDULE 40 PVC PIPE ½”               PER 10’  $5.32 $4.51

171 SCHEDULE 40 PVC PIPE 3/4”               PER 10’   $6.40 $5.42

172 SCHEDULE 40 PVC PIPE 1”               PER 10’   $9.30 $7.91

173 SCHEDULE 40 PVC PIPE 1½”               PER 10’    $15.60 $13.20

174 SCHEDULE 40 PVC PIPE 2”          PER 10’  $19.46 $16.47

175 SCHEDULE 40 PVC PIPE 2½”          PER 10’ $30.50 $25.81

176 SCHEDULE 40 PVC PIPE 3”          PER 10’  $37.27 $31.53

177 SCHEDULE 40 PVC PIPE 3½”          PER 10’  $47.30 $40.02

178 SCHEDULE 40 PVC PIPE 4”          PER 10’  $51.39 $43.47

179 SCHEDULE 40 PVC ½” 90° ELBOW              50         $.47 $.38

180      SCHEDULE 40 PVC 3/4” 90° ELBOW                       50    $.52 $.40

181 SCHEDULE 40 PVC 1” 90° ELBOW                50          $.82 $.61



182      SCHEDULE 40 PVC 1½” 90° ELBOW                    50          $1.57 $1.22

183      SCHEDULE 40 PVC 2” 90° ELBOW                   50      $2.15 $1.64

184      SCHEDULE 40 PVC 2½” 90° ELBOW                         50     $3.75 $2.95

185      SCHEDULE 40 PVC 3” 90° ELBOW                    50 $6.63 $4.95

186      SCHEDULE 40 PVC 3½” 90° ELBOW                         50  $9.10 $6.95

187      SCHEDULE 40 PVC 4” 90° ELBOW                         50  $11.38 $9.07

188      LB CONDUIT BODY SCHEDULE 40 PVC ½”                       75  $2.50 $1.75

189      LB CONDUIT BODY SCHEDULE 40 PVC 3/4”          75  $3.21 $2.25

190      LB CONDUIT BODY SCHEDULE 40 PVC 1”                 75  $3.53 $2.46

191      LB CONDUIT BODY SCHEDULE 40 PVC 1½”          75  $6.46 $4.54

192      LB CONDUIT BODY SCHEDULE 40 PVC 2”                      75  11.43 $7.99

193      LB CONDUIT BODY SCHEDULE 40 PVC 2½”          75  $41.49 $29.31

194      LB CONDUIT BODY SCHEDULE 40 PVC 3”                       75  $42.86 $29.86

195      LB CONDUIT BODY SCHEDULE 40 PVC 3½”           75  $44.07 $34.39

196      LB CONDUIT BODY SCHEDULE 40 PVC 4”                       75  $47.01 $34.75

197      SCHEDULE 40 PVC ½” TERM. ADAPTER MNPT      150  $.16 $.12

198      SCHEDULE 40 PVC 3/4” TERM. ADAPTER MNPT                150  $.28 $.20

199      SCHEDULE 40 PVC 1” TERM. ADAPTER MNPT              150    $.36 $.27



200      SCHEDULE 40 PVC 1½” TERM. ADAPTER MNPT              150  $.56 $.42

201      SCHEDULE 40 PVC 2” TERM. ADAPTER  MNPT              150        $.81 $.59

202      SCHEDULE 40 PVC 2½” TERM. ADAPTER MNPT              150  $1.38 $1.02

203      SCHEDULE 40 PVC 3” TERM. ADAPTER  MNPT 150  $2.02 $1.42

204      SCHEDULE 40 PVC 3½” TERM. ADAPTER MNPT 150 $2.61 $1.98

205      SCHEDULE 40 PVC 4” TERM. ADAPTER MNPT 150 $3.47 $2.55

206 SCHEDULE 40 PVC ½” TERM. ADAPTER FNPT 150 $.19 $.14

207      SCHEDULE 40 PVC 3/4” TERM. ADAPTER FNPT 150 $.30 $.22

208      SCHEDULE 40 PVC 1” TERM. ADAPTER FNPT 150 $.41 $.30

209 SCHEDULE 40 PVC 1½” TERM. ADAPTER FNPT 150 $.59 $.43

210 SCHEDULE 40 PVC 2” TERM. ADAPTER FNPT 150 $.80 $.57

211      SCHEDULE 40 PVC 2½” TERM. ADAPTER FNPT 150 $1.79 $1.27

212      SCHEDULE 40 PVC 3” TERM. ADAPTER FNPT 150 $2.23 $1.60

213 SCHEDULE 40 PVC 3½” TERM. ADAPTER FNPT 150 $2.92 $2.14

214      SCHEDULE 40 PVC 4” TERM. ADAPTER FNPT 150 $2.99 $2.16

215 SCHEDULE 40 PVC COUPLING ½” 150 NO BID $.09
 
216 SCHEDULE 40 PVC COUPLING ¾” 150 NO BID $.12

217      SCHEDULE 40 PVC COUPLING 1” 150 NO BID $.17



218       SCHEDULE 40 PVC COUPLING 1 ½” 150 NO BID $.33

219       SCHEDULE 40 PVC COUPLING 1 ¾” 150 NO BID NO BID

220       SCHEDULE 40 PVC COUPLING 2” 150 NO BID $.42

221       SCHEDULE 40 PVC COUPLING 2 ½” 150 NO BID $.76

222       SCHEDULE 40 PVC COUPLING 2 ¾” 150 NO BID NO BID

223       SCHEDULE 40 PVC COUPLING 3” 150 NO BID $1.23

224       SCHEDULE 40 PVC COUPLING 3 ½” 150 NO BID $1.38

225       SCHEDULE 40 PVC COUPLING 3 ¾” 150 NO BID NO BID

226       SCHEDULE 40 PVC COUPLING 4” 150 NO BID $1.83

227       SCHEDULE 40 PVC 45° BEND ½” 150 NO BID $.35

228       SCHEDULE 40 PVC 45° BEND ¾” 150 NO BID $.37

229       SCHEDULE 40 PVC 45° BEND 1” 150 NO BID $.62

230       SCHEDULE 40 PVC 45° BEND 1 ½” 150 NO BID $1.12

231       SCHEDULE 40 PVC 45° BEND 1 ¾” 150 NO BID NO BID

232       SCHEDULE 40 PVC 45° BEND 2” 150 NO BID $3.11

233       SCHEDULE 40 PVC 45° BEND 2 ½” 150 NO BID $3.04

234       SCHEDULE 40 PVC 45° BEND 2 ¾” 150 NO BID NO BID

235       SCHEDULE 40 PVC 45° BEND 3” 150 NO BID $4.64



236       SCHEDULE 40 PVC 45° BEND 3 ½” 150 NO BID $6.07

237       SCHEDULE 40 PVC 45° BEND 3 ¾” 150 NO BID NO BID

238       SCHEDULE 40 PVC 45° BEND 4” 150 NO BID $8.16

239       SCHEDULE 40 PVC 30° BEND ½” 150 NO BID $.51

240       SCHEDULE 40 PVC 30° BEND ¾” 150 NO BID $.52

241       SCHEDULE 40 PVC 30° BEND 1” 150 NO BID $.68

242       SCHEDULE 40 PVC 30° BEND 1 ½” 150 NO BID $1.35

243       SCHEDULE 40 PVC 30° BEND 1 ¾” 150 NO BID NO BID

244       SCHEDULE 40 PVC 30° BEND 2” 150 NO BID $1.82

245       SCHEDULE 40 PVC 30° BEND 2 ½” 150 NO BID $3.41

246       SCHEDULE 40 PVC 30° BEND 2 ¾” 150 NO BID NO BID

247       SCHEDULE 40 PVC 30° BEND 3” 150 NO BID $5.81

248       SCHEDULE 40 PVC 30° BEND 3 ½” 150 NO BID $15.93

249      SCHEDULE 40 PVC 30° BEND 3 ¾” 150 NO BID NO BID

250       SCHEDULE 40 PVC 30° BEND 4” 150 NO BID $8.30

251       TWO HOLE CONDUIT STRAP PVC ½” 100 NO BID $.17

252       TWO HOLE CONDUIT STRAP PVC 3/4” 100 NO BID $.20

253       TWO HOLE CONDUIT STRAP PVC 1” 100 NO BID $.25



254       TWO HOLE CONDUIT STRAP PVC 1½” 100 NO BID $.32

255       TWO HOLE CONDUIT STRAP PVC 2” 100 $.59 $.44

256       TWO HOLE CONDUIT STRAP PVC 2½” 100 $1.23 $1.09

257       TWO HOLE CONDUIT STRAP PVC 3” 100 $2.22 $1.84

258       TWO HOLE CONDUIT STRAP PVC 3½” 100 NO BID NO BID

259       TWO HOLE CONDUIT STRAP PVC 4” 100 $2.50 $2.11

260       TWO HOLE CONDUIT STRAP STEEL ZINC PLATED ½” 100 $.05 $.06

261       TWO HOLE CONDUIT STRAP STEEL ZINC PLATED 3/4” 100 $.06 $.08

262       TWO HOLE CONDUIT STRAP STEEL ZINC PLATED 1” 100 $.09 $.17

263       TWO HOLE CONDUIT STRAP STEEL ZINC PLATED 1½” 100 $.16 $.22

264       TWO HOLE CONDUIT STRAP STEEL ZINC PLATED 2” 100 $.28 $.28

265       TWO HOLE CONDUIT STRAP STEEL ZINC PLATED 2½” 100 $.48 $.64

266       TWO HOLE CONDUIT STRAP STEEL ZINC PLATED 3” 100 $.59 $.73

267       TWO HOLE CONDUIT STRAP STEEL ZINC PLATED 3½” 100 $.84 $.77

268       TWO HOLE CONDUIT STRAP STEEL ZINC PLATED 4” 100 $.93 $1.18

269       ONE HOLE EMT STRAP STEEL ZINC PLATED ½” 100 $.06 $.06

270       ONE HOLE EMT STRAP STEEL ZINC PLATED ¾” 100 $.07 $.08

271       ONE HOLE EMT STRAP STEEL ZINC PLATED 1” 100 $.11 $.14



272       UL STEEL CONDUIT LOCKNUT ½” 150 $.06 $.09

273       UL STEEL CONDUIT LOCKNUT ¾” 150 $.10 $.09

274       UL STEEL CONDUIT LOCKNUT 1” 150 $.17 $.13

275       UL STEEL CONDUIT LOCKNUT 1 ½” 150 $.30 $.23

276       UL STEEL CONDUIT LOCKNUT 2” 150 $.43 $.31

277       UL STEEL CONDUIT LOCKNUT 2 ½” 150 $1.16 $.80

278       UL STEEL CONDUIT LOCKNUT 3” 150 $1.60 $.87

279       UL STEEL CONDUIT LOCKNUT 3 ½” 150 $2.07 $1.42

280       UL STEEL CONDUIT LOCKNUT 4” 150 $3.07 $1.57

281       UNI STRUT 1 5/8” X 1 5/8” 14 GAUGE        PER 10’ NO BID $13.20

282       UNI STRUT 1 5/8” X 7/8” 14 GAUGE        PER 10’ NO BID $8.50

283       UNI STRUT CONDUIT CLAMP ½” 100 NO BID $.46

284       UNI STRUT CONDUIT CLAMP ¾” 100 NO BID $.47

285       UNI STRUT CONDUIT CLAMP 1”  100 NO BID $.54

286       UNI STRUT CONDUIT CLAMP 1½” 100 NO BID $.69

287       UNI STRUT CONDUIT CLAMP 2” 100 NO BID $.80

288       UNI STRUT CONDUIT CLAMP 2½” 100 NO BID $.95

289       UNI STRUT CONDUIT CLAMP 3”  100 NO BID $1.04



290       UNI STRUT CONDUIT CLAMP 3½” 100 NO BID $1.32

291       UNI STRUT CONDUIT CLAMP 4”  100 NO BID $1.41

292       ½” 105D PLASTIC BUSHING 150 NO BID $.05

293       ¾” 105D PLASTIC BUSHING 150 NO BID $.06

294      1 ½” 105D PLASTIC BUSHING 150 NO BID $.17

295       2” 105D PLASTIC BUSHING 150 NO BID $.32

296       2 ½” 105D PLASTIC BUSHING 150 NO BID $.63

297       3” 105D PLASTIC BUSHING 150 NO BID $.71

298       3 ½” 105D PLASTIC BUSHING 150 NO BID $.81

299       4” 105D PLASTIC BUSHING 150 NO BID $.95

300       BRI 1001 1 ANTI SHORT BUSHING 150 NO BID $4.00/BAG BAGS OF 50

      GROUNDING BUSHING ¾” 150° RIGID/MC,
301       LAY-IN-LUG INSULATED 150 NO BID $2.19

      GROUNDING BUSHING 1” 150° RIGID/MC,

302       LAY-IN-LUG INSULATED 150 NO BID $4.67

      GROUNDING BUSHING 1 ¼” 150° RIGID/MC,

303       LAY-IN-LUG INSULATED 150 NO BID $4.54

304       ARL SMC4 STL MC CABLE HANGER 200 NO BID $2.03

      ADJUSTABLE BAR HANGER, STEEL,
305       RACO 920 OR EQUAL 200       NO BID $4.81



      2X2 RECESSED LED PANEL RAB EZPAN
306       #EZPAN 2X2 40 N /D10 WHITE OR EQUAL    50 $52.16 $45.00

      2X4 RECESSED LED PANEL RAB EZPAN
307       #EZPAN 2X4 40Y N /D10 WHITE OR EQUAL    50 $77.74 $66.00

      LITHONIA LIGHTING FMLWL LED WRAP
308       FMLWL 24 840 2’ LED WRAP  50 $57.89 $38.17

      LITHONIA LIGHTING FMLWL LED WRAP
309       FMLWL 48 840 4’ LED WRAP  50 $58.76 $45.80

      LED WALL PACK EQUAL TO LITHONIA TWR
310       70W 4000K DARK BRONZE WET LOCATION                                 20        $126.16 $142.00

      LED WALL PACK EQUAL TO LITHONIA TWR
311       150W 4000K DARK BRONZE WET LOCATION  20        $209.64 $154.00

      LED DOORWAY LIGHT RAB ENTRA 12
312       BRONZE OR EQUAL  50 $125.16 $110.00

      CAPACTOR (UNIVERSAL LIGHTING)
313             #R17058555-BH 010.00U 400VAC OR EQUAL  50    $22.93 NO BID

      VGR2C GATEWAY ARCHITECTURAL ROUGH
314       SERVICE FIXTURE OR EQUAL  50 $598.76 $530.00

      WALLPACK LED RAB WP2 LED 37W N.
315       BRONZE OR EQUAL  50 $164.14 $142.00

     WALLPACK LED RAB WP3 LED 55W N.
316       BRONZE OR EQUAL  50 $198.75 $185.00

317       HOFF A121236RT – 3R GALV WIRE TROUGH 100 $292.97 $221.00

318       HOFF F66G36 NM1 LAY-IN WIREWY 100 $48.92 $31.62



      HOFF F66GCPNK – NMA1 WIREWY
319       END-NO K 100 $7.19 $4.34

320       3/8 – 16 BEAM CLAMPS STEEL ZINC PLATED 100 NO BID $1.50

      SQD NQ42L2C PNLBD INT NQ 225 MLO 42 CKT
321       1P CU 100 $69.16 $325.70

322       SQD QOB250 2P-120/240V – 50A CB  25 186.48 $66.00

323       SQD QOB240 2P-120/240V – 40A CB  25 $69.15 $66.00

      SQD QOB2100 MINIATURE CIRCUIT BREAKER
324       120/240V  25 $186.48 $177.00

325       SQD QOB230 2P-120/240V – 30A CB  25 $69.15 $66.00

326       SQD QOB260 2P-120/240V – 60A CB  25 $69.15 $66.00

327       SQD QOB220 2P-120/240V – 20A CB  25 $69.15 $66.00

328       SQD QOB115 SP-120/240V – 15A CB  25 $30.93 $30.00

      SQD PK27GTA LOAD CENTER EQUIPMENT
329       GROUND BAR  25 $14.00 $13.00

      SQD NQN2CU PNLBD NQ 225A 100% CU
330       NEUTRAL KIT  25 $163.83 $157.00

331       SQD QOB120 SP-120/240V – 20A CB  25 $30.93 $30.00

332       BREAKER 30AMP 1POLE SNAP-IN MURRY  25 $10.00 $4.77-MP130

333       MUR MP230 30A 2P CIRCUIT BREAKER      25 $15.00 $10.66



334       MUR MP270 70A 2P CIRCUIT BREAKER  25 $35.00 $28.26

335       BUI HOM220 SQUARE D 20A 2P CB  25 $10.10 $8.49

336       *SIE BQD120 1P20A 277V  25 $18.75 $77.00

337       `ITE Q130 SP 30A 120/240V CB ITEQ130  25 $7.50 $4.77

338       “ITE Q120 SP 20A 120/240V CB ITEQ120  25 $7.50 $4.77

      `ITEQ120DF Q120DF GRND FAULT/ARC
339        FAULT BRKR  25 $68.75 $51.00

340       MUR MP120 1P 120/240V 20A CB  25 $7.50 $4.77-Q120

      MUR MP120DF BRKR AFCI/GFCI 20A 1P
341       120V 10K  25 $68.75 $50.00

      FUSE – 30 AMP CARTRIDGE                
342       TIME DELAY – 250 VOLTS  10     $5.08 $3.18-TR30R

      FUSE – 20 AMP 250 VOLTS   
343         CARTRIDGE TIME DELAY  10 $5.08 $3.18-TR20R

      FUSE CARTRIDGE 60 AMP – 600 VOLT 
344       (TIME DELAY)  15 $20.65 $5.82-TR6OR

345       FUSE 20A 600V RK5 DE  15    $7.71 $7.06-TRSZOR

346       CUL 40725J 1/4X1 ¼ FENDER WASHER CULLY JAR  10 $10.88 $4.99

      T&B TC5345A TR TC 5345A CABLE TIE
347       1” NAT MTG BAS   5 $89.74 $90.00



348       ARL 720Z ½ TO 1 D/C GRD CLAMP  75 $1.07 $.79

349       ILSCO PCT-2-2/0 INS CLR MULTI-TAP  75 $36.17 $17.00

350       ARL 721B 1-1/4 TO 2 BRS GRD CLMP  75 $6.64 $6.64

351       ERC CP58 5/8 GROUND ROD CLAMP  75 $1.64 $.75

352       ERC 615800 5/8X10FT CU GROUND ROD  75 $17.19 $13.85

353           PHOTO CONTROL EK4036S INTERMATIC  50 $15.16 $14.41

354       PHOTO CONTROL 120/277V STEM MOUNT #EK4136S  50 $24.26 $15.21

      PHOTO CONTROL – 120 VOLTS, TI5
355       INT-MAT K4121C            50 $15.08 $7.35

            INTERMATIC EK4436SM METAL STEM MOUNT
356       ELECTRONIC PHOTOCONTROL  50 $10.55 $23.97

      PHOTO CONTROL STEM MOUNT 208-277V
357       15A #K4123C  50 $68.81 $8.18

      PHOTO CONTROL STEM & SWIVEL MOUNT
358       120V, 15A #K4221C  50 NO BID $8.75

      BALLAST KIT – 150W M102/M142 MH
359       120/208/240/277V 60HZ PHILIPS# 71A5492-001D  30 NO BID $59.00

      BALLAST – ADVANCE VH-2B13-TP-BLS FOR
360       13W LAMP 277V 60HZ  30 NO BID $85.00

      BALLAST – HX-HPF AUTO TRANSFORMER
      CORE & COIL BALLAST 100W M90 MH

361       LAMP 120/208/240/277  30 NO BID $67.00



       BALLAST HYDREL HYD HSLM50120
362       #HSL M50 120 TRANSFORMER  30 NO BID NO BID

      BALLAST – SYLVANIA QUICKTRONIC
363       QTP1X70MH/UNV F 120-277V  25 NO BID $89.00

     BALLAST – LTV 100MH277 BALLAST ASSY.
364      #85820-277R (KIM LIGHTING) ORDER# 111390392  25 NO BID NO BID

     BALLAST – UNIVERSAL M7012-27CK-6EU-F
     120/277V 50/60HZ ELECTRONIC MH BALLAST

365      PART# 188939  25 NO BID NO BID
 

     BALLAST KIT – HPS QUAD TAP S250ML5AC40-500K
366      FOR (1) 250W S-50 LAMP  25 NO BID $96.00

     BALLAST KIT – (1) 200W M-136 LAMP QUAD TAP 60HZ
367      PULSE START MH BALLAST P200ML5AC3M-500K  25 NO BID $87.00

368      BALLAST – ADV71A5237500DBP (1) 70W MH LAMP 277V  25 NO BID $190.00

     BALLAST – HATCH #MC20-1-J-277V ELECTRONIC MH
369      BALLAST FOR 20W LAMP  20 NO BID NO BID

     BALLAST – LUTRON EC3DT4MWKU2S DIMMING BALLAST
370      FOR 26W OR 32W T4 4-PIN CFL  20 NO BID $111.00

                  BALLAST KIT 400W HPS QUAD TAP
371      GELGES400ML5AC455  25  NO BID $84.00

     BALLAST – QTP 2X26CF/UNV DM QUICK TRONIC
372      FLUORESCENT LAMP BALLAST 2-LAMP T4 20  NO BID $30.00

                  BALLAST KIT 175W MH QUAD TAP M57 ULT



373            M175ML5AC3M500K                                                                 20    NO BID $82.00

     BALLAST TRIAD C240PUNVHP-B FOR 2 FT40W/2G11 LAMP
374            120/277V VAC 60HZ OR EQUAL                                                      20    NO BID $23.00

     BALLAST B+L TECHNOLOGIES NU6-2128-PSX 277V 50/60HZ
375            0.08A CLASS P OR EQUAL 30    NO BID NO BID

     BALLAST KIT 400W HPS QUAD TAP
376      GELGES400ML5AC455 30 NO BID $84.00

                  BALLAST KIT UNMM 250 ML5AC3M
377            500K                                                                                      25         NO BID $60.00

378            BALLAST – RCN-2TTP40-SC ADVANCED                          20         NO BID  $23.00

     BALLAST KEYSTONE TECHNOLOGIES F8T5
379            OR PL 7W-9W 120V 60HZ 0.18A CLASS P                                20         NO BID NO BID

380      BALLAST ADVANCED 71A54A3 – MILL. LIGHTS   20         NO BID $244.00

     BALLAST FOR 2 LAMPS GEC242-MVPS-3W
381            120/277V, 50/60HZ OR EQUAL   40         NO BID $23.54

     BALLAST –FOR 2F40 TUBES            
382      446-L-SLH-TC-P     10       NO BID NO BID

     BALLAST – 3 OR 2 LAMP F32T8 120/277
383            N.87 BF GE332MAX-G-N-DIYB OR EQUAL                          30       NO BID $16.36

     BALLAST – OSRAM QTPX32/120IS          
384      FOR 4 4’TUBE BALLAST             200       NO BID $11.88

     BALLAST – QTPX32/120, FOR 2 – 4’ 



385      TUBES             100       NO BID $9.51

386      BALLAST ADVANCE 1CF2S18-H-LD 18W – 4 PIN    20        NO BID $23.00

                   BALLAST ADVANCE 277V V5 0624
 387            24 BL TP (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)                                           35        NO BID NO BID

388      BALLAST ADVANCE F2 S 13 H1I DK                               35        NO BID $23.00

     BALLAST-L 48 ROBERT, TRANS.            
389      FOR 1-4’6 OR 8 WATT LAMP, 120 VOLT    25        NO BID NO BID

     BALLAST ADVANCE IMH-39-G-LF FOR
390      (1) 39W MH LAMP 50       NO BID $138.00

     BALLAST- SYL #51843 QTP 2X26/32/42
391      CF/UNV-DIM CFL 50        NO BID $31.00

     BALLAST FOR 20W MH LAMP, ANSI-M156, 277V
392      HATCH MODEL MC 20-1-J-2776 50        NO BID NO BID

     BALLAST HATCH MC20-1-F-277X FOR 20W MH
393      LAMP, ANSI-M156 50       NO BID NO BID

     BALLAST HATCH MC20-1-F-UNNV FOR 20W MH
394      LAMP, ANSI-M156, 120-277V 50        NO BID NO BID

     EMERGENCY BALLAST BODINE B70A FOR ONE
395      17/32W T8 50        NO BID NO BID

     EMERGENCY BALLAST, FLUORESCENT LAMP,
     BODINE B94 CGU, 17W THROUGH 40W SINGLE

396      OR BI-PIN, 90 MIN. 50        NO BID $152.00

      BATTERY 6 VOLTS 12.0AH PC6120 POWER CELL
397             (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)                                                   50        NO BID $14.30-JASCO RB6121-F1



      BATTERY 6V 7.0AH PC 670 POWER CELL
398             (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)                                                  50        NO BID $20.15

            BATTERY 12V – 18AH POWER CELL #12180
399       RECHARGEABLE (NO SUBSTITUTIONS) 10        NO BID $42.25

      BATTERY PC 6130 6V 13.0AH
400             POWER CELL ONLY                                                                12        NO BID $22.10

     BATTERY – FOR EXIT LIGHT              
401      WP 4-6, 6V4AH 50        NO BID $5.18

     LIGHT & EXIT COMBO UX2EWRWLED/2M                 
402      LIGHT-A-LARM 30        NO BID $104.60

     EXIT SIGN LED 120/277V ORBIT ESBL-W-R
403            OR EQUAL                                                                                   12        NO BID $18.18

     EMERGENCY LIGHT TWIN-HEAD WHITE 120/277V
404            BATTERY BACK-UP REMOTE CAPABLE 18        NO BID $18.18

     BATTERY EXIT LIGHT (ELS) NICK-A-LITE
405      #LDD0420B62 (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)        30        NO BID NO BID

     IPEX PVC CEMENT REGULAR BODIED CLEAR
406      LOW VOC 1 QUART   10       NO BID $9.50

     TELESCOPIC BRACKET- COPER B-LINE
407       BB2 -16T OR EQUAL                        50       NO BID $1.74

408       BUI THQB2130 GE 30A 2P BOLT-ON CB                15       NO BID $22.00

409       ‘ALUM JKT 12/4-MC COIL MCAL124WG                10       NO BID $241.25/CAL



410       GEM BOX SUPPORTS MULBERRY #40490 50 PER CS.     5       NO BID $10.00

      CUL 53020J ¼-20X1-1/4 SLOT-PHIL CULLY ROUND

411       HD MACHINE SCREW              100       NO BID $4.38

412       PWF 9220 ¼-20 LEAD MACH SCR ANCH              100       NO BID $24.00

413       ERC RLC DEVICE LEVELER/RETAINER   30 NO BID $.44

414       CRS TP526 4SQ 1G TILE RING 100 NO BID $2.38

415       100FT JACK CHAIN   10 NO BID $16.00

416       ¼” TITE GRIP SPRING NUT   30 NO BID $.48

417       ¼” PLATED TWIRL NUT 100 NO BID $1.25

418       3/8” PLATED TWIRL NUT 100 NO BID $1.30

419       ½” PLATED TWIRL NUT 100 NO BID $1.49

420       QTEKD7 10-1” TEK SLF DR SCR 100 NO BID $5.83

421       5/16” SQ WASHER - 3/8” HOLE 100 NO BID $.46

      TAPCON ¼” X 1 ¼” SLOTTED HEX WASHER HEAD,
422       STEEL, BLUE CLIMASEAL 500 NO BID $37.95

      TAPCON ¼” X 1 ¾” SLOTTED HEX WASHER HEAD,
423       STEEL, BLUE CLIMASEAL 500 NO BID $49.92

     TAPCON ¼” X 2 ¼” SLOTTED HEX WASHER HEAD,
424       STEEL, BLUE CLIMASEAL 500 NO BID $62.33

      TAPCON ¼” X 2 ¾” SLOTTED HEX WASHER HEAD,



425       STEEL, BLUE CLIMASEAL 500 NO BID NO BID

      TAPCON ¼” X 3 ¼” SLOTTED HEX WASHER HEAD,
426       STEEL, BLUE CLIMASEAL 500 NO BID NO BID

427       FENDER WASHER 3/16” X ½” O.D., STEEL, ZINC PLATED 500 NO BID NO BID

428       FENDER WASHER 3/16” X ¾” O.D., STEEL, ZINC PLATED 500 NO BID NO BID

429       FENDER WASHER 3/16” X 1” O.D., STEEL, ZINC PLATED 500 NO BID NO BID

430       FENDER WASHER ¼” X 9/16” O.D., STEEL, ZINC PLATED 500 NO BID NO BID

431       FENDER WASHER ¼” X 7/8” O.D., STEEL, ZINC PLATED 500 NO BID NO BID

432       FENDER WASHER ¼” X 1” O.D., STEEL, ZINC PLATED 500 NO BID $5.10

433       FENDER WASHER ¼” X 1 ¼” O.D., STEEL, ZINC PLATED 500 NO BID $4.99

434       FENDER WASHER 5/16” X 7/8” O.D., STEEL, ZINC PLATED 500 NO BID NO BID

435       FENDER WASHER 5/16” X 1” O.D., STEEL, ZINC PLATED 500 NO BID NO BID

436       FENDER WASHER 5/16” X 1 ¼” O.D., STEEL, ZINC PLATED 500 NO BID $13.67

437       FENDER WASHER 5/16” X 1 ½” O.D., STEEL, ZINC PLATED 500 NO BID $12.89

438       FENDER WASHER 3/8” X 1” O.D., STEEL, ZINC PLATED 500 NO BID $6.87

439       FENDER WASHER 3/8” X 1 ¼” O.D., STEEL, ZINC PLATED 500 NO BID $7.43

440       FENDER WASHER 3/8” X 1 ½” O.D., STEEL, ZINC PLATED 500 NO BID $10.29

441       FENDER WASHER 3/8” X 1 5/8” O.D., STEEL, ZINC PLATED 500 NO BID NO BID

442       SCREWS – 3/8 GROUNDING 500 NO BID $4.98              



      MACHINE SCREWS 6-32 X ¾” ROUND HEAD/COMBO
443       PHILIPS/SLOTTED 500 NO BID $2.62

      MACHINE SCREWS 6-32 X 1 ¼” ROUND HEAD/COMBO
444       PHILIPS/SLOTTED 500 NO BID $3.14

      MACHINE SCREWS 8-32 X ¾” ROUND HEAD/COMBO
445       PHILIPS/SLOTTED 500 NO BID $2.79

      MACHINE SCREWS 8-32 X 1 ¼” ROUND HEAD/COMBO
446       PHILIPS/SLOTTED 500 NO BID $3.92

      MACHINE SCREWS 10-32 X ¾” ROUND HEAD/COMBO
447       PHILIPS/SLOTTED 500 NO BID $3.99

      MACHINE SCREWS 10-32 X 1 ¼” ROUND HEAD/COMBO
448       PHILIPS/SLOTTED 500 NO BID $5.52

      MACHINE SCREWS 114-20 X ¾” ROUND HEAD/COMBO
449       PHILIPS/SLOTTED 500 NO BID $5.52

      MACHINE SCREWS 114-20 X 1” ROUND HEAD/COMBO
450       PHILIPS/SLOTTED 500 NO BID $6.87

      MACHINE SCREWS 114-20 X 1 ¼” ROUND HEAD/COMBO
451       PHILIPS/SLOTTED 500 NO BID $4.38

      DROP WIRE CLIP, STEEL, ZINC PHOSPHATE
452       EATON BW4 OR EQUAL 200 NO BID $.38

453       FULLY THREADED ROD, ZINC PLATED 3/8” 6’ LONG 180’ NO BID $1.86/PER 6’

  CABLE SUPPORT, “COLORADO JIM”, STEEL
454       PRE-GALVANIZED 200 NO BID $.44

455       ½” OFFSET NIPPLE 45º 200 NO BID $1.10



456       ¾” OFFSET NIPPLE 45º 200 NO BID $1.20

457      VANDAL RESISTANT & HARSH ENVIRONMENT 5 $485.00 $260.00
      EXIT SIGNS LTA WW-XVE-1-R-D-4X-CW EXIT
      SIGN – NO SUBS

458       VANDAL RESISTANT & HARSH ENVIRONMENT 5 $740.00 $561.00
      COMBO EXIT SIGNS LTA WW-XV-12ERD4X-2LD1-CW4
       – NO SUBS

459       VANDAL RESISTANT HOUSING-LTA 2VG1LD1-M-D-CW4 5 $613.00 $373.00
      EXIT SIGNS LTA WW-XVE-1-R-D-4X-CW EXIT
      – NO SUBS

VARIATIONS:  GRAYBAR – pipe and wire items are subject to escalation or de-escalation.  Prices subject
To review after 6 months.

DELIVERY – GRAYBAR – next day for stock items. COOPER FRIEDMAN – 1 DAY stock; 10 days non-stock.

THE CONTRACT SHALL BE FOR A PERIOD OF TWO YEARS.

WILL VENDOR EXTEND PRICES TO LOCAL GOVERNMENT ENTITIES WITHIN
THE COUNTY – GRAYBAR- NO; COOPER FRIEDMAN - YES

BID SPECS SENT TO:




