
5/5/2021PD 020-049

Bid Opening 9/25/20  10:00am

SPECIFICATIONS AND PROPOSAL FORM FOR THE
DELIVERY OF NITRILE POWEDER FREE 3 MIL
MINIMUM EXAM GLOVES FOR VARIOUS
DEPARTMENTS OF THE COUNTY OF
GLOUCESTER AND EXISTING UNITS WITHIN THE
COUNTY AS ALLOWED THROUGH THE COUNTY
CONTRACT PURCHASING SYSTEM NUMBERS
CK-01-GC & 16GLCP

Vendor: Vendor: Vendor: Vendor: Vendor: Vendor:

Munidex, Inc Unipak Corporation
Varsity Brands Holding Co., Inc. dba
BSN Sports, LLc A&A SALES ASSOCIATES, LLC UWEPort Global Geeks, Inc.

174 Route 17 North P.O. Box 300027 P.O. Box 7726 1715 Kumry Road 3623 Latrobe Drive 1258 N. Church St

 Rochelle Park, NJ 07662  Brooklyn, NY 11230  Dallas, TX 75209-0726 Quakertown, PA 18951  Charlotte NC 28211  Moorestown, NJ 08057-1129 

 201-291-1000  888-808-5120  800-445-9446  215-852-9651  314-494-7337  800-421-6603 

 201-291-8588 - Fax  718-677-9371-Fax  800-523-5112 - Fax  215-538-5002 - Fax  800-421-6603 - Fax 

 Fred Hannaham, Vice President  Brian Marcus, President  William Rusinak, Sr. Bid Specialist Keith Dyer, President  Amy Teague, National Acct. Mgr.  Ahmad Loul, CEO 

ITEM DESCRIPTION  Rejected-Does Not Meet Specs 
PER CASE PER CASE PER CASE PER CASE PER CASE PER CASE

1
3 MIL MINIMUM NITRILE POWDER FREE
EXTENDED LENGTH EXAM GLOVES $1,150.00 $289.00 NO BID NO BID $110.00 NO BID
100/BOX, 10 BOXES/CASE
SIZE:  SMALL
BRAND NAME: V Glove; Superior or Symed UPC Synmax

2
3 MIL MINIMUM NITRILE POWDER FREE
EXTENDED LENGTH EXAM GLOVES $1,150.00 $289.00 NO BID NO BID $110.00 NO BID
100/BOX, 10 BOXES/CASE
SIZE:  MEDIUM
BRAND NAME: V Glove; Superior or Symed UPC Synmax

3
3 MIL MINIMUM NITRILE POWDER FREE
EXTENDED LENGTH EXAM GLOVES $1,150.00 $289.00 NO BID NO BID $110.00 NO BID
100/BOX, 10 BOXES/CASE
SIZE:  LARGE
BRAND NAME: V Glove; Superior or Symed UPC Synmax

4
3 MIL MINIMUM NITRILE POWDER FREE
EXTENDED LENGTH EXAM GLOVES $1,150.00 $289.00 NO BID NO BID $110.00 NO BID
100/BOX, 10 BOXES/CASE

SIZE:  EXTRA LARGE
BRAND NAME: V Glove; Superior or Symed UPC Synmax

5
3 MIL MINIMUM NITRILE POWDER FREE
REGULAR LENGTH EXAM GLOVES $1,150.00 $169.00 $242.94 $125.90 $110.00 $199.90
100/BOX, 10 BOXES/CASE
SIZE:  SMALL
BRAND NAME: V Glove; Superior or Symed UPC FEI AMMEX OR MEDISPRO Synmax

6
3 MIL MINIMUM NITRILE POWDER FREE
REGULAR LENGTH EXAM GLOVES $1,150.00 $169.00 $242.94 $125.90 $110.00 $199.90
100/BOX, 10 BOXES/CASE
SIZE:  MEDIUM



5/5/2021BRAND NAME: V Glove; Superior or Symed UPC FEI AMMEX OR MEDISPRO Synmax

7
3 MIL MINIMUM NITRILE POWDER FREE
REGULAR LENGTH EXAM GLOVES $1,150.00 $169.00 $242.94 $125.90 $110.00 $199.90
100/BOX, 10 BOXES/CASE
SIZE:  LARGE
BRAND NAME: V Glove; Superior or Symed UPC FEI AMMEX OR MEDISPRO Synmax

8
3 MIL MINIMUM NITRILE POWDER FREE
REGULAR LENGTH EXAM GLOVES $1,150.00 $169.00 $242.94 $125.90 $110.00 $199.90
100/BOX, 10 BOXES/CASE
SIZE:  EXTRA LARGE
BRAND NAME: V Glove; Superior or Symed UPC FEI AMMEX OR MEDISPRO Synmax

Variations NONE NONE

Out of stock delivery is 3-5 weeks
ARO.  Call for availability at time of

order 4 MIL V. 3 MIL NONE NONE

Delivery 45 DAYS ARO 1-10 DAYS ARO 5-7 DAYS ARO (IN STOCK) 21 DAYS ARO 15 DAYS ARO 10 DAYS ARO

Will you extend your prices to local
government entities within the County YES NO NO NO YES NO

THIS IS A ONE (1) YEAR CONTRACT WITH
ONE (1) TWO YEAR EXTENSION OR TWO (2)
ONE YEAR EXTENSIONS

Bid specifications sent to: Taxi-AeroParts Go Green USA Deltek Lewis Enterprises Caprice Electronics
Phalanx Group Performance Safety Group Commerce Glass ProcurmentNet America Bidnet
Telesource Services Ever Ready First Aid Y Not Design & Mfg School Warehouse Supplies Westcomb Outerwear
Professional Plastics Baypromo ReelQuick Pro-Vibe Life Omega Scientific
SMS Ambassadors Corp Interboro Packaging Sea Partners Melissa Cobuzzi DealMed
VizoCom Digital Dolphin Supplies CYK Enterprises Cetrix Technologies The Glove Guys
Ansell Healthcare Smartmatic USA Astro Med Jodytown Diversified Industries Ultimate Innovations USA
Pandemic Products PPE Buddy Uniform States of America Medineks Medical Defense Medical Syndicate
Global Healthcare Resources Super7 Wholesale Partners PPE Deltek

Based upon the bids received, I recommend that A&A Sales Associates be awarded the contract as the lowest responsive, responsible bidder for Items 5, 6, 7 and 8.

Items 1, 2, 3 and 4 are not being awarded.  Overbudget
 Sincerely, 
Kimberly Larter, Qualified Purchasing Agent
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