PD 020-008

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

Bid Opening 3/03/20 at 10:00 am

CVR Computer Supplies

W.B. Mason Co., Inc.

The Tree House

Allied Document Solutions & Svcs

Beepsmart Communications,
Inc. dba Smart Group Systems

Supply-Saver Corporation

SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY

1606 Bowling Green Drive

151 Heller Place

PO Box 413

200 Church Street

990 N. Bowser Rd, Ste 720

1324 Wyckoff Road

OF PRINTER RIBBONS, PRINTER INK JET

Cherry Hill, NJ 08003

Bellmawr, NJ 08031

Norwood, MA 02062

Swedesboro, NJ 08085

Richardson, TX 75081

Neptune, NJ 08753

AND TONER CARTRIGES,FAX MACHINE

Steve Yuhas VP of Sales

Daniel Orr, Jr., Senior V.P.

David Rizzo -Sales

Robert Richardson, President

Mickey Faruque, CEO

Laurence L. Jones, President

TONER AND DRUM UNITS TO BE

856 857-0355

888-926-2766

800 595-6651

856-241-2000

972-235-2161

800-526-2794

UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

856 857-0357 Fax

888-598-1788 - Fax

781 278-0706 Fax

856-241-2290

Fax-1-888-427-8990

732-938-4045 - Fax

IN THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER

Item |Individual Prices
1 |Axiom Model A758 Purple $24.00 $6.95 $2.50 No Bid $30.00 No Bid
BROTHER
2 |DR400 Fax Drum $145.00 $147.40 $146.55 No Bid $152.00 $149.00
3 |BRT-TN436BK $72.00 $70.12 $69.75 No Bid $74.00 $83.00
4 |BRT-TN436C $156.00 $147.41 $146.55 No Bid $155.00 $169.00
5 |BRT-TN436M $155.00 $147.41 $146.55 No Bid $155.00 $169.00
6 |BRT-TN436Y $155.00 $147.41 $146.55 No Bid $155.00 $169.00
7 |DR420 Fax Drum $72.00 $73.16 $72.75 No Bid $77.00 $93.00
8 |DR 500 Fax Drum $60.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.00 $139.00
9 |DR510 Fax Drum $160.00 $161.53 $160.60 No Bid $170.00 $192.00
10 |DR520 Fax Drum $184.00 $186.72 $185.65 No Bid $195.00 $194.00
11 |DR620 Fax Drum $120.00 $120.37 $119.70 No Bid $127.00 $144.00
12 |LC 101 BK $11.00 $10.52 $10.50 No Bid $12.00 $14.00
13 |LC101Y $7.00 $7.01 No Bid No Bid $10.00 $10.00
14 |LCO010C $7.00 $7.01 No Bid No Bid $10.00 $10.00
15 |LC 101 M $7.00 $7.01 No Bid No Bid $10.00 $10.00
16 |TN420 Drum $73.00 $31.28 $31.15 No Bid $35.00 $49.00
17 |TN430 Fax Toner $55.60 $54.48 $54.20 No Bid $59.00 $69.00
18 |TN450 Fax Toner $48.00 $47.75 $47.50 No Bid $51.00 $59.00
19 |TN460 Toner $74.00 $76.82 $76.40 No Bid $80.00 $97.00
20 |TN530 Toner $56.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.00 $49.00
21 |TN540 Toner $71.00 $69.09 $68.70 No Bid $74.00 $79.00
22 |TN550 Toner $71.00 $72.23 $71.85 No Bid $75.00 $89.00
23 |TN570 High Yield $87.00 $89.33 $88.80 No Bid $94.00 $99.00
24 | TN580 Toner $100.00 $98.35 $97.80 No Bid $105.00 $109.00
25 |TN-650 Toner $96.00 $96.29 $95.75 No Bid $99.00 $109.00
26 |TN-700 Toner $99.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $109.00 No Bid
27 |TN-850 Black $91.00 $91.15 $90.65 No Bid $96.00 $109.00

CANON
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28 |1977B001AA Yellow $81.00 $75.02 $69.40 No Bid $75.00 $89.00
29 |1978B001AA Magenta $74.00 $75.02 $69.40 No Bid $75.00 $89.00
30 |1979B001AA Cyan $74.00 $75.02 $69.40 No Bid $75.00 $89.00
31 |1980B001AA Black $76.00 $79.56 $73.55 No Bid $76.00 $93.00
32 |2659B001AA Yellow $111.00 $101.05 $99.45 No Bid $112.00 $129.00
33 |2660BO01AA Magenta $111.00 $101.05 $99.45 No Bid $112.00 $129.00
34 |2661B001AA Cyan $110.00 $101.05 $99.45 No Bid $112.00 $129.00
35 ]2662B001AA Black $109.00 $101.05 $100.55 No Bid $114.00 $129.00
36 |3500B001 Black $72.00 $79.01 $70.95 No Bid $79.00 $89.00
37 |6260B012AA Yellow $240.00 $253.97 $220.10 No Bid $219.00 $249.00
38 |6261B012AA Magenta $240.00 $253.97 $220.10 No Bid $219.00 $249.00
39 |6262B012AA Cyan $239.00 $253.97 $220.10 No Bid $219.00 $249.00
40 |6264B012AA Black $96.00 $232.73 $202.80 No Bid $207.02 $229.00
41 16269B001 Yellow $96.00 $85.36 $70.90 No Bid $78.00 $93.00
42 16270B001 Magenta $96.00 $85.36 $70.90 No Bid $78.00 $93.00
43 ]16270B001 Cyan $97.00 $85.36 $70.90 No Bid $78.00 $93.00
44 16272B001AA Black $79.00 $57.89 $59.70 No Bid $65.00 $79.00
45 19435B001 $76.00 $55.79 $67.35 No Bid $65.00 $89.00
46 |CL211XL Black $26.00 $27.49 No Bid No Bid $26.00 $33.00
47 |CL142M Magenta $14.00 $15.25 No Bid No Bid $26.00 $16.50
48 |CL142PC Photo Cyan $15.00 $15.25 No Bid No Bid $26.00 $16.50
49 |CL142Y Yellow $16.00 $15.25 No Bid No Bid $49.00 $16.50
50 |CL142bk Black $14.00 $15.55 No Bid No Bid $49.00 $16.50
51 |CL142g Gray $14.00 $15.25 No Bid No Bid $49.00 $16.50
52 |CL142lgy Light Gray $14.00 $15.25 No Bid No Bid $49.00 $16.50
53 |CNM3500B001AA $72.00 $72.42 $70.95 No Bid $79.00 $82.00
54 |PG158K $17.00 $33.16 $17.70 No Bid $49.00 No Bid
55 |PG210XL Black $22.00 $22.46 $21.40 No Bid $24.00 $25.50
56 _|8C CL1-8C Cyan $16.00 $17.19 $12.70 No Bid $19.00 $19.00
57 |8M CL1-8M Magenta $16.00 $17.19 $12.70 No Bid $19.00 $19.00
58 |8Y CL18Y Yellow $16.00 $17.19 $12.70 No Bid $19.00 $19.00
59 116 Black 1980B001AA $76.00 $79.56 $73.35 No Bid $76.00 $89.00
60 ]116 Cyan 1979B001AA $77.00 $75.02 $69.40 No Bid $39.00 $87.00
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61 |116 Magenta 1978B001AA $73.00 $75.02 $69.40 No Bid $39.00 $87.00
62 |116 Yellow 1977B001AA $74.00 $75.02 $69.40 No Bid $39.00 $87.00
63 ]118 Black $111.00 $101.05 $100.55 No Bid $175.00 $129.00
64 |118 Colors $111.00 $303.16 $99.45 No Bid $190.00 $129.00
EPSON

65 1059120 Black $18.00 $15.37 $17.60 No Bid $19.00 $20.50
66 1S015337 Ribbon $9.00 $9.38 $9.20 No Bid $229.00 $12.00
67 |Colorwave 3500 C No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $229.00 $219.00
68 |Colorwave 3500 M No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $229.00 $219.00
69 |Colorwave 3500 Y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $229.00 $219.00
70 _|Colorwave 3500 BK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $229.00 $219.00
71 |EPS-T048520 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.00 No Bid
72 |ERC-22 $1.60 $1.52 No Bid No Bid $5.00 $3.00

73 |T017201 Black No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.00 No Bid
74 |T019201 Color No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.00 No Bid
75 |T059120 Black $18.00 $15.37 $17.60 No Bid $19.00 $21.00
76 |T059220 Cyan $18.00 $15.37 $17.60 No Bid $19.00 $21.00
77 _|T0O59320 Magenta $18.00 $15.37 $17.60 No Bid $19.00 $21.00
78 |T059420 Yellow $18.00 $15.37 $17.60 No Bid $19.00 $21.00
79 |T059520 Light Cyan $18.00 $15.37 $17.60 No Bid $19.00 $21.00
80 |T059620 Light Magenta $18.00 $15.37 $17.60 No Bid $19.00 $21.00
81 |T059720 Light Black $18.00 $15.37 $17.60 No Bid $19.00 $21.00
82 |T059820 Matte Black $18.00 $15.37 $17.60 No Bid $19.00 $21.00
83 |T059920 Light, Light Black $17.00 $15.37 $17.60 No Bid $19.00 $21.00
84 |T0O87020 Gloss Optimizer $15.00 $12.08 $13.95 No Bid $16.00 $16.50
85 |T0O87120 Photo Black $14.60 $11.95 $13.95 No Bid $16.00 $16.50
86 |TO87820 Matte Black $14.60 $11.95 $13.95 No Bid $16.00 $16.50
87 |TO87220 Cyan $14.60 $11.95 $13.95 No Bid $16.00 $16.50
88 |TO87320 Magenta $14.60 $11.95 $13.95 No Bid $13.00 $16.50
89 |T0O87420 Yellow $15.00 $11.95 $13.95 No Bid $16.00 $16.50
90 |TO87720 Red $14.00 $11.95 $13.95 No Bid $16.00 $16.50
91 |TO87920 Orange $15.00 $11.95 $13.95 No Bid $16.00 $16.50
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92 |T200120 Black $14.00 $11.38 $13.40 No Bid $15.00 $15.00
93 |T200220 Cyan $10.00 $7.86 $9.50 No Bid $11.00 $12.00
94 |T200320 Magenta $10.00 $8.22 $9.50 No Bid $11.00 $12.00
95 |T200420 Yellow $10.00 $8.22 $9.50 No Bid $11.00 $12.00
96 | T200XL120 Black XL $10.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.00 No Bid
97 |T200XL220 Cyan XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.00 No Bid
98 |T200XL320 Magenta No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.00 No Bid
99 |T200XL420 Yellow XL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.00 No Bid
100 |T54451 Photo Black No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $77.00 No Bid
101 |T545100 Black No Bid $47.64 $52.50 No Bid $59.00 $79.00
102 | T545200 Cyan No Bid $47.64 $52.50 No Bid $77.00 $79.00
103 |T545300 Magenta No Bid $47.64 $52.50 No Bid $77.00 $79.00
104 |T545400 Yellow No Bid $47.64 $52.50 No Bid $77.00 $79.00
105 |T545500 Light Cyan No Bid $47.64 $52.50 No Bid $77.00 $79.00
106 |T545600 Light Magenta No Bid $47.64 $52.50 No Bid $77.00 $79.00
Fargo Ymcko
107 |800015-540 No Bid $104.43 No Bid No Bid $189.00 No Bid
Hewlett Packard
108 |HEW-390A $150.00 $114.33 $118.00 No Bid $115.00 $149.00
109 |414A Black W2020A $67.00 $57.27 $52.95 $98.75 $55.00 $79.00
110 |414A Yellow W2022A $86.00 $74.12 $68.60 $138.00 $71.49 $99.00
111 J414A Cyan W2021A $86.00 $74.12 $68.60 $138.00 $71.49 $99.00
112 |414A Magenta W2023A $86.00 $74.12 $68.60 $138.00 $71.49 $99.00
113 |HEW-902XL Yellow T6EM10AN#140 $20.00 $16.69 $15.70 No Bid $15.10 $23.00
114 JHEW-902XL Black T614AN#140 $34.00 $30.20 $28.40 No Bid $27.35 $39.00
115 JHEW-902XL Magenta T6EMO6AN#140 $19.00 $16.69 $15.70 No Bid $15.10 $23.00
116 JHEW-902XL Cyan T6M02AN#140 $20.00 $16.69 $15.70 No Bid $15.10 $23.00
117 |HEW-934XL Black No Bid $23.99 $22.80 No Bid $29.00 $32.00
118 |HEW-935XL Yellow No Bid $15.64 $14.75 No Bid $29.00 $22.00
119 JHEW-935XL Cyan No Bid $15.64 $14.75 No Bid $29.00 $22.00
120 |HEW-935XL Magenta No Bid $15.64 $14.75 No Bid $29.00 $22.00
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121 |HEW-950XL Black No Bid $31.61 $30.10 No Bid $29.00 $41.00
122 |951XL Cyan, Magenta, Yellow No Bid $73.02 $23.10 No Bid $177.00 $33.00
123 1952 Black F6U15AN No Bid $22.69 $21.55 No Bid $20.88 $30.00
124 1952XL Black F6U19AN No Bid $33.01 $30.80 No Bid $30.00 $43.00
125 1952 Cyan LOS49AN No Bid $15.86 $14.80 No Bid $14.35 $21.50
126 ]952XL Cyan LOS61AN No Bid $25.03 $23.75 No Bid $23.10 $33.00
127 1952 Magenta LOS52AN No Bid $15.86 $14.80 No Bid $14.35 $21.50
128 1952XL Magenta LOS64AN No Bid $25.03 $23.75 No Bid $23.10 $33.00
129 ]952 Yellow LOS55AN No Bid $15.86 $14.80 No Bid $14.35 $21.50
130 1952 XL Yellow LOS67AN 952 (3 color combo) No Bid $25.03 $23.75 No Bid $23.10 $33.00
131 |N9K27AN No Bid $47.39 $44.40 No Bid $43.00 $62.00
132 |51645A Black No Bid $28.91 $36.60 No Bid $35.49 $51.00
133 |JHEW-C1775A No Bid No Bid $60.00 No Bid $55.00 No Bid
134 |HEW-C1823D Color No Bid $37.90 $44.80 No Bid $45.00 $62.00
135 |HEW-C2P04A Black No Bid $12.88 $12.40 No Bid $12.00 $17.50
136 |HEW-C2P05AN-62XL No Bid $27.82 $27.10 No Bid $26.35 $36.00
137 |HEW-C2P06A Tri Color No Bid $15.65 $14.95 No Bid $14.55 $21.00
138 JC2PO7AN-62XL No Bid $30.60 $29.90 No Bid $28.75 $39.00
139 |HEW-C2P23AN No Bid $23.99 $22.80 No Bid $22.65 $31.00
140 |HEW-C2P24AN No Bid $15.64 $14.75 No Bid $14.35 $21.00
141 |HEW-C2P25AN No Bid $15.64 $14.75 No Bid $14.35 $21.00
142 |HEW-C2P26AN No Bid $15.64 $14.75 No Bid $14.35 $21.00
143 |HEW-C4127X $60.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $105.00 $139.00
144 |HEW-C4182X $60.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $105.00 $159.00
145 JHEW-C4254A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $185.00 No Bid
146 |C4844A Black $51.00 $41.84 $39.50 No Bid $39.79 $56.00
147 JC4911A Cyan $44.00 $38.30 $44.55 No Bid $49.00 $49.00
148 |C4912A Magenta $45.00 $38.30 $44.55 No Bid $49.00 $49.00
149 |C4913A Yellow $45.00 $38.30 $44.55 No Bid $49.00 $49.00
150 |C4950A $250.00 $217.19 $252.70 No Bid $265.00 $279.00
151 |C4954A $250.00 $217.19 $252.70 No Bid $265.00 $279.00
152 JC4961A Cyan $266.00 $227.54 $264.75 No Bid $279.00 $289.00
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153 |C4962A Magenta $264.00 $227.54 $264.75 No Bid $279.00 $289.00
154 |C4963A Yellow $264.00 $227.54 $264.75 No Bid $279.00 $289.00
155 |C4965A Light Magenta $264.00 $227.54 $264.75 No Bid $279.00 $289.00
156 |HEW-C6578D Tri-Color $52.00 $30.39 $39.35 No Bid $38.35 $55.00
157 |HEW-C6578DN Tri-Color $52.00 $30.39 $39.35 No Bid $38.35 $55.00
158 |HEW-C6578AN Double Tri Color $89.00 No Bid $64.70 No Bid $163.10 $88.00
159 JHEW-C6578 AN $90.00 No Bid $64.70 No Bid $63.10 $88.00
160 |HEW-C6615DN Black $43.00 $27.32 $35.15 No Bid $34.25 $48.00
161 |HEW-C6625A Tri Color $44.00 $29.81 $37.40 No Bid $38.25 $52.00
162 |HEW-C6656AN Black $46.00 $19.57 $25.00 No Bid $24.34 $35.00
163 |HEW-6657AN Tri Color $50.00 $31.51 $40.60 No Bid $39.65 $55.00
164 |HEW-C6658AN Toner No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.00 No Bid
165 |HEW-C7115A $60.00 No Bid $60.00 $37.00 $55.00 $75.00
166 |HEW-C8061X $60.00 No Bid No Bid $81.00 $120.00 $99.00
167 |HEW-C8543X $200.00 $226.69 $213.00 $119.00 $220.00 $289.00
168 |HEW-C8721WN $30.00 $23.03 $21.80 No Bid $21.10 No Bid
169 |HEW-C8765WN Black $32.00 $26.98 $25.00 No Bid $24.34 $35.00
170 |HEW-C8766 WN Black $37.00 $31.57 $29.50 No Bid $28.75 $42.00
171 |HEW-C8767WN Black $44.00 $27.04 $34.00 No Bid $33.65 $49.00
172 |HEW-C8771 WN Cyan $13.00 $11.37 $10.50 No Bid $10.00 $16.00
173 |[HEW-C8772WN Magenta $13.00 $11.37 $10.50 No Bid $10.00 $16.00
174 |HEW-C8773WN Yellow $13.00 $11.37 $10.50 No Bid $10.00 $16.00
175 |HEW-C8774 WN Light Cyan $13.00 $11.37 $10.50 No Bid $10.00 $16.00
176 |HEW-C8775 WN Light Magenta $13.00 $11.37 $10.50 No Bid $10.00 $16.00
177 |HEW-C9321FN No Bid $69.28 $65.80 No Bid $110.00 $78.00
178 |HEW-C9348FN Black No Bid No Bid $68.00 No Bid $70.00 $98.00
179 |HEW-C9351A Black $18.00 $11.23 $14.50 No Bid $14.10 $22.00
180 |HEW-C9352A Tri Color $25.00 $15.91 $20.25 No Bid $19.70 $29.00
181 |HEW-C9353FN 2 pack $90.00 $58.06 $74.70 No Bid $73.00 $102.00
182 |HEW-C9359AN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.10 No Bid
183 |HEW-C9363WN Tri Color $48.00 $42.96 $40.00 No Bid $39.00 $56.00
184 |HEW-C9364 WN $29.00 $19.00 $24.35 No Bid $23.70 $35.00
185 |HEW-C9369 WN Photo No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $47.00 No Bid
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186 |HEW-C9381A $76.00 $67.37 $66.00 No Bid $64.00 $89.00
187 |JHEW-C9382A $76.00 $67.37 $66.00 No Bid $64.00 $89.00
188 |HEW-C9385AN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $57.00 No Bid
189 |HEW-C9386AN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $57.00 No Bid
190 JHEW-C9387AN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $57.00 No Bid
191 |HEW-C9388 AN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $57.00 No Bid
192 |HEW-C9730A Black $199.00 $223.37 $206.00 $110.00 $215.00 $259.00
193 |HEW-C9731A Cyan $295.00 $313.23 $293.00 $145.00 $304.00 $319.00
194 |HEW-C9732A Yellow $295.00 $313.23 $293.00 $145.00 $304.00 $319.00
195 |HEW-C9733A Magenta $300.00 $313.23 $293.00 $145.00 $304.00 $319.00
196 |HEW-C9734B Transfer Kit $320.00 $274.61 $325.00 $269.00 $290.00 $295.00
197 |HEW-CB321 WN Black No Bid $22.35 $20.40 No Bid $39.00 $29.00
198 |HEW-CB322WN Photo XL $23.00 $20.06 $18.30 No Bid $35.00 $27.00
199 |[HEW-CB323WN Cyan XL $24.00 $20.74 $18.30 No Bid $35.00 $27.00
200 |HEW-CB324WN Magenta XL $24.00 $20.74 $18.30 No Bid $35.00 $27.00
201 |HEW-CB325WN Yellow XL $24.00 $20.74 $18.30 No Bid $35.00 $27.00
202 |HEW-CB400A Black $168.00 $146.29 $137.00 $89.25 $141.00 $169.00
203 |HEW-CB401A Cyan $182.00 $217.65 $204.00 $112.00 $211.00 $245.00
204 |HEW-CB402A Yellow $182.00 $217.65 $204.00 $112.00 $211.00 $245.00
205 |HEW-CB403A Magenta $182.00 $217.65 $204.00 $112.00 $211.00 $245.00
206 |HEW-CB540A Black $56.00 $58.24 $49.00 $39.00 $56.00 $69.00
207 |HEW-CB541A Cyan $57.00 $53.53 $45.00 $43.00 $51.00 $67.00
208 |HEW-CB542A Yellow $57.00 $53.53 $45.00 $43.00 $51.00 $67.00
209 |HEW-CB543A Magenta $58.00 $53.53 $45.00 $43.00 $51.00 $67.00
210 |HEW-CC364A $150.00 $118.68 $117.00 $86.50 $120.00 $149.00
211 |HEW-CC530A (Black) $86.00 $91.14 $69.00 $45.25 $87.00 $99.00
212 |HEW-CC531A (Cyan) $86.00 $89.83 $77.00 $47.50 $87.00 $95.00
213 |HEW-CC532A (Yellow) $87.00 $89.83 $77.00 $47.50 $87.00 $95.00
214 |[HEW-CC533A (Magenta) $88.00 $89.83 $77.00 $47.50 $87.00 $95.00
215 |HEW-CC641WN $42.00 $35.95 $33.70 No Bid $32.85 $46.00
216 |HEW-CC644WN $47.00 $40.77 $38.35 No Bid $37.35 $53.00
217 |HEW-CE255A $125.00 $97.05 $99.00 $94.75 $103.00 $129.00
218 |HEW-CE255X $186.00 $148.06 $154.00 $189.50 $162.00 $189.00
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219 |HEW-CE255XD $352.00 $276.71 $284.00 $176.00 $291.00 $349.00
220 |HEW-CE390A $146.00 $114.33 $118.00 $88.00 $118.00 $149.00
221 |HEW-CE390A $146.00 $114.33 $118.00 $88.00 $119.00 $149.00
222 |HEW-CE390X $192.00 $212.68 $199.00 $112.00 $205.00 $229.00
223 |HEW-CE410A Black $71.00 $55.64 $57.00 $45.00 $60.00 $77.00
224 |HEW-CE410X Black $82.00 $68.34 $65.00 $45.00 $85.00 $95.00
225 |HEW-CE411A Cyan $92.00 $88.23 $76.00 $44.00 $85.00 $102.00
226 |HEW-CE412A Yellow $92.00 $88.23 $76.00 $44.00 $85.00 $102.00
227 |HEW-CE413A Magenta $92.00 $88.23 $76.00 $44.00 $85.00 $102.00
228 |HEW-CES505A $72.00 $58.83 $61.00 $40.50 $63.00 $79.00
229 |HEW-CE705A No Bid $58.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid $79.00
230 |HEW-CET740A Black $129.00 $111.43 $105.00 $92.50 $107.50 $139.00
231 |HEW-CE741A Cyan $206.00 $196.28 $185.00 $127.50 $190.00 $229.00
232 |HEW-CET742A Yellow $206.00 $196.28 $185.00 $127.50 $190.00 $229.00
233 |HEW-CE743A Magenta $206.00 $196.28 $185.00 $127.50 $190.00 $229.00
234 |HEW-CF226A $98.00 $84.84 $79.00 $80.50 $82.00 $99.00
235 |HEW-CF230A $53.00 $46.06 $44.00 $50.75 $44.49 $59.00
236 |HEW-CF237A $146.00 $127.23 $118.00 $107.00 $122.50 $165.00
237 |HEW-CF280A $88.00 $68.10 $70.00 $74.25 $73.49 $95.00
238 |HEW-CF280X $136.00 $115.03 $119.00 $74.25 $126.00 $152.00
239 |HEW-CF281X $242.00 $191.03 $196.00 $99.50 $201.40 $249.00
240 |HEW-CF287X $249.00 $214.94 $190.00 $105.25 $207.87 $259.00
241 |HEW-CF350A $48.00 $41.57 $39.00 $37.00 $40.00 $55.00
242 |HEW-CF351A $51.00 $42.88 $40.00 $39.00 $40.00 $56.00
243 |HEW-CF352A $51.00 $42.88 $40.00 $39.00 $40.00 $56.00
244 |HEW-CF353A $50.00 $42.88 $40.00 $39.00 $40.00 $56.00
245 |HEW-CF360A Black $131.00 $113.69 $105.00 $92.00 $110.00 $149.00
246 |HEW-CF361A Cyan No Bid $142.54 $131.00 $107.00 $137.00 $183.00
247 |HEW-CF362A Yellow $152.00 $142.54 $131.00 $107.00 $137.00 $183.00
248 |HEW-CF363A Magenta $153.00 $142.54 $131.00 $107.00 $137.00 $183.00
249 |HEW-CF400A Black $58.00 $46.71 $47.00 $78.00 $48.40 $65.00
250 |HEW-CF400X Black $77.00 $62.75 $57.00 $68.75 $65.00 $89.00
251 |HEW-CF401A Cyan $67.00 $53.10 $55.40 $68.75 $57.00 $79.00




PD 020-008

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

Bid Opening 3/03/20 at 10:00 am

CVR Computer Supplies

W.B. Mason Co., Inc.

The Tree House

Allied Document Solutions & Svcs

Beepsmart Communications,
Inc. dba Smart Group Systems

Supply-Saver Corporation

SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY

1606 Bowling Green Drive

151 Heller Place

PO Box 413

200 Church Street

990 N. Bowser Rd, Ste 720

1324 Wyckoff Road

OF PRINTER RIBBONS, PRINTER INK JET

Cherry Hill, NJ 08003

Bellmawr, NJ 08031

Norwood, MA 02062

Swedesboro, NJ 08085

Richardson, TX 75081

Neptune, NJ 08753

AND TONER CARTRIGES,FAX MACHINE

Steve Yuhas VP of Sales

Daniel Orr, Jr., Senior V.P.

David Rizzo -Sales

Robert Richardson, President

Mickey Farugue, CEOQ

Laurence L. Jones, President

TONER AND DRUM UNITS TO BE

856 857-0355

888-926-2766

800 595-6651

856-241-2000

972-235-2161

800-526-2794

UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

856 857-0357 Fax

888-598-1788 - Fax

781 278-0706 Fax

856-241-2290

Fax-1-888-427-8990

732-938-4045 - Fax

IN THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER

252 |HEW-CF401X Magenta $86.00 $67.07 $66.00 $68.75 $72.40 $99.00
253 |HEW-CF402A Yellow $68.00 $53.10 $55.40 $68.75 $57.00 $79.00
254 |HEW-CF402X Cyan $86.00 $67.07 $66.00 $68.75 $72.40 $99.00
255 |HEW-CF403A Magenta $70.00 $53.10 $55.40 $68.75 $57.00 $79.00
256 |HEW-CF403X Yellow $86.00 $67.07 $66.00 $68.75 $72.40 $99.00
257 |HEW-CF410A Black $72.00 $58.79 $59.00 No Bid $60.50 $79.00
258 |HEW-CF411A Cyan $88.00 $75.93 $71.00 No Bid $78.95 $99.00
259 |HEW-CF412A Magenta $89.00 $75.93 $71.00 No Bid $78.95 $99.00
260 |HEW-CF413A Yellow $90.00 $75.93 $71.00 No Bid $78.95 $99.00
261 |HEW-CH565A Black $40.00 $34.74 $40.80 No Bid $45.00 $45.00
262 |HEW-CH566A Cyan $29.00 $25.21 No Bid No Bid $49.00 $34.00
263 |HEW-CH563WN Black $29.00 $23.78 $28.05 No Bid $37.00 $39.00
264 |HEW-CH564WN Tri Color $29.00 $24.78 $29.15 No Bid $38.00 $39.00
265 |HEW-CH567A Magenta $29.00 $25.21 No Bid No Bid $85.00 $35.00
266 |HEW-CH568A Yellow $29.00 $25.21 No Bid No Bid $85.00 $35.00
267 |HEW-CNO45AN Black $28.00 $31.61 $30.10 No Bid $29.40 $41.00
268 |HEW-CNO46AN Cyan $28.00 $24.34 $23.10 No Bid $22.35 $34.00
269 |HEW-CNO047AN Magenta $28.00 $24.34 $23.10 No Bid $22.35 $34.00
270 |HEW-CNO48AN Yellow $28.00 $24.34 $23.10 No Bid $22.35 $34.00
271 |HEW-CNO49AN Black $26.00 $22.02 $20.80 No Bid $20.10 $29.00
272 |HEW-CNO50A Cyan $19.00 $15.86 $14.85 No Bid $14.30 $23.00
273 |HEW-CNO51A Magenta $15.86 $14.85 No Bid $14.30 $21.00
274 |HEW-CNO52A Yellow $18.00 $15.86 $14.85 No Bid $14.30 $21.00
275 |HEW-CNO53AN Black $29.00 $25.63 $24.10 No Bid $14.30 $33.00
276 |HEW-CNO54AN Cyan $16.00 $13.56 $12.90 No Bid $12.45 $18.00
277 |HEW-CNO55AN Magenta $16.00 $13.56 $12.90 No Bid $12.45 $18.00
278 |HEW-CNO56AN Yellow $16.00 $13.56 $12.90 No Bid $12.45 $18.00
279 |HEW-CNO58AN Cyan $11.00 $9.45 $8.95 No Bid $8.50 $13.00
280 |HEW-CNO59AN Magenta $11.00 $9.45 $8.95 No Bid $8.50 $13.00
281 |HEW-CNOG0AN Yellow $11.00 $9.45 $8.95 No Bid $8.50 $13.00
282 |HEW-CNO0684WN Black $24.00 $17.71 $20.40 No Bid $19.85 $29.00
283 |HEW-Q1338A $124.00 $134.36 $127.00 $72.00 $131.00 $155.00
284 |HEW-01339A $100.00 No Bid $169.00 $91.75 $290.00 $169.00
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285 |HEW-0Q2610A $112.00 $125.44 $115.00 $79.75 $115.00 $139.00
286 |HEW-02612A $60.00 $57.60 $50.00 $38.25 $55.00 $72.00
287 |HEW-02613A $60.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $85.00 $49.00
288 |HEW-02613X $92.00 $92.21 $86.00 $40.75 $85.00 $109.00
289 |HEW-0Q2670A $60.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $85.00 $99.00
290 |HEW-02671A Cyan $60.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $85.00 $109.00
291 |HEW-02672A Cyan $60.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $85.00 $109.00
292 |HEW-0Q2673A Magenta $60.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $85.00 $109.00
293 |HEW-0Q3655A (Maintenance Kit) $250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $289.00 $169.00
294 |HEW-0Q5421A $277.00 $239.98 $290.40 $197.50 $230.00 $269.00
295 |HEW-0Q5942A $142.00 $134.87 $125.00 $69.75 $128.00 $159.00
296 |HEW-05942X $192.00 $204.08 $188.00 $118.00 $194.00 $229.00
297 |HEW-0Q5949A $61.00 $74.47 $68.00 $38.50 $70.00 $89.00
298 |HEW-05949X $126.00 $136.25 $126.00 $119.25 $131.10 $159.00
299 |HEW-Q6000A Black $61.00 $68.42 $63.00 $56.50 $72.00 $79.00
300 |HEW-OQ6001A Cyan $61.00 $74.67 $69.00 $47.00 $72.00 $85.00
301 |JHEW-0O6002A Yellow $61.00 $74.67 $69.00 $47.00 $72.00 $85.00
302 |HEW-OQ6003A Magenta $61.00 $74.67 $69.00 $47.00 $72.00 $85.00
303 |[HEW-0Q6511A $60.00 No Bid No Bid $74.75 $175.00 $119.00
304 |HEW-Q7551A $86.00 $106.64 $97.00 No Bid $101.50 $125.00
305 |HEW-Q7551X $160.00 $178.66 $165.00 $115.00 $171.00 $205.00
306 |HEW-Q7553A $66.00 $72.80 $68.00 $55.50 $70.00 $99.00
307 |RMI-1082 $201.00 $146.96 No Bid No Bid $295.00 $269.00
308 |Toner 43X $252.00 $226.69 $213.00 $118.00 $222.00 $289.00
309 |TROY-02-81136-001 $440.00 $412.08 $383.75 No Bid $425.00 $419.00
310 |HP81A $147.00 $113.31 $117.00 $83.50 $117.00 $149.00
311 |HP81X $240.00 $191.03 $196.00 $99.25 $200.00 $229.00
1BM
312 1053685 $30.00 $28.04 $36.35 No Bid $195.00 $59.00
KYOCERA
313 |FS-C8550DN $89.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $315.00 No Bid
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314 |TK3102 Black $89.00 $56.99 $57.50 No Bid $67.00 $69.00
315 |TK5242 Yellow $89.00 $76.28 $68.70 No Bid $74.00 $79.00
316 |TK5242C Cyan $89.00 $76.28 $68.70 No Bid $74.00 $79.00
317 |TK5242M Magenta $88.00 $76.28 $68.70 No Bid $74.00 $79.00
318 |TK5242K Black $87.00 $55.71 $55.90 No Bid $59.00 $67.00
319 |TK-572C $85.00 $115.28 $119.15 No Bid $127.00 $139.00
320 |TK-572K $85.00 $88.82 $91.05 No Bid $98.00 $109.00
321 |TK572M $86.00 $115.28 $119.15 No Bid $127.00 $139.00
322 |TK572Y $86.00 $115.28 $119.15 No Bid $127.00 $139.00
323 |TK582C $86.00 $61.79 $64.45 No Bid $68.00 $79.00
324 |TK582K $86.00 $48.26 $49.10 No Bid $54.00 $59.00
325 |TK582M $86.00 $61.79 $64.45 No Bid $70.00 $79.00
326 |TK582Y $86.00 $61.79 $64.45 No Bid $70.00 $79.00
327 |TK-8602K $96.00 $95.40 $94.80 No Bid $97.00 $109.00
328 |TK-8602C $180.00 $175.44 $182.70 No Bid $190.00 $199.00
329 |TK-8602M $180.00 $175.44 $182.70 No Bid $190.00 $199.00
330 |TK-8602Y $180.00 $175.44 $182.70 No Bid $190.00 $199.00
Lexmark
331 |52D100 $126.00 $126.27 $121.30 $105.75 $129.00 $129.00
332 |C500H2KG Black $96.00 No Bid No bid No Bid $65.00 $109.00
333 |E260A11A $101.00 $108.68 $104.45 No Bid $111.00 $104.00
334 |J654X11A $429.00 $473.24 No bid No Bid $295.00 $349.00
335 |MS710 $126.00 $126.27 No bid No Bid $380.00 $129.00
336 _|T654X11A $446.00 $473.24 $455.15 No Bid $380.00 $349.00
337 _]52D1H00 $126.00 $374.59 $360.50 No Bid $380.00 $349.00
338 |78C10KO Black $60.00 $60.00 $58.90 No Bid $65.00 $69.00
339 [78C10YO Yellow $72.00 $71.58 $70.05 No Bid $74.00 $83.00
340 |78C10MO Magenta $72.00 $71.58 $70.05 No Bid $74.00 $83.00
341 |78C10CO Cvyan $72.00 $71.58 $70.05 No Bid $74.00 $83.00
OCE
342 11060016924 (Black) $160.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $179.00




PD 020-008

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

Bid Opening 3/03/20 at 10:00 am

CVR Computer Supplies

W.B. Mason Co., Inc.

The Tree House

Allied Document Solutions & Svcs

Beepsmart Communications,
Inc. dba Smart Group Systems

Supply-Saver Corporation

SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY

1606 Bowling Green Drive

151 Heller Place

PO Box 413

200 Church Street

990 N. Bowser Rd, Ste 720

1324 Wyckoff Road

OF PRINTER RIBBONS, PRINTER INK JET

Cherry Hill, NJ 08003

Bellmawr, NJ 08031

Norwood, MA 02062

Swedesboro, NJ 08085

Richardson, TX 75081

Neptune, NJ 08753

AND TONER CARTRIGES,FAX MACHINE

Steve Yuhas VP of Sales

Daniel Orr, Jr., Senior V.P.

David Rizzo -Sales

Robert Richardson, President

Mickey Farugue, CEOQ

Laurence L. Jones, President

TONER AND DRUM UNITS TO BE

856 857-0355

888-926-2766

800 595-6651

856-241-2000

972-235-2161

800-526-2794

UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

856 857-0357 Fax

888-598-1788 - Fax

781 278-0706 Fax

856-241-2290

Fax-1-888-427-8990

732-938-4045 - Fax

IN THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER

343 11060016925 (Yellow) $153.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $179.00
344 11060016926 (Cyan) $152.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $179.00
345 11060016927 (Magenta) $150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $179.00
346 11060019424 Black Ink $180.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $169.00
347 11060019425 Yellow $80.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $169.00
348 11060019426 Cyan Ink $80.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $169.00
349 11060019427 Magenta Ink $79.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $169.00
Sharp
350 |FO50ND Toner $69.00 $102.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid $139.00
351 |FO47DR Drum $60.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $109.00
Xerox
352 |XER-106R03690 Cyan $147.00 $167.94 $151.00 No Bid $155.00 $164.00
353 |XER-106R03691 Magenta $147.00 $165.97 $151.00 No Bid $155.00 $164.00
354 |XER-106R03692 Yellow $150.00 $165.97 $151.00 No Bid $155.00 $164.00
355 |XER-106R03480 Black $118.00 $131.20 $119.05 No Bid $120.00 $129.00
356 |XER-108R00292 Black No Bid $100.37 No Bid No Bid $120.00 No Bid
357 |XER-108R00723 Cyan $106.00 $135.92 $117.75 No Bid $137.00 $125.00
358 |XER-108R00724 Magenta $107.00 $135.92 $117.75 No Bid $137.00 $125.00
359 |XER-108R00725 Yellow $108.00 $135.92 $117.75 No Bid $137.00 $125.00
360 |XER-108R00726 Black (3 sticks) $87.00 $89.22 $71.90 No Bid $89.00 $84.00
361 |XER-108R00727 Black (6 sticks) $106.00 $133.44 $109.55 No Bid $137.00 $109.00
362 |XER-108R00926 Cyan $156.00 $159.27 $138.35 No Bid $159.00 $149.00
363 |XER-108R00927 Magenta $156.00 $159.27 $138.35 No Bid $159.00 $149.00
364 |XER-108R00928 Yellow $154.00 $159.27 $138.35 No Bid $159.00 $149.00
365 |XER-108R00929 Black (2 pack) $140.00 $100.37 $90.80 No Bid $130.00 $109.00
366 | XER-108R00930 Black (4 pack) $181.00 $159.27 $138.35 No Bid $170.00 $149.00
367 |108R01417 Cyan Drum $80.00 $89.59 No Bid No Bid $85.00 $89.00
368 |108R01418 Magenta Drum $82.00 $88.54 No Bid No Bid $84.00 $89.00
369 |108R01419 Yellow $80.00 $88.54 No Bid No Bid $84.00 $89.00
370 |108R01420 Black Drum $84.00 $88.54 No Bid No Bid $84.00 $89.00




PD 020-008

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

Bid Opening 3/03/20 at 10:00 am

CVR Computer Supplies

W.B. Mason Co., Inc.

The Tree House

Allied Document Solutions & Svcs

Beepsmart Communications,
Inc. dba Smart Group Systems

Supply-Saver Corporation

SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY

1606 Bowling Green Drive

151 Heller Place

PO Box 413

200 Church Street

990 N. Bowser Rd, Ste 720

1324 Wyckoff Road

OF PRINTER RIBBONS, PRINTER INK JET

Cherry Hill, NJ 08003

Bellmawr, NJ 08031

Norwood, MA 02062

Swedesboro, NJ 08085

Richardson, TX 75081

Neptune, NJ 08753

AND TONER CARTRIGES,FAX MACHINE

Steve Yuhas VP of Sales

Daniel Orr, Jr., Senior V.P.

David Rizzo -Sales

Robert Richardson, President

Mickey Farugue, CEOQ

Laurence L. Jones, President

TONER AND DRUM UNITS TO BE

856 857-0355

888-926-2766

800 595-6651

856-241-2000

972-235-2161

800-526-2794

UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

856 857-0357 Fax

888-598-1788 - Fax

781 278-0706 Fax

856-241-2290

Fax-1-888-427-8990

732-938-4045 - Fax

IN THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER

371 |XER-109R00783 Extended $99.00 $99.58 $90.80 No Bid $105.00 $103.00
372 | XER-109R00784 Standard $63.00 $61.84 $54.85 No Bid $64.00 $69.00
373 |XER-113R00711 Black $227.00 Not included with Bid $189.25 No Bid $226.00 $209.00
374 |XER-113R00719 Cyan $131.00 Not included with Bid $118.90 No Bid $135.00 $124.00
375 | XER-113R00720 Magenta $130.00 Not included with Bid $118.90 No Bid $135.00 $124.00
376 |XER-113R00721 Yellow $129.00 Not included with Bid $118.90 No Bid $135.00 $124.00
377 |XER-113R00723 Cyan $256.00 $261.06 $225.20 No Bid $264.00 $249.00
378 |XER-113R00724 Yellow $256.00 $261.06 $225.20 No Bid $264.00 $249.00
379 |XER-113R00725 Magenta $256.00 $261.06 $225.20 No Bid $264.00 $249.00
380 |XER-113R00726 Black $211.00 $226.59 $199.90 No Bid $229.00 $249.00
CE410A REPLACE WITH CE410X;
CF226A REPLACE WITH CF226X;
CF230A REPLACE WITH CF230X;
CF280A REPLACE WITH CF280X;
CF400A REPLACE WITH CF400X;
CF401A REPLACE WITH CF401X;
CF402A REPLACE WITH CF402X;
VARIATIONS NONE NONE NONE CF403A REPLACE WITH CF403X NONE NONE
THIS IS A ONE YEAR CONTRACT
Will you extend your prices to local YES NO YES YES NO NO
government entities within the County
Bid specifications sent to: The Office Pal Prime Vendor Royal Imaging NPA Computers Office Ventures Bid Prime
Aita Technologies Onvia Access Products Bidnet Beyond Technology PC University Distributors
Can-Am Wireless Magtec Corporation Y&S Technologies Barbarian USA Erepublic RJ InfoMedia
Mvation Worldwide Dallas Paper& Packaging Supplies Hotline Corp. Supplies Outlet Heritage School Wholesale Supplies

Buy on Purpose

Elite Textile Trading

Lotus Logistics

Star Data




PD 020-008 VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR:

Beepsmart Communications,

Bid Opening 3/03/20 at 10:00 am CVR Computer Supplies W.B. Mason Co., Inc. The Tree House Allied Document Solutions & Svcs Inc. dba Smart Group Systems |Supply-Saver Corporation

SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY 1606 Bowling Green Drive 151 Heller Place PO Box 413 200 Church Street 990 N. Bowser Rd, Ste 720 1324 Wyckoff Road

OF PRINTER RIBBONS, PRINTER INK JET Cherry Hill, NJ 08003 Bellmawr, NJ 08031 Norwood, MA 02062 Swedesboro, NJ 08085 Richardson, TX 75081 Neptune, NJ 08753

AND TONER CARTRIGES,FAX MACHINE Steve Yuhas VP of Sales Daniel Orr, Jr., Senior V.P. David Rizzo -Sales Robert Richardson, President Mickey Farugue, CEOQ Laurence L. Jones, President

TONER AND DRUM UNITS TO BE 856 857-0355 888-926-2766 800 595-6651 856-241-2000 972-235-2161 800-526-2794

UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS 856 857-0357 Fax 888-598-1788 - Fax 781 278-0706 Fax 856-241-2290 Fax-1-888-427-8990 732-938-4045 - Fax

IN THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER

Based upon the bids received | recommend the bid

be awarded to each vendor as follows as the lowest

responsive, responsible bidder:

CVR Computer Supplies is awar
335, 337, 342, 343, 344, 345, 34¢

ded item numbers 2, 7, 8, 9, 10, 13,
, 347, 348, 349, 350, 351, 352, 353,

14, 15, 19, 23, 26, 40, 46, 47,
854, 355, 357, 358, 359, 361,

367, 368, 369, and 370.

A48, 50, 51, 52, 54, 55, 66, 96, 143, 144, 1

66, 267, 289, 290, 291, 292, 303,

304, 313, 319, 320, 321, 322, 333,

W.B. Mason is awarded item nu
261 through 266, 282, 307, 312,

mbers 44, 45, 49, 65, 72, 75 through
314, 318, 323 through 326, 328, 329

95, 101 through 106, 108, 13
, 330, and 356.

2, 134, 147 through 157, 160, 161, 162,

163, 171, 179, 180, 181, 184, 218

, 229, 237, 249, 251, 253, 255, 257,

The Tree House is awarded item
through 201, 234, 235, 250, 252

numbers 1, 3, 4,5, 6, 11, 12, 16, 17
254, 256, 258, 259, 260, 309, 315, 3

| 18, 21, 24, 25, 27, 28 throug
16, 317, 327, 338, 339, 340, 3

h 39, 41, 42, 43, 53, 56, 57, 58, 59, 63, 6
41, 360, 362 through 366, 371, 373 thro

ugh 380.

4,109 through 113, 117, 118, 11

9, 120, 122, 146, 158, 177, 178, 197

Allied Document Solutions & S
through 302, 305, 306, 308, 310

cs is awarded item numbers 165, 16
311, 331.

7, 192 through 196, 202 thro

ugh 214, 217, 219 through 228, 230, 231

, 232, 233, 236, 238 through 248, 283, 284, 285, 286, 288, 294

Beepsmart Communications dbz
through 176, 182, 183, 185 thro

ugh 191, 215, 216, 268 through 281,

Smart Group Systems awarded itern numbers 46, 60, 61, 62, 73,

332, 334 and 370.

74,97, 98, 99, 100, 114, 115, 116, 121, 1

23 through 131, 133, 135 through 142, 159, 164, 168, 169, 170, 172

Supply Saver Corporation is aw:

arded item numbers 20, 67, 68, 69, 7

0, 287, 293, 336, and 346.

Sincerely

Kimberly Larter, QPA
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