

	ITEM DESCRIPTION	Manufacturer	MFG. Part #	Quantity	Vendor Part #	Substitution Permitted with Approved "Or Equal"?	Bound Tree	Henry Schein	Common Cents	Quadmed	Medline
1	Adult BVM w/peep	Ambu/Spur	520 211 001	12/box		NO	\$151.80/bx	\$134.64	\$151.54	\$146.72	\$146.12
2	Pediatric BVM	Ambu/Spur	530 213 000	12/box		NO	\$145.80/bx	\$128.76	\$150.86	\$153.84	\$158.42
3	Infant BVM	Ambu/Spur	540 212 000	12/box		NO	\$145.80/bx	\$128.76	\$150.86	\$153.84	\$158.42
4	Oxygen Cylinder Wrench	Western Medica	MCW-2BC	1/ea		yes	\$2.85/ea	\$0.75	\$3.19	\$1.85	\$3.18
5	Oxygen Cylinder Wrench	Western Medica	MCW-3P	1/ea		yes	\$0.82/ea	\$0.54	No Bid	\$0.44	\$39.32
6	Medical Dust Cap	Ratermann	MP-POPK100	100/pk		NO	\$No Bid	\$No Bid	\$15.88	no bid	no bid
7	Adult Partial Non-rebreather Mask	Hudson RCI	1059	50/cs		NO	\$50.00/cs	\$61.50	\$47.91	\$58.00	\$81.91
8	Adult Nasal Canula	Hudson RCI	1103	50/cs		NO	\$16.50/cs	\$21.00	\$15.36	\$23.00	\$31.02
9	Pediatric Partial Non-rebreather Mask	Hudson RCI	1058	50/cs		NO	\$53.00/cs	\$80.50	\$47.91	\$82.00	\$118.23
10	Pediatric Nasal Canula	Hudson RCI	1838	50/cs		NO	No Bid	\$68.20	\$53.93	\$84.50	\$86.16
11	O2 Supply Tubing	Hudson RCI	1115	50/cs		NO	\$24.95/cs	\$17.50	\$15.83	\$31.00	\$24.02
12	Oxygen Prefilled Humidifier	Hudson RCI	003-40	20/cs		yes	\$26.20/cs	\$30.84	\$28.70	no bid	\$28.02
13	Adult Trach Collar	Hudson RCI	1075	1/ea		NO	\$0.85/ea	\$1.17	\$0.92	\$1.48	\$73.71
14	Pediatric Trach Collar	Hudson RCI	1076	1/ea		NO	\$1.07/ea	\$1.59	\$1.15	\$1.73	\$97.00
	Nasal Airways: (Robertazzi style)										
15	12 fr	Rusch	123312	10/bx		NO	\$23.10/bx	\$28.60	\$22.39	\$23.80	\$34.00
16	14 fr	Rusch	123314	10/bx		NO	\$17.30/bx	\$28.60	\$22.39	\$23.80	\$34.00
17	16 fr	Rusch	123316	10/bx		NO	\$17.30/bx	\$28.60	\$22.39	\$23.80	\$34.00
18	18 fr	Rusch	123316	10/bx		NO	\$23.50/bx	\$28.60	\$22.39	\$23.80	\$34.00
19	20 fr	Rusch	123120	10/bx		NO	\$23.50/bx	\$26.40	\$22.39	\$23.30	\$56.95
20	22 fr	Rusch	123222	10/bx		NO	\$17.30/bx	\$26.40	\$22.39	\$23.30	\$56.95
21	24 fr	Rusch	123124	10/bx		NO	\$23.50/bx	\$26.40	\$22.39	\$23.30	\$56.95
22	26 fr	Rusch	123126	10/bx		NO	\$23.50/bx	\$27.50	\$22.39	\$23.30	\$56.95
23	28 fr	Rusch	123128	10/bx		NO	\$23.50/bx	\$27.20	\$22.39	\$23.30	\$68.34
24	30 fr	Rusch	123230	10/bx		NO	\$23.50/bx	\$32.90	\$22.39	\$23.30	\$56.95

25	32 fr	Rusch	123132	10/bx		NO	\$17.30/bx	\$34.00	\$22.39	\$23.30	\$56.95
26	34 fr	Rusch	123234	10/bx		NO	\$17.30/bx	\$33.00	\$22.39	\$23.30	\$56.95
27	36 fr	Rusch	123236	10/bx		NO	\$17.30/bx	\$30.60	\$22.39	\$23.30	\$56.95
28	Sterile Lubricating Jelly (for above)	Dynarex	1250	12/bx		NO	\$0.60/bx	\$4.80	\$5.73	\$69.60	\$49.93
	Oral Airways: (Color Coded, Berman style)										
29	#00 (40 mm)	Rusch	121801	50/bx		yes	\$9.00/bx	\$8.26	\$8.61	\$8.00	\$3.50
30	#0 (50 mm)	Rusch	121850	50/bx		yes	\$9.00/bx	\$8.25	\$8.61	\$8.00	\$3.50
31	#1 (60 mm)	Rusch	121802	50/bx		yes	\$9.00/bx	\$8.50	\$8.61	\$8.00	\$3.50
32	#2 (70 mm)	Rusch	121870	50/bx		yes	\$9.00/bx	\$8.50	\$8.61	\$8.00	\$3.50
33	#3 (80 mm)	Rusch	121803	50/bx		yes	\$9.00/bx	\$8.50	\$8.61	\$8.00	\$3.50
34	#4 (90 mm)	Rusch	122804	50/bx		yes	\$9.00/bx	\$9.00	\$8.61	\$8.00	\$3.50
35	#5 (100 mm)	Rusch	121805	50/bx		yes	\$9.00/bx	\$8.50	\$8.61	\$8.00	\$3.50
36	#6 (110 mm)	Rusch	121806	50/bx		yes	\$9.00/bx	\$8.50	\$8.61	\$8.00	\$4.12
	Suction Canisters:										
37	On-Board (Sccor)	Bemis	484410	48/cs		NO	\$136.80/cs	\$120.00	No Bid	\$146.04	\$22.73
38	Portable Tubing & Catheter	Sscor	2480-36	10/cs		NO	\$32.00/cs	No Bid	No Bid	\$30.82	\$39.25
39	Replacement Canister for Quickdraw	Sscor	2480-20	20/cs		NO	\$303.00/cs	\$276.10	No Bid	\$268.80	\$360.00
	Manual Suction Canisters:										
40	Neonate / Pediatric	ResQvac/Repro-Med	2254	1/ea		NO	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.63	\$13.36	No Bid
41	Soft Yankauer	ResQvac/Repro-Med	2216	1/ea		NO	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.63	\$13.36	No Bid
42	Rigid Yankauer	ResQvac/Repro-Med	2217	1/ea		NO	No Bid	No Bid	\$27.09	\$14.24	No Bid
43	First Responder Kit	ResQvac/Repro-Med	321420	1/ea		NO	\$69.20/ea	No Bid	\$81.73	\$74.88	No Bid
	Soft Suction Catheters:										
44	6 fr	Dynarex	4806	50/cs		yes	\$7.00/cs	\$10.50	\$9.76	\$9.50	\$33.79
45	8 fr	Dynarex	4808	50/cs		yes	\$7.00/cs	\$10.50	\$9.76	\$9.50	\$25.80
46	10 fr	Dynarex	4810	50/cs		yes	\$7.00/cs	\$10.50	\$9.76	\$9.50	\$35.21
47	12 fr	Dynarex	4812	50/cs		yes	\$7.00/cs	\$10.50	\$9.76	\$9.50	\$34.33
48	14 fr	Dynarex	4814	50/cs		yes	\$7.00/cs	\$10.50	\$9.76	\$9.50	\$34.98
49	16 fr	Dynarex	4816	50/cs		yes	\$7.00/cs	\$10.50	\$9.76	\$9.50	\$38.58
50	18 fr	Dynarex	4818	50/cs		yes	\$7.00/cs	\$10.50	\$9.76	\$34.20	\$39.10
51	Suction Tubing	Medline	DYND50216	50/cs		yes	\$26.00/cs	\$22.07	\$28.70	\$39.00	\$17.98
52	Yankauer Suctions Catheters w/ tubing (vented)	Medline	DYND50137	20/cs		NO	\$41.00/cs	\$37.84	\$44.63	\$34.20	\$24.86
53	Sscor Quickdraw replacement Battery	Sscor	80613-100	1/ea		NO	\$21.26/cs	\$19.25	no bid	\$23.88	\$25.50

[illegible]

82	Small	Kimberley Clark	55081	10/cs		NO	\$7.64/bx of 100*	\$69.10	\$78.64	\$69.64	\$67.00
83	Medium	Kimberley Clark	55082	10/cs		NO	\$7.64/bx of 100*	\$69.10	\$78.64	\$69.64	\$67.00
84	Large	Kimberley Clark	55083	10/cs		NO	\$7.64/bx of 100*	\$69.10	\$78.64	\$69.64	\$67.00
85	X-Large	Kimberley Clark	55084	10/cs		NO	\$7.64/bx of 100*	\$0.77	\$78.64	\$69.64	\$67.00
86	Infection Control Kits	Common Cents EMS	No Part Number	1 ea		yes	\$1.72/ea	\$7.36	\$2.16	\$3.08	\$577.98
87	Cover Gowns	Dynarex	2141	1/cs		NO	\$15.85/cs	\$14.31	\$14.92	\$15.15	\$46.69
88	Shoe Covers	Dynarex	2132	1/cs		NO	\$15.85/cs	\$15.40	\$16.07	\$4.59	\$22.13
	HEPA Masks: (N95)										
89	Small	3M	1860S	20/bx		NO	\$18.25/bx	\$15.51	\$21.81	\$24.15	\$85.42
90	Regular	3M	1860	20/bx		NO	\$18.25/bx	\$15.51	\$21.81	\$16.48	\$85.42
91	Small	Moldex	1510 N95	20/bx		NO	\$19.49/bx	\$21.21	No Bid	\$24.82	\$85.42
92	Medium	Moldex	1512 N95	20/bx		NO	\$19.49/bx	\$21.21	No Bid	\$26.94	\$85.42
93	Large	Moldex	1513 N95	20/bx		NO	\$19.49/bx	\$21.21	No Bid	\$23.60	\$85.42
94	Ear Loop Mask w/ Extended Face Shield	Halyard Health	47137	25/pkg		yes	\$28.50/bx	\$26.28	\$79.21	\$17.48	\$36.34
95	Safety Glasses	Crews/Excalibur	99910	1/ea		yes	\$1.62/ea	\$1.85	\$1.40	\$1.80	\$114.96
96	Vionex Towelletes	Metrex/Vionex	10-1510	50/bx		NO	No Bid	mft disc	\$8.55	No bid	\$61.45
97	Vionex Liquid Soap 18oz	Metrex/Vionex	10-1518	1/ea		NO	\$6.20/ea	\$8.61	\$10.33	\$10.94	\$30.45
98	Vionex No Rinse Gel	Metrex/Vionex	10-1624	1/ea		NO	No Bid	\$3.40	\$4.42	\$4.38	\$20.94
99	Hype-Wype Bleach Pads	Current Technology	9103	1/cs		NO	No Bid	\$52.48	\$60.73	No bid	\$79.69
100	Equipment Disinfection Wipes	Dynarex/Sani-Cloth HB	P-Q08472	1/cs		NO	\$5.90/TB of 160*	\$19.60	\$70.12	\$82.08	\$52.39
101	Sani-Hands Wipes	PDI Helathcare	P-13472	1/cs		NO	No Bid	\$54.12	\$56.44	\$69.00	\$22.62
102	Disinfectant Spray	Metrex/Cavicide	13-5024	1/cs		NO	\$9.80/ea	\$7.67	\$9.46	\$134.36	\$71.71
103	Spray Cleaner	Sparten Chemical SD 20	6520	1/cs		NO	No Bid	No Bid	\$78.40	No bid	No bid
104	Ice Packs 5 X 9 (loose)	Dynarex	4512	1/cs		yes	\$7.44/cs	\$7.92	\$12.63	\$9.35	\$14.19
105	Hot Packs 5 X 9 (loose)	Dynarex	4516	1/cs		yes	\$11.45/cs	\$9.63	\$13.78	\$13.78	\$18.32
106	Adult B/P Cuff	Mabis Healthcare	09-149-011	1/ea		yes	\$6.46/ea	\$5.50	\$5.74	\$5.22	\$12.00
107	Lg. Adult B/P Cuff	Mabis Healthcare	09-149-016	1/ea		yes	\$6.35/ea	\$5.50	\$11.37	\$5.22	\$13.74
108	Child B/P Cuff	Mabis Healthcare	09-149-015	1/ea		yes	\$6.10/ea	\$5.50	\$9.18	\$5.22	\$11.69
109	Infant B/P Cuff	Mabis Healthcare	09-149-013	1/ea		yes	\$6.10/ea	\$5.50	\$8.04	\$5.22	\$11.41
110	Stethoscope (Sprague Rappaport)	Mabis Healthcare	10-419-3601	1/ea		yes	\$3.92/ea	\$5.50	\$5.68	\$4.44	\$3.83
111	AED Electrodes (LP 12/15 Compatible)	Kendall/Meditrace	31319281	1/cs		NO	\$16.70/pk of 1*	\$213.60	\$202.68	\$188.80	\$171.70
112	Bulb Syringe	Medline	DYND70280	1/ea		yes	\$0.61/ea	\$0.63	\$0.90	\$0.69	\$17.59

[illegible]

143	Stifneck Select Adult	Laerdal	980010	1/cs		NO	\$5.08/ea	\$4.95	\$298.48	\$280.50	\$259.06
144	Stifneck Select Pediatric	Laerdal	980020	1/cs		NO	\$5.08/ea	\$5.05	\$119.39	\$328.50	\$103.62
145	Stifneck Pediatric	Laerdal	980200	1/cs		NO	\$5.08/ea	\$4.77	\$280.11	\$280.50	\$259.06
146	Stifneck Baby No Neck	Laerdal	980100	1/cs		NO	\$5.08/ea	\$4.77	\$280.11	\$280.50	\$259.06
147	Philly - Child	Ossur USA/Royce Medical	213103	1/ea		NO	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.76
148	Philly - Small	Ossur USA/Royce Medical	213303	1/ea		NO	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.17
149	Philly - Medium	Ossur USA/Royce Medical	213305	1/ea		NO	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.17
150	Philly - Large	Ossur USA/Royce Medical	213307	1/ea		NO	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.17
151	Philly - XLarge	Ossur USA/Royce Medical	213308	1/ea		NO	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.17
152	Disposable Longboard Straps	Compliance Medical Mfg	402	1/cs		NO	\$38.00/ea	No Bid	\$232.47	No Bid	\$6.00
153	Phillips AED Pad Cartridge	Phillips	M5071A	1/ea		NO	\$38.00/ea	\$42.99	\$46.15	\$44.18	\$67.00
154	Phillips AED Pad Cartridge - Pedi	Phillips	M5072A	1/ea		NO	\$62.20/ea	\$69.29	\$74.39	\$71.20	\$101.00
155	Phillips AED Battery	Phillips	M5070A	1/ea		NO	\$101.25/ea	\$108.43	\$116.41	\$114.00	\$165.00
156	Padded Board Splint (small) 15 inch	Morrison Medical	1815	1/ea		yes	\$2.50/ea	\$2.76	\$3.31	\$2.21	\$6.89
157	Padded Board Splint (medium) 36 inch	Morrison Medical	1836	1/ea		yes	\$4.72/ea	\$4.56	\$4.28	\$4.35	\$13.44
158	Padded Board Splint (large) 54 inch	Morrison Medical	1854	1/ea		yes	\$4.85/ea	\$5.90	\$5.45	\$5.75	\$17.71
159	Soft-W Tactical Tourniquet	Tactical Medical Solution	SOFTT-W	1/ea		NO	\$21.95/ea	\$29.78	\$24.53	\$24.29	\$43.72
160	Posey Non- Locking Twice as tough CUFFS Wrist	Posey	2750	Pair		NO	\$45.30/pr of 2	\$22.55	\$34.33	\$28.39	\$26.40
161	Posey Non- Locking Twice as tough CUFFS Ankle	Posey	2755	Pair		NO	\$46.24/pr of 2	\$22.77	\$34.33	\$27.84	\$39.25

Bound Tree - Being awarded item #12, 13, 14, 16, 17, 20, 25, 26, 27, 44, 45, 46, 47, 48, 49, 50, 61, 77, 91, 92, 93, 97, 104, 111, 112, 115, 130, 133, 134, 141, 142, 153, 154, 155, 158 and 159.

Henry Schein - Being awarded items #1, 2, 3, 4, 28, 37, 51, 52, 53, 54, 55, 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, 62, 63, 67, 69, 71, 72, 73, 74, 75, 78, 79, 80, 81, 82, 83, 84, 87, 88, 89, 90, 94, 98, 99, 100, 101, 102, 105, 106, 107, 108, 109, 117, 118, 119, 120, 124, 125, 126, 127, 128, 132, 135, 138, 139, 143, 144, 145, 146, 160 and 161.

Common Cents - Being awarded items #6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 15, 18, 19, 21, 22, 23, 24, 68, 86, 95, 96, 103, 114, 123, 129, 131, 137, 140, and 157.

Quadmed - Being awarded items #5, 29, 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36, 38, 39, 40, 41, 42, 43, 64, 65, 66, 70, 76, 85, 110, 113, 116, 121, 122, 136, and 156.

Bound Tree Variations - Where the customer has a lower unit of measure than Bound Tree's, the price is marked with an asterisk and the price given is Bound Tree's lowest unit of measure. #113-SpO2 pulse oximetry sensor, disposable, finger tip/toe, 90.0cm cable length, neonate/infant/adult neonate>40kg infant 10-20kg. #114-SpO2 adapter cable. 3.3 ft for Nellcor SpO2 sensors. #115SpO2 pulse oximetry sensor, disposable, finger tip/toe, 90.0cm cable length, neonate/infant/adult. #116-SpO2 pulse oximetry sensor, reusable finger tip 2.0m cable length, greater than 110 lbs. adult

Henry Schein - No Variations

Common Cents - No Variations

Quadmed - No Variations

Medline - Free freight for stocked items, but customer pays freight for vendor direct items.