PL 018019 VENDOR: VENDOR: FENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDUR:
Bid Opening 3/15/1§ at 16:00 am CVR Compurer Supplies  |W.B. Mason Co., inc. The Tree House Alfied Document Solutions & Sves Adorama, inc. Ribbons Express, Inc. Fhe Office Pal, Inc.
SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY Y Tanner St Sie 107 151 Heller Place PO Box 413 200 Church Streer 42 Waost 18tk Streer 1980 M Cutiberi Road 2.0 Box 2

OF PRINTER RIBBONS, PRINTER INKE JET

Haddonfield, NJ 08033

Bellmawr, NF 08037

Norwood, MA 020062

Swedeshoro, NP O8ORS

New York, NY 10011

Cherry Hill, NF 08634

Lakewood, NI 08701

AND TONER CARTRIGES, FAX MACHINE

Steve Fruhas VP of Sales

Daniel Ore, Jr., Senier VP,

Davidd Rizzo -Sales

Robert Richardson, President

Carofine Brzuszek, Bid Crdn

Thomas Costelle, Sales Mgr

Brenda Friedman

TONER AND DRUM UNITS TO BE ¥56 8570355 888-4926-2766 800 595-6657 856-241-2000 212-741-0401 800-533-9949 87 7-486-0590
UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS 856 857-0357 Fax 386-598-1788 - Fax 781 278-070¢ Fux 856-242-2290 046-756-8554 B56-834-5235 732.363-6933 - Fax
IN THE COUNTT OF GLOUCESTER svevii@yahog.com dnozz@acl.com
Limp Sum Price Lump Sum Price Lumip Sum Price Lump Sum Price Lump Sum Price Luomp Sum Price Lump Sum Price
. $28,475.13 52797877 328, 108,95 525,209.25 52542518 525,310.00 BID REJECTED A8
lter NO CONTRACT NON-RESPONSIVE
Individual Prices
RE
1 |Axiom Model A758 Purple $26.00 GRS $85.00 Mo Bid No Bid Ne Bid Alrernatives
BROTHER
2 JDR40C Fax Drum 5140.00 Ligr3nay $142.25 5167.00 Ne Bid SI51.06
3_IDR420 Fax Drum £70.00 66. 570.90 $83.23 387.8¢ 576.00
4 |DR 500 Fax Drum 5169.00 Sle3.00 FI91.50 No Bid S104.00
5 IBR51D Fax Drum $166.00 515595 $183.50 $176.05 3177200
g IDR526 Fax Dram 3184.00 318110 $312.75 5214.50 S202.00
7 |DR620 Fax Drum SI14.00 §116.60 SI37.00 $136.75 S123.00
& JLC 101 BK 51100 510.20 514.00 §526.79 $12.00
S WY SO0 S6.80 SI12.00 $16.78 39.00
10 JLCO016 C S11.00 36.80 $12.00 No Bid 9.0
11 JLC 101 W 5700 36.80 S12.00 $16.70 $8.00
12 JTN420 Drom S7.60 830,15 $35.5¢0 No Bid 576.00 DR420
13 JTN430 Fax Toner 553,00 £52.60 $61.75 347.65 856.00
14 I'TN450 Fay Toner 547.00 S546.05 554.00 361.85 55000
15 ['TN460 Toner 874.00 £74.20 $94.00 593.05 £79.00
16 ' TMN53{ Toner So60. 00 86530 576.75 No Bid $75.00
17 iTN340 Toner 369,00 566.70 57850 384,14 §78.00
18 JTN35¢ Toner 57400 869,75 $82.00 581,15 $78.00
18 I'TN570 High Yield $91.00 $86.25 5101.25 5105.99 so0.00
20 [TNS8C Toner F00.00 504,95 $111.50 $116.25 ST04.00
1 ITN-65¢ Tomer 59700 $93.25 5109.56 5111.99 399.00
272 JTN-700 Toner F109.00 $99.9¢ 85117.56 8121.65 Sile.00
CANON
23 11Y77B001AA4 Yeliow 573.00 571,99 582,00 576.65 »79.00
24 {1978BO0IAA Magenta $74.00 £71.99 $82.00 £73.90 £79.00




PLGIS-01Y VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR:
Bid Opening 3/15/18 ar 10:00 am CVE Computer Supplies  {W.B. Masor Co., inc. Tire Trec House Allied Document Solutions & Sver Adorama, Inc. Rihbons Express, inc, The Office Pal, Inc.
SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY & Tanner St Ste 107 15} Beller Place PO Box 413 200 Churel Street 42 West 18th Street 1980 Old Cuthber! Road PO Box 2
OF PRINTER RIBBONS, PRINTER INE JET Haddonfield, NY 08033 Eellmawr, NJ 0803] Norwoad, M4 02062 Swedeshare, N.J (18085 New York, NI 10017 Cherry Hill, N7 08034 Lakewood, NF 08767

AND TONER CARTRIGES,FAX MACHINE

Steve ¥uhas VP of Sales

Daniel Orr, Jr., Senior VP,

Duyid Rizzo -Sales

Robert Richardson, President

Caroline Brzuszek, Bid Crdrr

Thoemas Costelio, Sates Mgr

Bremde Friedpun

TONER AND DRUM UNITS TO BE

856 8§57-6355

888-926-2766

800 595-06517

856-241-2000

212-741-0407

800-333-9949 |

877-486-059

UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

856 §57-0357 Fux

8848-598-1788 - Fax

781 278-0706 Fax

§56-241-129¢

G4i-758-8558

836-834-5235

732-363-6933 - Fax

IN THE COUNTT OF GLOUCESTEE

svevri@vahou.com

ar

djidzz(@aol.com

Lumyr Sum Price Lump Sune Price Lump Sum Price Lunmp Sum Price Lamp Swom Price Lump Sum Price Luwmp Sum Price
528,475.13 SZ7978.77 528,108,095 23,200,285 $25425.1% 525,310.00 BID REJECTED AS
liem NO CONTRACT I NON-RESPONSIVE

25 J1879B001A4 Cran $75.00 LgEes $82.00 574,45 579.00

26 |J980B00LAAL Black 576.00 g 7RSI $86.75 88175 $82.00

Z7 12659BO0LA A Yellow 5109.00 $105.50 512450 S112.70 512200

28 |2660B001AA Magenta F109.60 SI1¢5.5¢ $124.50 51i3.29 S122.00

28 1266EB00IAA Cvan §111.00 5105.50 5124.5¢ F108.41 SI122.00

20 {2662B00T AA Black 3109.40 5104.70 §124.50 $176.7¢ 8123.00

31 135008001 Biack $79.60 387.50 58443 582.00

32 16260B0I2AA Velliow $239.00 $255.25 $233.35 No Bid

33 16261BO12AA Miagenta 242,00 $243.71 $5255.25 §5233.40 Ne Bid

34 16262B012AA Cyan F248.00 $£243.71 L 255,25 523340 No Bid

35 |6264B012AA Black $241.08 - B195i05. $196.20 $229.75 $215.55 No Bid

36 16269B001 Vellow $80.00 $3.64. §75.50 $88.00 $89.40 $78.00

37 |6270B001 Magentiz 58204 £75.5¢0 388.00 574,99 £78.00

38 16270B00I Cyan S8400 £73.50 588.00 No Bid 378,00 62718007
39 J62Z72B001AA Black 364.00 362,00 $72.00 861.06 $65.00

40 194358001 369.60 $71.35 §81.75 £72.05 S80.00

41 ICL2IIXL Black 524,90 536.75 No Bid 516,00

42 JCL142M Magenta $14.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

43 |CL1I42PC Phwie Cyan S13.00 No Bid Neo Bid No Bid

44 1CLI42Y Yellow 515.90 Ne Bid No Bid No Bid

A5 |CL142bk Black $15.99 No Bid Ne Bid No Bid

46 JCL142g Gray 316.60 Neo Bid No Bid No Bid

47 |CLY42)gy Light Gray 817.04 No Bid No Bid Ne Bid

48 JCNM3IS00BO01AA 578.00 S87.50 Ne Bid 882,00

48 PG 58K S18.00 $18.13 Ne Bid Ne Bid No Bid

50 |PG210XL Black $22.00 gmse i $28.00 No Bid $12.00

&1 18C CLY-8C Cyan s16.00 316,44 520.00 516.15 518.00

52 18M CL3-8M Magenia 51700 516,44 524,00 577,99 $18.60

53 |8V CL18Y Yeliow 518.00 516.49 520.00 $19.39 $18.00

54 1116 Black 1980B0O1AA $74.00 576.34 $86.75 $81.60 582.00




PD015-01¢ FVENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR:
Bid Opening 3/15/18 ar 10:00 am CVE Computer Suppiies  |W.B. Mason Co., inc. The Trec House Allied Dacument Solutions & Sves Adorama, Inc Ribbons Express, Inc. The Office Pal, Inc.
SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY % Tauner St. Ste 147 157 Heller Place P Box 413 200 Church Streer 42 Wesr 18tk Sireet 1986 Old Cuthberr Road P Box 2
]OF PRINTER RIBBONS, PRINTER INK JET Haddonfield, N7 08433 Bellmawr, NF 08037 Nerwoeod, M4 (12062 Swerdesboro, N.F (08085 New York, NF 1011 Cherry Hill, NJ 18034 Lakewood, NV 0570
] AND TONER CARTRIGES, FAX MACHINE Steve Yuhas VP of Sates | Daniel Orr, Ji., Senior V.F. David Rizze -Sales Rebert Richardson, President Caroline Brzuszek, Bid Crdtr Thomas Costello, Sales Mgr Brenda Friedmun
| TONER AND DRUM UNITS T¢ BE 856 857-0355 888-926-2766 800 5956651 856-241-2000 212-741-0407 800-533-904¢ 877-486-0590
UTILIZED BY VARIOUS BEPARTMENTS 856 857-0357 Fax 888-598-1788 - Fax 787 278-070% Fax 836-241-2290 646-738-8358 8356-834-5235 7352-363-6933 - Fax
IN THE COUNTT OF GLOUCESTER svevr@yahoo,.com diirizz{@anl.com
Lirup Susm Price Lupp Sum Price Lump Suwe Price Lunp Sum Price Lamp Sum Price Liumtp Sum Price Lump Suwm Price
528,475.13 §27,878.77 £28,108.95 025,200.25 525,425,118 §25,310.00 BID RETECTED AS
iemi NO CONFRACT NON-RESPONSIVE

55 1116 Cyan 19798001 A A 573.00 $71.99 882,00 S7L.03 575.00

56 1116 Magenta 1978B00IAA S72.00 571,99 £82.00 $75.94 57800
1 57 |1316 Yellow 1977B001AA 573.00 $71.99 E 582,00 575,60 579.00

58 {116 Black £113.610 SI896.97 i 5109, 74 SI181.00 3116.79 $I123.00

59 1118 Cotors $112.00 3290.91 LBgI0550 No Bid 8445.99 512200

ELSON

60 4592120 Black 319.00 $16.63 $23.75 515,45 52000 T059120

61 18615337 Ribbon S1L00 £9.00 $12.00 S11.35 S10.04

62 |EPS-T048520 $66.00 NO BID Ne Bid No Bid S18.00

63 IERC-22 $1.90 $1.96 No Bid $£3.25 Ne Bid

B4 [T017201 Black $5.0¢ NO BID e Ne Bid No Bid

65 7019261 Color 35.00 NO BID No Bid No Bid Na Bid

66 |T059120 Black $18.60 $16.63 $16.6¢ §23.73 TS 52040

&7 |T059220 Cyan $19.00 316.63 CisTewe T §23.75 $17.1Y $20.00

68 |TOS59320 Magents §16.60 $16.63 516.60 523.75 Sgrse 520,00

69 |T059420 Yellow $20.00 516.63 Csteie0; $23.75 $16.90 $20.00

70 [T059520 Light Cyan $21.60 $16.63 $16.60 §23.75 Ligr6ss $20.00

71 |T059620 Light Magenta 51811 $16.63 CigIe60 523.75 516.90 52000

72 |T059720 Light Biack 819,47 gRge L $16.60 523,75 $16.90 $20.00

73 |T059820 Matte Black $20.11 516.63 el $23.75 520.00 $20.00

74 |T05%920 Light, Light Black 818.47 51660 523.73 CiBnes 520.00

75 ['TOB7020 Gloss Opiimizer 513.00 $13.90 $149.75 513,758 Sre.o0

76 {TOE7120 Photo Black $I3.40 S13.90 514,75 $13.63 516,00

77 1TOS7820 Matie Biack $14.77 513.90 $719.75 $13.63 516.00

78 |TO8T220 Cyan 514.17 FI3.90 $74.75 CURIRA0 51600

78 1TOET320 Magenta 51401 $15.90 $18.75 $516.00

80 {TO87426 Yeliow $15.17 513.9¢ $19.75 [ g $16.00

81 1TO87720 Red $714.77 SE3 90 5719.75 $76.00

82 [TO87920 Orange 315.67 $73.90 519.75 51604




PD (1&-019 VENDOR: VENDOR.: VENDOR: VENDOR: FENDOR: VENDOR: MENDOR:
Bid Opening 3/15/18 ar 10:00 am CVR Computer Supplies | W.B. Masen Co., Inc. The Tree House Alited Document Solutions & Sves Aderama, Inc. Ribbons Express. inc. The Gffice Pal, inc,
SPECTFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY Y Tanner St. S5ie 107 151 Heller Place P} Box 413 200 Church Street 42 West 186 Street 1980 OId Cuthber: Road P Box 2

OF PRINTER RIBBONS, PRINTER INK JET

Haddonfield, NJ 08033

Beltmawr, N7 018031

Norweod, M4 $2062

Swedeshore, NF 08085

New York, NY 10017

Cherry Hill, N 08034

 Lakewood, N7 08761

AND TONER CARTRIGES, FAX MACHINE

Steve Yuhas VP of Sales

BDawniaf Orr, Jr, Seniar P,

David Rizeo -Sales

Rober: Richardson, FPresidenr

Caroline Brouszek, Bl Crdir

Thomas Cosielle, Sales Mgr

Brende Friedman

FONER AND DRUM UNTES TO BE

856 857-0355

888-926-2766

800 5956051

E36-247-2001

2I2-741-0401

8-333-9949

§77-486-059¢4

UTILIEED BY VARIOUS DPEPARTMENTS

856 857-0357 Fax

888-396-1788 - Fax

781 275-6706 Fax

836-241-2290

046-756-8558

§36-834-5233

732-365-6933 - Fax

N THE CQUNTY OF GLOUCESTER

syevi@yahou.com

diirizzftanl.com

Lunp Sum Price Lump St Price Lump Sum Price Lwp Sum Price Lasmp Sum Price Lump S Price Lump Sum Price
528,475, 13 527,878.77 528,108,935 325,200.25 £25, 425,18 525.310.00 BID REJECTED AS
, jtem; . NG CONTRACT NON-RESPONSIVE

83 {T200120¢ Biack SI5.00 $I3.55 §19.73 513,45 F14.00

84 17200220 Cyan $9.00 $59.37 81975 $11.29 51000

E5 [T20032¢ Magents 59.14 $9.37 AIY.75 514.69 S1e.00

86 [T200424 Yeliow S16.00 $9.37 Sr0.75 $11.2% £10.00

87 [T200X1.320 Black XL £30.00 NG BID Ne Bid Nao Bid No Bid

88 |T200X2.220 Cyar XL §17.08 NO BID Ne Bid Ne Bid No Bid

89 {T200XEL320 Mageniz S16.40 NO BID Ne Bid Ne Bid No Bid

90 ['T200X5.420 Yeliow X& $17.20 NGO BID Ne Bid No Bid No Bid

91 1754451 Pheto Black S16.00 342,14 No Bid No Bid 397.00 T5445700
82 |T545100 Black S10.00 $42.14 $63.75 546.98 No Bid

83 11545200 Cyan 310,00 342,14 $63.75 546.98 No Bid

94 1T545300 Magenia $10.00 542,14 $63.75 $46.98 No Bid

95 1T545400 Yellow SI10.00 $42.14 543,75 546.98 Ne Bid

96 [T54550¢ Light Cyan 510.00 S42.14 363.73 $46.98 No Bid

97 1'T545600 Light Magenia 210.00 Sd42.14 $63.75 546,98 No Bid

Fuarge ¥Ymcke
98 [$00015-540 517.00 iiiisgsas $115.00 No Bid Ne Bid Ne Bid
Hewietr Pacicard

99 |HEW-3904 §147.00 $136.12 588.50 S773.68 SI53.00 ICE3904 Dup
100 (HEW-962XL Yellow TeMIGANHI40 $18.00 516.36 $20.75 Ne Bid $29.06

101 [HEW-902XL Black T614AN#140 $32.00 29,00, $37.00 No Bid $34.00

102 |HEW-902X1. Magenia ToMOGANST 4} 517,60 §16.36 520.75 No Bid $19.00

103 JHEW-902X1L, Cyan ToMOZ AN#14( S17.9¢ £28.75 Ne Bid S19.00

104 |JHEW-934 XL, Black $28.00 $33.75 No Bid $32.00 C2P23AN
105 |HEW-S35X1L. Yellow S18.00 K650 522.25 Ne Bid $20.00 C2P2GAN
106 JHEW-235X1. Cyan 81711 516.50 $22.25 No Biid $20.00 C2P24AN
107 JTHEW-$35X1. Magenta 1860 $16.50 £322.25 Ne Bid 520.00 C2P25AN
108 |HEW-950XL Black $33.60 VIRl E 533.40 Ne Bid 53600 CNO45AN




PD 018-01Y VENDOR: VENDOE: PENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: FENDOR:
Bid Opeming 3/15/18 ar 16:00 am CVER Compuier Supplies | W.E. Mason Ca., inc. The Tree House Allied Document Solutions & Sves Aderama, inc. Ribhons Express, inc. Fhe Office Pul, Inc.
SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY 4 Tauner St. Sie 107 151 Heller Place PO Box 413 200 Church Sereer 42 West 18tk Streer 1980 Old Cuthbert Road F.0. Box 2
OF PRINTEK RIBBONS, PRINTER INKE JET Haddonfgield, NY 08033 Belimawr, NJ 0803] Norwoad, M4 02062 Swedesbare, NJ (08085 New York, NT 10011 Cherry Hill, N7 08034 Lakewood, NJ 0871

AND TONER CARTRIGES FAX MACHINE

Steve Fultas VP of Sales

Daniel Orr, Ji., Senior 17.E,

David Rizro ~Sales

Rober: Richardson, President

Caroline Brouszek, Bid Crire

Thomas Costello, Sales Mgr

Brende Friedman

i TONER AND DRUM UNITS TO BE 836 857-035% 888-926-2766 800 5056657 §56-247-2000 212-741-0401 800-533-9949 §77-486-0590
UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS 856 £57-0357 Fare $8E-598-1788 - Fax 781 278-0706 Fax $56-241-2290 646-756-8558 836-834-5235 732-363-6933 - Feex
IN THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER sveviiyahoo.comm diirizzfdiacl.com
Eymp Sum Price Ewump Sum Price Lump Sum Price Laomp Sum Price Lump Sum Price Lusp Sum Price Lump Sum Price
$26,475.13 527, 078,77 $28,108.95 §25,209.25 $25,425.18 §25,310.00 BID REJECTED AS
Trem NO CONTRACT NON-RESPONSIVE
108 1951X1, Cyan, Magenta, Veliow $81.20 $73.64 LA 526,75 Ne Bid No Bid
110 1952 Black FeUISAN 52500 $22.60 CEENERSE $31.50 522,453 52700
111 1852XL Black F6U19AN 536.00 $32.72 £34.25 $43.85 $38.00
1121952 Cyan LOS49AN $17.00 $75.36 $23.50 522,45 $18.00
$13 M952XE Cyan LOS61AN $28.00 §25.30 834,25 $35.70 $29.00
! 444 1952 Magenta LOSSZAN £77.40 $15.56 $23.50 £22.30 $15.00
| 115 1952XL, Magents LOS64AN 528.00 $25.50 $34.25 $335.65 $29.00
116 1952 Veltow LOS55AN $I17.00 515.56 $23.50 $21.33 $73.00
117 (952 XL Yeliow LOSG7AN 952 (3 color combo) 52800 $25.30 $34.25 535.70 $20.00
118 |NOK27AN $53.00 §46.27 $58.75 $71.90 §53.00
1191516454 Brack 544.00 $36.51 547.50 $48.15 542.00
120 |REW-C17754 £5.00 867.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid
121 |HEW-C1825D Color £58.00 845,87 £58.00 $61.89 $55.00
122 |HEW-C2P04A Black §14.00 Ry £19.75 No Bid 815.00
123 [HEW-C2POSAN-62XE $32.00 $28.63 838.23 No Bid $33.00
124 |HEW-C2P064 Tri Color $17.00 e ik KRR £23.50 No Bid $18.00
125 JC2POTAN-62XL 534.00 £31.60 $41.00 No Bid $36.00
126 |HEW-C2P23AN $28.60 i gagen e $26.50 53400 No Bid 532,00
127 [HEW-CIPZ4ANR $18.00 FLARISY $16.50 $23.25 No Bid 52090
128 |HEW-C2P25AN $17.60 : $76.50 £23.25 No Bid £20.00
128 IHEW-C2P26AN §77.20 §16.50 §23.25 Ne Bid 520,00
130 |HEW-C4127% $30.00 BEINIE e $47.00 No Bid No Bid
131 (HEW-C4182X $40.00 $66.75 Ne Bid Ne Bid
132 |[HEW-C42544 $10.00 Ne Bid Ne Bid No Bid
133 |C49504 $209.00 $214.10 $247.00 5243.50 $215.00
134 |C48544 $210.00 §214.10 524700 $243.50 $219.00
135 |C49614 Cyan $212.00 §214.70 $247.00 $237.49 $219.00
136 |C4962A Magents $214.60 §214.10 $247.00 $243.30 $216.00
137 149634 Yellow $209.00 $274.10 $247.00 £243.50 $219.00
138 }C49654 Light Magenta $208.00 $214.10 $247.00 5243.50 £219.00




P 018-019 VENDNOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: \ VENDOR:
Bid Opening 3/15/18 wr 10:08 am CVE Computer Supplies | W.B. Mason Co., inc. The Tree Honse Allied Document Solutions & Sves Aderama, inc. Kibbous Express, Inc. The Office Pal, Inc.
SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY 9 Tanner St Ste 107 5] Helier Place PO Box 413 200 Church Swreet 42 West 18fh Streer 1984 Oid Cuthbert Road F.Q0. Box 2
OF PRINYER RIBBONS, PRINTER INK JET Haddonfield, NF 08032 Bellmawr, NF 08037 Norweood, MA 02062 Swedeshora, NF 08085 New York, NY 10011 Cherry Hill, NJ 08034 Lahewaod, N (18701

AND TONER CARTRIGES, FAX MACHINE

Steve Yuhas VP of Sales

Daniet Ore, Jr., Sepior VP,

David Rizzo -Sajes

Rebert Richardson, President

Caroline Brasgek, Bid Crdtr

Thomas Cosielto, Sales Mgr

Brende Friedman

TONER AND DRUM UNITS TO BE

&56 857.0335

884-426-2766

8 395-66357

856-241-2000

212-741-0401

800-533-944¢

§77-486-0590

UTILIZED BY VARIQUS DEPARTMENTS

856 857-0357 Fax

888-5986-1788 - Fax

781 Z78-0706 Fax

856-241-2290

646-758-855¢8

856-834-5235

732-363-6933 - Fax

N THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER

gvevriglyahoo.com

jdiirizzddacl.cont

Lump Sum Frice Ly Suni Price Lump Sume Price Lump Sum Price Eump Sum Price Lump Sum Price Lump Sum Price
528,475.13 $27.978.77 $28,108.95 $25,208.25 525,425.18 £25.316.00 BID REJECTED AS

Lizm NO CONTRACT NON-RESPONSIVE
139 THEW-Ca578D T ri-Color S46.00 §39.85 £50.5¢0 Ne Bid No Bid
140 |HEW-C6578DN Tri-Color S46.00 530.85 550,50 £56.98 546.00
147 |EEW-C6578AN Double Tri Coloer S72.00 5133.24 384.50 No Bid Ne Rid
142 [HEW-C6578 AN §72.00 $66.62 $84.50 No Bid 57500
143 fHEW-Ca635DN Bhack 53%.00 536,00 845.5¢ £52.09 S41.00
144 |[HEW-C6625A Fri Color 342.00 $38.44 548.75 £55.25 $43.00
145 |HEW-Coa56 AN Black 528,00 $25.34 532.50 $33.7¢ $30.00
146 |HEW-6657AN Tri Color 8545.00 S34.80 852.25 556,75 S47.00
147 | HEW-C6658 AN Toner S10.00 NG BID No Bid 53200
148 |HEW-CTI15A $38.00 367.97 360.00 59195 $77.00
149 JHEW-C8061X 360.00 §141.99 3124.00 $180.75 $160.00
150 JHEW-C8543X $266.00 524245 S215.00 ;15'1 997 $296.25 527200
151 JHEW-CE721'WN $23.90 $21.81 Rr9T0 $28.00 §35.30 526.00
152 |HEW-CR765WN Black $28.00 $25.34 R $32.50 £38.35 $30.00
153 | HEW-CE766 WN Biack 532.00 £29.72 bi $37.75 Sad. Ay $34.06
154 JHEW-CR767TWN Black S39.00 $34.76 $45.00 54580 $40.06
155 fHEW-CE771 WN Cyvan 511.00 510.81 $18.00 321.50 £13.00
156 [HEW-CET72WN Magenta SI12.00 510.87 SI8.04 S2L70 $13.00
157 |HEW-C8773WK Yeliow SI12.60 S10.87 518.00 $21.50 S13.00
158 |HEW-C8774 WK Light Cyan 512,80 $14.87 S18.00 §21.76 S13.00
159 JTHEW-CE775 WN Light Magenia S13.00 516.81 518.00 §21.70 £13.00
160 |HEW-C9321FN SF0.00 $66.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid
161 |HEW-C9348FN Black 516.00 $68.32 No Bid No Bid Ne Bid
162 |HEW-C9331 A Biack 516.00 §14.45 §22.25 Ne Bid Ne Bid
163 {HEW-C9352A Tri Color $23.00 £20.83 524,25 No Bid No Bid
164 /THEW-CY9353FN 2 pack $83.00 $73.34 597,50 $101.95 387.00
165 |HEW-CY3I59AN S10.00 NG BID No Bid No Bid No Bid
166 JHEW-C9363WN Tri Color S44.00 24053 $51.25 $51.8% S46.00
167 |HEW-C%364 WN 52700 §24.64 $33.73 $38.79 $20.00
168 |HEW-C9369 WN Phoie Sit.o0 NO BID Ne Bid No Bid Ne Bid




PDo1s-019 FENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR.: FENDOR: FENDOR: VENDOR:
Bid Opening 3/15/18 ar 1:00 am CVE Computer Supplies  iW.B. Mason Co., inc The Tree House Allied Document Solutions & Sves Adorama, Inc. Ribhons Express, ing. The Offtce Pal, Inc,
SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY 9 Tanner St Ste 147 151 Heller Place PO Box 413 208 Churck Streer 2 West 18th Street 2980 Qi Cuthbert Roud P.0. Box 2
OF PRINTER. RIBBONS, PRINTER INK JET Haddenficld. NJ 08833 Belimawr, NF 08031 Norwood, MA 02062 Swedesbore, NJ 080183 New ¥ork, NV 10011 Cherry Hill, NJ 08034 Latkewood, NJF 08707

AND TONER CARTRIGES, FAX MACHINE

Steve Yuiaz VP of Sates

Duaiel Chr, Jr., Senior .2,

David Rizzo -Sales

Roberr Richardson, President

Caroline Brzuszek, Bid Crdwr

Thomas Costello, Sales Mgr

Brende Frieduan

TONER ANI* DRUM UNITS TO BE 856 8570355 888-926-1766 860 595-6657 856-241-2000 ZI2-741-04017 BiH-533-994Y 877-486-0590
UTILIZED BV VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS 836 §57-0357 Fax $85-596-1788 - Fax 781 278-0706 Fax 856-241-2294 646-758-8558 856-854-5235 732-363-6933 - Fax
IN THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER svevi{d@ivahoo.com ditnizz(@acl.com
Lumip Sumn Price Lump Sum Price Lrmp Sum Price Lrmp Sum Price Leemmp Sum Price Lamp Sum Price Lump Sun: Price
52847513 $27,976.77 528,108,935 525,209.25 25,425.18 £25.310.00 BID REJECTED AS
ttem NOCONTRACT NON-RESPONSIVE
169 [HEW-C9814 574.0¢ $67.94 B2 386,00 59100 57700
170 |THEW-C493824 E75.400 367.9¢ : ' 386.00 385.25 877.08
171 JHEW-C9385AN w1800 522,31 52825 $34.69 526.00
172 |JHEW-C9386 AN 529.00 $16.25 $20.25 528.30 519.08
173 JHEW-C9387 AN $19.60 516.25 524.25 52830 $19.00
174 THEW-(C9388 AN 21700 516.25 : 528.30 5r0.00
175 FHEW-C9730A Black 5200.00 $235.89 $210.06 526479 5268.00
176 [HEW-C9731A Cyan 5240.00 $335.62 529500 8354.65 5375.00
177 JHEW-CO732A Yeliow 5260.00 $335.02 $295.00 §353.85 E375.00
178 |HEW-C9733 A Magenta 5280.00 §335.02 520500 5353.8¢9 5375.00
170 |HEW-C9734R Transfer Kit 5200.00 §292.41 Ne Bid 5281.00
180 |HEW-CB321 WN Black s16.00 521,44 No Bid No Bid
181 {HEW-CEB322WN Photo XL 51%.00 518.49 No Bid $21.00
162 |HEW-CB323WN Cyan XL 519.64 519.23 No Bid 522.00
183 |HEW-CB324WN Magenta XL $21.00 519,23 No Bid $22.00
184 [HEW-CB315WN Vellow XL $20.00 $19.23 io Bid 52100
185 |[HEW-CB400A Black Fiat.00 5156.45 8137.00 5198.65 $176.06
186 |REW-CR401A Cyan $220.00 $232.78 5245.00 5294.5¢ 5261.00
187 [HEW-CB4024 Yeliow 824000 $232.78 $205.00 520050 5261.00
188 JHEW-CB403A Magenia 5239.00 $232.78 5205.00 29130 $261.00
189 |HEW-CB5404 Black 860,94 $62.30 53500 §77.94 $71.00
190 JHEW-CB541 A Cyan $60.00 $57.25 $50.00 57915 $65.00
191 {HEW-CR5424 Yeliow 858.00 §57.25 £56.00 $78.14% 565.00
182 |HEW-CBS543A Magenta 35700 $57.25 &50.00 §70.49 S65.00
183 JHEW-CC364A §151.60 5136.17 512000 5174.19 $153.00
194 tHEW-CC5304 (Black) 576.00 597.47 £75.00 $167.1¢ 5116.00
195 JHREW-CC531A (Cyan) $86.00 596.08 £80.00 512160 5109.00
196 |HEW-CCS32A (Yellow) $492.84 $96.0% 580.06 Sizl.60 $109.00
197 |HEW-CCS33 A (Magenta) $94.96 §96.08 $80.00 $125.05 $109.00
198 |HEW-CC641WN $40.00 536.23 U§3LEs No Bid $41.00




PD18-019 VENDOR; VENDOR: VENDOR: FENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR.:
Bid Openirng 3/15/18 ar Hi:00 am CVE Computer Supplies | W.B, Masor Ce., Inc. The Tree House Allied Documen: Soiutions & Sves Adorama, inc, Kibbous Express, inc. The Office Pal, Inc,
SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY Y Tanner St Ste 1047 151 Heller Pluce PO Box 413 200 Church Street 42 West 18th Streer 1980 Ofd Cuthberi Road PO, Bex 2

OF PRINTER RIBBONS, PRINTER INE JET

Haddonfield, N7 08033

Belimawr, NJ 03031

Norwood, M4 02062

Swedesbore, NJ 08083

New York, NV 10011

Cherry Hill, NF 08034

Lakewood, NF 08707

ANTF TONER CARTRIGES, FAX MACHINE

Steve Yuhas VP of Sales

Daniel Orr, Jv., Senior VP,

Dravid Rizzo ~Salas

Robert Richardson, President

Caroline Brzuszek, Bid Crdor

Thaemas Costello, Sales Mgr

Brendo Friedmuan

' TONER AND DRUM UNITS TO BE

856 857-01355

B88-H20-2 766

00 595-6657

856-241-2000

212-741-0401

800-533-9949

§77-486-0590

UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS 856 857-0357 Fax J88-598-178 - Far 781 278-0706 Fax 856-241-2290 646-758-8558 £56-834-5235 732-363-6933 - Fax
IN THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER sycvrifvahog.com djirizzfmaol.com
Lump Sum Price Lump Sum Price Lump Sum: Price Lunp Sumi Price Lump Sum Price Lamp Sum Price Lwmp Sum Price
§28,475.13 $27.878.77 $28,108.95 £25,206.25 $25,425.78 $25.310.00 BID REJECTED AS
NO CONTRACT NOMN-RESPONSIVE
HEW-CC644WN $46.60 541,46 CHLRE36.20, T £52.50 560.35 525.00
HEW-CEZS54 SI27.00 $115.56 CEgdipge $146.23 $747.80 130,00
VHEW-CE255% $192.00 $779.67 $770.00 Ciigesips R $226.50 £202.00
HEW-CE255XD $344.00 $323.25 §315.45 TEEIe0se 8406.7¢ $363.00
[HEW-CE39G4A $i45.60 5136.12 $123.00 L UBRRIS0. 5173.79 $155.00
L IHEW-CEI0A S140.90 $136.12 §123.00 38850 $173.7¢ Ne Bid
HEW-CE390X £229.00 522746 5199.0¢ i : 5284.19 $256.00
HEW-CE4104 Black $72.60 366.23 LeRsset $85.79 §75.00
BEW-CE410%. Biack 889.60 580,71 $7L.00 §107.19 $92.00
HEW-CE411A Cyan §74.60 $94.37 $81.00 $122.65 $106.00
HEW-CE4124 Yellow 596.00 £94.37 $81.00 $122.65 5106.00
HEW-CE413A Magenta 594.00 $94.37 S81.00 §123.85 $106.00
HEW-CE5054 57700 $70.04 $65.00 £93.55 579.00
HEW-CET05A 540,00 57004 S0 No Bid No Bid
|HEW-CE740A Black 5129.00 $1I0.77 $104.00 5154.55 5134.00
HEW-CE741A Cyan 5220.00 5200.93 $184.90 £263.85 §235.00
HEW-CE7424 Vellow 5230.00 $209.93 $784.90 . : £263.05 5235.00
IMEW-CE743A Magenta 5229.00 £209.93 $184.90 CEEIZRA00 §263.15 5235.00
HEW-CFI26A 599,20 £90.73 B 5132.00 $108.85 S162.00
HEW-CFI30A $54.60 549.26 $81.00 862.50 $56.00
|[HEW-CF2804 589.60 581.07 . $I38.75 $107.65 £92.00
HEW-CF280X $152.66 5139.60 $122.00 : §177.39 $157.00
HEW-CF281X 5244.00 $223.22 5197.00 $279.30 5250.00
HEW-CF287% £249.00 §220.89 5199.50 = £263.50 £257.00
HEW-CF3504 549,06 $44.46 i 543.00 $36.55 $51.00
HEW-CF351A 556.00 $45.86 $44.50 $59.15 £52.00
HEW-CF3524 S51.00 $45.86 $44.50 £38.15 £52.00
HEW-CF353A $47.00 543.86 : $44.50 $59.15 $52.00
HEW-CF360A Black 513100 $121.59 S167.06 Slgeeps ol $I55.35 5137.06
|JHEW-CF361A Cyan 5164.60 §152.45 g v 5134.75 STR4.70 $I72.00




PoOrE-019 FENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: I VENDOR:
Eid Gpening 3/15/18 ar 1:00 am CVE Computer Supplies  |W.B. Mason Co., inc. The Tree House Alfied Document Solutions & Sves Adorama, inc Ribbons Express, nc. Fhe Office Pal, Inc
SPECIFICATIONS FOF THE DELIVERY 4 Tamner St. Sre 107 151 Heller Place PO Box 413 200 Chiureh Streer 42 West 18th Street 1980 Ot Cuthbert Read F.{. Box 2
(F PRINTER RIBBONS, PRINTER INK JET Laddonyield, NF 08033 Bellpiawr, NJF 08037 Norwood, MA 02062 Swedeshore, NF 08085 New York, NY 10017 Cheyry Hill, NJ 08034 Lakewood, NT (08700
AND TONER CARTRIGES, FAX MACHINE Steve Yulas VF of Sales | Daniel Ory, Jv., Senior F.E David Kizzo -Sales Raobert Richardson, Presidemnt Caroline Brzuszel, Bid Crdtr Thomas Costelle, Sales Mgr Brende Friedman

TONER AND DRUM UNITS TO BE

8§36 §57-0355

888-926-2766

S0 585-6657

§56-241-2000

212-741-0401

800-333-994¢ |

877-486-05%0

: UTILIZED BY FARIOUS DEPARTMENTS 456 857-0357 Fax 888-595-1788 - Fax 787 276-0706 Fax 856-241.2290 G46-758-8558 856-834-5255 732-363-6933 - Fax
E I THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER Syeyrgvaloo com diitizzt@ao).com
Laump Sum Price Lump Sunt Price Lump Sum Price Lumnp Sum Price Lump Sum: Price Lump Sum Price Lump Sum Price
§28,475.23 §27.978.77 £24,108.95 $25,209.25 §25,425.18 £35,310.00 BID REJECTED AS

tiom NO CONTRACT NON-RESPONSIVE
228 HEW-CF362A Yeliow 5169.06 515245 §139.75 5182.89 SI72.00

230 |HEW-CF3634 Magenta 5168.00 $152.45 5138.75 SI78.50 517206

2237 JHEW-CF4004 Black $50.60 353.59 $67.75 $69.60 $61.400

252 |HEW-CF400X Biack £79.60 57200 $86.73 $88.29 381.00

233 |HEW-CF4014 Cyan $69.46 §63.22 $80.00 580,48 £72.00
{ 234 |HEW-CF401X Magenia $86.00 579.85 $96.25 £99.59 39006

235 |HEW-CF402A Yellow 563,00 $63.22 $80.00 £77.89 57200

736 |HEW-CF402% Cyan £64.00 $79.85 $96.25 $96.40 590,00

257 | HEW-CF403 A Magenta $67.60 $63.22 586.00 880,49 $72.00

238 |[HEW-CF403X Yellow $86.90 §79.85 $96.25 896.40 £90.00

239 {HEW-CR4104 Black £72.00 $67.45 $129.75 $83.70 576.00

240 JHEW-CF4114 Cyan $90.00 $87.17 $157.50 ST04.90 $98.00

241 [HEW-CF412A Magenta $93.00 $87.11 $157.50 $704.98 $98.00

242 [HEW-CF4134 Yellow £94.00 $87.11 $157.50 5104.96 598.00

243 |HEW-CH565 4 Biack $32.60 e £38.75 $45.20 535,00

244 JHEW-CH566A Cyan 524.00 igppay i 527.00 $34.35 525,00

245 |HEW-CH563WN Black $32.60 529.00 §37.25 No Bid §35.00

246 |HEW-CHS64WN Tri Color $33.00 $30.57 $38.75 Ne Bid 535.00

247 |HEW-CHS67A Magenta $23.00 Cgap] $26.75 No Bid £25.00

248 HEW-CH5684 Yellow $23.00 e VI 526.75 No Bid $25.400

249 |HEW-CNU45AN Black £34.00 £31.23 $46,25 $43.95 536.00

250 |HEW-CNO46AN Cyan $27.00 §24.55 $31.25 $35.79 £20.00

251 JHEW-CNO47 AN Magenta £28.00 524.55 $31.25 539.68 $29.00

252 [HEW-CN(MEAN Yellow 530,00 $24.55 §31.25 §323.7¢ $29.00

253 [HEW-CNG49AN Black $26.00 52191 $27.75 $28.70 526.00

254 |HEW-CNOS0A Cyar $18.00 $15.61 52025 Ne Bid 51800

255 |HEW-CNUS1A Magenta 518.00 §15.61 $20.25 Ne Bid $18.00

256 JHEW-CNUS2ZA Yellow §17.00 $15.61 §20.25 No Bid $78.0¢

257 |HEW-CNO53 AN Black £26.00 g §33.75 §26.95 $32.00

258 | HEW-CNI54AN Cyan SI3.00 $13.75 g e $17.50 $26.4% $16.00




PDO1E-017 FENDOR: VENDOR: WENDOR: FENDOR: FVENDOR: VENDOR: FENDOR:
Bid Opering 3/15/18 ar 16:00 am CVE Computer Supplies | W.E. Muson Ca., inc. The Free House Altied Documant Selutions & Sves Adorama, inc. Ribbons Express, inc The Office Pal, Inc,
SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERT Y Tanner St. 5te 147 151 Heller Place PO Box 413 200 Chureh Street 42 Wesi 18th Street 1986 OId Cutithert Road PO Bor 2

OF PRINTER RIBEONS, PRINTER INKE JET

Haddonfield, NJ 08033

Bellmawr, NJ (08037

Norwood, MA 02062

Swedesbore, NJ 08085

New York, NV 10017

Cherry Hill, NF 08034

Lakewood, N7 08701

AND TONER CARTRIGES, FAX MACHINE

Steve Yuhas VP of Seles

Danie! Gry, Fr.. Senior VP,

David Rizzo -Sales

Robert Richardson, President

Cavroline Brzusiek, Bid Crdi

Thomas Costello, Sales Mgr

Brende Friedmar

TONER AND DRUNM UNITS TO BE

56 £57-0355

386-926-2766

806 395-6651

E56-241-2000

212-741-040]

§4-555-9949

§77-486-039¢

787 278-61706 Fax

856-241-2290

646-755-8558

8§56-834-5235

732-363-693% - Fax

UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS 856 857-0357 Fax 8R6-598-1788 - Fux
IN THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER svevriaiyahou.com diifzzimaol.com
Lump Sum Price Luinp Sum Price Lump Swm Brice Lyemip Sum Price Euinp Sum Price Lump Sunm: Price Lump Sum Price
§28,475.73 §27,978.77 $28,108.95 $25,209.25 $25.425.18 $23,316.00 BID REJECTED AS

item NO CONTRACT NON-RESPONSIVE
259 | HEW-CNOS5 AN Magentz $14.00 $13.75 §17.50 526,40 $16.60

260 |HEW-CNRSEAN Yellow $15.00 $13.75 §75.50 §20.76 S16.00

2671 |HEW-CNG58AN Cyan $11.0¢ $9.47 $12.00 $73.99 SIL.40

267 [HEW-CNO59 AN Magents $10.60 59.47 512.00 §13.05 SILOv

263 |HEW-CNOGOAN Yellow 810,70 $9,41 31200 $13.99 $i1.00

264 JAEW-CNO684WN Black §24.60 $21.44 No Bid Ne Bid

265 {HEW-013384 $120.00 814874 SI30.00 No Bid $167.00

266 |HEW-Q133%A $160.00 8196.94 $174.00 §248.25 $221.00

267 [HEW-Q26104 $129.00 2134.76 517700 §772,85 $751.00

268 [HEW-Q26124 361.60 $61.60 854,00 $80.79 $70.00

260 |[HEW-Q26134 $60.06 NO BID i $124.75 Ne Bid No Bid

270 [HEW-Q26313% $90.00 §98.62 LERaEs $128.55 11100

274 [HEW-(2670A $60.00 NO BID No Bid Ne Bid Ne Bid

272 |HEW-02671A Cyan 360,00 NO BID No Bid Ne Bid Ne Bid

273 IHEW-32672A Yeliow $60.00 NO BID Ne Rid Ne Bid No Bid

274 |HEW-2673A Mageniz 570.00 NO BID : Ne Bid Ne Bid Ne Bid

275 |HEW-(36554 (Maintenznee Kit) $80.00 NO BID ST T No Bid No Bid Ne Eid

276 [HEW-Q5421A £269.00 525554 S245.00 CLgRIae $255.59 $254,00

277 |HEW-Q5942A 3156.00 $244.25 $126.00 : i $184.69 5162.00

278 |HEW-Q5942X $I76.00 $218.27 S191.00 £273.75 5245.00

276 | HEW-(5949 A $86.00 579,65 £76.00 §T01.56 596,00

280 |HEW-Q5949% $100.06 $145.73 CIETRTOR 578516 5164.00

281 |HEW-Q6000A Black $60.00 §73.29 $64.50 £94.10 $82.00

282 IHEW-Q6001LA Cyan 540.00 £79.85 $70.30 §106.99 596,00

283 IHEW-Q60024 Yeliow $50.00 §79.85 $70.30 5165.35 £90.00

284 |HEW-Q6003A Magents 560.00 §79.85 £70.30 $705.25 £960.00

285 [HEW-06511A 380.06 N& BID Cisdson §149.75 Ne Bid No Bid

286 |HEW-07551A $80.00 511406 HEETRI2S $147.75 $141.10 $729.00

287 |HEW-Q7551X% 5190.00 $191.09 $162.00 Sy s s $241.79 $214.00

288 |HIEW-Q75534 584,00 $77.86 SHETLSER00 £79.73 $99.93 $88.00




PD G18-019 VENDOR: VENDOR: FENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: ! VENDOR:
Bid Opening 3/15/18 ar 10:00 am CVE Compuier Supplies  |W.B. Masor Ce., lnc. The Tree Honse jAllied Document Sohgions & Sves Adovamea, inc. Ribbons Express, inc. The Office Pal, Inc.
SPECIFICATIONS FOE THE DELIVERY 2 Tanner St. Sre 107 151 Reller Place PO Box 413 200 Church Streei (2 West 18th Streer 1986 Old Cutirhert Road PO Beox 2
OF PRINTER RIBBONS, PRINTER YNE JET Haddonfield, NJ 08032 Bellmawr, NJ (18631 Norwood, MA 02062 Swedeshoro, NJ 08085 New York, NF 10011 Chervy Hill, NJ 08034 Lakewood, NJ 08701
AND TONER CARTRIGES, FAX MACHINE Sreve Yuhas VP of Sales [ Daniel O, Jr,, Senior V.E, David Rizzo -Sales Robert Richardson, President Caroline Brzuszek, Bid Crder Thomas Costello, Sales Mgr Brende Friedman
TONER AND DRUM UNITS 7O BE 856 857-0355 B388-926-2766 BiME 595-645] 856-241-2000 212-741-0401 800-533-9949 | 877-486-0390
1 UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS 8356 8570357 Fax BBE-598-1788 - Fax 781 278-6706 Fax 856-241-2290 H46-758-8358 856-834-5235 732-363-6933 - Fax
P IN THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER sycevii@yvahoo.com dirizzigaol.com
Euwmp Sum Price Lump Sum Price Lump Sum Price Limp Sum Price Lump Sum Price Lump Sun: Price Lump Sum Price
52847513 $27.978.77 S$28,108.95 525,209,235 52542518 §25,310.00 BID REJECTED AS
lizm NO CONTRACT NOKN-RESPONSIVE
280 |RMVE-1082 56¢.00 CHERIE2EY e 5210.00 Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
} 290 Toner 43X 5270.00 5242.45 s21500 519575 No Bid 5272.00 cas543x
201 ITROY-02-81136-001 5£29.00 $407.93 LRS00 $477.25 No Bid 343000
207 |HPR1A $346.0¢ 5134.91 L SI1Y0p §92.75 $171.50 SISLOY CF281A
203 jHPEIX 5236.00 822322 §96.75 327425 §250.00 CF281Xx
LEM
284 11053685 526,00 525.63 No Bid No Bid $29.00
| |KVOCERA
285 |F5-CE550DN 520.00 $91.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid
296 | TH3102 Black 350,00 £54.47 366.00 Ne Bid Ne Bid
297 ITR-572C SI12%.00 §110.63 $126.75 No Bid Ne Bid
298 | TK-572K 399,60 $85.23 5162.00 No Bid Ae Bid
ZO9ITKS72M $120.00 $110.63 8$126.75 Ne Bid No Bid
300 [ TKS72Y $120.00 §116.63 $126.75 Ne Bid No Bid
301 | TK582C $119.00 R61. $75.25 No Bid No Liid
302 | THS82K S60.00 548,00 §54.75 No Bid No Bid
303 | TKS82M S60.00 365.45 §72.25 No Bid No Bid
304 [TK582Y $70.00 565,45 872.25 Ne Bid ~ No Bid
305 | TH-8602K 5100.00 R0 g0 Ne Bid Ne Bid No Bid
308 | TE-8602C 5100.00 $168.35 CB167.00. Ne Bid Ne Bid No Bid
307 | TE-8602M 5196.00 $164.33 SlETeT.n: Ne Bid Ne Bid No Bid
308 [TE-8602Y 5186.00 5168.35 AR No Bid No Bid o Bid
Lexmark
308 {52106 5126.00 CAgregy 5109.95 512906 No Bid No Bid
210 |C500H2KC Black 514800 $146.19 : .:$143.'9ﬂ_." $170.50 Ne Bid SIS7.00
11 JE260AT1A 597,60 e AT $94.20 $111.60 §105.05 510200
312 | I654%X11A $419.00 §414.24 HEO7A No Bid No Bid No Bid




P O1§-019 VENDOR: FENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: | VENDOR:
Bid Opening 3/15/18 ar 16:00 am CVR Computer Suppiies  1W,B. Mason Co., Inc. The Tree House Aliied Document Solutions & Sves Adorama, inc, Ribbons Express, inc. Fhe Office Pal, Inc.
SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY 9 Tanner SL Ste HI7 151 Belier Piace P Box 413 200 Churcli Srreet 42 Wesr 18th Streer 1980 Oid Cuthbert Road L.l Box 2

OF FRINTER RIBBONS, PRINTER INE JET

Huddonfield, N 08033

Bellmawr, NJ 08031

Narwoad, MA 02062

Swedzsbore, N.F 08085

New Fork, NV 10017

Cherry Hill, N7 08034

Lakewood, NF 08707

AND TONER CARTRIGES, FAX MACHINE

Steve ¥uhas VP of Sules

Daniel Gre, Jdr., Senior T.F,

David Rizze -Saies

Rokberi Richardson, President

Cavoline Brouszek, Bid Crder

Thomas Costella, Sales Mgr

Brenda Friedman

TONER AND DRUM UNITS 70 BE

456 8570355

888-026-2766

800 585-6651

856-241-2000

2I2-741-0401

800-553-9949

877-486-0159(

E36-834-5234

732-363-6933 - Fax

UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS §56 §57-0357 Fax B88-598-1788 - Fax 781 278-6706 Fuo: §56-241-2290 646-758-8558
: IN THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER svevr@vahoo.com dilrjzz@aol.com
Lump Sum Price Lawmp Stm Price Lump Sum Price Luntp Sum Price Lump Sunt Price Lump Sum Price Lump Sum Price
$28,475.13 £17,978.77 $28,108.9% £25,209.25 §25,425.18 525,310.00 BID REJECTED A5
| inem) NO CONTRACT NON-RESPONSIVE
313 JMS710 $122.00 $695,39 510995 COUGTOE.S No Bid Ne Bid
314 [T654X114 5440.00 $414.24 T RA0TSe $482.7% 5486.45 $448.00
OCE
315 [ 1066016924 (Black) $60.00 NO BID o Bid Ne Bid No Bid
316 |1060016925 (Yeliow) 56000 NO BID Neo Bid Neo Bid Ne Bid
397 11060016926 (Cyan) $60.00 NO BID No Bid Ne Bid Ne Bid
218 [1060016927 (Magenia) $100.06 NO BID Ne Bid Ne Bid No Bid
319 11060018424 Black Ink 36000 NO BID Ne Bid No Bid Neo Bid
320 /1066819425 Veliow 560.00 NO BID Ne Bid No Bid No Bid
321 ) 1060019426 Cyap ink $40.00 NG BID Ne Bid No Bid No Bid
322 }1060019427 Magenta inis 860,00 NO BID igreTigh No Bid No Bid No Eid
Sharp
323 | SHR-FOSOND Toner S100.00 98,64 CApRITS _ Ne Bid No Bid Ne Bid
324 |SHR-FO47DR. Drum §70.00 NO BID HgeRae Ne Bid Ne Bid No Bid
Xerox
325 | XER-106R03690 Cyan 5140.00 151.68 5161.50 §164.98 $753.00
326 | XER-106R0369]. Magenta 514906 I151.68 5761.50 5164.98 £153.00
327 |XER-106R03692 Vellow 515000 151.68 $161.50 5164.98 $153.00
528 | XER-106K03480 Black £152.00 114,89 $126.25 $130.68 SE19.00
320 [XER-FOSRIH292 Black $I16.00 170,24 No bid No Bid Mo Bid
330 [XER-108R00723 Cyan 5106.00 $118.5¢ 5137.50 5134.50 $I131.00
331 | XER-108R00724 Magenia $706.00 5118.56 SI37.50 $119.75 $I31.00
332 | XER-108100725 Yellow $104.00 $178.56 S $157.50 $I31.25 $131.00
332 'XENR-108R06726 Black (3 sticks) 576.00 $73.9¢ gL 584,00 £88.60 38100
334 |XER-108R00727 Black (¢ sticks) ST06.00 SRR B $112.45 5129.00 512910 $123.00
335 [XER-108R00926 Cyarn 5136.00 E132.33 §137.40 $153.50 No Bid 5151.00
336 [XER-108R00Y27 Magenta $138.00 K YEVACE Rt $137.40 5133.50 $151.85 SISL.O0




P 18-019 VENDOR: VENDOR: FENDOR: VENDOR, FENDOR. VENDOR: VENDOR:
Bid Opening 3/15/18 ar 16:00 am CVR Computer Supplies  |1W.B. Masor Co., Inc. The Tree Flouse Alited Document Solutions & Sves Aderamu, Inc Hibbony Express, lnc, The Office Pal, inc,
SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY 9 Famner 8L Ste 107 15] Heller Place PO Box 413 2006 Church Sireet 42 West 18th Sreet 1980 Old Cuthberi Road P Bex?

{F PRINTER RIBBONS, PRINTER INE JET

Haddonfield, NJ 080133

Beltmawr, N7 08031

Norwood, MA 02062

Swedeshoro, NJ 08085

New York, NF 10071

Cherry Hill, NJ 08034

Lakewood, NY 08767

AND TONER CARTRIGES, FAX MACHINE

Steve ¥uhas VP of Sales

Daniei Grr, Jv., Senior V.2,

David Rizze -Sales

Robert Richardson, President

Caroline Brouszek, Bid Crdyr

Thomas Costello, Sales Mgr

Bremde Friedman

TONER AND DRUM UNITS TO BE

8§56 §57-0355

388-926-2766

806 595-6657

$536-24F-2000

212-741-0401

800-553-9949

877-486-0591f

UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

856 857-0357 Fax

H88-398-178E - Fax

781 278-0706 Fax

U56-241-229¢

646-755-8558

§56-854-5233

731-363-6933 - Fax

N THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER syevri@yahoo.com diitizz(@laol.com
Leomp Sum Price Laowmp Sum Price Luamp Suw: Price Lumip Sum Price Lump Sum Price Lump Suw Price Lump Sum Price
52847513 527,978.77 $28,108.95 $25,205.25 52542528 $25,310.00 BID REJECTED AS

liem NO CONTRACT NOM-RESPONSIVE
237 |XER-108RU8928 Yeliow $141.00 LgI3233n $137.4¢ 5153.56 525175 5251.40
338 [ XER-108R00929 Biack: (3 pack) $90,06 issgigr §90.25 §102.25 510460 $106.0¢
330 [XER-T08R0093( Black (4 pack) S140.00 '$132:33 SI3ATS 5153.50 513669 SI51.00
340 [108R01417 Cyan Drum 82.00 585.97 LgTeER $90.56 Ne Bid No Bid
341 |108RU3418 Magenia Drum 884,00 584,96 39650 Ne Bid No Bid
342 [LUBROL419 Vellow $80.00 $84.96 96,50 No Bid N Bid
343 | 108R{IH 420 Black Drum F53.00 £84.96 396.50 No Bid No Bid
344 [XER-109R00783 Extended souo0 39038 SI00.0n S104.31 S103.00
345 | KER-109R00784 Standard S60.00 555,80 $67.23 $66.30 363.00
346 | XER-113R00711 Biack 520660 8221.75 5190.15 £220.00
347 | XER-LI3R00719 Cyan 511400 $115.90 $132.25 $127.70 8127.06
348 | XER-1L3RG672( Magenta $120.00 : $115.90 513225 5126.70 $127.00
349 [RER-113R00721 Yeliow 52116.00 ETIRIRT §115.90 $132.25 S127.7¢ SI27.00
350 |XER-113R00723 Cyan 5240.00 §227.74 0224:35 $264.25 No Bid 5258.00
351 | XER-113R00724 Yellow 5240.00 §227.74 5264.25 $253.38 5258.00
352 | XER-113R00725 Magents 5240.00 5227.74 : 526423 §251.68 $258.00
353 | XER-113R64726 Black 519600 LIT9%6T 519900 $228.25 §230.75 $214.00

VARIATIONS NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE

THIES IS A ONE YEAR CONTRACT

Will you extend vour prices to local YES YES YES§ YES YES YES

sovarnnicit entifies within the Counry

Bid specificationy sent fo: Aira Fechnologies Prinrer Components Quill, LLC Daze Prinier Products

eRepubiic Mvation Worldwide Toner Green Tendering Authority
Onvig Rasiz Computer Center Prime Vendor Printer Pro Selutions




PL018-01% VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: | VENDOR:
Bid Opening 3/15/18 av 10¢:00 aw CVR Compurer Supplies  {W.B. Mason Cu., Inc The Tree House Allied Document Soluiions & Sves Adorame, Inc. Ribbons Express, inc. The Office Pal, Inc.
SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY Y Tanner St Ste 147 151 Helier Place PO Box 413 200 Church Streer £2 West 180h Streer 1986 Nd Cuthberr Road AL Box 2
OF PRINTEE RIBRBONS, PRINTER INK JET Haddenfield, NJ 08053 Bellmmwr. NJ Q8031 Norwood, M4 62062 Swedeshore, NJ (08085 New Fork, NV 1101} Cherry Hill. NT 08034 Lakeweood, NJ 087071
AND TONER CARTRIGES, FAX MACHINE Steve Yuhas VP of Sales  |Daniel Orr, Jr., Senior V.P. Duvid Rizzo -Sufes Roberr Richardsoun, President Carofine Brzuszek, Bid Crdn Thomas Costeliy, Sales Mpr Brenda Friedman
TONER AND DRUM UNITS TC BE 856 §57-0353 B86-926-2766 B 595-6631 ¥36-241-2000 212-741-0207 800-333-9949 §77-486-00590
UTILIZED BY VARIGUS DEPARTMENTS 8§30 857-0357 Fax B8E-398-1788 - Fax 781 Z76-0706 Fax 856-241-2294 646-758-8558 856.834-5235 732-363-6933 - Fux
I THE COUNTT OF GLOUCESTER svevrigivahoo.com diirizad@aol.com
Lump Sum Price Lump Sam Price Lump Sum FPrice Lump Sum Price Lumyp Sum Price Lump Sum Price Lrnp Sum Price i
i 528,475.13 527,978,777 528,108,935 $25,209.25 25,425,148 525.310.00 BID REJECTED AS
Item NG CONTRACT NON-RESPONSIVE

Based upon the bids received I recommend the bid
ve awarded to eacit vendor as follows as the lowest
responsive, responsible bidder:

W.B. Mason is awarded item numbers 1,2,3, 4, 5,6, 7, 8 % 710, 11,12, 13 14, 15, 16, I7, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 27, 28, 29, 30, 31, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39, 40, 41, 48, 50, 58, 72, 75, 78, 77. 79, §1, 82, 9&, 101, 104, 105, 106, 167,
122,124, 126, 127, 128, 129, F33, I34, 135, 136, 137, 138, 243, 244, 247, 248, 257, 289, 301, 302, 303, 304, 308, 311, 334, 335, 336, 337, 338, 339, 347, 348, 34% and 353.

The Tree House is awarded itenr numbers 23, 24, 25, 26, 32, 33, 34, 42, 43, 44, 45, 46, 47, 48, 51, 52, 53, 34, 55, 56, 57, 59, 64, 61, 62, 63, 65, 67, 69, 71, 73, 83, 84, 83, 86, 87, 88, 8%, 90, 91, 92, 93, 94, 95, 96, 47, 99,
100, 102, 103, 108, 109, 110, 111, 152, 113, F714, 115, 116, 177, 118, 119, 120, 121, 123, 125, 130, i31, 132, 13%, 140, 141, 142, 143, 144, 143, 146, 147, 151, 152, 153, 1534, 153, 156, 157, 158, 159, 166, 161, 162, 163,
164, 165, 166, 167, 168, 169, 17, 171, I72, 173, I74, 180, 181, 182, 183, 184, 198, 199= 200, 206, 212, 217, 218, 219, 223, 224, 225, 226, 228, 229, 236, 231, 232, 233, 234, 235, 236, 237, 238, 239, 240, 241, 242, 245,
246, 249, 250, 251, 252, 253, 254, 255, 256, 258, 259, 260, 261, 262, 263, 264, 26%, 271, 272, 273, 274, 275, 280, 285, 286, 288, 290, 291, 292, 293, 294, 295, 296, 247, 298, 299, 300, 305, 306, 307, 308, 310, 312, 314,
313,316,317, 318, 319, 320, 321, 322, 323, 324, 325, 326, 327, 328, 329, 330, 331, 332, 333, 340, 341, 342, 343, 344, 345, 346, 350, 351, and 352,

199% this item was not awarded to lowest bidder because it will not exceed $250.00.

| i | l | [

Allied Documem Solurions & Sves is awarded itew numbers 64, 148, 149, 156, 175, 176, 177, 178, 179, 185, 186, 187, 188, 189, 190, 191, 192, 153, 194, 193, 196, 197, 201, 202, 263, 204, 205, 267, 208, 209, 2148, 211,
213,214,213, 216, 220, 221, 222, 227, 265, 266, 267, 268, 270, 276, 277, 278, 279, 281, 282, 283, 284, 287, and 313,

| | l | | J

Adorama is awarded frenr rumbers 66, 68, 70, 74, 78, und 86,

Kimberly Larter

Purchasing




