

PD 015-045
 Bid Opening 9/9/2015 10:00am
 SPECIFICATIONS AND PROPOSAL
 FORM FOR EMS CONSUMABLES

ITEM DESCRIPTION	VENDOR: VE Ralph & Son PO Box 633 320 Schuyler Ave Kearny NJ 07032 Vernon J. Ralph 800 526-1196 800 772-7203 FAX vralph@vralph.com	VENDOR: Common Cents EMS Supply LLC 304 Boston Post Rd. Old Saybrook, CT 06475 John Dunn 860 388-4599 860 388-4699 Fax jdunn@savelives.com	VENDOR: Nashville Medical & EMS Products Inc. PO Box 64 Springfield, TN 37172 Nari Sadarangani - Pres. 615 384-0573 615 384-0574 Fax nashvilleems@gmail.com	VENDOR: QuadMed Inc. PO Box 550773 Jacksonville, FL 32255 Jackie Gieger Bid Mgr. 904 380-2323 904 380-2303 Fax bids@quadmed.com	VENDOR: Bound Tree Medical LLC. 5000 Tuttle Crossing Dublin OH 43016 Mark Dougherty Sec. Treas. 800 533-0523 877 311-2437 Fax christopher.fyffe@boundtree.com	VENDOR: Moore Medical LLC 1690 New Briton Ave. Farmington CT 06032 Bonnie Samse 800 234-1464 877 354-5916 Fax bid@mooremedical.com
Adult BVM	\$10.29	\$9.50	NO BID	\$10.90	\$9.95	\$9.42
Pediatric BVM	\$13.65	\$12.59	NO BID	\$10.90	\$7.49	\$12.54
Neonatal BVM	\$13.65	\$12.59	NO BID	\$15.95	\$12.45	\$12.54
On Board O2 Flowmeter (0-15 LPM)	\$118.00	\$108.92	\$16.95	\$37.92	\$109.00	\$113.37
1/8 Inch NPT Adapter for above	\$22.95	\$21.39	NO BID	\$9.05	\$19.99	\$11.79
Oxygen Nipples	\$0.55	\$0.28	\$0.39	\$0.62	\$0.56	NO BID
Oxygen Gaskets	\$0.75	\$0.51	\$0.45	\$0.80	\$0.74	NO BID
Oxygen Cylinder Storage Rack	\$124.95	\$126.50	NO BID	\$478.00	\$54.01	NO BID
Oxygen Cylinder Wrench	\$2.79	\$2.85	NO BID	\$2.95	\$2.39	NO BID
Oxygen Cylinder Wrench	\$0.80	\$1.55	NO BID	\$0.48	\$1.99	NO BID
Adult Partial Non-rebreather Mask	\$1.04	\$47.99	NO BID	\$1.07	\$1.02	\$0.93
Adult Nasal Canula	\$0.34	\$15.39	NO BID	\$0.47	\$0.33	\$0.31
Pediatric Partial Non-rebreather Mask	\$1.04	\$47.99	NO BID	\$1.59	\$1.39	\$0.93
Pediatric Nasal Canula	\$1.16	\$54.03	NO BID	\$1.70	\$1.16	\$0.32
O2 Supply Tubing	\$0.35	\$15.86	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.11	NO BID
Oxygen Humidifier (Prefilled)	\$1.30	\$1.21	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.69	\$1.17
Adult Trach Collar	\$0.85	\$0.78	NO BID	\$1.03	\$1.21	\$4.72
Pediatric Trach Collar	\$1.03	\$0.94	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.99	\$4.72
Nasal Airways: (Robertazzi style)						
12 fr	\$22.95	\$21.36	\$15.90	\$2.34	\$11.40	\$2.06
14 fr	\$22.95	\$21.36	\$15.90	\$2.34	\$11.40	\$2.06
16 fr	\$22.95	\$21.36	\$15.90	\$1.55	\$11.40	\$2.06
18 fr	\$22.95	\$21.36	\$15.90	\$1.55	\$11.40	\$2.06
20 fr	\$22.50	\$18.40	\$15.90	\$1.55	\$11.40	\$2.06
22 fr	\$22.50	\$18.40	\$15.90	\$1.55	\$11.40	\$2.06
24 fr	\$22.50	\$18.40	\$15.90	\$1.55	\$11.40	\$2.06
26 fr	\$22.50	\$18.40	\$15.90	\$1.55	\$11.40	\$2.06
28 fr	\$22.50	\$18.40	\$15.90	\$1.55	\$11.40	\$2.06
30 fr	\$22.50	\$18.40	\$15.90	\$1.55	\$11.40	\$2.06
32 fr	\$22.50	\$18.40	\$15.90	\$1.55	\$11.40	\$2.06
34 fr	\$22.50	\$18.40	\$15.90	\$1.55	\$11.40	\$2.06
36 fr	\$22.50	\$18.40	\$15.90	\$1.55	\$11.40	\$2.06
Sterile Lubricating Jelly (for above)	\$6.20	\$5.74	\$5.90	\$5.89	\$8.99	\$4.66
Nasal Airway Kit (Boxed)	\$20.25	\$16.86	\$15.50	\$23.05	\$20.42	\$14.70
Oral Airways: (Color Coded, Berman style)						
#00 (40 mm)	\$7.45	\$6.89	\$7.00	\$0.16	\$5.20	\$2.64
#0 (50 mm)	\$7.45	\$6.89	\$7.00	\$0.16	\$5.20	\$2.64
#1 (60 mm)	\$7.45	\$6.89	\$7.00	\$0.16	\$5.20	\$2.64
#2 (70 mm)	\$7.45	\$6.89	\$7.00	\$0.16	\$5.20	\$2.64
#3 (80 mm)	\$7.45	\$6.89	\$7.00	\$0.16	\$5.20	\$2.64
#4 (90 mm)	\$7.45	\$6.89	\$7.00	\$0.16	\$5.20	\$2.64
#5 (100 mm)	\$7.45	\$6.89	\$7.00	\$0.16	\$5.70	\$2.64
#6 (110 mm)	\$7.45	\$6.89	\$7.00	\$0.16	\$5.70	\$2.64
Oral Airway Kit (Boxed)	\$8.80	\$0.96	\$2.05		\$3.89	\$1.91
Suction Canisters:						
On-Board (Sccor)	\$162.24	\$161.28	\$130.00	\$2.75	\$137.28	NO BID
Portable	\$260.00	\$282.79	NO BID	\$14.64	\$259.80	NO BID
Portable Tubing & Catheter	\$33.00	\$35.94	NO BID	NO BID	\$32.90	NO BID
Replacement Canister for Quickdraw	\$260.00	\$293.25	NO BID	\$14.64	\$259.80	NO BID
Manual Suction Canisters:						
Neonate / Pediatric	\$24.65	\$198.65	NO BID	\$13.42	\$17.67	NO BID
Soft Yankauer	\$26.75	\$196.65	NO BID	\$13.42	\$72.95	NO BID
Rigid Yankauer	\$26.75	\$271.40	NO BID	\$14.73	\$12.74	NO BID
First Responder Kit	\$132.00	\$81.87	NO BID	\$77.89	\$46.80	NO BID
Yankauer Suctions Catheters w/ tubing (vented)			\$24.90	\$8.83		
Soft Suction Catheters:						
6 fr	\$0.24	\$0.20	\$0.07	\$0.21	\$0.13	\$0.23
8 fr	\$0.24	\$0.20	\$0.07	\$0.21	\$0.13	\$0.23
10 fr	\$0.24	\$0.20	\$0.07	\$0.21	\$0.13	\$0.23
12 fr	\$0.24	\$0.20	\$0.07	\$0.21	\$0.13	\$0.23
14 fr	\$0.24	\$0.20	\$0.07	\$0.21	\$0.13	\$0.23
16 fr	\$0.24	\$0.20	\$0.07	\$0.21	\$0.13	\$0.23
18 fr	\$0.24	\$0.20	\$0.07	\$0.21	\$0.13	\$0.23

Suction Tubing	\$37.25	\$0.45	\$0.61	\$0.95	\$0.54	\$0.38
Bulb Syringe	\$0.89	\$0.90	\$0.39	\$0.78	\$0.76	\$0.82
Adult/Pod SPO2 Sensors (Tuffsatt Compatible)	\$389.00	\$322.00	\$10.99	\$8.67	NO BID	NO BID
Cable for Above	\$110.00	\$63.25	\$99.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Adult/Pod SPO2 Sensors (Tuffsatt Compatible)	\$223.00	\$171.35	\$10.99	\$71.00	NO BID	NO BID
Adult SpO2 Sensor	\$274.00	\$172.50	\$119.00	\$71.00	NO BID	NO BID
Bite Sticks	\$4.20	\$2.53	\$2.90	\$4.37	\$3.90	\$0.23
Lyfetymer LED Metronome	\$119.00	\$114.20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2 X 2's	\$1.29	\$49.20	\$0.01	\$1.36	\$0.03	\$2.60
3 X 3's	\$1.39	\$94.74	\$0.02	\$1.32	\$0.05	\$3.84
4 X 4's	\$1.50	\$52.99	\$0.03	\$1.43	\$0.03	\$5.78
4 X 7's	\$3.25	\$2.35	\$0.05	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
5 X 9's	\$2.25	\$47.02	\$0.08	\$2.28	\$0.10	\$1.67
8 X 10's	\$3.98	\$59.82	\$0.13	\$3.97	\$0.19	\$2.05
Triangular	\$4.15	\$87.40	\$0.26	\$2.72	\$0.23	\$2.56
2" Kling	\$2.60	\$27.69	\$0.16	\$2.35	\$0.10	\$0.61
3" Kling	\$3.10	\$32.10	\$0.18	\$2.75	\$0.11	\$0.78
1" Tape	\$7.49	\$82.80	\$0.49	\$7.07	\$0.56	\$5.76
2" Tape	\$7.49	\$82.80	\$0.98	\$7.07	\$1.33	\$5.76
3" Tape	\$7.49	\$82.80	\$1.47	\$5.66	\$2.00	\$5.76
Eye Pads	\$4.35	\$59.80	\$0.08	\$4.44	\$0.09	\$5.78
Butterfly Closures	\$2.15	\$45.43	\$0.02	\$2.19	\$0.02	\$2.11
Pediatric Band-Aids	\$4.15	\$3.15	\$0.05	\$1.24	\$0.01	\$2.37
Adhesive Bandage 3/4 X 3	\$1.85	\$40.25	\$0.01	\$1.83	\$0.02	\$1.31
Adhesive Bandage 2 X 4 1/2	\$4.05	\$108.71	\$0.05	\$4.05	\$0.08	\$3.02
DynaStopper	\$1.40	\$78.09	\$1.99	\$1.33	\$1.41	NO BID
Trauma Dressing 12 X 30	\$1.28	\$58.08	\$0.74	\$0.89	\$0.99	\$0.39
Burn Sheets 60 X 96	\$5.20	\$2.59	\$1.59	\$2.39	\$2.04	\$1.89
Sterile Water:						
250 cc	\$2.15	\$3.59	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.92	\$2.15
1000 cc	\$2.45	\$3.50	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.79	\$2.30
Saline:						
250 cc	\$2.15	\$3.62	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.88	\$2.15
1000 cc	\$2.45	\$3.91	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.17	\$2.55
Petroleum Gauze	\$13.75	\$0.60	\$0.42	\$5.10	\$0.71	\$8.59
Asherman Chest Seals	\$92.50	\$8.51	\$91.00	\$9.98	\$96.90	\$8.25
Gloves						
Small	\$8.40	\$78.78	NO BID	\$71.20	\$0.08	\$7.15
Medium	\$8.40	\$78.78	NO BID	\$71.20	\$0.08	\$7.15
Large	\$8.40	\$78.78	NO BID	\$71.20	\$0.08	\$7.15
X-Large	\$8.40	\$78.78	NO BID	\$71.20	\$0.08	\$7.15
Infection Control Kits	\$6.20	\$1.73	\$4.95	\$3.50	\$1.92	\$2.86
Cover Gowns	\$16.25	\$14.95	\$0.30	\$15.35	\$0.39	\$19.66
Shoe Covers	\$17.45	\$16.10	\$0.05	\$4.62	\$6.95	\$15.77
HEPA Masks: (N95)						
Small	\$18.70	\$21.85	NO BID	\$21.95	\$0.93	\$16.67
Regular	\$18.70	\$21.85	NO BID	\$13.54	\$0.93	\$16.67
Ear Loop Mask w/ Extended Face Shield	\$105.00	\$79.35	\$36.45	\$3.31	\$6.00	\$15.37
Safety Glasses	\$2.15	\$1.40	NO BID	\$2.14	\$4.62	\$1.57
Vionex Towellettes	\$8.75	\$8.57	NO BID	\$8.99	\$10.29	\$7.69
Vionex Liquid Soap 18oz	\$100.80	\$106.08	NO BID	\$9.25	\$71.88	\$91.68
Vionex No Rinse Gel	\$84.00	\$204.48	NO BID	\$3.62	\$99.60	\$74.64
Hype-Wype Bleach Pads	\$56.00	\$60.84	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Equipment Disinfection Wipes	\$74.40	\$70.24	NO BID	\$6.99	\$63.48	\$65.88
Antimicrobial Hand Wipes	\$61.80	\$65.52	NO BID	NO BID	\$63.48	\$54.36
CPR Pocket Masks	\$94.20	\$3.45	NO BID	\$4.13	\$71.88	NO BID
Disinfectant Spray	\$94.20	\$8.04	NO BID	\$8.10	\$101.88	\$85.56
Spray Cleaner	\$67.00	\$53.17	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Ice Packs 5 X 9 (loose)	\$9.05	\$10.06	\$0.49	\$9.85	\$0.32	\$0.21
Hot Packs 5 X 9 (loose)	\$11.89	\$10.93	\$0.59	\$13.99	\$0.29	NO BID
Adult B/P Cuff	\$6.25	\$5.75	\$5.21	\$5.72	\$5.04	\$9.83
Obese B/P Cuff	\$12.35	\$11.39	\$5.89	\$8.05	\$5.99	\$12.92
Child B/P Cuff	\$9.95	\$9.20	\$5.21	\$6.90	\$4.95	\$9.83
Infant B/P Cuff	\$8.75	\$8.05	\$5.21	\$6.61	\$4.95	NO BID
Stethoscope (Sprague Rappaport)	\$7.85	\$5.69	\$4.89	\$5.62	\$4.19	\$6.11
AED Electrodes (LP 12 Compatible)	\$20.65	\$18.98	NO BID	\$19.42	\$16.99	\$2.18
Safety Razors	\$18.45	\$17.25	\$0.18	\$17.42	\$0.36	\$15.33
Ring Cutter	\$7.20	\$3.74	\$3.49	\$4.70	\$4.27	\$5.90
Tweezers	\$1.45	\$0.58	\$0.69	\$0.74	\$0.18	\$0.85
Pen Lights	\$4.15	\$6.21	\$0.52	\$4.35	\$0.98	\$3.65
EMS Sheers (Medicut 7 1/4")	\$2.20	\$0.75	\$0.63	\$0.71	\$0.78	\$1.83
Convenience Bags	\$276.00	\$158.13	\$227.00	\$0.93	\$279.80	NO BID
Alcohol Prep Pads	\$0.90	\$1.73	\$1.29	\$1.39	\$2.72	\$0.59
Bee Sting/Medicaine Swabs	\$2.75	\$2.00	NO BID	\$2.41	\$3.14	\$2.01
Ammonia Inhalants	\$17.89	\$15.21	NO BID	\$20.25	\$16.97	\$14.78

[illegible]

\$0.43	\$1.04
\$0.69	\$0.82
\$12.20	\$297.55
\$89.20	\$82.76
DISCONTINUED	\$165.51
DISCONTINUED	\$203.49
\$0.29	\$2.16
NO BID	NO BID
\$0.01	\$0.02
\$0.015	\$0.03
\$0.023	\$0.03
NO BID	\$2.64
\$0.08	\$0.12
\$0.1263	\$0.16
\$0.19	\$0.17
\$0.186	\$0.11
\$0.215	\$0.14
\$0.53	\$0.51
\$1.06	\$0.90
\$1.59	\$1.66
\$0.07	\$0.13
\$0.0188	\$0.08
\$0.0364	\$0.05
\$0.0123	\$0.02
\$0.054	\$0.06
\$1.26	\$1.26
\$0.73	\$0.87
\$1.53	\$2.37
\$1.27	\$9.52
\$2.26	\$9.28
\$1.27	\$9.60
\$2.50	\$10.40
\$0.58	\$0.59
\$8.22	\$92.61
\$0.078	\$0.09
\$0.078	\$0.09
\$0.078	\$0.09
\$0.078	\$0.10
\$3.80	\$4.45
\$0.25	\$0.30
\$0.05	\$0.07
\$0.825	\$0.84
\$0.825	\$0.84
\$0.64	\$44.12
\$3.05	\$4.47
\$0.1660	\$7.82
\$8.61	\$83.27
\$3.34	\$75.37
\$0.597	\$48.68
\$0.036	\$65.29
\$0.035	\$54.13
\$2.75	\$46.93
\$7.84	\$84.73
NO BID	NO BID
\$0.39	\$0.19
\$0.56	\$0.27
\$4.84	\$6.08
\$5.00	\$6.77
\$4.84	\$6.08
\$4.84	\$6.08
\$4.44	\$6.03
\$18.33	\$18.20
\$0.32	\$0.34
\$11.39	\$6.73
\$0.99	\$0.54
\$0.56	\$0.55
\$0.70	\$0.87
\$1.05	\$264.01
\$0.65	\$1.05
\$0.287	\$2.75
\$0.186	\$14.34

