PD 24-037
Bid Opening 09/10/2024 10:00am
ISPECIFICATIONS AND PROPOSAL FORM FOR THE DEL|VERY
IOF JANITORIAL ITEMS AND SUPPLIES FOR THE COUNTY
IOF GLOUCESTER AND EXISTING UNITS WITH THE COUNTY
IAS ALLOWED THROUGH THE COUNTY CONTRACT
PURCHASING SYSTEM NUMBERS CK-01-GC §& 16GLCP
VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR:
Plastic Express, Inc. Aida Enterprises CooperFriedman Electric Supply Co., Inc. United Sales USA Corp UNIPAK CORP. Interboro Packaging Central Poly Bag Corp. Spruce Industries, Inc.
667 Lehigh Avenue 29 Riverwalk Blvd 315 Cranbury Half Acre Road 5902 14th Avenue P.O. BOX 332 114 Bracken Road 2400 Bedle Place 759 E. Lincoln Avenue
Union, NJ 07083 Burlington, NJ 08016 Cranbury, NJ 08512 Broolyn, NY 11219 West Long Branch, NJ 07764 Montgomery, NY 12549 Linden, NJ 07036 Rahway, NJ 07065
718-499-1119 609-667-9072 908-296-7441 718-709-5900 888-808-5120 845-782-6800 908-862-7570 732-388-9091
908-624-9090 - Fax Patrick Peters, CEO 732-308-4606 - Fax 718-709-7705 Fax 718-677-9371 - Fax 845-781-2450 - Fax 908-862-9019 - Fax 732-388-9585
Eddie H. Mardahaev, VP Tania Rodrigues, Gvmnt Solutions Mgr Peri Noe, Secretary Brian Marcus, President Bassy Gelb, Secretary Andrew Hoffer, President Daniel Josephs, CEO
ITEM |DESCRIPTION EST.QTY | Brand Proposed Unit Price__Total Brand Proposed Unit Price_Total | Brand Proposed Unit Price Total Brand Proposed Unit Price Total Brand Proposed Unit Price Total Brand Proposed Unit Price Total | Brand Proposed Unit Price_Total | Brand Proposed Unit Price__Total
1 [TORK 4012 15 FOAM SOAP ANTIBACTERIAL 9 PER CASE -
INO SUBSTITUTION 24 CASES $88.69 _$2,128.56 $79.00 _$1,896.00 NO BID $67.55 _$1,621.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 [TORK 4002 17 HAND SANITIZER ALCOHOL FOAM 6 PER
CASE - NO SUBSTITUTION 8 CASES $108.53 $868.24 NO BID NO BID $90.95 $727.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
[TORK 57 16 00 (BATTERY OPERATED) SOAP DISPENSER
3 W/ INTUITION SENSOR, FOAM WHITE - NO
[SUBSTITUTION 16 EACH $139.91 $2,238.56 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 [BETCO CLARIO GREEN EARTH FOAMING SKIN
ICLEANSER, 1000ML 6 PER CASE NO SUBSTITUTION
4 CASES $63.22 $252.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
IND-000365 INDIVIDUAL ANTIBACTERIAL FOAM CS SOAP
5 [6/100 MIL., MFG#590-000365 6 PER CASE - NO
SUBSTITUTION
4 CASES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 |[ELECTRONIC (BATTERY OPERATED) TOUCHLESS TOWEL
DISPENSER, 1.75 CORE SIZE 8 EACH San Jamar $134.68  $1,077.44 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 s oz wer mop RUBBERMAID-FGV11600]
- 120 EACH Rubbermaid $3.99 $478.80 NO BID $3.50  $420.00 Boardwalk $4.40  $527.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 [SWIFFER DUSTER KIT 24 EACH Swiffer $5.99  $143.76 $33.00 $792.00 NO BID Swiffer $23.83 $571.87 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
g [?MACID BOWL CLEANER READY TO USE 1QT BOTTLE
121 QT BOTTLES PER CASE 4 CASES 3M $56.76  $227.04 NO BID NO BID 3m $52.64  $210.56 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 |PINE (OIL) CLEANER DETERDENT 4-1 GAL. PER CASE
27 CASES Kess $30.21  $815.67 NO BID NO BID ACS $25.68  $693.36 NO BID NO BID NO BID UNIFIED #1154 $17.25  $465.75
11 |BLEACH1GAL. 6 PER CASE 18 CASES Pure Bright $27.13  $488.34 PRIME SOURCE $23.50 _$423.00 NO BID KIK $17.89 $322.02 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 [ENVIROX H2 ORANGE 117 4-1GAL. PER CASE
45 CASES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13 |[ENVIROX E282 DISPENSER SYSTEM 4EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
14 [URINAL FLOOR MAT W/FRAGRANCE 6/CS 48 EACH IMPACT $7.26_$130.68 FRESH PRODUCTS $2.50 $45.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
15 |FLAT URINAL SCREEN, CHERRY $11.02  $2,115.07 (0.9183
192 EACH BOARDWALK $1.08 $207.36 NO BID NO BID Boardwalk 12/cs ea $176.31) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
16 |BROOM ANGLE 48" POLYSTYRENE BRISTLE 12 EACH SIMPLE SPACES $8.62 $103.44 NO BID RUBF6638906BLA $8.30 $99.60 Bristles $4.50 _$54.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
17 24" PLUSH BROOM (GARAGE) W/POLY BRISTLES 6 EACH SIMPLE SPACES $25.22 $151.32 NO BID RUB2186280 $41.80 $$250.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
18 [60" MOP HANDLE, WINGNUT 18 EACH ZEPHYR $17.61 _$316.98 NO BID RUBFGH116000000 $10.75__ $193.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOILET PAPER 9" 2-PLY JR JUMBO, 12 ROLLS PER CASE.
19 |UNIVERSAL W/ 3.3 CORE (GCP-JRT9 OR NJ 73041000 OR
EQUAL 60 CASES SOFTOWEL $22.49 _$1,349.40 RIGHT CHOICE | $22.50 _$1,350.00 NO BID Atlas $16.52 _$991.20 NO BID NO BID CENTRAL POLY #700| _$24.00 $1,440.00 MARCAL 5216 $29.08_$1,744.80
20 [GEORGIA PACIFIC ENMOTION 89440 ROLL TOWEL 6/CASE|
| NO SUBSTITUTION 45 CASES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 |WHITE ROLL TOWEL 2" CRE 8" WIDE, 800 LINER FEET 6
ROLLS/CASE 240 CASES GREEN SOFT $28.21 $6,770.40 RIGHT CHOICE $35.00 _$8,400.00 NO BID SKC $17.70 _$4.248.00 NO BID MARCAL#P7088 | $31.66 $7.598.40 |MARCALNP6800 EW| $28.33  $6.799.20
2, WHITE ROLL TOWEL 6/ROLLS PER CASE
IMFR#NP6B0OEWRP - NO SUBSTITUTIONS 12 CASES NO BID NO BID NO BID $27.31 $327.75 NO BID $39.44 $473.28 $26.04 $312.48
ICASCADE PRO T150A HIGH CAPACITY TOILET TISSUE
23 [3.75" X 4" FOR TANDEM C2 DISPENSER 36/CASE NO
[SUBSTITUTION 6 CASES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
24 |[FAST ORANGE HAND CLEANER 128 OZ. 4/CASE 2 CASES FAST ORANGE $64.79 $129.58 NO BID NO BID ACS $21.74 $2,152.18 NO BID NO BID
25 [BOWL CLEANER (NON-ACID) 12/CASE 99 CASES BETCO $34.99 $3.464.01 NOBID NO BID Alrite $21.51 $2,129.49 NO BID SPRUCE SPLNABC | $26.25  $2508.75
PLASTIC LINERS, 38" X 58" (55-60 GAL.) CORELESS ROLLS,|
26 (100 BAGS/CS, 3PLY 1.5 MIL HEAVY TUTY BLACK - MUST
BE ROLLS BCREYLBR3858X31
112 CASES | PLASTIC PRINCE $23.14 $2501.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID UPC 395631 $18.30 $2,049.60 INT-3858-EXH $18.32 $2051.84 | CENTRALPOLY | $16.90 $1892.80 3 $33.55  $3757.60
7 |PLASTIC LINERS, 23X17X48 25 MIL, BLACK ROLLS,
100/CASE
192 CASES | PLASTIC PRINCE $20.44 $5652.48 NO BID NO BID NO BID UPC 48XHD $15.20 $2,918.40 INT-231748-XXH | $13.24 $2542.08 | CENTRALPOLY | $14.80 $2.841.60 NO BID
PLASTIC LINERS, 24" X 24" 1.5 MIL FITS UP TO 33 GAL.,
2 |CLEAR, ROLLS
' 75 CASES | PLASTIC PRINCE $30.28 $2.271.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID UPC HD24. $10.40 _ $780.00 INT-2424-L $10.48 $786.00 CENTRALPOLY | $20.40 $1,530.00 NO BID
29 [PLASTIC LINERS, 33X99, L5 MIL, FITS UP TO 33 GAL,
ICLEAR ROLLS 100 PER ROLL
56 CASES | PLASTIC PRINCE $24.99 $1,399.44 NO BID NO BID NO BID UPC 3340115 $10.75 __ $602.00 INT-3339-XH $20.74_$746.64 CENTRAL POLY $12.90 $722.40 NO BID
30 |PLASTIC LINERS 43X47, 2.0 MIL, CLEAR ROLLS 100/CASE
36 CASES | PLASTIC PRINCE $28.29 $1018.44 NO BID NO BID NO BID UPC 47CL $22.20 $799.20 NO BID CENTRAL POLY $17.30  $622.80 NO BID
31 [35QT MOP BUCKET W/RINGER
Q 4EACH PLASTIC PRINCE $51.50 _$206.00 JANCO $84.00 _$336.00 RUBFG758088YEL $85.40  $341.60 Janico $58.65 $234.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3, [STANDARD PLASTIC DOUBLE ROLL TOILET PAPER
DISPENSER, BLACK HORIZONTAL 8EACH | GEORGIAPACIFIC $37.09 $303.92 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
33 [FLOOR & CARPET MECHANICAL SWEEPER EQUAL TO
RUBBER MAID 4212-88 .
8 EACH RUBBERMAID $64.09 $512.72 NO BID $33.40 _$267.20 Scotch Brite $42.73 $341.87 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




34

|28 QUART WASTE BASKET (BLACK)

12 EACH PLASTIC PRINCE $9.00 $108.00 NO BID RUBFG295600BLA $6.20 $74.40 Boardwalk $7.12 $85.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
35 |RUBBER MAID 6141 OR EQUAL BROWN WAXED PAPER
ISANITARY RECEPTABLE LINER, 9"X10" 250 EA/CASE
8 CASES HOSPECO $28.20 $225.60 NO BID $24.20 $193.60 Rubbermaid $37.42_$299.37 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
36 [LINER WAX SANITARY AG 7.5" X 3"X10" 500/CASE
12 CASES IMPACT $2089 $358.68 NOVOLEX $26.00 $312.00 NO BID Hospeco $29.75 $357.01 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
37 [DISINFECTING WIPES 6 CS PROFESSIONAL LEGACY101075 6/75|
12 CASES LYsoL $27.49 $320.88 DISPOSABLE $52.00 _$624.00 NO BID Boardwalk $23.56 _$282.76 NO BID NO BID NO BID $22.50 __ $270.00
35 [FASTBALL, HEAVY DUTY SPRAY DEGREASER 1QT
BOTTLE OR EQUAL 12/CASE 3CASES SPRAY NINE $50.87 $179.61 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
39 |5 GAL. WAX FLOOR FINISH ACRYLIC
9 EACH SIMONIZ $64.61 $581.49 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID UNIFIED 1185 $73.11 $657.99
40 |WET MOP #20 60 EACH BOARDWALK $3.80 _$228.00 NO BID RUBFGV11700WHOO $4.05 _$243.00 Boardwalk $4.01 _$240.48 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
41 RAYONMOP #20 144EACH |  BOARDWALK $462 $665.28 NOBID RUBFGV41800WHOO $5.30$763.20 Janico $3.60 $518.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
42 [CLEANMAX VACUUM BAG FOR VACUUM MODEL
(CMPS-QD 100 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID
ICOMMERCIAL SILICONE TOILET BOWL BRUSH (BRISTLE)
43
LONG HANDLE
4EACH NO BID NO BID RUBFG631000WHT $1.80 $7.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
44 |JONNY MOP SOFT 100 EACH IMPACT $1.17 $117.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
45 [CAUTION WET FLOOR SIGN, 2 SIDED YELLO
100 EACH | PLASTIC PRINCE $10.00 $1,000.00 PRIME SOURCE $10.50 _$1,050.00 RUBFG611277YEL $9.65 $965.00 Janico $7.69 $769.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
46 |44 GAL. RUBBER TAIN TRASH CAN (NO LIDS) 4 EACH PLASTIC PRINCE $43.20 $172.80 NO BID RUBFG2643600RAY $38.45 $153.80 Rubbermaid $70.98 $283.91 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
47 [WHEEL DOLLY FOR 44 GAL. TRASH CAN 6 EACH PLASTIC PRINCE $2422  $145.32 NO BID RUBFG264000BLA $32.00  $192.00 Janico $10.44  $116.64 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
48 [/0" EXTENSION DUSTERS 24 EACH BOARDWALK $9.35 $224.40 NO BID RUBEGT110006400 $16.50 _$396.00 Boardwalk $8.08 $193.92 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
490" BROOM HANDLE W/ METAL TIP 12 EACH BOARDWALK $5.98  $71.76 NO BID RUBFGG36Y0OLAC $5.00 _$60.00 Boardwalk $5.76  $60.12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
50 |5 QT BUCKET W/HANDLE
12 EACH RUBBERMAID $11.08  $132.96 NO BID RUB1853776 $7.15 _ $85.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
51 |TOILET BRUSH BRISTLE 12 EACH RUBBERMAID $9.87  $118.44 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
P
52 |WHITE COTTON BAR MOP RAG 25 LBICS 7 CASES HOSPECO $62.25  $435.75 NO BID NO BID International Wipes $24.00_$168.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
53 |MICROFIBER CLEANING CLOTH 16"X16" 120 EACH RUBBERMAID $071  $85.20 NO BID RUB1820581 $.75 $90.00 Boardwalk $20.09 $2.410.56 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
54 |[FRESHENERS BOARDWALK BWK CLIPMAN, MANGO, 30
DAY, 72EA/CS 3 CASES BOARDWALK $158.34 $475.02 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 [TOILET SEAT COVERS 1/2 FOLD (SSEPTIC SAFE) 20/250 CS
12 CASES BOARDWALK $42.61 $511.32 PRIME SOURCE $53.00 $636.00 NO BID Gen $30.20 $363.48 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
56  [NITRILE EXAM GLOVE MED. POWDER FREE 1000/CS
4 CASES EMERALD $35.09 $143.96 PRIME SOURCE $49.00 $196.00 NO BID Pro Stat $28.80 _$115.20 NPE-M $35.00 _$140.00 SRI TRANG $26.80 $107.20 NO BID NO BID
57 |NITRILE EXAM GLOVE LG. POWDER FREE 1000/CS
7 CASES EMERALD $35.99 $251.93 PRIME SOURCE $49.00 _ $343.00 NO BID Pro Stat $28.80 _$201.60 NPE-L $35.00 _$245.00 SRI TRANG $26.80 $187.60 NO BID NO BID
58 |NITRILE EXAM GLOVE XLG. POWDER FREE 1000/CS AURELIA XL NPFG-E|
6 CASES EMERALD $35.99 $287.02 PRIME SOURCE $49.00 _$294.00 NO BID Pro Stat 28.80 _ $172.80 NPE-XL 1$35.00 __$210.00 $26.80 $160.80 NO BID NO BID
INDOOR WALK-OFF MAT 4'X6' CHARCOAL/GRAY (SILVER|
5 SERIES), NORIBS
' 8 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
INDOOR WALK-OFF MAT 3'X5' CHARCOAL/GRAY (SILVER|
60 ISERIES), NORIBS
' 8 EACH GUARDIAN $55.00 $440.72 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
\Variations: (if any) SEE ABOVE SEE ABOVE SEE ABOVE SEE ABOVE SEE ABOVE SEE ABOVE NONE SEE ABOVE
ARO 2-14 DAYS 20 DAYS ARO 2 WEEKS ARO 7 Business Days 1-10 DAYS 3-5DAYS 10 DAYS ARO 5 DAYS ARO
[This is a one time purchase
ill you extend your prices to local government YES YES NO NO YES YES YES YES
lentities within the County
Bid specifications sent to: |ASP, LLC, Imperjal Dade, Sam Tell Qompanies, Deltek, ARAMSCO; Brady Plus; PWXPress; SJ Shinell; WB Mason; Ln ProServices
Bid rejectefd: ODP Business [Solutions bid is rejeqted because theijr bid was contingent upon acceptance gf the Master Agreement of the City of Tamarac| Florida
Item #3 not awarded - All bid$ were overbudget.

Based upon the bids received | recommend the bid be

awarded to each vendor as follows as the lowest
responsive, responsible bidder: United Sales USA|Corp: Item #1, 2, 9, 11, 15, 16, 19, 21,25, 41, 45 and 47, 48, 52 and 55.

Plastic Express, Inc.: Item #4, 6, 8, 17,24, 31, 32, 38, 39, 40, 44, 51, 53, 54 ahd 60.
ICooper Electric Supply Company: Item# 7, 18, 33, 34, 35, 43, 46, 49 and 50
ISpruce Industries| Inc.: Item #10, 22 and 37.
ICentral Poly Bag Corporation: Item #26, 27 and 30.
UniPak of NJ Corporation: Item #28 and 29.
Interboro Packagipg Corp.: Item #56, §7 and 58.
)Aida Enterprises: | Item #14 and 36.

Sincerely,

Kimberly Larter, Purchasing Department
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