PD 0715-045 " ] 10/8/2015
.77 Bid Opening 5972675 16:00am b - : ) : ‘ o
SPECIFICATIONS AND PROPOSAL o .
___FORMFOR EMS CONSUMABLES : ) T T e e ] o :
. T |vEnDOR: ' VENDOR: . VENDGR: ) VENDGR: _VENDOR: :
.VE Ralph & Son | Common Cents EMS Supply LLC ‘Nashvifle Medical 8EMS Praducts Inc. QuadMed Inc. Bound Tree Medical LLC. iMoare Medical LLE | ;
| o PO Box 633 304 Boston Post Rd, PO Box 64 PQ Box 550773 5000 Tuttie Crossing . 1630 New Briton Ave. !
. 1320 Schuyler Ave | OId Saybrook, CT06475 Springfield, TN 37172 Jacksonville, Fi. 32255 1Dublin OH 43616 Farmington CT 06032 _
B T | Kearny NJ 07032 | John Dunn . Nari Sadarangani - Pres. Jackie Gieger Bid Mgr. Mark Dougherty Sec. Treas. Bonnie Samsel
_____ Verron J. Ralph ! 860 388-4699 T | B15384-0573 - 904 380-2323 800 533-0523 800 234-1464
[ o . | 800 536-1796 860 386-4699 Fax 615 384.0574 Fax 904 380-2303 Fax §77 311-2437 Fax 477 354-5916 Fax____
{TEM | DESCRIPTION - 800 772-7203 FAX | jdunn@savelives.com nashvilleems@gmaii.com bids@guadmed.com christopher. Fyffe@boundiree.com |bid@mooremedical.com

I — . ‘

Adulf BVM T 31028  TTTgdsn $10.90 R - “§9.4z |

Pediatric BYM . $13.65 $12.59 $70.80 3748 ] $12.54 :

Neonatal BVl B I R : - A N £ 7Y 1. $15.95 ‘ $12.45 $72.54

~"'On Board O2 Flowmeter {0-15 LPW) L $1r800 I $105.92 - $37.92 I T 1 X i X A

/8 Inch NPT Adapter for above i $22.95 | 2139 £5.05 T T ydsee 371,78

. Oxygen Nipples - $0.55 e go.28 062 3ok NO BID

[Oxyyen Gaskets - $0.78 $0.57 - _ $0.74 _NoB8iD -

Oxygen Cylinder Storage Rack | T §124.95 Y {21 - Rz $54.01 . . . NoBbD i
| |Oxygen Cylinder Wrench T $2.78 : $2.55 $2.95 $2.38 NO BID '
| |Oxygen Cyiinger Wrench : $0.80 $1.55 s04E $1.99 -7 "'wnoBID

:Adult Partial Nan-rebreatherMask 3 $1.04 $d7.99 £1.07 £1.02 1. %083

___‘Aduif Nasal Canufa R [ X] Y - A o $0.35 $0.31

Pediatric Partial Nen-rebreather Mask $1.04 $47.99 - $1.58 $1.39 $0.83

Pediatric Nasal Canula 7.78 _ $5do3 $1.70 $1.16 $0.32

|02 Supply Tubing o 0.35 - $i5.86 NO BID L _fotr . NOEID

Oxygen Humidifier (Prefilled) ] $1.30 ] $1.21 NO BiD $1.55 §q7 T
| _|Adult Trach Collar” o $0.85 $o7s 7 $1.21 ¥ 7

Pediatric Trach Collar $1.03 . $0.94 NO BID $0.99 $4.72

_iNasal Airways; (Roberiazzi style) — . - - I S
L 128 $22.95 T $21.36 o $2.34 $11.46 $206 |
P L $22.95 %2136 $2.34 Y i $2.06
wEy ) $22.95 ] “$21.36 T $1.85 $17.40 06
|1 48/ o ) ~$22.95 ' 33136 o $71.40 $2.06
207 . $22.50 ) §18.40 ) %1140 $2.06
2% . 33250 %1840 £11.40 $2.06
Ll o ] $22.50 - $18.40 " . ¥4 %208 |
26f $22.50 §78.40 $11.40 I 7 R
[ B : $22.50° $18.40 - - 51140 o £2.06
dowr 000 AR R 7+ -1 R #18.40 - £11.40 .. %208
3z ) ~ §22.50 §Ta40 $11.40 %206
My ] $22.50 $18.40 ) $11.40 $2.06
36 $22.60 1 . ¥18d0 $11.40 . %208
Sterile Lubricating Jelly (for ahove} $6.20 8574 ] $8.99 ] $4.66
| |Nasal Afrway Kit (Boxed) $i0.25 " §16.86 $20.42 31470
| Oral Afrways: (Color Coded, Berman style) | i B .
#00 (40 mm) ] $7.45 ~ %688 $0.16 i 3520 %264
B #0 (50 mm) L $7.45  $6.89 %016 $5.20 $2.64 B
_#HeOmmy ] $745 | $6.89 T $0.16 $5.20 %24 T
#2 (70 mm) ) $7.45 X $0.16 | #8520 B $2.64
#3 (80 mmj . $7.45 %689 £0.76 - $2.64
# @0 mmy $7.45 $6.89 $0.76 ] 264
#5 (100 mm) ] 37.45 $6.89 $0.16 $2.64

B (110 mm) N | TS A $6.89 ~ $0.16 §2.64

i Orafl Afrway Kit {Boxed) — $8.80 - $0.96 N $1.91

Suction Canisters:

Gn-Board (Scco) LT sT62.24 - $761.28 T $2.76 - $137.28 NOBID

Forfable ) - $260,00 - T§ia7s . " "NOo BID $14.64 .. %2980 NO BiD

Portable Tubing & Caih $33.00 $35.94 o T T 'NoBID $32.96 ~  NOBID

Replacement Canister for Quickdraw _ | T T§260.60 $293.25 ] $14.64 | giFaEn NO BID

Manual Suction Canisiers! e i N ”

Neonate / Pediatric )  $24.65 N $796.65 1342 $i767 NO 8ID

Soft Yankaiier . $26.78 ~ $196.65 T $13.42 - $7285 NOBID

Rigid Yankauver T $26.75 ‘$2ita’ - $14.73 $12.74 | NoBID

First Raponder Kit ~ $132.00 - $81.87 $77.89 o $4680 NOBID T T
. Yankauer Suctions Cathefers w/ tubing (ventedy =~ 7~ — B $8.83 ) ) -

Soff Suction Catheters: L 1 - L

6 ir o o L 3620 $0.21 o ~ $0.13 — $o.23
| _8fr - #6247 $0.20 ” - R ¥ I o $0.13 $0.23

10 ] B $0.24 o $0.20 1 $0.27 “$0.13 $0.23

izfr ] T $0.24 $0.20 $0.27 | . %013 $0.23

T 4 ] $0.24° . $0.20 ) $0.29 $0.13 $0.23

o 18T . T T Ts0.24 . som0 $0.27 $0.13 $0.23
| 181 $0.24 $0.20 $0.21 30.13 $0.23




"Suction Tubing — T37.35 : $0.45 $0.67 : 104812015
Bulb Syringe ~ 77 TV 3oss Cs08ec T $0.395 :
| |Aduit/Ped SPQZ Sensors (Tuffsatt Compatible) $369.06 7T $322.00 N #1099 :
| cabte for Above T $110.00 $63.25 $99.60 ;
Adult/Ped SPC2 Sensars (Tuffsatt Compatible) | $223.00 §7i3E $10.99 )
Aduft Sp02 Sensor ) $ar4.00 T §irase - T $119.00
Bite Sticks ) : $4.20 o $2.55 S $2.90
|Eyfetymer LED Metronome I N 11 X B NS < ¢ 7 I ] —__NCBID )
2X2's L stas T $49.20 T L o © 3138
3IX3s o ] ] $7.39 ] $94.74 ] $0.02 - $1.32 ] s
iXds . ) $1.50 $52.99 ] ) $0.03 L $1.43
4X7s i ) . 832 N $2.35 . $0.05 ] NO BID
5X8%s ) - $1.35 ] $47.02 $b.08 2.28
8xXis - $3.98 $59.92 o ) $0.13 397
Triangular - 8415 ) $87.40 ) : _samz
2" Kling ] 52.60 . $z2789 T 2.35
3" Kling B T $3.90 $32.10 — $2.75 i .
1" Taps - ) " T3B2.80 ] 1. 7.07
2" Tape } $82.80 - - 7.07
| |3"Tape’ " -~ - T s82.80 - 5.66
EyeFads B $59.80 4,44
Buftferfly Closures T $4543 : - 2.19 o :
_____ Pediatric Band-Alds T o g5 T - 1.24 .
Adhesive Bandage 314 X3 B N 540,75 B N 1,83 '
Adhesive Bandage 2X 4 1/2_ — F108.71 54,05 o ‘
DynaStopper N 378,00 ) B $1.33
Traumna Dressing 12 X 30 $58.08 $0.89 | B
Burn Sheets 60 X 96 $2.59 - T $2.39
Sterfle Watar: -
- 250 cc - h ) NO BID
i 1000cc . NO BID
Salina:
L A - X e Y - 1 > NOBID $4.88 $2.15
|| tebbce NO BID $4.47 $2.55
Petroleum Gauze - $5.10 0,71 $8.59
Asherman Chest Seals ) ) o $0.98 $96.90 $8.25
s7a.78 Nogw T T T §71.20 ; fo08 o srids
I $78.78 ) NO BID ~ $71.20 ET YT A $7.15
) ] “$ud0 “TTs7B.7E - NOBID R 4 X $0.08 3715
X-Large - Y I 78,78 T " No BiD _$71.20 $0.08 ] A
infaction Control Kiis ) “$5.20 B /I U4 §3.50 - - ez o $2.56
Cover Gowns - - §16.25 B " §14.95 $0.30 ol #tsas T sa3s §79.66
Shoe Covers ) . §17ds5 L e T o soes $4.62 36.95 . R iEX
HEPA Masks: (N95) B .
B ~ Smali - B $18.70 32185 o NgBHTT T $21.95 %08 - _576.67
Regular $18.70 $27.85 NOBID | §3b4 - $16.67
Ear Loop Mask w/ Extended Face Shield $105.00 o sm3s | T gaEds $3.31 $15.37
| Safety Giasses 3215 $1.40 ~ NOBiD ” i $2.14 B $1.57
Vionex Towelletes "~ - 3 $5.75 ) Y857 o NGO BID I R L §7.69
Vionex Liquid Soap 180z $100.80 “$osos - NOBIDT T T £9.26 $91,68
Vionex No Rinse Gel ) " $Rd.00 - . - ] " "TNGBID £3.62 T _ $74.64
Hype-Wype Bleach Pads ) $56.00 ) - %6084 ¢ NG BID NOBID B NO BID
I |Equipment Disinfection Wipes $74.40 _NOBID ~ $6.99 $e5.88
Antimicrobial Hand Wipes " 367.80 NO BID ~_NOBID $54.36
CPR Pocket Masks $94.20 - - NO BID ] $4.13 NO BID
| |Disinfectant Spray - $94.20 T T wNoBO_~ g $8.90 $85,56
___: Spray Cleaner TT§ero0 | NO BID — NOBID NO BID
| |lce Packs 5 X 9 (loose) T s8.os — $0.49 T T TTTTRR @S _ $0.21
Hot Packs 5 X 8 (foose) [ 5 7] $0.59 ~ $1399 - NO BID
Aduit B/P Cuff _ §6.25 o $5.21 $6.72 $9.87
Obese B/F Cuff ) $12.35 R 2 X _ $1292
| Child B/P Cuif _ - X $5.21 3$6.50 $5.83
infant B/P Cuff . ] $8.75 $5.21 1 $6.67 - NO BID
Stethoscope (Sprague Rappapori) .. $7.86 5489 o o U $587 .11 |
___|AED Electrodes (LF 12 Compatibis] o $20.65 " NOBID $19.42 . $2.18
Safety Razors B — ] $18.45 ' U §iras B $17.42
Ring Cufter . ] 720 ) $3.74 $4.70 i
| |Tweezers ] $1.45° $0.58 $0.74 B
__'PenLights N - ¥T6 o $6.21 $4.38
EMS Sheers (Medicut 7 147 ) $2.20 $0.75 - $0.71
Convenience Bags - $ared0 $158.13 ) TTf0.93
| Atcohof Prep Pads ) B ) $0.90 1~ ] ) §f38
Bee Sting/Medicaine Swabs B $2.75 %200 $2.41 N
Ammonia Inhalants _ | 51785 a $15.21 T ) 520,25




Oral Glucose §14.16 " $12.13 : 'NO BiD $4.40 T $73.49 10/8/2015 i
VComparrmam Sears ) B C T Tsfes : - $71.85 C §$14.00 e ;P A T : 31309 | i
"AA" Batieries T 1 $8.17 B T NOEBID T go.s8 $6.72 '
777777 TAAAT Batteries T : $10.50 ' $7.75 o - NO BID gofg " $1272
-9 Vait Batteries ] U wrae i $74.85 Tt NoBW T T I $71.64 ]
0B Kit (NJ OEMS Approved) T $12.89 $8.30 ' NO BID NOBID & NO BID
Baby Bunting ] B ] ; $250.00 §$280.14 ) $169.00 ) $2.34 $54.00
| :Emergency Blankets 34760 $703.04 - T w00 T T Tstew L $76.40 L ]
Red Bags smali (24 X 24) ] $38.14 $66.03 ' NO 8iD $92.60 : $6.67 B
Red Bags Jarge {30 X 44) ) ; $35.74 §aTe o B NoBib T $54.00° T $0.40 ] .
| |Sscor Quickdraw replacement Battery (82185 ) $23.86 T " NOBID I NoED | $21.99 L ]
Sscor VX2 replacement Batteries - o #3935  $4284 o NO BiD 1 NO BID $39.60
Sscor EVX Repaicement Bafteries $36.35 o $60.95 R NO Bib NOBID ~ $39.60 | .
Minitor V Batteres o " NOBid $16.75 B o T NoBID o NoBD -
Forefead Thermometer $59,00 — $49.68 B $0.45
| Cervical Colfars; ! I
Stifneck Select Aduft - $5.30 $5.98 ‘§5.29 ,” $5.28
Stifneck Select Pediatric . 3539 B $5.98 $5.28 ] $5.28
| I Stitneck Pediatric ’ £4.95 ) 5489 B - $5.28 ) | . #472
Stifneck Baby No Neck - %495 ! $4.83 $5.29 o #an
Phifly - Child - ) $11.55 i $z025 ) $7.09 e NOBID
| Philly - Smalf - L Ts1185 $20.25 - ) fres | KNOBID ]
1 _Philly - Medium ] ) $7155 $20.25 $7.18 1 NOBID
Philly - Large - - _ T$11.55 $20.25 3718 __ NOBID —
. _Philly- XLarge i X I - T%20.25 ) &5 NO BIb
Cervical Collar Bag ] : $37.50 $34,53 $46,9% - NOBID
__|Disposable Longhoard Straps ) $27400 $221 38 $237.00 . NG BID
“Sant” Splimt_ ) ) l $8.90 §7.38 N $5.15 o $6.33
| _ . |Bin Box (Parts Tray) ) ] 3 ’ L P
| Small(z 14 X 11 X 4°574) ) $17.25 $34.50 No BiD ] NO BID
Modium (4 14 X 11 X4 3/4) ) © o $20.00 $41.77 NOBID NO BID
Large (6 AX 11 X434 $23.75 T g6232 ) B ..NOoEID ) NO BID
Patient Pillow — 579.95 $35.44 _ S48 T I #0208 ]
_.._|Disposable Pifiow Case i %2683 " $19.71 $29.54 $713.39
Phillips AED Pad Carridge ] $43.55 $46.23 345.20 3Tz
| Phillips AED Pad Cariridge - Pedi _ $70400 | §74.52 ) $72.80 ) $60.00 ]
Phiflips AED Batiery . $100.00 $116.61 ) $109.00 i $93.89
Padded Board Splint {small} 15 incit B $2.36° B > X1 $2.24 B N $2.06
Padded Board Splint (medium) 36 inch $4.05 T ""s234 426 $2.27
| |Padded Board Spiint (large] 54 inch . T g578 $3.93 $5.48 $4.32 ]
Soft-W Tactical Tourniquet R $26.75 $24.58 " $26.9% 1 NO BID
' Posey Non-Locking Twice as Tough Cffs Wris| '$37.75 $34.39 $29.45 _ NOBID
Posey Non-Locking Twice as Tough Cuffs Anki 33775 83435 $2048 NC BiD_
Dafivery Days . Tto7pays _ 7Days’ : ] Jto7Days | 2t 3pays ) ~ Zto3Days 210 10 Days
Variations: (ifan__w“ - o ] T . S ] ) | 1
Wiil you extend your prices to focal - o B ) P B o ) o B
government entities wiihin the County NO . YES o - NO - - NoO NG NO
\
This Ts a (1) one year contract with (1) cne twd year extension or (2} two one year extensions, ] — i i . o
| |Bid specifications sent ta: B Prime Vendor Mediine Industries " |Soutt mEmergency """ |Emergency Medical Products | ]
| |Based upon the bids received, { recommend_a splif award be made ta all 6f the vendors as the lowest responsiva, respansible bidders as follows: | g L
- Sincerely, -
|Robert J. McErfana ) )
Purchasing




VENDOR: 'VENDOR: ]
Midwest Medjcaf Sup. Ca. LLE " Hefiry $chein Inc. .
| 13400 Lakefront Dr PO Box 3237
Earth City, Mo 63045 trmro, SC 29063
Jo Ann_Rudd EMS Spec. Jesse Garringer VP
8§88 540-3232 ) ‘800 845-3550
800 545-0065 Fax___ 800 533-4793 Fax T
Joann. nudd@mmsmedical.com esse.gaminger@henryschein.com
$10.93 $9.97
.. %1373 £12.08
___f#37m $17.40 |
$111.18 $87.81
- $78.92 $71.36
3$0.37 £0.35
. $0.49 0.4
B NO BID $73.35
_ %289 $1.85 .
[ $0.76 - NOBID
$.93 B .20 -
— 5035 $0.36 .
$0.93 R $1.56
s $1.30 $64.94
$0.43 $6.32
$1.79 $1.49 B
$1.16 $1.12
. $7.54 2.6 ]
3157 £16.67
$1.57 $18.61 o
$1.57 $25.71
$1.57 $25.01°
$1.57 $23.21
] $1.57 $22,71
R $1.57 $23.31
— 3157 $2337
$1.5¢7 $23.31
. $1.67 $22771 ]
$1.57 _ $23.39
$1.57 $23.31
$7.57 ) $23.31 -
$0.04 $8.17
515,60 $9.84 N
$6.15 $12.57 L
$0.15 §12.51
$0.15 ) $12.01 —
$0.15 $12.57
| $0.15 $12.51
$0.15 $iz2.01
$0.15 $12.51
I $0.15 $7.01
$1.61 $2.17
| $2.72 $2,89
NO BID $275.73
) NG BID $36.52
[ NO BID $275.73_
NG BID ) $14.23
— NOBID $14.08
B ‘NOBID $15.49 B
NO BID $71.78
$1.09 F10.41
$0.165 $0.214
%0768 $0.21
$0.165 $0.21
30465 621
$0.165 $0.29
$0.165 TS0zt
_$06.165 $0.21 )

10/8/2015




. .43 ) ) $1.04
$0.65 T ¥082
TT§n2%: I $297.55 T
. ssaae T 86276
DISCONTINUED TTSeEET _
DiSCONTINUED $203,40 T
- sz f2.16
NO BID NG BID
$0.01 %002 —
$0.015 $0.03 .
77 $0.023 8003
NO BID 5264
$0.08 do.42
¥0.1263 $0.46
l $0.73 $0.77
$0.785 011
$0.275 $0.14 B
| $0.53 $0.51
§1.06 —$0.90
$7159 3166 T
$0.07 $0.13
I $0.0788 TS0
" "%0.0364 $0,05 ]
f0.0123 L
B £0.054 3006
31.26 $1.26
$0.73 §0.87
- $1.53 N FET
1 $9.52
$2.26 $5.28
B §7.27 $560
$2.50 $1040 —
s0.58 _$6.59
B $8.27 - $92.67 ]
£0.075 $0.09
$0.078 $0.08
- $0.678 £0.09
$0.078 $0.76 ~
$3.80 $4.45
$0.25 $0.30
$0.65 s007 |
~ T ¥0.825 $0.84
$0.825 $0.84
$0.64 $44.12
$3.05 $4.47
so.1660  $7T82
$8.61 38327
$3.34 $75.37
I $0.597 £48.68
“$0.036 $65.29 |
£0.035 $54,93
N $2.75 _ §46.93
57.54 $84.73 1
_NOBID NO'EID
3 $0.39 $0.19 ]
$0.56 $0.37
. $4.84 $6.08
§5.00 $6.77 -
- 54.84 $6.08
$4.84 TF6.08
— $144 $6,03
§16.33 $16.20
P03 $0.34 .
I $11.39 $6.73
30398 $0.54 ]
$0.56 $0.55
T s0.70 $0.87
i T$1.05 5264.01
$0.65 ) $1.05
- _ $0.287 $275
$0,186 §14.34

10/8/20156




— §4z23 o £70.44
o414 ; §1148
B $0.295 ! $21.83 _
$0.295 ] 32479
- %098 - R FEN
B $13.47 $13.08
T4z $578.47
$1.02 _$90.81
$0.10 $0.08 .
[ $0.22 " ¥307
NO BID $44,12
I NO BID NG BID -
NG BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID
$16.95 §7.62
$4.27 $4.97
I $4.27 %457 B
- $3.72 $4.69 )
$3.72 $4.60
B “NOBID $7.30
NOBID $22.16
B NO BID $22.16
[ NG BiD $16.80
NG BiD $9.66 ]
$17.29 $716.98
$4.96 NO BiD
$3.00 8635 o
I NOBID $32.96
“NO BID NO BiD
_NOBID NO Bib
$2.18 $2.55
§0.218 $1.54
$77.90 $44.34
$125.58 7147
— $196.50 $111.84
I £1.60 $2.32
$3.06 $3.82
$a87” 34.95
B $26.70 $28.13
$27.69 '$70.05
) $27.89 $70.05
2 t0 3 Days 2 Days
B YES NO ]

10/8/2015




