o PD 014-018 o
Bid Opening 5/21/14 10:00am i i i ]
VENDOR:~ | VENDOR: 'VENDOR: VENDOR:
SUPPLY AND DELIVERY ( OF . 'Camden Bay & Faper Office Basics ‘Central Poly Corp. ‘AH American Poly
N PAPER PRODUCTS - 114 Gaither Drive 22 Creek Circle w2400 Bedle Place 140 Turner Place e
‘Mt Laurel, NJ 08054 | Boothwyn, PA 19051 “liinden NJ 07036 Piscataway, N.J 08554
- o L - Fred Rasmussen VP Katherine Leighton Andrew Hoffer | Nikki Klein
| B . 7(85(}')]’2? -3313 800 541-5855 1908 862-7570 732 752-3200
_____ (856)727-4114 Fax |800 225-4049 Fax 908 862-9019 Fax | 732 752-2305 Fax
|
ITEM __ DESCRIPTION - CUNITPRICE TOTAL  |UNITPRICE  TOTAL "|UNITPRICE_ TOTAL _ [UNIT PRICE _ TOTAL .
B 1| Dessert Cups, plastic, 4 oz., 2500/cs i
Solo # P040 or equal s o
Annuai estimated quantity: 36 cs 34478 $1612.08 No Bid No Bid . NeBid |
| 2|Dessert Cup Lids, Plastic, 4 oz., T
2500/cs solo H#Y04F or equal S L .
Annual estimated quantity: 30 cs $38.93  $1167.90 | No Bid _No Bid No Bid
| 3|Foam Cups, 10 oz, 1000/cs dart# o
16-B-20 or equal o e
Annual estimated quantity: 60 cs $39.20 $2352.00 |$33.65 $2019.00 No Bid NoBid |
4|Foam cup lids, 1000/cs dart #20 JL _
or equal o e .. o
Annual estimated quantity: 45cs $36.30 $1656.00 |$17.50 $787.50 NoBid No Bid
_ 5| Place mats, white 10"x10", 1000/cs -
American #343 or equal o ] e
__:Annual estimated quantity: 50 cs $17.80  $890.00 No Bid ~ No Bid No Bid
| 6 Napkins, white, 15"x17", s600/cs | . ]
i, howard #363 or equal e SO SO PRT S
Annuar estimated quaniity: 25¢cs 1$28.00 $700.00 No Bid No Bid : NoBid
7 Paper towels, bleached, plyfold
1 2400/cs, ft. howard #206-or equal ) o o :
o Annual estimated quantity: 18 cs $15.20 $273.60 |$17.95 _$323.10 :§15.1% $273.42 No Bid
8 Toilet tissue white, 2 ply 500 sheets S B -
196/cs gen‘tpaper#612 or equal N R
1Annual estimated quantity: 10 cs $31.00 ~ $310.00 1$28.90 $289.00 |$30.99 $309.90 No Bid
9 | Piates, Plastic, 9", 500/cs, dart or ]
- equal R ) : e o
Annual estimated quantity: 160 cs  $30.50 " $4880.00_$26.50 $4240.00 No Bid NoBid
10| Folding tray, shallow plate hinged
200/cs, mobil # THI-010 or equal S SSp—— o
Annual estimated quantily: 92 cs [$15.88 $1460.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 |Cold Cups, flat bottom, 7 0z., | -
2500 ¢s solo or equal R o
|Annual estimated quaniity: 8 cs $44.38 $359.04 No Bid No Bid NoBid |
| 12| Poly gloves, disposable, medium .
1000/cs, impact # 6W100 or equal




Annual estimated quantity: 15 ¢s $4.88 $73.20 . ~ No Bid $5.96 $89.40 No Bid
_ 13|Chix Wipers 14"x24",200CS | o I U —
Chicopee Mili # 8310 or equal 10 cs -$15.60 $156.00 '$145.75 $1457.50 No Bid i No Bid
| 14|Poly bags, plain 8" x 3" x 15",
| 1000/cs fandis or equal : ;
Annual estimated quantity: 10 cs 1 $16.60 $166.00 No Bid '$25.00 . %25000 | No Bid
| 15|Bowis, 12 oz., 1000/cs dart # 36 ‘ R ) ] ]
712 or equal e N e .
Annual estimated quantity: 45 cs $31.80 $1431.00 $14.20 $639.00 No Bid No Bid
16 | Clear Bags, 16"x14"x36", 250cs ] i
Landis or equal )
Annual estimated quantity: 30 cs (2168 $650.40 $17.50  $525.00 |$19.70 .. $591.00 |$38.86
17| Aluminum Trays wilids 250/cs, pca - )
#?1390Porequal o o S o o
1 Annual estimated quantity: 400 cs $48.80 $18,520.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
18 | Bags, sandwich, 1 cs, . B
| 6"x 7 5/8", aztec or equal _ - e e
Annual estimated quantity: 15 cs $1498 322470 . NoBid Na Bid No Bid
19 Paper plates, plastic coated 6" . )
1000/cs, solo or equal - L
| _.4_n_r;yal_e§t;mated guantity: 25 cs .$12.65 $316.25 $49.65 $1241.25 No Bid _NoBid
20 Cups, styrofoam, 1000/cs, dart | e e
#8J8 or equal . _—_— R A :
Annua! estimated quantity: 30 cs :$19.88 $596.40 |$16.95 $508.50 $35.60 $71068.00 | No Bid )
~ Delivery Date 710 10 Days T4Days  ____ Storpsys |5t 20Days
i ?'Vg;jations: i #7 Putney Put 100 Brand Vari. | #12 Priced per case of 1000
! ‘#8 Nittany Paper Brand Vari. but only soid in case of 10,060
i i#16 Clear Bags Brand Vari. I
Will you extend your prices to local I 3
government entities within the County _YES YES _YES
| | THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT SHALL BE FOR TWOQ YEARS FROM DATE OF AWARD. )
B Bid Specifications sent to: iUﬁifJék Corp |WB Mason CPSPaperGroup | Graphic Paper NY
Cahco industries Prime Vendor Euclid Info Tech :
_____ |
B | Based upon the bids received, I recommend we award items 1,2,5,6,7.10,11,12,13,14,17,18,19, to Camden Bag and Paper and items -
3,4,8,9,15, 16,20 fo Office Basics as the lowest responsive responsible bidders. ;_,__ R
- “Sinesraiy -
|Robert J. McErlane
Purchasing




