Bid Opening 9/6/2013 16:60am :
SPECIFICATIGNS AND PROPQSAL /
I FORM FOR EMS CONSUMABLES - o - )
. VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: ] VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: _ { VENDOR:
| _ . VE Ralph & Son Commeon Cents EMS Kentron Health Care Bound Tree Medical |Ever Ready First Aid | Emergency Medical Prod. |Moote Medicai LLC | Midwest Medical Sup.
‘320 Schuyier Ave | 304 Boston Post Rd. PC Box 120 11210-1 Phillips Industrial Bivd.| 5000 Tutile Crossing | 101-01 Foster Ave 5235 International Dr ste, B| 1600 New Briton Ave.| 13400 L akafront Dr
" Kearny NJ 07032 | OId Saybrook, CT 06475 | Springfield, TN 371721 Jacksonville, Fl. 32256 Dublin OH 43016 Brooklyn, NY 11236 | Cudahy, Wl 53118 Farmington CT 06032| Earth City, Mo 63045
__: Verngn J, Ralph John Dunn | Nari Sadarangani iAaron Pral Jusfin Stein Miri Weber Bradley Smith Bonnie Samsel Jo Ann Rudd
| 800 526-1156 860 3884599 | 615 384-0573 1904 88G-2323 80G 533-0523 718 495-4600 800 556-6270 806 234-1464 888 540-3232
. 800 772-7203 FAX | 860 388-4699 Fax | 615 364-0574 Fax 904 880-2303 Fax 577 311-2437 Fax__ | 718-495-5600 Fax Ie0 558-1851 Fax 877 354-5916 Fax 8O0 545-0065 Fax
[TEM | DESCRIPTION : !
| |EMS Consumables B o o
Adult BYM $9.65 $9.42 NO BID 510,88 $8.95 $10.90 $9.90 $9.32 511.18
Pedfiatric BVM $12.75 512.48 NQ BID §13.94 : $10.50 $13.90 NO BID $11.53 $14.03
Neonatal BV $12.75 512.52 NO BID 516.61 $12.37 i $14.50 NO BIG $11.53 $14.03
On Board 02 Fiovmeter (0-15 LPM) sr18.00 $107.97 $21.59 $19.47 $104.46 §12500 | NOBIO §104.65 §120.33
/8 inch NPT Adapter for above $12.15 511.40 NO BID §11.7¢ $19.27 $24.00 NO 5ID $9.27
Oxygen Nipples $0.34 $0.46 529.00 (50 $0.59 $0.44 $0.54 NO BID : NO BID
Oxygen Gash $0.47 $0.68 $6.40(10) $0.77 . %065 $0.60 NO BID NO BID .
Oxygen Cylinder Siorage Rack 3135.00 $206,62 $269.00 $235.54 §53.60 | $18.00 NO BID NO BID $257.87
Oxygen Cylinder Wrench $2.45 $2.55 $3.39 32.90 p2.4 $1.50 NO BID NO BID $3.06
Oxygen Cylinder Wrench $0.70 $0.73 $0.65 $0.48 $2.03 51.00 $0.51 NO BID $0.74
Aduif Partial Non-rebreather Mask : $1.14 $1.49 NO BID 5124 $0.94 $0.85 $1.12 $1.05
Adult Nasal Canula B ! $0.40 $0.37 NO 81D 5054 $0.35 $0.46 $0.35 } §0.35
. Pediatric Partial Non-rebreather Mask $1.55 $1.49 NOBID ¢ 51.57 $1.35 §1.02 $1.45 §1.18
Pediatric Nasal Canula $1.78 s1.11 NO BID i $1.46 $0.38 $1.54 NO BID ~ NOBID $1.32
.| 02 Supply Tubing ) 50.39 $0.31 NO 810 $1.18 30.31 $0.85 $0.50 $0.34 $0.73
| .. |Gxygen Humidifier o $1.49 §1.59 NO BID $1.27 $1.82 $1.85 $1.64 $1.57 $1.98
Aduif Trach Collar $1.22 §1.12 $39.69 (50} 51.01 $1.10 $1.18 $1.25 $3.65 $0.67
Pediatric Trach Collar ) 51.68 $1.50 $42.19 (50} $1.37 NO BiD $2.10 $1.80 $3.59 $1.78
Nasal Airways: (Roberiazzi stylg) . :
iz fr 52550 $520.52 $16.90 $23.86 $1.42 $24.00 $2.35 52.08 $2,19
14 fr $25.50 $20.52 $76.90 $23.86 $1.42 324.00 L $2.35 52,08 $2.19
16 fr $25.50 520,52 $16.90 514.91 $1.42 $24.00 $2.35 52,08 $2.19
184 $25.50 $20.52 i $16.96 $14.91 : $1.42 92400 $2.35 $208 | $2.19
264 2 $20.52 ! $16.90 $14.91 $1.42 $24.00 $2.28 32.08 $1.51
22 fr $25.56 $26.52 $16.90 §14.91 o Sta $24.00 $2.28 52.08 51.51
24 fr $25.50 $20.52 $16.90 §14.91 §1.42 $24.00 $2.28 32.08 §1.51
26 525.50 $20.52 : $16.96 §14.91  81.42 $24.00 $2.28 $2.08 §1.51
28 fr $25.50 $20.52 $16.96 §14.91 814 ) $24.00 $2.28 $2.08 $1.51
3¢ fr 82550 $20.62 $16.96 §14.91 N s142 | $24.00 $2.28 52.08 $1.51
3z fr $25.50 N $20.52 $16.90 $14.91 $1.42 82400 $2.28 52.08 . $1.54
34 fr $25.50 $20.52 516.9¢ §14.91 $1.42 | . $24.00 $2.28 52,08 $1.51
36 fr $25.50 $20.52 $16.90 §14.91 $1.42 $24.00 $2.28 52,08 51.51
Steritg Lubricating Jelly (for above) §5.98 $7.59 $7.08 $5.84 $7.20 3690 $9.40 $4.61 $06.0402
Nasal Airway Kit (Boxed} $15.19 $38.77 51649 $719.66 $719.80 $21.00 NO BID 513.26 %2561
Oral Airways: (Colar Coded, Berman siyle}
#60 (40 mm) $11.54 §7.75 $70.50 $0.14 $5.36 $0.15 §0.22 5034
#0 (50 mm) §11.54 §7.75 $i0.50 3014 $8.36 $0.15 $0.22 50.14
#1 (60 mm) §11.54 $7.75 $10.50 $0.14 $8.36 $0.15 $0.22 $0.14
#2 (76 mm) §11.54 $7.75 $10.50 $0.14 $8.36 $0.15 s0.22 50.14
| i _#3(80mm) $11.54 $7.75 $10.50 $0.14 $8.36 $0.15 $0.22 50.14
#4 (90 mm) §11.54 $7.75 $10.50 $0.14 $8.36 $0.15 50.22 56,14
#5 (160 mm) $11.54 $7.75 1o.50 $0.14 $8.36 30.15 50.22 $0.14
#6 (110 mm) $11.54 $7.75 515.50 $0.14 $8.36 30.15 50.22 30.14
Oral Airway Kit {Boxed) 1006 $1.75 §1.49 $1.94 $12.00 $8.96 NO BiD $1.64
Suction Canisters: —
On-Board (Sccor) $149.76 §159.78 §143.52 $133.92 $2.56 $140.00 $3.00 NQ BID $2.53
Portable ___8245.88 $296.40 | NO BID $298.20 $15.46 $430.00 $713.23 NO BID NO BID
Fortable Tubing & Catheter $35.91 NO BID $32.96 $3.24 354 $3.36 NOC BID NO BiD
Replacamant Canister for Quickdraw $296.40 NO 81D $258.20 $15.46 $430.00 $13.23 NG BID NO B
Manuai Suction Canisters:
Neonate / Pediatyic $2.11 NO BID NO BID NO 8ID NO BID NG BID NO BID NO BID
Soft Yankauer $3.11 NO BID NO BID $72.13 i NO BID NG Bi0 NO BID NO BID
Rigid Yankayer 54.25 NO BiD NO BID $12.63 : NOBID NG 810 NO BiD NG BID
First Reponder Kit $59.01 NG BIG NO BID NO BID NOBID NC BID NOBID NO BID
Yankauver Suctions Cathatars wy tubing {vented| $30.80 $35.34 NO BiD $26.65 $2.00 $58.00 $1.90 NO BID $1.12
Soft Suction Catheters: i T




&k - $az24 | . 8039 50.15 swoso 1. 8017 $0.24 1 s021 T saig - [PETsaaz 1|
gtr $0.24 50.19 50,15 51050 - 8018 $0.24 :
10 fr $0.24 o 50.19 50.15 §10.50 $0.17 $0.24 _
124 o 56.24 $0.19 50.15 510.50 $0.18 $0.24
4 §0.24 §6.19 $0.15 §10.50 . . $0.17 $0.24
16 #r §0.24 50.18 50.15 510.50 $0.19 $0.24
18 #r $0.24 $9.18 50.15 $10.50 %018 $0.18
Suction Tubing $0.85 $0.19 §0.73 $0.73 $0.50 $0.75
Buib Syringe §0.85 50.19 $0.39 $0.69 o $0.71 $0.46
Adult/Pad SPO2 Sensors (Tuffsatt Compatible) $299.00 ] $336.30 NO BID NO BID NO BIC NO BiD e
Cable for Aove §79.35 578,80 NO BID NO BID NO BIG NO BID NO BID
Adult/Ped SPO2 Sensors (Tuffsatt Compatibie) $182.00 $193.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NG BiD NO BIG
Adult Sp02 Sensor $194.00 $171,00 NO BID NO BID L s21s500 NO BID
Bite Sticks $3.20 $2.51 52.70 $4.60 $0.35 .. 3360 $0.37
Lyfetymer LED Matronome $115.00 NO BiD NO BID NO BID $3.60 NO BiD NO BID
2X2s §1.58 $1.63 §1.25 51.36 $3.00 $1.36 $1.31 s2.04 $6.0111
3X3's L §1.23 $1.87 $1.80 $1.30 $0.87 $1.45 $1.39 33.2¢ $0.0164
4X4's $1.55 $2.19 . $137 $1.52 §1.48 $1.60 $1.52 $5.14 $0.0248
4X7's B $3.15 NO BID ___.NoBID NG BID NO BID NO BIG NOBID NO BID NO BID
5X9's R §2.24 $2.33 90 32.26 $2.18 $0.08 ! $2.05 82.69 51.60
2x10s o $3.92 $2.47 $3.67 $3.94 $0.16 $0.16 $4.01 $4.14 $3.170
Triangular $4.05 $4.33 34.33 $0.21 $0.36 $0.31 $0.37
2" Kiling ) $2.50 $3.43 32.47 $2.42 $0.12 $2.50 $0.96
3" Kling ___$2.95 $3.98 210 i $2.90 $0.29 $0.16 $2.82 $1.28
_|1" Tape gr.10 $6.84 §5.70 Lo $7.02 $0.55 $0.65 $6.85 58,55
| |2"Tape $7.10 $6.84 $5.70 $7.02 $1.11 $1.30 $6.85 $8.55
3" Tape $7.10 $6.84 $5.70 i} $7.02 $1.66 $1.98 $6.85 $8.55 P
Eye Pads $4.15 $4.94 $4.25 : 3412 $4.30 $0.07 $4.87 | .. 8547
Butlerfly Closures » §1.85 $1.88 NO BiD : $1.98 $2.27 $2.25 $2.14 . §1.92 i
Pediztric Band-Aids j $3.95 §4.07 s0.79 ! 0.97 | $7.02 $4.00 $1.05 $2.36 i
Adhesive Bandage 3/4 X 3 §1.75 $1.66 $1.29 $1.81 31.74 $185 | $1.87 $1.25
Adhesive Bandage 2 X 4 1/2 $3.89 $2.72 $2.69 $4.01 $3.84 $4.00 $4.12 $2.63 :
DynaStopper §1.35 $1.29 51.29 : §1.32 $1.38 51.40 $1.43 NO BID
Trauma Dressing 12 X 30 . $1.20 §1.15 $0.79 : $1.08 $6.90 $0.85 $0.57 $1.10
Bum Sheets 60 X 96 $2.75 $2.57 $1.67 $2.34 $2.29 $6.85 $6.54 $2.7¢
Sterile Water: ;
250 ec B $1.39 §1.14 B NO BID NO BID $1.21 $1.45 : $1.25 $2.70 $1.34 :
too0ec §1.59 §1.35 __NOBID NO BID $1.07 $1.75 $1.50 $2.50 51.28 |
Saline: R NO BID !
250 cc . $138 $1.14 NO BID $1.13 31.45 $1.25 82.61 $1.33
1000 c¢ $1.69 §1.35 NO BID : $1.13 $1.75 $1.50 32.82 $1.33
Petroleum Gauze $9.15 $0.60 $7.37 $19.39 $0.54 $6.65 $8.54 30.62
Asherman Chest Seals ... —599.80 $81.27 $9.30 $9.22 $93.00 310.44 $9.24 $9.55
iGloves ) I ;
i Smail $8.05 §a3a NO BID §0.0748 $10.85 39.62 58.26 $7.70 '
| Medium $3.05 §8.34 NO BiD $0.0748 $10.85 $9.62 $8.26 57.70
| Large - $8.05 §8.34 NO BID $0.0748 $10.85 $9.62 $8.26 $7.76
i XLarge $8.05 $8.34 NO BID $0.0748 $10.85 $9.62 $8.26 §7.70
Infection Control Kits . $5.79 $5.49 52.89 $3.89 $3.36 $4.39 $2.83 $4.50
Cover Gowns $14.25 30.36 $13.90 $0.31 $0.36 $1.65 §12.09 $13.00
Shoe Covers §15.75 $0.11 $17.00 $092 | gf421 | $0.06 NO BiD 515.72 $14.10
HEPA Masks: (N95) o
Smati $19.85 521.66 ! NO BID $0.85 $0.90 $18.99 $16.52 $17.10 |
Regutar $19.85 $21.66 NO BID $0.99 $0.90 $718.99 $16.52 $17.10 g
Ear Loop Mask w/ Extended Face Shield $18.50 $78.66 i $34.00 $45.00 $18.00 NG BID $12.12 50.71 ‘
Safety Gh $2.25 $1.29 NO BiD $1.60 $1.18 $1.00 $1.56 $3.19
Vionex Towslh §7.85 $8.49 NO BID $8.73 ol 8850 $6.00 $7.29 $8.17
Vionex Liguid Seap 180z ) §95.40 $95.08 NO BID $110.16 $125.90 $8.92 587.12 $96.28
Vionax No Rinse Gel $75.60 580.99 NO BID 584.24 $96.90 | $3.62 £70.80 i $79.68
Hype-Wype Bieach Pads 564.59 560.37 NO BID NO BID $80.00 NO BID NO BID $59.10
Equipment Disinfection Wipes B $69.48 $75.10 : NO BID $89.88 $79.90 ; $6.28 $65.52 §5.76
Antimicrobiai Hand Wipes o $58.68 §54.04 NO BID ! 857.72 $70.00 NO BiD $54.00 54.86
CPR Pocket Masks $59.76 $56.50 533.00 ! $28.98 §46.90 $5.59 NO BID 83.25
Disinfectant Spray . $87.00 $95 62 NO BID ! $92.52 $115.90 $5.30 $80.78 57.63
Spray Cleaner $64.95 i $47.68 NG BID NO BID NG BiD NO BID NO BID NG BID
Ice Packs 5 X 9 {io 50,36 i sgaz $0.55 i 50.42 $0.56 $7.68 50.30 ! $0.38
|Hot Packs 5 X 9 floose} $0.46 : 3645 $6.65 i $0.54 $0.60 55.84 $0.50 i $0.56




_|Adun e cusr - $5.99 $6.78 55.85 8488 §9.00 $9.72 REEETX T
‘‘‘‘‘‘‘ Chese BIP Cuff §11.45 $8.27 56.99 85.96 $9.960 §12.78 $5.79
| chita BfP Cutf 59.65 $6.78 56.99 ) 8474 $9.50 $9.72 §5.78
infant B/P Cuff 59.65 $6.78 ) 5.69 $6.99 $4.74 $9.50 NO BiD $5.79
Stethoscope (Sprague Rappaport) $7.45 $5.64 3 -‘ ] $§5.72 N $5.35 $6.50 $5.65 §5.09
] AED Electrodes (LP 12 Compatiblg) $19.45 518.81 ___NOBID $19.30 . $16.24 $22,00 §1.82 519.18
Safety Razors 817.75 $0.33 50.35 $0.32 $0.46 $15.33 $§17.20
I Aing Cutter . $6.79 $3.71 53.99 $5.48 $5.00 $5.47 $711.55
Tweezers $1.40 $0.57 $0.84 B $0.68 $0.06 $0.81 51.01
Pen Lights $4.15 $5.47 $0.83 $3.60 $0.96 $2.97 $0.50
EMS Sheers (Medicut 7 1/4") 51.45 50.74 56.67 $0.75 $0.81 $1.50 ] $1.20 $0.67
Convenience Bags $259.60 $257.64 $219.60 £218.40 $1.05 $360.00 NO BiD 510.94 _ 5264.00
Alcohol Prep Pads 50.85 S0.92 NO BID $0.98 $1.27 $1.00 $0.92 $0.68 51.30
Bee Sting/Medicaine Swabs $2.49 $1.98 NO 8ID §5.32 $3.15 $1.60 $2.67 $1.92 $3.00
Ammonia Inhaiants 51,58 515,08 i NO BID $79.60 $2.98 ; $1.30 $21.00 514.10 $1.93
Oral Glucose 510.83 NO BID $11.99 $71.50 $12.72 $711.82 §10.32 $4.32
Compartment Seals . 516,91 i NO BID $12.04 NO BID : $5.50 $16.57 NGO BID $10.86
"AA" Batleries $7.68 ; NO BID $16.56 $0.42 $12.00 $0.36 57.20 $0.30
"AAA" Batteries 57.68 i NO BID $20.16 $0.44 $14.00 $0.39 37.75 §0.36
2 Volt Batteries . 516,12 ! NO BID $10.08 $1.65 $22.00 $1.35 512.81 §1.02
OB Kit (N OEMS Approved) 2.35 58.23 i NO BID NO BID $4.29 $21.00 NO BID 35.14 $13.72
Baby Buniing $324.00 §277.70 : 5238.80 | 5216.80 $0.44 $320.00 $3.37 NQ BIp $4.27
Emergency Blankets $144.00 - $129.50 523.60 $69.60 $1.80 $24.00 $4.11 $0.60 $a.73
Red Bags small (24 X 24) $75.90 $0.20 $6.95 $82.13 $67.57 $90.00 $7.24 $4.42 $0.11
Aed Bags large (30 X 44} $36.45 . 5041 NO BID 539.88 $32.31 $54.00 $14.37 $8.11 $0.24
Sscor Quickdraw replacement Battery $21.00 524.23 NO BID $29.95 $21.35 $35.00 $22.15 $23.41 NO BID
Sscor VX2 replacement Batteries $37.75 NO BID $30.41 $36.95 NG BID $398.87 - NO BiD No BiD
Sscor EVX Repalcement Batteries $37.75 61 NO BID $30.99 $36.95 NOBID | $3987 NO BID NO 81D
WMinitor V Batfteries ] NO BID $17.96 . NO BID NO BiD NG BID NG BID NO BID NO BiD NO BiD
Forehead Thermometer NO BID $49.24 .NosBo $9.60 $36.00 NQ BIiD NO BID $22.50 y
... |Cervical Collars: H _— —— B ) R
Stifneck Sefect Aduit ) 35.15 i $4.85 NO BID 36.26 N $8.00 $5.37 $5.28 $10.51
Stitneck Select Pediatric §5.15 54.85 NC BID 36,84 $8.60 $5.37 $5.28 $10.51
Stifreck Pediatric $4.75 84.85 NO BiD $6.05 $8.60 $5.32 $4.70 $4.81
Stifreck Baby No Neck $4.75 $4.85 NO BID $6.05 $8.00 i $5.32 $4.70 §4.81
Fhilly - Child $12.49 NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.00 NO BiD NO BID $3.94
Phitly - Smail $12.49 NO BID NO BiD NO BID $6.00 NO BID NO BID $6.17
Philly - Madium $12.49 NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.00 NO BiD NQ BID §6.17
Fhilly - Large $12.49 NO BiD NO BiD NO BID $6.00 NO BID NQ BID $6.17
Ehilly - XLarge . NO BID NO BiD NO BID $6.00 NO BID NO BiD 86.17
Cervicai Collar Bag $26.65 ~ $20.52 NO BID $29.24 $24.00 NO BID NO BiD §32.58
Disposabie Lorgboard Straps $250.00 $242.25 NO BID i NO BID $275.00 34.81 NO BID $5.20
“Sam" Splint $7.60 $7.36 $2.99 ! $4.99 $3.00 $7.27 $6.33 $3.37
Bin Box {Parts Tray) 5
Small (2 1/4 X 11 X 4 3/4) $32.50 $31.64 NO BID NO 8ip NO BID NO BiD NO BID
Medium (3 1/4 X 11 X4 3/4) $39.75 $37.91 NO BiD NO 8iD NO BID NO BID NO BID
Large {6 1/4 X 11 X 4 3/4) ! $47.25 $46.74 NO BID NO BID NO BID NG BID NO BID NO BID
Patlent Pitlow ‘ $§79.95 $34.14 i $26.28 $2.00 $45.00 NO 8iD $102.08 $2.27
Disposabile Pillow Case B $25.36 $29.06 | $27.00 $21.92 $29.90 $20.22 521.93 $0.21
Phittips AED Pad Carlridge §40.95 $48.17 NO BID $39.64 $47.00 $41.35 $35.39 $77.38
Phillips AED Pad Cartridge - Pedi $66.15 577.81 NOC BID $64.03 $77.00 $66.88 $56.85 $125.00
Phillips AED Battery e $103.00 $121.52 NO BID $100.00 i $120.00 $103.79 $89.29 5195.23
Padded Board Splint (smalf) 15 inch $2.10 $2.37 $1.69 $2.04 ' $3.00 $2.50 $2.02 __s210
Padded Board Spiint {medium) 36 inch $2.70 $2.82 $2.89 $3.46 ! $5.00 $4.17 $3.25 $3.30
Padded Board Spiint (large) 54 inch 35.25 $3.90 $4.79 $4.94 $6.00 $5.40 $4.29 $4.13
Delivery Days T TG 7DAYS 7DAYS 5TO 7 DAYS 2 DAYS 2705 DAYS 7 T0 14 DAYS 3 TO 4 DAYS 270 10 DAYS 3TO5DAYS
NEED COPY OF BRC
Variations: (if any) e T SEE ATTACHED
Will you extend your prices o local o
governmient entities within the County YES YES NG ANSWER __¥ES VES NO ANSWER YES NO ANSWER YES
___iThis is a (1) one year coniract with (1] one twa year extension or (2) two one year extensions. N N T
Bid specifications sent to: i Prime Vendor Zoll Medical WE Supply Center fa}“b@iéfbuvernmenr Star Poly bag Jersey Fire & Safety |Clearwater Distribulion
Based upon the bids received, | recommend a lsph‘t award be made to all of the vendors as the Iowest responsive, responsible bidders as follows: .
% L.
| a |




PB4

|"Sincerety,

Robert J. McErlane

Purchasing




