PD 013-019

Bid Opening 4/9/2013 10:00am

SPECIFICATIONS FOR REPAIRAND RECOATING

OF TENNIS & BASKETBALL COURTS AT

ATKINSON PARK AND GLOUCESTER COUNTY

COLLEGE
Vendor: Vendor: Vendor:
Nickolaus Construction | American Athletic Courts |Hinding Tennis
PO Box 2322 2050 Route 206 24 Spring St.
Vincentown, NJ 08088 Vincentown, NJ 08088 West Haven CT, 06516
Steven D. Nicklaus John P. Nelson Jr. Jamie Pinder
609 859-8668 609 859-1414 203 285-3055
609 859-3674 Fax 609 B59-1791 Fax 203 285-3033 Fax
ITEM | DESCRIPTION Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1| Repair tennis courls at Atkinson Park (8 Courls) $47,300.00 $52,500.00 $63,.760.00
2| Repair tennis courts at Gloucester County College (6 Courts) $39,800.00 $42,500.00 $52,380.00
3| Total cost for repairing tennis courts at Atkinson
Park & Gloucester County College $82,900.00 $92 500.00 $116,140.00
4| Total cost to repair basketball courls at Atkinson Park (2 Courls) $15,900.00 $19,500.00 $17,715.00
5|ALT {1 Total cost to replace tennis courts at Atkinson Park No Bid $387,500.00 No Bid
6|ALT 2 Tofal cost to replace tennis courls at GCC No Bid $266,500.00 No Bid
71ALT 3 Total cost to replace baskeiball courts at Atkinson
Park No Bid $117,450.00 No Bid
Specifications sent to: Prime Vendor iSqFt GWP Enterprises inc.
Construction Journal Mid Atfantic BX
Tendering Authority H. Wolfson inc. i

Based upon the bids received, | recommend Nickolaus Construction be awarded the contract, as the fowest responsive, responsible bidder.

Sincerely,

Robert J. McEriane

Purchasing

872013




