

**SPECIFICATIONS AND PROPOSAL FOR THE
PROVIDING OF INTERNET AND NETWORK
SERVICES FOR THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER
DEPARTMENT OF INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY**

VENDOR:	VENDOR:	VENDOR:	VENDOR:	VENDOR:
Comcast Business Comm. LLC	Business Automation Tech Inc.dba	Verizon Business Network	Spectrotel	Comcast Business Comm. LLC
1701 JFK Blvd.	Data Network Solutions	500 Clinton Center Dr.	3535 State Hwy. 66	1701 JFK Blvd.
Philadelphia PA 19103	106 Apple St. Suite 103	Clinton MS 39056	Neptune, NJ 07753	Philadelphia PA 19103
Terrence Connell SVP	Tinton Falls NJ 07724	Patricia L. Myers	Ross Antole COO	Terrence Connell SVP
215 286-5982	Isaac Fajerman Pres	601 460-8642	732 345-7848	215 286-5982
215 286-1040 Fax	732 741-5889	571 258-5373 Fax	732345-7895	215 286-1040 Fax

ITEM

AA					
1	Central (Core) Site - Clayton	\$14,940.00	\$19,140.00	\$19,503.60	\$19,188.00
2	Central (Core) Site - Clarksboro/Shady Lane	\$14,940.00	\$19,140.00	\$28,551.60	\$22,788.00
BB					
1	Court House 1			\$14,918.88	Bid on items BB & CC Bid id rejected for being non-responsive
2	Court House 2			\$14,918.88	
3	Clayton 911			\$14,918.88	
4	Board of Elections 1			\$14,918.88	
5	Board of Elections 2			OMITTED	
6	Justice Complex			\$14,918.88	
7	Administrative Offices			\$14,918.88	
8	Social Services			\$14,918.88	
9	GC BOE (Monroe)			\$14,918.88	
10	Health Department			\$14,918.88	
11	Budd Blvd.			\$14,918.88	
12	Adult Probation (5 Points)			\$14,918.88	
	Total for all of BB	NO BID	NO BID	\$164,107.68	
CC					
1	Atkinson Park			\$13,835.16	
2	Fleet Management			\$13,835.16	
3	WIC (Paulsboro)			\$13,835.16	
4	Swedesboro Yard			\$13,835.16	
5	82-2			\$13,835.16	
6	82-3			\$13,835.16	
7	82-4			\$13,835.16	
8	82-5			\$13,835.16	
9	82-6			\$13,835.16	
10	82-7			\$13,835.16	
11	83-1			\$13,835.16	
12	83-2			\$13,835.16	
13	Veterans Affairs			\$13,835.16	
14	Scotland Run Park			\$13,835.16	
15	Pitman Golf Course			\$13,835.16	
16	GC BOE (Deptford)			\$13,835.16	
	Total for all of CC	NO BID	NO BID	\$221,362.56	
DD					
	Transparent Ethernet LAN Service	\$6,480.00	\$15,300.00	\$31,548.12	\$10,188.00
	Variations: (if any)		NONE		
	Bid specifications sent to:	Office Business Systems Tendering Authority	JPDR Enterprises Prime Vendor	BEI-TC RX3 Communications	ComTec Systems Xtel Communications

	<i>Level 3 Communications</i>	<i>Windstream</i>	<i>EssexTec</i>	<i>CenturyLink Public</i>	
	<i>Net Access</i>	<i>At&T Business</i>	<i>Alpha Tech Group</i>		
<i>Based upon the bids received, I recommend Comcast Business Communications LLC be awarded the contract for AA Central Site Clayton and DD - Transparent Ethernet LAN Service</i>					<i>4/26/2013</i>
<i>and Business Automation Tech Inc. dba Data Network Solutions be awarded AA Central Site Clarksboro/Shadylane as the lowest</i>					
<i>responsive, responsible bidders. BB and CC are not being awarded as they are over budget.</i>					
		<i>Sincerely,</i>			
		<i>Robert J. McErlane</i>			
		<i>Purchasing</i>			