1/23/2013

PD 012-052

Bid Opening 12/11/12 16:00am__
SPECIFICATIONS AND PROPOSAL FOR THE

ANNUAL INSPECTIONS AND MAINTANANCE OF

WATER/SPRINKLER SYSTEMS IN VARIOUS COUNTY

BUILDINGS. BUILDINGS CONTAINING ANSEL FIRE

SUPPRESSION SYSTEMS WILL AALSC BE

MAINTAINED AND INSPECTED, AND EXISITING

UNITS WITHIN THE COUNTY AS ALLOWED THROUGH

THE COUNTY PURCHASING SYSTEM NUMBERS

CK-01-GC & 16GLCP

................. ~ |VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
Allied Fire & Safety Equip. Co. Inc. SimplexGrinnelf Oliver Sprinkler Co. Tri-Stafe Fire Protection
517 Green Grove Road 283 Gibralter Road 561 Feheley Drive 445 Delsea Dr.,

Neptune, NJ 07754

Horsham, FA 19044

King of Prussia PA 19406

Sewell, NJ 08080

James Daniello VP

Chris Algard Sales Manager

Thomas Morrow Sales Rep ]

Nichalas Bozine Pres.

732 922-3399 - 215 347-6500 610 277-1331 856 589-9370
732 918-8668 Fax 215 §82-7979 Fax 610 277-2837 Fax 856 589-9352 Fax B
TEM DESCRIPTION -
1 |Fuli Service Maintenance $105.00 per hour $115.06 per hour $130.00 per hour B $110.00 per hour
N . $160.00 per hour OT/Holiday $175.00 per hour OT/Holiday $760.00 per hour OT $168.00 per hour Overtime/Holiday

$250.00 per hour Sundays & Holidays

DISCOUNT ON PARTS

20%

20%

0%

15%

INSPECTION RATES

Gloucester County Justice Complex

1 Annual $900.00 3 Quarterly §1050.06

1 Annual $7850.00 3 Quarlerly $1070.00

1 Annual $2000.00 3 Quarterly $1050.00

|7 Annual $1800.00 3 Quarterly $1400.00

Gloucester County Clayton Complex 1 Annual $525.00 . 1 Annual $1041.00 1 Annual $500.00 1 Annual $325.00
Gloucester County Detention Centers (Shady Lane) {1 Annual $500.00 1 Annual $475.00 1 Annual $350.60 o 1 Annual $340.00 B
Gloucester County Superintendant of Schools 1 Annual $250.00 1 Annual $230.60 1 Annual $350.00 1 Annual $75.00
Gloucester CountyBudd Blvd, Complex 1 Annual $206.00 R . 1 Annual $115.00 1 Annual $200.00 1 Annual $170.00
Gloucester County Building - 26 Delaware St 1 Annual $900.00 ) 1 Annual $925.00 1 Annual $750.00 1 Annual $425.00 _—
Gloucester County Offices at 211 County House Rd. 1 Annual $250.00 1 Annual $230.00 1 Annual $200.00 7 Annual $170.00
N Gloucester County Offices at 5 Poinis (Probation Area) |1 Annual $200.00 o 1 Annual $230.00 1 Annual $200.00 1 Annual $125.00
Bankbridge School - Alt. High School 1 Annual $525.00 1 Annual $1350.00 1 Annual $400.00 1 Armnual $375.00
Bankbridge School - Elementary 1 Annual $450.00 1 Annual $230.00 1 Annual $350.00 1 Annual $275.00
Health Services Dept 1 Annual $250.00 1 Annual $230.00 1 Annual $200.00 1 Annuai $170.00
Family Court Building |1 Annual $800.00 1 Annual $925.00 1 Annual $750.00 1 Annual $495.00 -
Pitman Golf Course 1 Annuai $500.00 1 Annual $230.00 1 Anniual $500.00 1 Annual §375.00
Gloucester Counfy Board of Elections i1 Annual 5250.00 1 Annual $230.00 1 Annual $200.00 1 Annual $170.00
GCIT 1 Annual $1150.06 1 Annual §1390.00 1 Annual $1250.00 N 1 Annual $1280.00

ANSEL SYSTEMS

Gloucester Cournty Prison

1 Annual $185.00 1 Serni Annual $195.00

1 Anriual $106.06 1 Semi Annual $700.00

1 Annual NO BiD 1 Semi Annual NO BID

1 Annual $200.00 1 Semi Annual $200.00

Bankbridge School - All. High Schoof

1 Annual $195.00 1 Semi Annual $195.00

1 Annual $100.00 1 Semi Annual $100.00

1 Annual NO BID 1 Semi Annual NO BID

1 Annual $200.00 1 Semi Annual $200.00

Bankbridge School - Elementary

1 Annual $195.00 1 Semi Annual $195.00

1 Annual $100.00 1 Semi Annual $100.00

1 Annual NO BID T Semni Annual NO BID

1 Annual $200.00 1 Semi Annual $200.00

Gloucester County Detention Centers (Shady Lane)

1 Annual $195.00 1 Semi Annual $195.06

1 Annual $100.00 1 Semi Annual $100.00

1 Annual NO BID 1 Semi Annual NO BID

T Annual $200.00 1 Semi Annual $200.00

Pitman Golf Course

1 Annual $195.00 1 Serni Annual $195.00

1 Annual $31060.00 1 Sermi Annual $100.00

1 Arnual NO BID 1 Semi Annual NO BID

1 Annual $200.00 1 Semi Annual $200.00

GCIT

1 Annual $195.00 1 Semi Annual $195.00

1 Annual $100.00 1 Sewni Annual $100.00

1 Annual NO BID 1 Semi Annual NO BID

1 Annual $200.00 1 Sermi Annual $200.00

i
|

Total for Inspections $11,951.06

Total for Inspections $9250.00

Total for Inspections $11,685

Variations: (if any)

DID NOT BID ON ANSEL SYSTEMS

BID IS REJECTED FOR BEING

NON-RESPONSIVE

Will you extend your prices to local government

YES

NO

NO ANSWER

YES

entities within the County




1/23/2013

Bid specifications sent to:

gArora Systems Group

__iElite Fire Protfection

Center for Digital Gov.

Kistler O'Brien Fire Profection

Construction Journal

S5.A. Comunale Co. inc.

Mid AtlanticBX

Affordable Fire Proiection

Approved Fire Protection

Legacy Fire Sprinkler Service

This'is a two year contract with 1 two year extension or 2 one year exlensions.

Based upon the bids received, { recommend Allied Fire &

Safety Equipment Co. Inc. be awarded a contract as the lowest responsive, responsible bidder.
:

Sincerely,

Aobert J. McErlarte

Purchasing




