B/26/2020

PD-20-002
Bid Opening: 1/14/2020 at 10:00 a.m.
SPECIFICATIONS AND PROPOSAL FORM FOR THE
SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF VARIOUS KINDS OF
PIPING FOR USE BY THE COUNTY PUBLIC WORKS
DEPARTMENT AND EXISTING UNITS WITHIN THE VENDOR: VENDOR:
COUNTY AS ALLOWED THROUGH THE COUNTY Caterina Supply Inc. Core & Main, L.P.
AS ALLOWED THROUGH THE COUNTY CONTRACT 1271 Glasshora Rd. 228 Williamstown Road
PURCHASING SYSTEM NUMBERS CK-01-GC & 16 Willlamstown, NJ 08094 Berlin, NJ 08009 |
GLCP Linda Gardner, President Ron Bush, Branch Manager
856 728-0171 856-753-5566
856-728-8275-Fax 856-753-5455 - Fax
info@caterinasupply.com Rusty Miller@coreandmain.com
EM DESCRIPTION (Pricing based on per foof cost)
Corrugated Metal Pipe
GAUGE Gaugei2 | Gauge 14 Gauge 16 Gauge12 Gauge 14 Gauge 16
1 12" No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.79 $14.19 $12.39
2 15" No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.89 $17.19 $14.4%
3 18" No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.49 $20.29 $17.49
4 21" No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.29 $23.29 $19.59
& 24" No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.99 $26.29 $21.59
& 30" No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.49 $32.29 $26.79
7 38" No Bid No Bid No Bid $47.79 $38.39 $31.89
High Density Polyethylene (HDPE) Solid
8 12" $5.28 $4.49
9 15" $7.50 $6.39
10 18" $9.90 $8.39
11 24" $16.86 $14.29
12 30" $23.40 $19.79
13 35" $29.46 $24.99
High Density Polyethylene (HDPE) Perforated
14 12" $5.28 $4.48
15 15" $7.50 $6.3%
16 18" $9.90 $5.3%
17 24" $16.86 $14.29
18 3" $23.40 $19.89
19 36" $29.46 $24.99
{COUPLING PRICING ON ALL HDPE)
Concrete Pipe with/plug and rubber seal Class3 | Class 4 Class § Class 3 Class 4 Class §
20 12" No Bid $13.70 $14.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid
21 15" $13.60 $14.40 $16.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid
22 18" $14.45 $16.70 $18.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
23 21" $17.55 $20.70 $26.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24 24" $21.20 $28.30 $35.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid
25 30" $32.20 $38.05 $54.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid
26 36" $46.05 $55.30 $75.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid
1. Concrete pipe 8' per length; 2. HDFE Pipe
Variations: (if any) 20" Length | | NONE
Will you extend your prices fo local govermment YES NO
entities within the County
Delivery 1 to 2 Weeks 1 to 2 Weeks




p/29/202G

This contract is for a two year period from date of
award with the option fo exfend for one two year
term or two one year terms.

Bid specifications senf to: The Biue Book |Go Atlantic  |Wafer Works Supply Bridgestate Foundry
Prime Vendor |Bidnet Remington & Vernick
Onvia Construct Connect

Based upon the bids received, | recommend Caterina Supply for ltem 20 (Class 4 and 5) and items 21 though 26 (Class 3, Class 4 and
Class 5) and Core & Main for items 1 through 7 (Ali Gauges) and 8 through 19 be awarded a contract as the fowest responsive

responsible bidder.

Sincerely,

Kimberly Larter, Qualified Purchasing Agent




