v PD 019-012 VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR:
Bid Opening 3/07/1% at 10:00 am CVR Computer Supplies W.B. Mason Ce., inc. The Tree House Allied Document Solutions & Sves Star Data Co. Solvix Selutions, LLC Dex: Imaging dba Tonertype
SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY 1606 Bowling Green Drive  |151 Heller Place PO Box 413 200 Church Street P.0. Box 12 701 Rt 73 South Suite 425 5100 W. Cypress Street
OF PRINTER RIBBONS, PRINTER INK JET Cherry Hill, NJ 08003 Bellmawr, NJ 08031 Norwaéd. M4 02062 Swedeshora, NJ 03085 Hewlett, NY 11557 Mariion, NJ 08053 Tampa, FL 33607
AND TONER CARTRIGES,FAX MACHINE Steve Yuhas VP gf Sales |Daniel Orr, Jr., Senior V.P. David Rizze -Sales Robert Richardson, President Dale Peterson, VP Bill Monerfi, Account Mgr. David Shaver, Manager
TONER AND DRUM UNITS TO BE 856 857-0355 888-926-2766 800 595-6651 856-241-2000 201-565-9876 856-324-4100 813-915-1300

UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

856 8570357 Fax

888-598-1788 - Fax

781 278-0706 Fax

856-241-2290

201-642-0298 - Fax

856-318-9100

813-884-2900 - Fax

IN THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER

Hem |individual Prices
1 |Axiom Model A758 Purpie 520.00 $6.67 SR g i No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid
BROTHER
2 |DR406 Fax Dram $141.00 S SI26.830 0 $742.25 No Bid $129.00 5160.00 5150.00
3 |PR420 Fax Drum $71.00 869,58 $70.90 No Bid $74.00 "$84.00 $76.00
4 |DR 500 Faz Drum $160.00 $60.55 $163.00 No Rid DRI, 7 £ 41| JERR R $179.00 $172.00
5 |DR510 Fax Drum $152.00 $150.45° $155.95 No Bid L EIATe 5173.00 $155.00
£ |DRS20 Fax Drum 5188.00 ST : 518110 No Bid $179.00 £199.00 $190.00
7 {DR620 Eax Drum $116.00 CRRIRAT $116.60 No Bid $119.00 $132.00 $125.00
g {LC101BK $11.00 8978 $16.20 No Bid Ne Bid 515.60 $13.00
5 ILCIe1Y CE600 $6.53 $6.80 No Bid Ne Bid $12.50 9.0
10 JLCHI0 C $5.00 L8683 36.80 No Bid No Bid $12.50 59.00
11 [LC1IM $7.00 T 8653 $6.80 Np Bid Ne Eid $12.50 59.00
12 [TN420 Drom $71.00 U E29.48 0 $30.15 No Bid No Bid £37.00 $80.00
13 |TN430 Fas Touer 85100 - S BA6TT . $52.60 No Bid Ne Bid £59.75 865.00
14 |TN450 Fax Toner 546.00 B PP KT SRt $46.05 No Bid Ne Bid $52.90 $50.00
15 |TN460 Toner $77.00 B v/ AT B $74.20 Ne Bid No Bid £82.20 580.00
16 JTNS530 Tomer LIS540.00 Ne Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid $74.90 £70.00
17 |TN540 Torer $71.00 BUSERAE $66.70 No Bid Ne Bid 574,50 §79.00
18 |TN550 Toner $71.00 s 1 o) SRR 569.75 No Bid Ne Bid £78.55 $79.00
19 |TN576 High Yield $96.00 CUSR3AR $86.25 No Bid No Bid $94.75 $95.00
20 |TN580 Toner $96.06 CLRYLSR $94.95 No Bid No Bid $104.60 $167.00
21 |TN-650 Toner $97.00 SR T i BT $93.25 No Bid Ne Bid $103.00 £99.00
22 {TN-T00 Toner $120.00 $60.44 Ne Bid Ne Bid No Bid S111.00 - §109.00
CANON
23 11977BOGLAA Yellow $70.60 §72.72 No Bid No Bid $74.50 $79.00
24 |1978B0O1AA Magenta $70.00 $72.72 No Bid Ne Bid $74.50 $79.00
25 {1979BOOLAA Cyan £70.00 872.72 No Bid No Bid $74.50 $79.00
26 |1980BOOLAA Black $76.00 $77.12 No Bid No Bid $77.80 £79.00
27 |2659B001AA Yelow $106.00 L ERTeE i No Bid No Bid $115.00 5116.00
28 |2660B001AA Magenta $107.00 LReTeE No Bid No Bid $115.00 $116.00




: PD 019-012 VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDGR:
Bid Opening 3/07/19 at 10:00 am CVR Computer Supplies W.B. Mason Co., Inc. The Free House | Allied Document Solutions & Sves Star Data Co, Solvix Solutions, LLC Dex Imaging dba Tenertype
SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY 1606 Bowling Green Drive  |151 Heller Place PO Box 413 200 Church Street P.0. Box 12 701 Rt 73 South Suite 425 5100 W. Cypress Street
OF PRINTER RIBBONS, PRINTER INKE JET Cherry Hill, NJ 08003 Bellmawr, NJ (8031 - Norwood, MA 02062 Swedeshora, NJ 18085 Hewlett, NY 11557 Marlton, NJ 08053 Tampa, FL 33607
AND TONER CARTRIGES,FAX MACHINE Steve Yuhas VP of Sales |Daniel Orr, Jr., Senior V_P. David Rizzo -Sales Robert Richardson, President Dale Peterson, VP Bill Monetti, Account Mgr, | David Shaver, Manager
TONER AND DRUM UNITS TO BE 856 857-0355 388-926-2766 800 595-6651 856-241-2000 201-565-9876 856-324-4100 813-915-1306

UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

856 857-0357 Fax

888-596-1788 - Fax

781 278-0706 Fax

856-241-2290

201-642-0298 - Fax

856-318-2100

813-884-2900 - Fox

IN THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER

29 [2661B8001AA Cyan $116.00 CUAE0TE §99.45 No Bid No Bid $115.00 $116.00
30 |2662B0DIAA Biack . $109.00 897.95 S106.50 Ne Bid No Bid $54.25 $120.60
31 35008001 Rlack $77.00 $76.58 VU ETL6S No Bid Ne Bid 381.00 $85.00
32 |6260BO12ZAA Yeliow $236.00 $246.18 $222.00 Ne Bid No Bid $215.00 5259.00
33 16261B012AA Magenta 5240.00 5246.18 $222.00 Ne Bid No Bid $219.60 $259.00
34 16262B012AA Cyan $235.00 $246.18 $222.00 No Bid No Bid $219.00 $259.00
35 |6264BO12AA Black $209.00 §205.47 £262.50 Ne Bid No Bid £199.00 $222.00
36 (62698001 Yellow $98.00 582,74 Y B R E Ne Bid No Bid $79.55 $84.00
37 |6270B001 Magenta £96.00 $82.74 e v L BRI No Bid No Bid $79.55 $84.00
38 62708601 Cyan 597.00 $82.74 “ 87125 No Bid Ne Bid $79.55 $84.00
39 |6272B001AA Black 581,00 R &% v R $62.00 No Bid No Bid $68.00 $85.00
40 194358001 $76.00 LBSRgT $67.35 Ne Bid No Bid $77.60 $82.00
41 |JCL2iIXLBlek  puihoniigaggg e $26.65 §26.20 Ne Bid No Bid $32.00 $31.00
42 |CLi42M Magenia $15.68 SI3.10 Ne Bid Ne Bid $18.95 No Bid
43 |CL142PC Photo Cyan $15.68 $I3.10 No Bid No Bid $18.95 No Bid
44 |CL142Y Yellow $I5.68 $13.10 Ne Bid No Bid $18.95 No Bid
45 |CLI42bk Black $15.68 ST ST No Bid No Bid $18.95 No Bid
46 |CL142g Gray $15.68 COSI3I0 0 No Bid No Bid $18.95 No Bid
47 |CL142lgy Light Gray $15.68 Y £ [ Ne Bid No Bid $18.95 No Bid
48 |CNM3500BO0TAA SN 7/ L B $71.65 No Bid No Bid $87.25 $85.00
49 |PGi 58K T $17.50 No Bid No Bid $27.00 No Bid
50 |PG210XL Bilack $21.77 $21.50 Ne Bid No Bid $27.00 $26.00
51 |8C CL1-8C Cyan $16.67 514,25 Na Bid No Bid $21.50 £20.00
52 |8M CL1-8M Magenta $16.67 $14.25 No Bid No Bid $31.56 $20.00
53 |8Y CLISY Veilow $16.67 $74.25 No Bid No Bid $21.50 £20.00
54 |116 Biack 1980B001AA 9.60 $77.12 £73.25 Ne Bid No Bid £80.00 §79.00
55 1116 Cyan 1979B001AA SERAD. $72.72 $69.30 No Bid No Bid $79.00 $78.00
56 1116 Magenta 1978B001AA USG90 $72.72 $69.30 No Bid No Bid $79.00 §78.00
57 116 Yellow 1977BO0IAA $71.00 §72.72 L RE9.30 Ne Bid No Bid $79.00 $78.00
58 |118 Biack $108.00 E9TEE $100,50 No Bid No Bid §121.00 No Bid
58 |118 Colors $£311.20 $293.88 CR90.45 No Bid Ne Bid 3117.00 No Bid
EPSON
80 |059120 Black $17.60 1678 $17.36 No Bid No Bid $24.00 No Bid




PD 018012 VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR:
Bid Opening 3/07/19 ar 10:00 am CFR Computer Supplies W.B. Masan Co., Inc., The Tree House Allied Document Seolutions & Sves Star Data Co, Selvix Selutions, LLC Dex. Imaging dbha Tonertype
SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY 1606 Bowling Green Drive  |151 Heller Place PO Box 413 200 Church Street P.0. Box 12 761 Rt 73 South Suite 425 5100 W. Cypress Street
OF PRINTER RIRBONS, PRINTER INK JET | Cherrp Hill, NJ 08003 Bellmawr, NJ 08031 Norwoed, MA 02062 Swedesboro, NJ 08085 1Hewlett, NY 11557 Marltor, NJ 08053 Tampa, FL 33607
AND TONER CARTRIGES,FAX MACHINE Steve Yuhas VP of Sales |Daniel Orr, Jr., Senior V.F. |David Rizzo -Saies Robert Richardson, President Dale Peterson, VP Bill Monetti, Account Mgr, David Shaver, Manager
TONER AND PRUM UNITS TO BE 856 857-0355 888-926-2766 200 595-6651 856-241-2000 201-565-9876 856-324-4100 813-915-1300
UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS 856 857-0357 Fax 888-598-1788 - Fax 781 278-0706 Fax 856-241-2290 201-642-298 - Fax 856-318-9100 813-884-2900 - Fax
IN THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER
61 |S615337 Ribbon $9.00 58.97 e I Neo Bid No Bid $13.50 $10.00
82 |EPS-T04852¢ TR NO BID No Bid Ne Bid Ne Bid £20.50 No Bid
&2 |ERC22 $9.00 Y R $1.85 No Bid No Bid $7.95 No Bid
84 IT017201 Black Cgleee NO BID Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
65 |T019201 Color T ETeNn v NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
66 _|T059120 Biack $15.00 e e $17.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
67 1T059220 Cyan $18.00 SR SIG TR T $17.30 Ne Bid No Bid No Bid 'No Bid
68 |TO59320 Magenta $17.60 R e §17.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
69 {TO59420 Yelow 81600 $16.78 $17.30 No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid
70 |T859526 Light Cyan " 81660 516.78 §17.30 No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid
71 |T059620 Light Magenta 817.40 CUSIGTE $17.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid
72 |T059720 Light Black $18.90 81678 $17.30 No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid
|_73_|T059820 Matte Black CR1400 516.78 §17.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
74 |T059920 Light, Light Black $18.00 LU i816.78 §17.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid
75 |TG&M20 Gloss Optimizer 814.00 CUURIRRE $13.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
76 |TO87120 Photo Black $14.00 ORISR $13.55 Ne Bid No Bid 'Ne Bid No Bid
77 |TO87820 Matie Black $15.00 VUST3.38 $13.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
78 [T087220 Cyan $I3.60 R 4 %] ST E R $13.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
79 [TO87320 Magenta $13.90 CRF3LEE §13.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
80 |TO87420 Yellow $14.00 E13.38 §13.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
81 [TO87720 Red $14.90 “$13.38 $13.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
82 |TOS87920 Orange L R12:00 $13.38 513.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
83 {T206120 Black $12.00° RNy [/ & PR $12.55 Ne Bid No Bid 51795 No Bid
84 |T200220 Cvan £9.00 e T I $8.80 No Bid No Bid $13.50 No Bid
85 |T2680320 Magenta $2.00 CUUETEL L $8.80 No Bid No Bid $13.56 No Bid
BE |T200420 Yellow $8.60 B AT IRt $8.80 No Bid No Bid $13.560 No Bid
87 |T200XL.120 Black XL CE3000 NO BID Ne Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
88 |T200XL220 Cyan XL CUSIGH0 NO BID Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
89 [T200XL320 Magentz B ¥ 711, O S NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
90 |T200X1420 Yelow XL g0 NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
91 1T54451 Photo Biack $79.00 $100.84 US89 No Bid Ne Bid Ne Bid No Bid
92 |T545100 Biack $80.00 346.18 34590, No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid
53 7545200 Cyan $81.00 $46.18 Bt AR R No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
94 |T545300 Magenta $77.60 $46.18 S50 Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




» PD 019-012 VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR:
Bid Opening 3/07/19 at 16:00 am CVR Computer Supplies W.B. Mason Ce., Inc. The Tree House Allied Document Solutions & Sves Star Data Ca. Solvix Solutions, LLC | Dex Imaging dba Tonertype
SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY 1606 Bowling Green Drive 1151 Heller Place PO Box 413 200 Church Street P.0). Box I2 701 Rt 73 South Suite 425 5100 W. Cypress Street
OF PRINTER RIBBONS, PRINTER INK JET Cherry Hill, NJ 68003 Bellmawr, NJ 08031 Norwood, MA 02062 Swedesboro, NJ 08085 Hewlett, NY 11557 Marlton, NJ 08053 T am;ba, FL 33607
AND TONER CARTRIGES,FAX MACHINE Steve Yuhas VP of Sales |Daniel Orr, Jr., Senior V.P. David Rizzo -Sales Robert Richardson, President Dale Peterson, VP Bill Monetfi, Account Mgr. Duavid Shaver, Manager

TONER AND DRUM UNITS TO BE

836 857-0355

888-926-2766

800 595-6651

856-241-2000

201-565-9876

856-324-4100

813-915-1300

UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS 856 8576357 Fax 888-598-1788 - Fax 781 278-0706 Fax 856-241-2290 201-642-0298 - Fax 856-318-9100 813-884-2900 - Fax
IN THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER
95 [T545400 Yellow $79.90 846,18 U g450 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
96 FT545500 Light Cyan $78.00 $46.18 [ Ne Bid Ne Bid Ne Bid Ne Bid
97 |T545600 Light Magenta §77.00 $46.18 No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid
Farge Ymcke
98 [S00015-540 $160.60 CUUSREAR LA Ne Bid No Bid No Bid $709.00 No Bid
Hewlett Packard
29 JHEW-3904 $147.00 $120.12 $I21.16 388:00 No Bid $146.00 No Bid
100 HEW-902XL Yeliow TCMIGAN#140 $19.00 $16.78 RIS R No Bid No Bid £25.00 §21.00
101 |HEW-902XL Black T614AN#140 $33.00 529.94 T R No Bid No Bid $41.00 $38.00
402 [AEW-902XL Magenta T6MO6AN#1I40 $19.00 516.78 $IS.80. No Bid No Bid $25.00 $20.00
103 [HEW-902XL Cysn T6MOZAN#140 $19.00 $16.78 815,80 No Bid Ne Bid $25.00 $20.00
104 |HEW-934XL Biack CSIROG $24.84 £23.75 No Bid No Bid 534.00 $31.00
105 |HEW-935X1. Yellow $28.00 §15.98 R T Ll F e No Bid No Bid 523.50 $21.00
106 |HEW-935XL Cyan $18.00 $15.98 sI520 Ne Bid Ne Bid $23.50 $21.00
107 {HEW-935XL Magenta $17.00 $15.98 R YL N D No Bid No Bid £23.50 $21.00
108 JHEW-950XL Black CERITOM $32.14 $30.40 No Bid No Bid 541.50 $39.00
409 1951X1L Cyan, Magenia, Yellow $36.00 $74.52 823,30 No Bid No Bid $32.75 559.00
110 1952 Black F6ULSAN $82.00 $22.88 2185 Ne Bid Ne Bid $31.06 $29.00
411 |952XL Biack FGU19AN "526.00 $32.86 530.80 No Bid No Bid $43.00 $42.00
112 1952 Cyan LOS49AN $34.00 515.96 E1400 No Bid No Bid $23.00 $18.00
113 |952XL Cyan LOS61AN 526,00 $25.55 Cvgaggs i Ne Bid No Bid $34.00 $27.00
114 1952 Magenta LOS52AN $16.00 $15.96 CIA90 No Bid No Bid £23.00 $17.00
115 |952X1 Magenta LOS64AN 525.00 §25.53 §RRE No Bid No Bid $34.00 526.00
116 1952 Yellow LOSSSAN $18.00 515.96 GBI No Bid No Bid §23.00 $18.00
117 1952 XL Yellow LOS67AN 952 (3 color combo) $26.00 $25.55 Ne Bid No Bid $34.00 $26.00
118 |NOK27AN $53.00 $45.48 Ne Bid No Bid $58.50 Ne Bid
119 1516454 Black $60.00 RBAG Ne Bid No Bid 549.50 $44.00
120 [HEW-C1775A LR60.00.5 568.98 No Bid No Bid £73.00 No Bid
121 [HEW-C1823D Color CUISES00. §44.78 No Bid No Bid £59.00 $54.00
122 [HEW-C2P04A Black $14.00 $13.16 No Bid No Bid £20.00 $18.00
123 |HEW-CZPISAN-62XL $32.00 $28.85 No Bid No Bid $34.25 536,00
124 |HEW-C2P06A Tri Color $16.00 $16.13 No Bid No Bid $23.00 £20.00




PD 019-012 VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR:
Bid Opening 3/07/19 at 10:00 am CVE Cemputer Supplics W.B. Mason Co., Inc. The Tree House Allied Document Solutions & Svey Star Data Co. Selvix Selutions, LLC Dex Imaging dba Tonertype
SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY 1606 Bowling Green Drive 151 Heller Place PO Box 413 200 Church Street P.0. Box 12 701 Rt 73 South Suite 425 5100 W. Cypress Streer
OF PRINTER RIBEONS, PRINTER INK JET | Cherry Hill, NJ 08003 Bellmawr, NJ 08031 Norwaod, MA 02062 Swedesbaro, NJ 08085 - |Hewlett, N¥ 11557 Marlton, NJ08053 ~ |Tampa, FL 33607
AND TONER CARTRIGES, FAX MACHINE Steve Yuhas VP of Sales | Daniel Orr, Jr., Senior V.P. | David Rizzo -Sales Robert Richardson, President Dale Perei'son, vre . Bl Monetfi, Account Mgr. David Shaver, Manager
TONER AND DRUM UNITS T0 BE 856 857-0355 888-926-2766 8O0 595-6651 856-241-2000 201-565-9876 856-324-4100 813-915-1300
UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS 856 857-0357 Fax $88-598-1788 - Fax 781 278-0706 Fax $56-241-2290 201-642-G298 - Fax -~ |856-318-9100 813-884-2900 - Fax
IN THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER '
125 |CZPOTAN-62XL $35.00 $31.77 No Bid No Bid $41.00 . §39.00
126 |HEW-C2P23AN $28.00 $24.84 No Bid No Bid £32.50 ' $32.00
127 |BEW-C2P24AN 517.00 $15.98 No Bid No Bid $23.00 521,00
128 |HEW-C2P25AN $18.00 ' $15.98 No Bid No Bid 523.00 $21.00
126 |HEW-CZP26AN 517.60 $15.98 No Bid Ne Bid $23.00 §21.00
130 |HEW-C4127X SRR $30.98 No Bid $117.00 4i-pei No Bid
131 |HEW-C4182X CLE S Te0 $51.87 Ne Bid No Bid $184.00 ' 66-pei No Bid
132 |HEW-C4254A R N £30.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid 41-pci No Bid
133 |C4844A Black $51.00 343.40 SRR No Bid No Bid $52.95 548.00
134 |C4911A Cyan $41.00 $38.28 $42.80 No Bid g $49.95 540.00
135 |C4912A Magenta 542.00 £38.28 $42.80 No Bid 549.95 $40.00
136 |C4913A Yellow $43.00 $38.28 342.80 No Bid o R $49.95 $40.00
137 |C4950A $237.00 [ Y T4 ST 5242.75 No Bid No Bid $265.00 $254.00
138 |C49544 5238.00 Bl TR 5242.7% Ne Bid Ne Bid $265.00 $254.00
139 1C4961A Cyan $240.00 B I e AL R T $242.75 Ne Bid No Bid $265.00 5254.00
140 |C4962A Magenta $241.00 S2U7:8 Y $242.75 Ne Bid Ne Bid $265.00 §254.00
141 |C4963A Yeliow $242.00 CTERITA8 $242.75 Ne Bid No Bid $265.00 $254.00
142 |C4965A Light Magenta $236.00 B v 1] B 5242.75 Ne Bid No Bid £265.00 5254.00
143 [HEW-C6578D Tri-Color $52.00 L ey R $39.45 No Bid No Bid ' $53.00 ' $56.00
144 |[HEW-C6578DN Tri-Color $51.00 ODEIEEEE - | % & ARTIER $39.45 Ne Bid No Bid $53.00 ' $80.00
145 [HEW-C6578AN Double Tri Color $75.00 $69.77 TRt T T LRt . No Bid " No Bid : $84.00 _ No Bid
146 |HEW-C6578 AN _ 576.00 $69.77 L S6RE Ne Bid No Bid $84.00 . $82.00
147 |HEW-C6615DN Black $41.00 e T I R $35.25 No Bid No Bid ' 548.00 543.00
148 |HEW-C6625A Tri Color $44.00 §37.85 No Bid " No Bid £51.00 549.00
149 |HEW-C6656AN Black §30.00 $25.10 No Bid 826.00 $35.50 $31.00
150 |HEW-6657AN Tri Color 548.00 _ : $40.70 Ne Bid $40.00 $54.00 $51.00
151 |HEW-C6658AN Toner L 7 R $16.46 No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
152 [HEW-CT1154 $64.00 568.98 $60.00 T Y o) B Ne Bid £73.00 $39.00
153 |HEW-C8061X $120.00 $139.38 $126.00 $92.75 $117.00 3144.00 TR SR2 0.
154 JHEW-C8543X $220.00 $237.98 $215.00 $199.25 ' $250.00 5235.00 R I R
155 IHEW-C8721WN $26.00 $23.48 LT GRG0 No Bid No Bid $31.25 $27.00
156 |HEW-C8765WN Black $34.00 $26.95 T EEEAe No Bid No Bid $35.50 $34.00
157 |HEW-C8766 WN Black $41.00 $31.83 $29.60 No Bid Ne Bid $40.95 $38.00
158 |HEW-C8767WN Black R e Tr Y T $28.94 534.00 No Bid No Bid $47.00 544.00




: PD 019-012 VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR:
Bid Opening 3/07/19 at 10:00 am CVR Computer Supplics W.B. Mason Co., Inc. The Tree House Allied Document Solutions & Sves Star Data Co. Solvix Solutions, LLC Dex Irmaging dba Toneriype
SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY 1606 Bowling Green Drive 151 Heller Place PO Box 413 200 Church Street P.0. Box 12 701 Rt 73 South Suite 425 5100 W. Cypress Street
OF PRINTER RIBBONS, PRINTER INK JET Cherry Hill, NJ 08003 Bellmavr, NJ 08031 Nerwood, MA 02062 Swedeshoro, NJ 08085 Hewlett, NY 11557 |Mariton, NJ 08053 Tampa, FL 33607
AND TONER CARTRIGES, FAX MACHINE Steve Yuhas VP of Sales Daniel Orr, Jr., Senior V.P. David Rizzo -Sales Robert Richardson, President Dale Peterson, VP Bill Monetti, Account Mgr, | David Shaver, Manager

TONER AND DRUM UNITS TO BE

856 857-0355

888-926-2766

800 595-6651

856-241-2000

201-565-9876

856-324-4160

813-915-1300

UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

856 857-0357 Fax

888-598-1788 - Fax

781 278-0706 Fax

856-241-2290

201-642-0298 - Fax

856-318-9100

813-884-2900 - Fax

IN THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER

159 |HEW-CB771 WN Cyan $12.60 $11.28 ) No Bid No Bid £17.95 $13.00
160 |HEW-CS772WN Magents $12.00 $17.28 105 No Bid No Bid $17.95 $13.60
161 |HEW-CETT3IWN Yellow $13.60 $11.28 55 No Bid No Bid $17.95 $13.00
162 [HEW.C8774 WN Light Cyan $14.60 $11.28 10 No Bid No Bid $17.95 513.00
163 |HEW-C8775 WN Light Magenta $13.00 $11.28 Y No Bid No Bid $17.95 513,00
164 [HEW-CY321FN $74.00 R EHLGR $65.80 No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid
165 |HEW-C9348FN Black $80.60 $8.27 $68.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
166 [HEW-C9351A Black $16.60 V51325 $14.50 No Bid No Bid $23.50 $20.00
167 |[HEW-C93524 Tri Color $22.00 RIS 520.40 No Bid No Bid 529,90 $25.00
168 [AEW-C9353FN 2 pack $89.60 e T R $74.90 No Bid No Bid 596,00 £96.00
163 [HEW-C9359AN CURE0.00 NO BID No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid
170 [HEW-C9363WN Tri Color $48.00 $43.12 $40.00 No Bid No Bid $54.00 548.00
| 171 |HEW-C9364 WN 529.00 ERINT v | BENEE R R $24.50 Ne Bid No Bid £35.00 $31.00
172 |HEW-C9369 WN Photo DR NG BID No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
173 [HEW-C93B1A $78.60 $70.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid $84.00
| 174 |HEW-C9382A £79.00 £70.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid 584,00
| 175 |HEW-C9385AN 577.00 $7.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.00
| 176_|HEW-CO386AN S g30.00 $16.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid 820.00
177 |HEW-C9387AN L ET900 $10.43 No Bid No Bid Neo Bid $20.00
| 178 HEW-C9388 AN $21.00 £7.37 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2000
179 JHEW-CY730A Black £229.00 $234.55 $212.00 $120.75 Ne Bid 5235.00 COBTTAOE
180 JHEW-C9731A Cyan $340.00 $328.93 $299.60 $159.25 Ne Bid $335.00 CUSI0.00 .
181 IHEW-C97324 Yeliow -$330.00 $328.93 §299.00 §159.25 No Bid 5335.00 CEIA9.00
182 |HEW-C9733A Magenta $327.00 5§328.93 $299.00 8159.25 No Bid $335.00 CETaN0
183 |HEW-C97348 Transfer Kit £290.00 $287.09 ' i No Bid Neo Bid $337.00 $350.00
184 |HEW-CB321 WN Black $26.60 526.64 No Bid No Bid $20.95 $25.00
185 |HEW-CB322WN Photo XL $22.00 $19.57 No Bid No Bid $27.00 $26.00
186 |HEW-CB323WN Cyan XL $§23.00 $20.33 Ne Bid Ne Bid 527.00 $26.00
187 |HEW-CR324WN Magenta XL $24.60 520.33 ; : No Bid No Bid $27.00 $26.00
188 |HEW-CB325WN Yellow XL $24.00 520,33 LS80 No Bid No Bid 527.00 $26.00
18% |[HEW-CB40DA Black $140.00 $153.63 $139.00 §89.25 T No Bid $159.00 $109.90
180 [HEW-CB401A Cyan $190.00 $228.55 $206.00 Ne Bid 523900 $140.00
191 |HEW-CB462A Yeliow £190.00 $228.55 $206.00 i i No Bid $239.00 $146.00
192 |[HEW-CB463A Magenta $180.00 $228.55 $206.00 CUSTI200 No Bid $239.00 $140.00




PD 018-012 VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR:
Bid Opening 3/07/19 at 10:00 am CVR Computer Supplies W_B. Mason Co., Inc. The Tree House [ Allied Document Solufions & Sves Star Data Co. Solvix Solutions, LLC Dex Imaging dba Tonertype
SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY 1686 Bowling Green Drive 151 Heller Place PO Box 413 200 Church Street P.0. Box 12 761 Rt 73 South Suite 425 5100 W. Cypress Street
OF PRINTER RIBBONS, PRINTER INK JET Cherry Hill, NJ 18003 Bellmmver, NJ 08031 Norwood, MA 02062 Swedesbore, NJ 08085 Hewlett, NY 11557 Marlton, NJ 08053 Tampa, FL 33607
AND TONER CARTRIGES,FAX MACHINE Steve Yuhas VP of Sales Daniel Orr, 1., Senior V.P. | David Rizzo -Sales Robert Richardson, President Date Peterson, VP Bill Monetti, Account Mer. | David Shaver, Manager
TONER AND DRUM UNITS TO BE 856 8570355 888-926-2766 800 595-6651 856-241-200G 201-565-9876 856-324-4100 813-015-1300

UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

856 857-0357 Fax

888-598-1788 - Fax

781 278-0706 Fax

8356-241-2290

201-642-0298 - Fax

856-318-9100

813-884-2900 - Fax

IN THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER

193 [HEW-CBS40A Black  |ovisshs $40.00 $61.16 $49.50 549,25 No Bid $68.00

194 |HEW-CR541A Cyan $46.00 856.22 RAsIsg $45.75 No Bid $65.50

195 [HEW-CBS42A Yellow $49.00 8§56.22 [T 5 TR 545.75 No Bid $65.50

196 |[HEW-CBS43A Magenta $47.00 856.22 E4SSR T 845.75 No Bid $65.50

197 [HEW-CC364A $148.00 $124.66 $120.00 SRR T v Rt No Bid $159.00

198 |HEW-CC530A (Black) £70.00 595.68 $74.00 LRSS T Ne Bid $116.00

198 {HEW-CCS31A {Cyan) $80.00 $94.33 $80.00 TR No Bid $105.00

200 JHEW-CC532A (Yellow) $86.00 $94.33 580.00 RTS8 Ne Bid $105.00

201 JHEW-CCS533A (Magenia) £77.00 §94.33 $80.00 el Ne Bid $105.00

202 {HEW-CC641WN $38.00 $36.27 Cligggeg i $45.75 No Bid $45.95

203 {HEW-CC644WN 546,00 $41.37 38R $52.00 Ne Bid $51.50

204 |HEW-CE255A $124.00 $103.85 3163.00 $145.75 No Bid $129.25 5 Rt
205 |HEW-CE255X $157.00 §155.57 $166.00 $94.75 No Bid $163.00 LRIZpp
206 |HEW-CE255XD $247.00 £290,68 5§295.00 CURIROSG No Bid $325.00 £248.00

207 |HEW-CE39%0A $146.00 $I20.12 $121.10 L E8R Ne Bid $146.00 892.00

208 |HEW-CE390A $147.00 §120.12 $121.10 CUEREN No Bid $146.00 $92.00

202 |[HEW-CE390X $160.00 $223.33 $204.00 CETARE i No Bid $224.00 5139.00

210 |HEW-CE410A Black $71.00 %58.46 CUESRAH No Bid No Bid $71.06 365.00

211 |[HEW-CE418X Biack $79.00 $71.78 $68.00 R YIr Ne Bid $79.00 $70.00

212 |HEW-CE411A Cyan $90.00 $92.65 $81.00 SR, No Bid $74.00 865.00

213 |HEW-CE412A Yeliow $92.00 $92.65 $81.00 84400 Ne Bid §74.00 $70.00

214 JHEW-CE413A Magenta $92.00 $92.65 $81.00 LS00 No Bid §74.00 $70.00

215 [HEW-CES05A $76.00 $61.78 £63.00 540.56 No Bid §62.00 548.00

216 |HEW-CE705A CgE000. $61.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

217 |HEW-CE740A Black $128.00 $117.96 $167.00 Ne Bid $132.00 $129.00

218 |HEW-CE741A Cyan " $226.00 $206.13 $185.00 No Bid $227.00 $169.00

219 [HEW-CE74ZA Yellow $228.00 $206.13 $185.00 No Bid 522700 5169.00

220 [HEW-CE743A Magenta £229.00 $206.13 $185.00 No Bid $227.00 $169.00

22t |[HEW-CF226A $97.00 $89.13 $81.00 No Bid $107.00 CUISESG.
222 |HEW-CF230A £52,00 548.36 SO0 No Bid 560.00 $59.00

223 |[HEW-CF237A $140.00 $133.58 $120.00 $112.75 No Bid 515600 CLRIORR i
024 |[HEW-CF280A 587.00 $71.48 $71.50 571.00 No Bid £89.00 BRSNS
225 |HEW-CE280X $126.00 $120.87 $122.60 COETARS No Bid §135.00 595.00

226 |HEW-CF281X $240.00 $200.67 $797.00 50050 Ne Bid $242.00 $749.00




PD 019-012 VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: FVENDOR: VENDOR:

Bid Opening 3/07/19 at 10:00 am CVR Computer Supplies W.B. Mason Co., Inc, The Tree House |Allied Document Selutions & Svey Star Data Co. Solvix Solutions, LLC Dex. Imaging dba Tonertype
SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY 1606 Bowling Green Drive 1151 Heller Pluce PO Box 413 200 Church Street P.0. Box 12 701 Rt 73 South Suite 425 5100 W. Cypress Street
OF PRINTER RIBBONS, PRINTER INE JET | Cherry Hill, NJ 08003 Belimawr, NJ 08031 Norwood, M4 02062 Swedeshoro, N.J 08085 Hewiett, NY 11557 Mariton, NJ 08053 Tampa, FI. 33607
AND TONER CARTRIGES,FAX MACHINE Steve Yuhas VP of Sales Daniel Orr, Jr., Senior V_P. | David Rizze ~Sales Rebert Richardsan, President Dale Peterson, VP Bill Monetti, Account Mgr, David Shaver, Manager
TONER AND DRUM UNITS TO BE 856 857-0355 888-926-2766 800 595-6651 856-241-2000 201-565-9876 8§56-324-4100 8§13-815-1300
UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS 856 857-0357 Fax. 888.598-1788 - Fax 781 278-0706 Fax 856-241-2290 201-642-0298 - Fax 856-318-9100 §13-884-2900 - Fax

IN THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER

227 JHEW-CF287X §209.00 5225.68 £199.00 e R gs s No Bid £239.00 $155.00
228 [HEW-CF350A $47.00 $43.65 CTRRe No Bid No Bid ' $53.00 542.00
229 [HEW-CF3I51A $49,00 $44.97 R R No Bid No Bid $55.00 $43.00
230 [HEW-CFI52A $50.00 $44.97 GRS g No Bid ' No Bid $55.00 " $43.00
231 |HEW-CF353A $49.00 544,97 R Y ¥ e No Bid No Bid 555.00 $43.00
232 |HEW-CF360A Black $126.00 §119.38 : $107.00 §99.50 No Bid $129.00 VL R
233 |HEW-CF3614A Cyan $163.00 $149.68  $134.00 $129.25 Ne Bid $156.60 T E10900
234 |HEW-CF362A Yellow 816400 5149.68 $134.00. $129.25 No Bid $156.00 SO TE09.00.
235 |HEW-CF363A Magenta $165.00 §149.68 $134,00 §129.25 Ne Bid $156.00 S 8109.00
236 |HEW-CF400A Black $57.00 $48.96 SR gy No Bid No Bid $64.50 BRI iRe 7 4 I
237 |HEW-CF400X Black §77.00 $65.92 $57.00 £79.50 No Bid 584,95 ST EE800
238 |HTW-CF401A Cyan $67.00 R o e $56.00 No Bid No Bid $75.50 861.00
239 [HEW-CF401X Magenta $89.00 $76.46 $70.00 589.25 No Bid $94.00 R r T TN | R R
240 |[HEW-CF402A Yellow _ $67.00 e I R $56.00 No Bid Ne Bid $75.50 $61.00
| 241 |HEW-CP402X Cyan ' 586.00 £70.46 $70.00 §89.25 No Bid £94.00 86900
242 |HEW-CF4034 Mageata $67.00 g g £56.00 No Bid No Bid ‘ §76.00 _ $61.00
243 |HEW-CF403X Yellow $86.00 $70.46 . $70.00 $89.25 No Bid 594.00 SRR, 11 %/ I
244 [BEW-CF410A Black $72.00 $61.75 I s59.20 $129.25 No Bid $76.00 ey 1 7 Ry
245 |HEW-CF411A Cyan $80.00 579.76 $74.00 $154.25 No Bid $101.00 R 122 I
2465 [HEW-CF4124 Magenta $77.00 $79.76 $74.00 $154.25 No Bid $101.00 e vy
247 |HEW-CF413A Yellow L g6000 $79.76 $74.00 C §154.25 No Bid 5101.00 §72.00
248 [HEW-CHS65A Black 538,00 ERCIRRURRE & - A, SRR -5§38.85 No Bid Ne Bid $46.00 §37.00
249 [HEW-CH566A Cyan £27.00 R 7L NI $26.90 No Bid Ne Bid $33.50 $31.00
250 |HEW-CH563WN Black 534.00 Shniiggg g i © $28.10 No Bid No Bid 538,95 $38.00
251 [HEW-CH564WN Tri Color £34.00 $29.28 e s No Bid No Bid $40.50 ' $39.09
252 |HEW-CH567A Magenta $27.00 EETENEE ¥ 1 & B SR £26.90 No Bid No Bid $33.50 $31.00
253 [HEW-CH568A Yellow 527,00 g $26.90 No Bid No Bid $33.50 $31.00
254 |HEW-CNO45AN Black $36.00 $32.14 R No Bid No Bid $41.50 $33.00
255 {HEW-CNO46AN Cyan 527.00 $24.84 U R Ne Bid No Bid $33.00 $24.00
256 JHEW-CNO47AN Magenta 528.00 $24.84 R T No Bid No Bid 533.00 524.00
257 [HEW-CNO48AN Yellow $26.00 $24.84 CS23AE T No Bid No Bid $33.00 524.00
258 JHEW-CNO49AN Black 524,00 $22.18 R RAE: 1/ %!/ P No Bid No Bid $30.50 $23.00
25¢ |HEW-CNO50A Cyan $17.00 $15.96 i US1485 E No Bid No Bid $24.00 $17.00

280 |HEW-CNOSIA Magenta $18.00 $15.96 L YRS No Bid No Bid $24.00 $17.00




’ PD 019-012 VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR:
Bid Opening 3/07/19 at 10:00 am CVR Computer Supplies W.B. Mason Co., Inc. The Tree House Allied Document Solutions & Sves Star Data Co. Selvix Selutions, LLC |Dex Imaging dba Tenertype
SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY 1606 Bowling Green Drive 151 Heller Place PO Box 413 280 Church Street P.0. Box 12 701 Rt 73 South Suite 425 5100 W. Cypress Street
OF PRINTER RIBBONS, PRINTER INK JET Cherry Hill, NJ 08003 Bellmawr, NJ 080631 Nerwood, MA 02062 Swedeshore, NJ 08085 | Hewiett, NY 11557 Marlton, NJ 08053~ “Vrampa, FL 33607
AND TONER CARTRIGES,FAX MACHINE Steve Yuhas VP of Sales |Daniel Orr, Jr., Senior V.P. |David Rizze -Sales Robert Richardson, President |Dale Peterson, VP Bill Monetti, Account Mgr. | David Shaver, Manager

TONER AND DRUM UNITS TO BE

856 857-6355

888-926-2766

800 395-6651

856-241-2000

201-565-9876

856-324-4100

813-915-1300

UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

856 837-0357 Fax

888-598-1788 - Fax

781 278-0706 Fax

856-241-2290

201-642-0298 - Fax

856-318-9100

813-884-2900 - Fax

IN THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER

261 |[HEW-CNO52A Yellow $15.00 $15.96 i gRARS No Bid No Bid $24.00 $17.00

262 |HEW-CNO53AN Black $29.00 $26.28 Shigag s No Bid No Bid $35.00 $36.00

263 |HEW-CNOS4AN Cyan $14.00 §13.87 RN T /X1 B No Bid No Bid 521.00 519.00

264 |HEW-CNOSSAN Magenta $16.00 $13.87 LRI No Bid No Bid 521.00 $19.00

265 |HEW-CNUS6AN Yellow §16.00 §13.87 L RIZ0 No Bid No Bid $21.60 $19.00

266 |HEW-CNOS8AN Cyan $10.00 $9.57 T TN LRI e No Bid No Bid $15.95 $13.00

267 [HEW-CNOS9AN Magenta $12.00 $9.57 LRy No Bid No Bid $15.95 $13.00

268 |HEW-CNOGDAN Yellow $11.00 $9.57 LSR5 No Bid No Bid $15.95 $13.00

269 [HEW-CNO684WN Black $24.00 $20.64 820,40 No Bid No Bid $29.95 No Bid
270 |HEW-Q1338A $100.00 $141.13 $129.00 CUgTReE No Bid- $147.00 " 5109.00

271 |HEW-Q1339A 5140.00 $193.36 $173.00 R ) A B No Bid $227.00 $119.00
272 |HEW-Q2610A $100.00 $131.73 $119.00 87975 No Bid $137.00 £89.00
273 |[HEW-Q2612A. $40.00 $60.48 £54.00 53828 v Ne Bid $59.00 $42.00

274 |[HEW-Q2613A $66.00 $24.98 No Bid No Bid §77.00 9 pei UES8.00.
275 |HEW-Q2613X $70.00 $96.83 $89.90 USRS $94.00 5118.00 565.00

276 [AEW-Q2670A BRI $60.17 No Bid No Bid No Bid 75-pei $119.00
277 IHEW-Q2671A Cyan CRRNN $61.36 No Bid No Bid Ne Bid 77-pei $178.00

278 {HEW-Q2672A Yellow TR0 362.44 Ne Bid No Bid No Bid 77-pei $118.00
279 {HEW-Q2673A Magenta EB0.00 $62.44 No Bid No Bid Ne Bid 77-pei $118.00

280 JHEW-Q3655A (Maintenance Kif) CRIZE00 NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid 145-pei Ne Bid

281 JHEW-Q5421A 820000 $250.88 $234.00 $212.50 Ne Bid $289.00 $379.00
282 THEW-Q59424A $140.00 $141.63 5129.00 HB69,78 $140.00 $147.00 $94.00

283 |HEW-Q5942X $160.00 $214.28 $193.00 CRIA9.25 $216.00 5218.00 $120.00
284 {HEW-Q59494 $60.00 $78.18 $71.00 ‘§38.50 No Bid $89.00 $55.00

285 |HEW-Q5949X $126.00 $143.13 $129.00 Ne Bid No Bid $143.00 89400
286 JHEW-Q6000A Biack $60.00 $71.85 $65.00 CEFT2E L Ne Bid $79.60 $58.00

287 JHEW-Q6001A Cyan igae.m $78.38 $70.00 858.00 Ne Bid 587.00 %62.00

288 |HEW-Q6002A Yellow LR $78.38 $70.06 $58.60 No Bid $87.00 $62.00

288 |[HEW-QG6003A Magents AT $78.38 $76.00 558,00 No Bid 587.00 562,00

200 |HEW-Q6511A $90.00 $52.38 No Bid RIS T $117.00 S5-pei 389.00

281 [HEW-Q7551A L9000 $111.98 3101.00 No Bid No Bid $118.00 CR00eE
2062 |HEW-Q7551X 5160.00 $187.58 5170.00 $140.25 No Bid $160.00 RIR0.90
293 |HEW-Q7553A $69.00 $76.45 $69.00 564,25 No Bid £83.00 SR LN i
294 |RMI-1082 $209.00 CEISRSS I $199.00 Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




. PD G19-012 VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: ' VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR:
Bid Opening 3/67/19 at 16:00 am CVR Computer Supplies W.B. Mason Cp,, Inc. The Tree House | Allied Document Solutions & Sves Star Data Co. Solvix Solutions, LLC Dex Imaging dbe Tonertype
ASPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY 1606 Bowling Green Drive 151 Heller Place PO Box 413 1200 Church Street P.Q. Box 12 701 Rt 73 South Suite 425 5100 W, Cypress Streer
OF PRINTER RIBBONS, PRINTER INK JET Cherry Hill, NJ 08003 Belimmer, NJ 08031 7 Norwood, MA 02062 Swedesboro, NJ 08085 Hewlett, NY 11557 Mariton, NJ 08053 Tampa, FL 33607
AND TONER CARTRIGES, FAX MACHINE Steve Yuhas VP of Sales Daziel Orr, Jr., Senior PP, | David Rizzo -Sales Robert Richardson, President Dale Peterson, VP Bill Monetti, Account Mgr.

\David Shaver, Manager

TONER AND DRUM UNITS TO BE

856 857-0355

888-926-2766

800 595-6651

856-241-2000

201-565-9876

856-324-4100

813-915-1300

UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

856 857-0357 Fax

888-598-1788 - Fax

781 278-0706 Fax

856-241-2290

201-642-0298 - Fax

856-318-9100

813-884-2900 - Fax

IN THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER

295 |Toner 43X 5200.60 §237.98 §215.00 $139.75 5250.00 $239.00 RI20060
296 |TROY-02-81136-001 5400.00 ig37Re8 $395.00 No Bid No Bid 5402.00 $419.00
297 [AP8I1A §148.00 $118.98 S119.00 $86.25 No Bid $153.00 CAes00
298 |HP81X $240.00 $200.67 5197.00 §99.25 No Bid £249.00 $149.00
IBM
299 [1053685 §31.60 §27.17 82690 No Bid No Bid $36.00 Ne Bid
KYOCERA
300 |FS-C8550DN $89.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $79.00 No Bid
301 |TK3102 Black SS9 §55.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid 864.00 $64.60
302 |TK-572C L iRRE00 $111.76 $114.50 No Bid No Bid $117.00 $119.00
| 503 |TR-S72K 880,00, 38613 §90.25 No Bid No Bid £91.50 £99.00
304 ITK572M $76:00." $111.76 $118.50 No Bid No Bid $117.00 $119.00
305 |TK572Y 8118.50 No Bid No Bid $117.00 $119.00
306 ITKS82C b SELee | TLETunligweigR il $65.45 No Bid No Bid $65.50 $65.00
307 |TK382K $48.30 No Bid No Bid §51.25 $50.00
308 |TK582M $65.45 No Bid No Bid $65.50 565.00
309 |TKS52Y 865.45 No Bid No Bid 865.50 365.00
310 |TK-8602K £93.90 No Bid No Bid 5$99.00 £94.00
311 |TK-$602C $175.60 CUURIZ0A3 - $181.96 No Bid No Bid $179.00 £179.00
312 ITK-5502M $174.00 1 R - $181.90 No Bid No Bid $179.00 $I79.06
313 |TK-8602Y CURIEYN $170.13 $181.90 No Bid No Bid $179.00 $179.00
Lexmark
314 |52D100 SELIZO0 T $116.28 $115.00 No Bid No Bid $126.25 $130.00
315 |CS00H2KG Black $143.00 No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid $64.50 $169.00
316 |E260A1IA CRROY $105.13 39909 No Bid $99.00 $114.55 $114.00
317 |¥654%X114A RGO $465.38 $430.00 No Bid No Bid $460.00 No Bid
318 |MST710 $360.90 $116.28 $115.00 RS No Bid $129.25 §129.00
319 |T654X11A TR 200 $465.38 $430.00 No Bid No Bid $460.06 $460.00
320 |S2D1HG U 8340.00° : £362.28 CLIERA000 No Rid Ne Bid $369.00 $375.00
321 }78CIIKO Biack CES000 $61.96 $57.00 No Bid Neo Bid $65.50 $69.00
322 |78C10YO Yeliow £72.00 $73.88 U680 No Bid No Bid $76.95 $82.00




PD ¢19-612 VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR:

Bid Opening 3/07/19 at 10:00 am CVR Computer Supplies W.B. Mason Co., Inc. The Tree House Allied Document Solutions & Sves Star Data Co. Solvix Selutions, LLC Dex Imaging dba Tonertype
SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY 1606 Bowling Green Drive  |151 Heller Place PO Box 413 200 Church Street P.O. Box 12 701 Rt 73 South Suite 425 5100 W. Cypress Street
OF PRINTER RIBBONS, PRINTER INK JET Cherry Hill, NJ 08003 Bellmawr, NJ 08031 Norwood, MA 02062 Swedeshora, NJ 08085 Héwletr, NY 11557 Marlton, NJ 08053 Tampa, FL 33607
AND TONER CARTRIGES, FAX MACHINE Steve Yuhas VP of Sales | Daniel Orr, Jr., Senior V.P, David Rizzo -Sales Robert Richardson, President | Dale Peterson, VP Bill Monetti, Account Mgr. David Shaver, Manager
TONER AND DRUM UNITS TO BE 856 857-0355 888-926-2766 800 595-6651 856-241-2000 201-565-9876 356-324-4100 813-915-1300
UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS 856 857-0357 Fax 888-598-1788 - Fax 781 278-0706 Fax 856-241-2290 201-642-6298 - Fax B56-318-9100 813-884-2900 - Fax

IN THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER

323 |78C10MO Magenta o $70.00 $73.88 S e No Bid No Bid $76.95 $82.00
324 |78CI0CO Cyan $76.00 $73.88 RSN 1Y B No Bid No Bid £76.95 $80.00
OCE .
325 1066016924 (Black) 1. $200.00 NG BID $236.00 " NoBid No Bid  $753.00 S TG
326 |1066016925 (Yellow) $202.00 NO BID $236.00 . Ne Bid No Bid $153.00 R 727 ) R
327 |1060016926 (Cyan) 5206.00 NO BID $236.00 No Bid No Bid $153.00 R T e e
328 |1060016927 (Magenta) $204.00 NO BID $236.00 No Bid No Bid $153.00 R o
329 [1060019424 Black Ink 5180.00 NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid $179.00 LU TS
330 |1060019425 Yellow $190.00 NO BID Ne Bid No Bid No Bid $179.00 e G TE00
331 |1066019426 Cyan Ink $150.00 NO BID No Bid No Bid No Bid $179.00 e
332 |1060019427 Magenta lnk $180.00 NO BID Ne Bid No Bid Ne Bid $179.00 R T e
Sharp
333 |FOSOND Toner 880.00 $99.64 $87.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid g3
334 |F047DR Drum $60.60 NO BID Ne Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
| Xerox
335 |XER-186R03690 Cyan SBIS6B0 $161.26 $150.90 ' No Bid No Bid 5159.00 $160.00
336 |XER-106R03691 Magents CS149.00 $161.26 $150.90 No Bid No Bid 5159.00 ' $160.06
337 |XER-106R03692 Yellow 8140000 $161.26 3150.90 No Bid No Bid $159.00 - SI60.00
338 IXER-106R03480 Biack e YT R $127.18 $178.95 Ne Bid No Bid $126.00 $125.00
339 |XER-108R06292 Black RS0 5102.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid
340 |XER-H8R00723 Cyan R0 $131.75 $116.80 " No Bid No Bid $144.00 ' $126.00
341 [XER-168R00724 Magenta CngI00. $§131.75 $116.80 " No Bid No Bid 5144.00 §126.00
342 |XER-108R00725 Yeliow e Y $131.75 $116.80 Ne Bid Ne Bid $144.00 $126.00
343 |XER-108R08726 Black (3 sicks) - $112.00 §82.13 CigTLEe No Bid No Bid $91.00 £94.00
344 |XER-108R00727 Black (6 sticks) ' s10800 $122.48 $108.90 No Bid No Bid $135.00 $122.00
345 [XER-108R80926 Cyan SI3Lgp e $154.37 $137.40 Ne Bid No Bid $166.00 $179.00
346 [XER-108RM927 Magenta 130005 $154.37 $137.40 No Bid No Bid $166.00 $179.00
347 |XER-108R00928 Yellow g0 $154.37 $I37.40 Ne Bid . No Bid $166.00 $I79.00
348 |XER-108R60929 Black (2 pack) S GRTg $102.68 $90.25 No Bid No Bid $114.00 S119.00
349 [XER-108R00230 Biack (4 pack) L R $154.37 $137.75 " Ne Bid No Bid 5166.00 5149.00

350 |108R01417 Cyan Drum $81.00 582.13 e Ne Bid No Bid $86.00 $90.00




FPD 019-012 VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR:
Bid Opening 3/07/19 at 10:00 am CVR Computer Supplies W.B, Mason Co., Inc. The Tree House | Allied Document Solutions & Sves Star Data Co. Solvix Solutions, LLC \Dex Imaging dba Tonertype
SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY 1606 Bowling Green Drive 151 .Heller Place PO Box 413 200 Church Street P.0), Box 12 701 Rt 73 South Suite 425 5100 W. Cypress Street
OF PRINTER RIBBONS, PRINTER INK JET Cherry Hill, NJ 08003 Bellmowr, NJ 08031 Norweod, MA 02062 Swedeshoro, NJ 08085 |Hewlett, NY 11557 Maritor, NJ 08053 Tampa, FL 33607 }
AND TONER CARTRIGES, FAX MACHINE Steve Yuhas VP of Sales Daniel Orr, 1., Senior V.P. David Rizzo -Sales Robert Richardson, President Dale Peterson, VP Bill Monetfi, Account Mgr. David Shaver, Marager
TONER AND DRUM UNITS TO BE 856 857-0355 888-926-2766 800 595-6657 856-241-2000 201-565-9876 856-324-4100 813-915-1308 .
UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS 856 857-0357 Fax 888-598-1788 - Fax 781 278-0706 Fux 856-241-229¢0 201-642-0298 - Fax 856-318-91040 813-884-2900 - Fax
IN THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER
351 |108R01418 Magenta Drum $80.00 §82.13 LsTeEs No Bid Ne Bid $86.00 $90.00
352 |108R01419 Yellow $86.00 $82.13 $79.65 No Bid No Bid $86.00 $90.00
353 |108R01426 Biack Drum $86G.00 $81.92 CETRES No Bid No Bid $86.00 $90.00
354 IXER-109R00783 Extended s "”.:3_‘36.0(2 i £91,28 $90.00 No Bid Ne Bid 59900 5109.00
355 |XER-109R00784 Standard s 35000 R $56.37 854.3% No Bid No Bid $61.95 $69.00
356 |XER-113R06711 Black EIT6.00. ;_: §212.43 $189.25 No Bid Ne Bid §225.00 5243.00
357 |XER-113R00719 Cyan e 't'$1.04.00":_ 5_ 5126.54 $118.25 No Bid Ne Bid $138.00 $126.00
358 |XER-113RH0720 Magenta L 510300 i 5126.54 $118.25 No Bid Ne Bid $135.06 $126.00
359 IXER-113RM0721 Yeliow :3105.;0b 5126.54 $1718.25 No Bid No Bid $138.00 $126.00
360 [XER-113R06723 Cyan -":_.321-1‘00 o 5252.98 $224.35 No Bid No Bid 5268.00 $235.00
361 [XER-113R00724 Yeliow . L $210.00 L B $252.98 $224.35 No Bid No Bid 5268.00 $249.00
362 |XER-113R00725 Magenta G060 $252.98 $224.35 No Bid Ne Bid $268.00 §235.00
363 |[XER-113R00726 Black L URIR9 e $219.65 £199.00 No Bid No Bid $233.40 $219.00
!
Item 45 pnced as each .mld as
Zpk. Itema‘ Ay 22, 130 131 .132
151 165 175, 176 177 q78, 274 C4127x, C4182x, C4254A,
276 277, 278,279, and290 3 B 02613,036554 & Q65114-
VARIATIONS NONE “remands.. NONE NONE NONE PCI NONE
THIS IS A ONE YEAR CONTRACT
Will you extend your prices to local YES NO YES YES YES NO YES
jgovernment entities within the County
Bid specifications sent ta: The Office Pal Prime Vendor Bidner Interstate & Associates SHI Lightsource ABRZ Internafional
Automation Aids, Inc. Onvia Worldwide Paper BurrellesLuce Vortex Companies Rasix Computer Center Printer Tech LLC
Unbeatable Sale, Inc. NPA Computers Y&S Technologies Barbarian US4 Erepublic Royal Imaging

Based upon the bids received I recommentd the bid
be awarded to each vendor as follows as the lowest

responsive, responsible bidder:

CVR Computer Supplies is awarded item numbers 9, 16, 41-44, 50-56, 62, 64, 65, 69, 70, 73, 82, 87, 88, 89, 90, 104, 168, 111, 120, 121, 130, 131, 132, 151, 158, 169, 172, 176, 177, 193, 216, 247, 276-281, 287, 288, 289, 281, 301, 302,

303, 304, 305, 318, 313, 314, 316, 317, 319, 320, 321, 335, 336-342, 344, 345-349, 354-363.




PD G19-012 VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR:

Bid Opening 3/67/19 at 18:00 am CVR Computer Supplies W.B. Mason Ce., Inc. ) The Tree House Allied Document Solufions & Sves Star Data Ce. Solvix Selutions, LLC \Dex Imaging dba Tonertype
SPECIFICATIONS FOR THE DELIVERY 1606 Bowling Green Drive 151 Heller Place PO Box 413 200 Charch Street P.0. Box 12 701 Rt 73 South Suite 425 5100 W. Cypress Street
OF PRINTER RIBBONS, PRINTER INK JET Cherry Hill, NJ 08003 Belimmyr, NJ 08031 Norwood, MA 02062 Swedesboro, NJ 08085 |Hewlett, NY 11557 [Marlion, NJ 08033 . Tampa,. FL 33607
AND TONER CARTRIGES, FAX MACHINE Steve Yuhas VP of Sales |Daniel Orr, Jr., Senior V.P. |David Rizzo -Sales Robert Kichardson, President Dale Peterson, VP Bill Monetti, Account Mgr. David Shaver, Manager
TONER AND DRUM UNTTS T0O BE 856 857-0355 888-926-2766 340 595-6651 856-241-2000 201-565-9876 856-324-4100 813-915-1300
UTILIZED BY VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS 856 8§57-0357 Fox 888-598-1788 - Fux 781 278-0706 Fax 856-241-2290 201-642-0298 - Fox 856-318-9180 813-884-2900 - Fax
IN THE COUNTY OF GLOUCESTER

,-|,-,

W.E. Mason is awarded item numbers 2, 3, 6, 7, 8, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 17, 18, 19, 28, 21, 27, 28, 29, 39, 40, 48, 49, 58, 66, 63, 66, 67, 68, 71, 72, 74 81, 83, 84, 85, 86, 98, 119, 137- 144, 147, 148, 149, 150, 164, 166, 167, 168, 171,
238, 240, 242, 248, 249, 250, 252, 253, 294, 296, 306, 307, 308, 309, 311, and 312.

The Tree House is awarded item numbers 1, 23, 24, 25, 26, 31, 36, 37, 38, 45, 46, 47, 57, 59, 61, 91~ 97, 184, 101, 192, 103, 105, 166, 107, 109, 110, 112, 113, 114, 115, 116, 117, 118, 120, 122129, 133, 145, 146, 155, 156, 159, 160,
161, 162, 163, 165, 170, 173, 174, 183, 184, 185, 186, 187, 188, 194, 195, 196, 202, 203, 218, 222, 228, 229, 236, 231, 236, 251, 254-269, 296, 299, 320, 322, 323, 324, 343, 350, 351, 352, and 353.

Allied Document Solutions & Sves is awarded itemt numbers 99, 152, 189, 190, 191, 192, 197, 198, 199, 206, 261, 206, 207, 208, 209, 211, 212, 213, 214, 215, 217, 218, 219, 220, 225, 226, 227, 270, 271, 272, 273, 275, 282, 283, 284,
286, 290, 298, and 318,

Star Data Co is awarded item numbers 4, 5, 134, 135 and 136.

Solvix Solutions is being awarded item numbers 30, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36, 360 and 315.

| Dex: Imaging dba Tonertype is awarded item numbers 22, 153, 154, 175, 176, 178, 179, 186, 181, 182, 204, 205, 221, 223, 224, 232, 233, 234, 235, 234, 237, 239, 241, 242, 244, 245, 246, 274, 285, 291, 292, 293, 295, 297, 325-333,

| Kimberly Larter, QP4




