Y
PO 010-087 \ | ;
Bid Opening 10/20/2018 10:60am____| | N
SPECIFICATIONS AND PROFOSAL FORM FOR THE DELIVERY
jOF JANITORIAL ITEMS AND SUPPLIES FOR THE COUNTY -
|OF GLOUCESTER AND EXISTING UNITS WITH THE COUNTY
|AS ALLOWED THROUGH THE COUNTY CONTRACT __] .
PURCHASING SYSTEM NUMBERS CK-01-GC & 18GLCP
; ___VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: VENDOR: . VENDOR:
W.B. Mason Company, inc, General Chemical and Supply, Inc. Spruce industries, Inc, Camden Bag & Paper Co., LLC All Unique Gifts, inc. T/A Turf Trade United Sales USA Group Interboro Packaging Central Poly Bag Corp.
157 Heljer Place 858 N. Lenola Road, Unit 1A 759 East Lincoln Avenue 200 Connecticut Drive 517 Franldinville Road {185 30th Streat 414 Bracken Road 2400 Bedia Place
o _Belimawr, N.J 08031 Moorestown, NJ 08057 Rahway, NJ 67865 B NJ 08018 Mullica Hill, NJ 05062 Brooklyn, NY 11232 Mentgornery, NY 12549 Linden, N.J 87038 r
§88.976.2766 856-778-5550 732-388-8081 856-727-3313 856-478-6704 718-708-6300 845-752-6800 808-862-7570
888-598-1788 - Fax #56-778-7381-Fax 732-388-9585 - Fax 856-727-4114 - Fax 856-478-D842-Fax 798-709-T705 - Fax B45-T81-2450 - Fax 908-862-8019 - Fax
| .. _Daniel Orr, Jr., Senior V.P. David McDenough, Fresident Danjel Josephs, Ex VP/COO Rohert Thomas Jessica Phiilips, Sales Rep. Chay Goldstein Chanie Holter Andrew Hoffer, Presfdent
!
ITEM |BESCRIPTION EST. QTY | Brand Proposod | Unlt Price Totai || Brand Proposed | Unit Prica Totsi | Brand Proposed Linit Prige Tolal || Brand Proposed | Unit Price Total | Brand Proposed Unlt Price Total Brand Proporad Unit Price Yota! | Brand Proposed Unlt Prive Torat Brand Proposed Linit Price  Total
L e e AL POTTLES MAVERICK WITH 12 CLOROX AP FORUMLA
- " 5 CASES NEL §22.13  §110.68 O B NO BID SPRAYERS saton__$105.00 5430 5@sR.c0 NOBID NO BID MO BID
B ’ WAJESTIC, 128 FLUID
2 |AUSTINS A-1 BLEACH, 1 (4AL., 6/CASE 0Z, REGULAR SCENT
40 CASES KK $0.89  sacesd | ASSPEGIFIED §12.00  $480.00 NO BID AUSTIN PURE BRIGHT 8% | $1a.97 556880 | BLEACH, 3% BLEACH $480 115200 AUSTIN $1176  $470.00 NOBID NO BID _
3 |BAB-O FOWDERED CLEANSER, 2] OZ, 30/CASE 10 GASES BABO §16.05  §16050 AS SPECIFIED §I7.00 517090 NOEID BABO/KLENZER 24/CASE | §20.30  5203.00 HORID NO BID NO BID NO BID
N ZEP GAL PINE
4 |PINE SCRNTED CLEANZRDEOIDIZER. | OAL 4CASE | 5o cases el $18.00  51188.40 PROKLEEN $1475  SBAEO0 UNIFIED #4134 $1405  $843.00 JeweL 51439 §883.40 CLEANER 1 GAL $905  52167.20 NOBID NOBID NO BID
5 5 WHEEL DOLLY FOR 44 QAL RUBBERMAIL TRAST CAN, CARLISLE PITS WITH RM.
26450 AND CONTINENTAL
128ACH | RUBBERMAID | $2857  sasiza | WORIDSMAIN | 51887 573864 NOBID CONTAINERS 52640 $528,00 NG BID NG 8D NOBID o NO BID
6 | STAINLESY STEEL CLEANER. I8 OZ, 1/CASE 20 CASES, NCL 53265 565100 SPRAYPAR 52650 862000 JCLAREC5227-1407| 52525  $506.00 CHASE 52640 §520.00 NO BID NO B hoBib NG 7
a7 LYSOL BOWL
7 [DOWLCLEANER, LIQUID CONCENTRATE, 2 QT, 12CASE |} 150 cases) NeL S788 $2608.50 acs $1675 5236250 GLEEM £1520  §2,28000 BOWILAWAY 1890 5253500 CLEANER 5540 5972000 NO BID NO AID KO BID
U |PROGMS, 48" HANDLE, ANGLE POLYSTYRENR BRISTLES . 75 eacr | moppowalk | sees  sdtors 5605 850040 Mo BID OTEDAR 3170 533840 QUICKIE MEG $10.80  ST7760 NO BID No &I nomp
§  |CHEWING GUM/CANDLE WAX REMOVER 6 CASES BOARDWALK $28.23 $175,38 $19.95 $119.70 NG BID _CHASE §23.86 $143.16 WEIMAN PROPUCTS 57.05 5253 80 NG BiD NQC BID NO 8|D
10 |LRATN GPENER, | QT. 12/CASE 20 OASES NCL 52580 547880 STMONTZ, 52015 s40am0 | BANMERRRIDIGT | §26.21  §52420 NC BID C JOHNSON §440 5105800 N BID NG BID NO BID
1t STANDARD LATEN RUBBER GLOVES, 12 PAIRS/BAG,
[ |wmonm 1zea65 | NOBID IMPACT $12.25 _ §147.00 NO BID TRADEX 56,60 $79.20 NO BID ND BID NO BID ~ NOBID |
1z [STANDAID LATEX {l/BBER GLOVES, 12 PAIRS/BAC,
LAROE 12 BAGS AKERS 56.29 _ §7548 IMPACT $12.95  §147.00 NG BID _TRADEX 3680  $79.20 NO BID NG BID MO BID NO 8ID
13 {WET MOP FIEADS, 12 02 98 EACH NO BID WORLD & MAIN 3165 15840 TRIPLE 5 #37655 $1.57  $145.92 NO BID ABCO §a88 5304 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 WET MOP HEADS, 24 OZ, 124 8ACH | _0OLDENSTAR 5238 334272 WORLD & MAIN §2485__ $410.40 TRIPLE & #37659 5266 538592 JHANDYKLENZEWIDEBAND|  §2.17 831248 ABCO 434 $520,80 HO BID NO BID NO Bl
15 TWET MOP HEADS, 16 OF. 120 EACH | GOLDENSTAR 5§17 $214.80 WORLD & MAIN §198 323880 TRIFLE S #37657 $1,00_ S226.00  JWANDY KEENZE WIDE BAND| __$1.63 519560 ABCO SEY0 __ §964.80 NO BID NO BiD NO BID
16 |[WET MOP HEARS, 16 OZ, RAYON ONLY R 144 EACH GOLIXENSTAR $347 §489.68 WORLD & MAIN $4.00 $578.00 TRIFLE S#37002 §2.87 saed. 48 HANDY KLENZE WIDE BAND 52.88 34472 ABCO $8.70 5964.80 NOBID NO BID - NO BID
17 [30FMH] MOPS, SOFT TOILET RRUSHES, I00/CASE 9CASES | BOARDWALK | $83.98  g§251.88_ ] WORLD&MAIN | $5000  $150.00 HO BID HANDY KLENZE 558,00 $174.00 GUICKIE MF& $2.19  $657.00 NOBID NO BID NOBID
LE_[S1GNE, "CAUTION, WET FLOGR”, TRLLOW PLASTIC 12 EACH | GONTIMEWTAL $7.52  $50.24 WORLD & MAIN 3675 56800 NO BID HORSHAL 3672 380.64 RUSBERMAID 51245 $148.40 NO BID NOBID NO BID
15 |PLASTIC WET MOP RUCKET WIWEEELS AND WRINGER. ]
¥ [¥eLLOw 35 gF cARACHTY . 12BACH | cONTIMEWTAL | 83300 53pR48 | WORIDSMAN |  §4215  8505.80 NO BID HANDY KIENZE 344,15 $530.04 ND BID NOAID NG BID NOBID
JACK MFG 110 COUNT,
” BX12%, MAGIC HAND &
HAND WIPES, DISPOSABLE, DOUBLE RE-CREPED BURFACE PAINT &
100CT/BOX TYFALL 140 #0579 OR BQUAL SES JIMBERLY CLARK| 55579 $657.90 A3 SPECTFIED s0200  5820.00 NQEID ND BID GRAFITTI WIFES 51457 §14670 WYDALL 65,85 366850 HO BID . hoBib
21 |[CLARIO TFEGAMING, WHTTE, TOUCH FIEE DISPENSER N
49186600 (MO SUBSTITUEIGHS) 24 EACH . NOBIDY NO HIDH NOBID 528.55  §685.20 NO BID NG BID NG pID : NO BID
23 |LIQUIE HAND SGAR. EINK | GAL, #/CASE socases | moaRDwark | st499  $honso AUSTIN 51285 S514.00 UNIFIED #1001 31515 $AOG,00 PINK-STAROD 51520 $8UB.00 OO $15.60 5219040 CERTO $15.00 _ $800.00 NO BID No B0
CLARI0 ULTRABLUE ANTI-GACTERIAL FOAMING SKIN
23 |CLEAMSER FOK CLARIO TFLISPENSER #75900-00 (N0 |
SUBSTITUTIONS} £ 120 CASES] NOBIE NG BID NO BID $83.80  §7556.00 WO BID NG BID NO BID WO BID
24 [WASP & HORNET SPRAY, 12 OZ, 12/CASE i 8 CASES SC JOHRSON _ 55304 5431.02 SFRAYPAK 336.72 520378 KO BID CHAEE 15 0Z 545.10 360,60 BLACK FLAG 5748 $716.08 NG BID NOBID NO BID
| 2 |PUSTDRUST, 2ol . 246000 | posmowatk | sssy  ssier | womDaman | sieo  swsdn NOBID OCEDANSOLD 12 PERCASE!  §2.08  STL7E QUICKIE MFG s355 38544 NoBID NO BID NO Bl .
76 |FLOOR STRIEPER NON-AMMONIATED, NON-RINSE. 5 GAL
CONTAINER 20 GONT. NeL 55339 $1067.80 SIMONTZ 82080 5580.80 UNIFIED #1165 528,65___§571.00 STARCO §20.20  5584.00 No 8D NO BID NOBID Napp
2 [FLOOR FINISH, LIQUID ACRYLIC S GAL, CONTAINER | 49 o, Net, 56025 52410.00 STMONTE $4265 5175400 | DANNER Fw213.05 | 54375 S17s0.te STAROO RESULTS S47.00  $1880.00 TRUE VALUE 50320 $3728.00 NO BID NO BID NG BID
28 [Fe i B e et v e P et ——n N BID NOBID |
25 |3 M SFOT REMOVEK. 12 02, 1/CASE. B UASES WDt $57.05  $458.24 SMONIZ | §20.7  §231TE NG BID CHASE 18 0Z $56.00 528600 SPOT EHOT 3534 §512.64 NO BID NO BID NO BID
| 30_|[POWDERED CARPET DEODORANY, 14 OF, 12/CASE 20GASES | ARM & HAMMER | 31138 Seovao | rRESH 53370 _$674.00 O BID CARPET FRESH 52350 _§470.08 MALCD 5234 566150 HO B NO B NO BID
31 |REAVY DUTY DRAIN ACH, LIQUID, 1 QT, I2/CASE 20 CASES MISTY 55315 51053.80 SC JUHNSON $49,50 588000 NO AID NO BID ROOTO se2s 5221620 NOBID NOBID NO BID
31 |BASEBOARD & FLOOR STRIPPER SPRAY 19 OF, IZGASE | 15 cases RO pBID, AMONIZ 53405 541840 GLAIRE C5235 52580 $309,60 CHASE §27.55  5330.60 NoBID NO BID NoBID No RID
43 |SPRAY BUFF CLEANER POLISH & MAINTAINER. 1 GAL, -
[4{CASE. 10 CASES Nel $2238  §22380 MATHTAIN 527.25  $272.50 BANNER SB101-04 $22.00  $220.00 STARGO-NEW LIFE §22.20  §222.00 NO BID NOBID NOBIG NO B}
34 |F9IC & EPAN CONCENIRATED POWDER CLEANER, 27 OZ,
1ZCASE 20 CASES 5g4.06 5188120 595,00 $1900.00 NO BID MO B> $5.83 5142800 NO BID NOBID NOBID ]
35 |VOHNSONS LEMON SHINEUP FURNITURE WA, 15
OZ.12/CASE 10 CASES | BOARDWALE §297%  5297.90 SPRAYPAK §23.99  5230.00 NO BID CHASE 17 OZ i 2870  §267.00 6 OZWEIMAN LEMON OI, 5585,80 O BID Na BID NOBID
35 |NOXON METAL POLISH AT, 12 OL GCASE 3 CASES NOXON §17.57 55271 SPRAYPAY 33275 39826 NO BID NO BiD NOXON | 5504 514184 NO BID ND BID NO BID
37 |RUG SHAMPOOEXTRACTION CLEANER, | BAL ACASE | 4 casks oL 52878 §115.16 SIMONIZ $35.00 §140.00 NOEID HANDY KLENZE 54535 $185.40 RECKITT | osres  soman HO BID NOBID NOBID
38 ENVIROR CONCENTRATE#112 471 QAL, C5. #ENV-118<4B
TN SUBSTITUTICHNS) 40) CASES NG BID NOBD NO BT SPECIAL $138.00  56,520,00 NO BID NG BID NO BID NO BID
|ENVIROX CONCENTRATEHEI7 4/ GAL. C5. kENV-117-048
| 7 \no susstumiens, 40 CASES NO BID AS SVECIFIED 518220 _87660.00 N BID $138.00 __§5,620.00 NO BID N BID HO AID N BID
40 {PAST ORANGE HAND CLEANER, 7.5 O7 BOTTLES 25108
112 BOTTLES/CASE 12 CASES NOBID GOIO $30,00 $360.00 NOBID NO BID MW GLCBAL BRANDS 5235 $338.40 NO BID NC BID NG BID
48 _ {THEECT REPELLANT, SKIN. 5 UL CANS, 6/CASE 5 CASES NOBlD SC JOHNSON $66.00  §325.00 ] NGBS CHASE 6 07 35060 5265.00 OFF 57.67 523010 NO BID MO BID NO B0
" };tégmm APFLICATOR BLOCK LAMBSWOOLPAT 1+ | i B e
: P 12EAcH | PoARDWALE S0B5 511820 acs 51699 §305.68 ND BID SEPARATE 53.50 542,00 NC BID HO BID Ho BID NG BID




WOOTHN AFPLICATOR BLOCK, LAMBSWOOL PAD 18

Rrrererey

! Imcun 12EAcH | noamowaik | sizzs  stsae Ges $2200 527668 NOBID PAD SOLD BEPARATE $550 586,00 NO BID NOBID __NoBID NO BID
52 |WAXAVPLICATOR. REFILL, LAMBSWOOLFAL, MINCH | a5 EacH NOBE Ges §085  $223.75 NG BID 5224  566.00 NOEID NO BID NO 3D NC BID ]
| 35 [WAXAPPLIGATOK REFILL, LAMBIWOOL PAD, I8INCH | g5 gach N0 BID oy $9.95 _ §248.75 NO BID 5325 §82.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID, NO BID
B 41 |VACUUMPAGS CLEAN MAX PRO (CMPS-QL) 12 FER
CASE. OR BQUAL 20 CASES NO BID GREENKLEEN s875  S175.00 NOBID CLEAN MAX 53200 5240.00 Ng BID NO BID NG BID NoBID |
55 |WASTE BASKETS, 28118 UT BLACK, |2/CASE 4GASES | CONIINENTAL | 52784 $11135 TMPACT 54800 §184.00 NOBID CONTINENTAL $46.00 3184.00 RUBHERMAID 57.07 533838 NG 3D NG BID NOBID
56 |BROOM-HEAVY, PALMYRA FIBER, 24 INCH 12 FACH BOARDWALK 57,88 $95.88 NO HID NO BID OCEDAR 5680 S$B1.60 NG BID NC BID NO BID NQ BID
47 [BROCHMEETNE/MEDILIWSTIEF Wis THREADED HARDLE o et
HOLES 12 EACH BOARDWALE $11.28 5136.88 GCR $14.70 §$140.40 NO BID QCEDAR $7.58  S91.08 SET UP PUST BROCH, 3~ 52768 §332.18 KNG BiD _NOBID NO BiD
5 IRCRUB BRUSH, MEDIUM/STIEF W12 THRRADED HANDLE - QUICKIE MPG-LYSOL
HOLES 246AcH | PoARDwALK 5349 58378 NORD NG D CCEDARRK 5200 s68.80 | OROUT SCRUB BRUSK 5300 §7272 NQBID NOBID NG BID
59 [TOILET SEAT COVER DISPENSER. HALF FOLDL
RESTASSURED, WHITE | ¢ PERS, CS. OR EQUIAL 2 CASES BOARDWALK $44.90 5$35.80 IMPACT $69.00 $138.00 NO BID OCEDAR 12 PER CASE 358,80 $117.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NC BiD a
& TRASH CAN, RUBBERMAID, 44 OAL, #2643-0 WITH LID )
| & lmssc r2EAcH | nussenam | sezas gmeane TMEACT $45.00 554000 NO BID CONTINENTAL WILID 54150 5498.00 N BID NO BID NO BID NG BID
6 SANJAMAR ELECTRONIC TOWEL CATNET {(#5AN-
Fr1300TBK) BLACK EARL OR EQUAL 1spacH | saoaMaR | $i02f0  S1542.00 | SAN-T1300TBE | $127.00 _ $1005.00 NO BID niteny 58320 $1248.00 NO AID NO BID NG 8ib NOBID
| [ ELCO LARORATORIES
62 [VACUUM BELTS, ROUND, FOR EUREKA UFRIGHT, FACH FUREKA RD, FAG,
100 EACH NO BIE GREENKLEFN 5124 312400 NOBID NO BID UPRIGHT YACULM 5295 §200.00 NOEID NO BID noBD |
63 |BIROOM HANDLES, 60 INCH W/METAL-TIF 72EACH ] BOARDWALK 5289 318368 IMPACT 5430 §309.80 NO BID $2.50  §180.00 NG BID NG BID! NO BID NOBib
&1 |BROOM, STREET, 16 INCH WITH HANDLE 12EACH NG BID acs 51489 $179.88 N0 BID JANICO 3,80 $117.60 NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID
FEUROFPEAN BOWL
§5 |[BRUSHES, TCILET BRISTLE BRUSH, 2 TONEDB, FOLY
» 100 EACH HKUBBERMAID 51.48 $148.00 IMPACT $2.65 $265.00 NC B> HANDY KLENZ - 3123 $123.00 BRUSII FIHERS REACH $3.01 5301.00 NOBID NO BID NDBID
. RUBBERMAID 11 QT
66 JBUCKETS, 10 QT WHANDLE 2aEacH | coNTMEMIAL | 5406 sord_ | womtpamam s3.25  S7TED NO BID HANDY KLENZ $3.88  §9576 NoURNG NUCKET $788  §19152 NOBID NO BID O BID
& [ VACUUM BAG, ADVANCE SPECTRUM 12 P W2 PRE
FILTERS 10 BAGE PERFR OREGUAL 30 PRE NORID CIB.EI:NK.LEEN 512,70 $281.00 MO BID NC B NO B NOBID NO BID NO B_ID
FLCO LABRATORIES
e o et Rimrrve
) 3 CASES ¥O BID CREENKLEEN | 2500 §76.0D NOBID NO BID BAG 5238 536612 NoBID NG BID NG RID
s FLOOR & CARPET SWEEPER. {LOW PILE CARPET) MOTOR STURDSWEEF CARP
FREE | jzeacH | RUBRERMAID | 53388 S40778 ces421z 56395 $647.40 NG BID CONTINENTAL 55437 SE52A4 53457 41424 NO BID NOBID NO BID
7 DISPENSERS ROLL TOWELL PULL-N-TEAR TOUCH FREE
| ™ lorrquar 12 EACH N BID SANTIS00MBK | §127.00 5198500 ND BID inany 54050 5594.00 NOBID NO BID ND BID NOBID
” DUSTERS, SWIFFER DUSTEK STARTER KIT, #PGC 40509 SWIFFER DUSTER
OREQUA). SOEACH | PRGSWIFFER | 5511 825550 POCADI 59.00  §499.00 NO BID a6 $320D__$1600.00 STARTER 5589 570450 NO B NOBID NO 1D
73 |NUSTERS, EXTENSION, 70" 36 EACH ROARDWALK $6.59 F237.24 QCEDSSATE 50,92 S36712 NG BID QCEDAR 5440 $158.40 NO BID NOBIP NOBID NO BID ]
7 DISPENSEN, BLEND BUDDY FOR ENYIROX
CONCENTRATE #ENV-5-252-117 N0 SUBSTTTUTIGNS 12 EACH NOEID O BID NG BID 511000 $1320,00 NOBID NOBID NO BID noBlb |
7 [DISPENGER - TOILET TIS5UE, STANDARD 2 ROLL, DARK
THANS 30 EACH BOARDWALK §20.78 5823.70 NG BID NOD BID JANICO $20.88  BH23.40 NG BIE NO BID KO BID NO BID
77 |RECEPTACLE, SANITARY NAPKIN 12 FACH HOSPECO 337.79 $453.48 IMPACT 511.75 §141.00 NO BiD OCEDAR SOLD 6/C8 $14.77  S177.24 NG BID NC BID N BID NO BID
E WANED SANTTARY LINER FOR SANITARY RECEP. i 7
| ™ |7smamio soncs 24casEs|  mosreEco $15.45 536380 IMBACT $17.50  s4z000 NOBID SANISAC $16.5 340580 _NOBD NO BID NO BID NOBID
70 DISPOSABLE TOILET SEAT COVERS, PAPER, 250/FKG, 20
PRGSICASE s0casEs b crystaLwans | s2nds stoznsn Ger | 5300 $1400.00 NG BID CRYSTAL S3435  $1712.50 MPACT $30.89  §1904.60 NOBID NOBID NOBID
B0 IDODST MO FRAME, 36™ X 57 24 EACH BOARDWALR 54,28 5102.86 WORLD & MATN §3.80 $66.40 NOBID QCEDAR $340  $81.60 ABCO §2.56  $220.44 NO BID ND_B|D NO BID
| S1_[MATS, WALKOFF, 3 FTX 5 FT, COLOR: GRAY {ZEACH §_ GUARDIAN 56035 548468 acs $78.50  5358.80 NO HD AMERICO 34075 5488,00 NOBID NOBID NOBID NO EID
1 |MATS. WALKOE?, 4 FT X 6 FT, COLOK: GRAY 12EACH | cuaRauan 55450 $685.08 o0s $48.00_ 35/5.00 NG BID ANERICO 36520 __§762.40 NOBID N BID NOBID NG BID
E3 |DUST MOF FRAME, 24" X 5" 24 EACH ?GMLDWALK $2.8¢ 5§69.385 IMPACT 5__3.25 37800 NO BID OCEDAR/NORSHEL $2.80  §67.20 ABCO $6.57  $157.68 NOBID NOBID NG BID
B4 _|MOP HARDLE, 60 INCH, WINGNLT T2EACH | BOARDWALK 5668 547408 MPACT $10.50  §756.00 NG B NGRSHEL $5.15_ 537080 ABCO $6.23 44855 No BID NG B NO BID
. -y gr OCEDAR SOLD PER CASE OF
B |DUSTMGP DISPSABLE HEAD, 36" X & 72EAcH | Dosrowak | 8500 saaeae CAROLINA 475 $342.00 NG BID 12 5399 $287.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
i e CCEDAT S0LI PER GASE GF
B IDUST MOP DISPORABLE HEAD, 247K TZEACH § _BOANDWALE si20 saes | WORLD&MAN | §375 57040 NO Bl 5510 522520 NO BID NO BID _NoBD NoBm |
#[FLOOR SQUEEGER, CURVED DUAL EDGE, 18 INCH 5 FACH NOBID NORD NOBID HANDY KLENZ $4.07_ 58442 NO BID NG BID NO BID NO BID
%% |DUST MOP DISPOSABLE HEAD, 18" X7 48 EACH BOARDWALK 3360 Az WORLD & MAIN §$2.85 8138.80 NOBID NORSHEL $275  §132.00 NG BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
J‘) DUST MOP FRAME, 18M{5" 24 EACH BOARDWALK 52.87 §71.28 WORLD & MAIN §2.80 §62,40 NO BID NORSHEL §2685 E63.60 NO BID NC BID NO BID NOBIP
50 |OIL DRY, 40 OF 5018 BACS, LBSEAT 20 BAGS oDl $11.05 22100 | OCSSOLBBAG | Si174 822840 NO BID N BID NO BID NG BID NOBID No BID
91 _|PADS, BUFFINGIFOLISHING, 1€ TNCF, RED, SICASE. 16 CASES: ACS 5728 57280 TRELEONI 5890 §ES.D WO BID HANDY KLERE $6.60 885,00 NOBID NOEBID NOPBID NO BID
92 {PADS, BLACK, SCRUBBING, 16 INCH. THICK LINE, 5/CASE
: . 5CASES ACS 57.25  $38.45 TRELEONT 5890 34450 NC AID FLANDY KLENZ 85D $43.00 NOBID No BID NO BID NG HID
55 |DUST PANS, METAL 24 EACH | BOARDWALX $5.30 512036 IMPACTHE 5498 511978 NO BID JANICO $3.85_ $81.82 NQ BID NO BID NO HID, NG BlD
91_|PADS, WHITE POLIEH, 20 INGEL S/ICASE 15 CASES ACS $5.35 §120.3% TRELEONI $1225_ §183.75 NO BID $1420  §213.50 NO BID NG BID NG BID NG BID
95 |PADS, BUFFING, SCOTCH HIITE RED, 20 INCH, 5/CASE.
10 CASES ACS $10.25  5102.50 TRELEON 51225 512240 NO BID S1420 14200 NC BID No 8ib NG BID NO BID
_2(' rPADS. BLAGE, SCRUBBING, 20 BNCH, S/ICASE 25 CASES ACS $10.25 $256.25 TRELEON] 312.25 $306.25 NO BID $14.20  $355.00 NO BID NOC BID NC BID NOBID
97 |PADS, WHITE POLISH, 16 TNCH, S/CASE 25 CASES ACS 5729 5182.25 ‘TRELEONI $12.25 5306.25 HO BID 33.60  §215.00 NO BID NG BiD NQ BID NOBID
% |SQUEHGER REFILI. RUBBER. W/CHANNEL, 18 INCE 24 EACH \NGER 5246 550.04 NOBID NOBID NG BID NO BID NO BID No B noBD |
9% |RAGS, TERR], WHITE 50LB CASE 5 CASES |RIILE WASTESUPY|  53B.05 _ 5503.88 oes 380.00_ §594.00 NG BID 1T7W CUT TERRY 54,00 _S824.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID
100 |WINDOW SQUPEGEE HANDLE 12 EACH DUNGER §7.51 580142 NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID
101 |SQUEHGEE REFILL RUBBER, W/CHANNEL, 12 INCH o4 EACH UNGER [ NOBID NOBD NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NosD |
162 [HANDLE DUSE MOE, 6 INGH 12EACH | BUARDWALK 5299 S107.85 | woRLD &MAN 5385 54620 NG BID HANDY KLENZ 5548 $65.76 NO BID NG BID NO BID ND 1D
103 DIEIE #302 PAVER CUPS, 707, Z500CASE BOASES § SPRINGGROVE | S75.48 345284 SOLO 2000/C5 597.20 3583.20 NO BID A-YT TRANSLUCENT 54980 $298.80 NO BID NG BID NG BD NG BID
DAY3§ TRANSLUCENT
| 104 |DIXIE#701 PAPER CUPS, 302, S000/CASE 6 CASES DIE §78E0  5453,8D NOBID NO BID 2S00/CASE $47.00  §282.00 KO BID WO 8D RO BID NO BID
105 |ROLL TOWELS, SCOTT #414 PREEMBOSSED 00 CASES| _ 4s00 7T 530,55 §9174.00 Gep 500 450000 | VONDREHLEM41o0 | sz4sb_ $73su00_ | NITANYABCO2'CORE | $17.50  $5280.00 NG AID ND BID NOBID NG BID
FRESH-MANGG S0LD 16
106 |ORINAL SANISCREEN 2s08AcH | _ HoseECo $73 E7520 TEACT $1.85 537200 No B PER BOX 5179 5429680 NG 8D NO BID NOBID ND BID
107 _|UIINAL MAT, WASHRGOM, WFLAGIANCE 6/C5 12CASES | BOARDWALK | 53275 _ $383.00 MPACT s892  S107.88 NOBID NO BID NG BID NO BID ND BID NO BID
SIMONIZ
108 1DELUX-WAX COTE, 1 GAL, 6/CASL WETLOOK 4/) GAL-
: 12 CASES NO BI JE CASES $46.10 5829.80 MO BID NO BID NO BID ND BID NO BIX NOBID




DCL SOLUTIONS MFG, "PAK-ITS"TH, WATER SOLUBLE
LIQUID BACKETS#Q305 GLASS & HARD SURFACE,
CLEANER, 80 FACKETS/CONTAINENR 1 QUART

NG BID

NG BID

NORBID

I

NG BID

entities within fhe County

110 |YIELDAACKET 25 BOXES | PAEIT s4288  §107200 NOBID AQUA CHEM $58.60  $1465.00
TLEXIBLE AIR FRESHENER-FRESH PRODUCTS HANG TAG

qq1 | WARGO PARTHITTF 012 10720 01 12005 36 CASES NOBD $1990  $716.40 FRESH $1482 553568 KO BID MO Bip NO BID NO BID
GUART CONTAINERS WITH SPRAY TRIGGER FOR, (PAK-IT)

{1p [PRODUCTS WITH IGHT-TO-KNOW INFO-ON CONTAINER g 6y popyy NOBD . NOBID SOLD FER B7 5220 578.20 NG BIE NOBID NG BID __NoEb

113 |RURBER GLOVES, SIZE XL, NO LATEX, | DOZAG A CASES NO B 524.95 SQ_E.EU NO B NO BID NG BID HNO BID NO BID
GLOVES EXAM, NITRILE POWDER FREE, 100/BOX, 10 H

114 |BX/CS, AMBITEX Ol BQUAL MEDJLO,XLG. 72cases|  sarecuamp | saas0  s248400 S37.00  $2,664.00 TRADEDD 53830 282860 NOBID NO BID AURELIAM, L XL-NPFG-E| 53290  52368,80 53260 §2308.80

115_|HOT DRINK CUPS § 02 SCASES | SPIINGOQROVE | 529.84 _ 823872 NOBID 848 1000/CS 52470 §197.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

117 |DISH DETERGENT 1 QT. B CASES NOBID §22.00  £174.00 No BID NO BID NC_) BT NO BID NO BID

121 |3M BRAND SCRUBBER SPONGES, 200X 4 CASES BOARDWALE $4.23 $16,82 NO BILy $14.20 S56.60 NOBD KO BIR NO BID NO B
ROLL TOWE}, WHITE #6820 NORTE RIVEW OR EQUAL.

122 |4"XROUT 6 ROLLS TO CASE : 10 cASES]  MARCAL $16.99 _ $2030.80 $1B.00 529500 | VONDREHLE-830-B NITTANY 52115 57538.00 NQ BID $17.25 5207000 NOBID $17.48  52096.80
GROROLA PACIFIC WHITE ROLL #89460 OR EQUAL

128 jioxant 80 CASES | OFOROIAPACEIC | 54324 5259440 54200 $2520.00 | VONDREHLE8iEE NITTANY 542.00__$2520.00 NOEBID | s3G50 5213000 NOBID 543.99  52830.40
OEORGIA PACIFIC BROWN TOWEL OR EQUAL #89440 YONDREHLE-88D-N NITEANY-CAN BE ADAPTED

124 [8.25"X760 SKID OF 55 120 CASES) OEORGIA PACIFIC | $39.18  $4702.80 NG BID BiCE TO R 3400  $4080.00 NOBID NO Big ROAIL NO BID
WET MOP HEAD (N0 LINT) MED. ROWWOVEN LOOP OCEDAR-SOLD PER CASE

125 48 CASES BOARDWALEK 56.38 $306.72 NO B> oF 5440  §21 1.2_0 NC BID NOBID NO BID NO BID

. JANICD LOBBY PAN W

126 [LOBBY BROOM AND DUST FAN COMBO 2EAcH | coon owrs 51544 51B528 518,10 529920 ANGLE BROOM $200_ $184.00 NO BID NOBID NO BID ND BID
WASTE CONTAINTR, ROLRID, BEIGE APPRONIMATELY 22

127 GAL, 12EACH NOBID NO BID CARLISLE SOLD 4/CS $20.40  $362.80 NO BID NO BID NO B2 NO BID

126 |ROUND SWING TOP LID, BEIGE FOR BID #127 §2 EAGH NQBID NO B CARL'S_LESOLD 4iCE $15.40 51_84.50 NO 8ID NU_B!D NO BID NOBID
RECYCLING CONTAINER, RECTANGULAR BLUE,

128 [APFROXEMATELY 23 GAL. 12 EACH RUBBERMAID $20.85 §359.40 F27.00  $324.00 CONTINENTAL 525,75 §300.00 NOBID NG BID NO BIR NO BID-

130 |BOTTLE & CAN RECYCLING TOP FOW BID#129 12EAGH § KUBBERMATD |  $37.88 545466 $15.00  5180.00 CONTINENTAL S1570_ 513640 NO BID NOBID NO BID NG BID

. Variations: (if any} PLEASE SEE ATTACHED NONE NONE NONE NGNE NONE
ARC 7-10 BUSINESS DAYS. 7-14 DAYS 1 1702 WEEKS 3.5 DAYS 3-5DAYS 14 BUSINESS DAYS.
SPEGIAL ITEMS MAY TAKE LONGER
Start up dats: Date of Award
Wili you extent your prices to iozai government YES NO NO YES 1_"E;§ YES YES
T

i
‘This Is a two [2) year contract from the date of award.

Unipak Corp.

Prime Vendor

Detltek

Conserv Flag Co

|Bid speciflcations sent ta;
i

Natfonal Art and School Supplies
[

|
39, 45, 48, 51, 52, 53, 86, 67, 5B, 61, 63, 64, 65, 71, 73, 74, B0, 83, 84, 85, BE, B7, 88, 83, 99, 105, 104, 111,

112, 115, 125, 127, 12

8 & 130 as the lowest responsibie and

Based upon the bids received, | recommend Camden Bag & Paper Co, LLG, be awarded ftem # 1, 6, 8, 11, 14,

15, 16, 21, 23, 25, 36,

ive bidder,

Based upon thae bids received, | racormmend General Chemical & Supply, Inc. be awarded

frem B 5, 7, 9, 40, 13, 17, 16, 20, 22, 24, 27, 29, 31, 35, 40, 54, 62, 66, 67, 68, 77, 8

1, 82, 82, 89, 102, 105, 107, 108, 713 & 123 as the lowest responsible r

2, 3,12, 19, 30, 34, 38, 37, 85, 69, 60,

4 as the lowest responsibie

i

Based upon the bids received, | recommend W.B, Mason Company, Inc., be awarded ftoms #
i \

9, 72, 76, 78, 79, 80, 91, 82, 94, 95, 96, 97, 88, 100, 101, 706, 110, 114, 121, 122 & 12
[

Sincerely,
I

Kimberly Larfer, Pumhasfng Pepartment
]




