Purchiase of Traffic Signal Patts and Components

Office of the County Engineer
Coumly of Gloucestor

SUMMARY OF BIDS

PD-$18-055

Traflic Parts Inc.

PO Box 837
Spring Tx, 77383
Tranny Miller Sales Mgr.
Phone: 1.800.345.6329
Fax: 713.490.0755

danny@uafficparts.com

Description

hETI00

UErG; m:nd;:l 5

I'rice
No Bid
$34.50
$54.00
Mo Bid
No Bid
No Bid
$28.00 $24.00
$95.00 $74.50
No Bid No Bid
$16.00 $17.50
No Bid No Bid
Mo Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
Neo Bid Mo Bid
$30.00 $17.75
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
$650.00 $290.00
No Bid No Bid
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Vi\Ttatic Slgnat Depltnaual PD foy

SUMMARY OF BIDS

Traflic Parls nc.
PO Box 837
Spring Tx, 77383
Dauny Miller Sales Mgr.
Phone: 1.800,345.632%

ﬁnu 'arle & Componants\2010-20161P0-011-056 Summary ¢f Bids

[ Fax: 713.490,0755
-018-055 dannyf@ralficparts.com
Z ig
Bl . 48 ,
= it Description oo Price Price Price
020 .1 10 each [12" Louvered Inserts {(Black) e 10 $74.00 $65.00 $54.00
5 each 18" Louvercd Inserts (Biack) $62.00 $55.00 $47.00
: 9 No Bid No Bid
A ; No Bid No Bid
024 |25 [ e T Vo, olo. Taffe Tedbig Col§ 900 6 35 |15 10 s
025 f B0 each |1 %" x 12" Nipple Asscinbly, Comnplete with Elbaw -~ RO $34.00 $38.00 320,95
026 - :80 ench]] %" x 6" Nipple Assembly, Complete with Elbow ‘80 $32.00 $32.00 $16.00
: " Rigid Steel Nipple . ' k ‘25 $7.50 $12.00 $5.70
RS20 No Bid
No Bid $15.50
No Bid $16,00
No Bid Ne Bid
No Bid No Bid
$48.00 $42.00
1 865.00: No Bid
$24.00 $113.75
No Bid No Bid
$265.00 327715
$220.60 $243.65
No Bid No Bid
Ne Bid No Bid
No Bid ™o Bid
No 8Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
$224.00 CBEBO00 $229.35
$12.00 S$1200 T $6.73
‘ No Bid No Bid
Ne Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
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SUMMARY OF BIDS

Faya@penernlirafficequip.com

Traffic Parts inc.
PO Box 8§37
Spriug Tx, 77383

Dianay Milter Sales Mpr,

Phose: 1,800,345,6329
Fax: 713.490.0755

danny(@hafficparts.com

Price Price
No Bid $990.00
No Bid $662.00
$810.00 __NoBid $800.00
$188.00 FE110:00: 7 $124.75
No Bid No Bid
} Ne Bid No Bid
50 each ; ! $24.00 No Bid $22.00
e Signal. Closure lut far traﬁ‘lc mgunl as mauufacmred hy Pc.!co Products pm #SE- '
056150 eac,h 30546-yellow S50 $3.50 $6.00 $2.75
i . [Signal Hardware Kit for cotmechng Iraffic stgnal seqtions mgethar a8 nmnui‘nclured o
037, 50 e;_ac.il by Peek 'ﬁafﬁc Syslems parl #070012B (or equal), 50 $6.50 $6.00 $4.75
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
Mo Bid Mo Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid

VaTrafle Slgnal Deplvhnival PO far Traific Signal Paits & Componenisi2058.20H 0P D-0MB-066 Sammary of Bids
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SUMMARY OTF BIDS

Traffic Parts e,
PO Box B3T
Spring Tx, 77383
Danny Miller Sules Mgr.

Phone: 1.800.343,6329
Fax: 713.490.0753

PD-018-055 dannyirafficoaris.com
. =
Z E
g . £8
= Uit Deseription = Price Price Price .
No Bid Mo Bid
No Bid No Bld
i b i ‘ $52.00 30.007 $41.00
066 -} -5 each |7 Conducior: 14AWG IMSA stranded traffic sigial cable ok 1,000 foof recl. 3 5 $1,145.00 No Bid $1,088.00
067 |5 each [Cable'an 1,000 foot rect, 10 conductar 14AWG TMSA siranded traffic signal. - 5 $1,475.00 No Bid $746.00
s . No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid Ne Bid
Ne Bid Mo Bid
No Bid No Bid

V\Traliie Signal DeptiAnnual PD for Traffic Signal Parle & Companon sQ018-2019PD-018-055 Summary of Blds
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Traffic Parts o,
PO Bex 837
Spring Tx, 77383
Danny Miller Sales Mgr.
Thone: 1,800.345,6329
Fax: 713.490.0755

danny@iralficpacts.com

Price
No Bid
Ne Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
Mo Bid
No Bid
No Bid
Mo Bid
No Bid

$2,196.00

SIER900:

25:e0

c
ach ]

$2,825.00

$215.00 $225,00

$3,000,00 No Bid

No Bid No Bid

$24.00 $25.00
No Bid No Bid
| £26,400.00 $38,320.50

$689,912.30

Total of bid ifems x estimated quantities{ $776,760.00 | $108,650.00 I $H5,0063,00

T = 1 ' e R
Vincent M. jnger
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