1 PD-018-047

_ L BidOpening 8/14/16 10:00am

i SPECIFICATIONS AND PROPOSAL FORKM

VENDOR,

iCamden Eag & Faper

VENDOR:

VENDOR: YENDOR:

VENDOR: _

VENDOR:

| General Chemical and Supply, inc, |

W.E Mason Ca, inc.

__|Det-Vei Chem Company

South Jersey Paper
Praoductis, Inc.

Central Poly-Bag Corp. linterboro Packaging Corp,

United Sales USA Corp

FOR THE SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF

| 114 Gaither Drive

858 N. Lenola Road

157 Helfer Place

| 250 Oid Marlton Pike

2400 jndustrial Way

2400 Bedie Place 1114 Bracken Road

250 44fh Stree!

PARPER PRODUCTS FOR THE DEPARTMENT

[Mt. Laurel, NJ 08054

Moorestown, N.J 08057

Bellmawr, NJ 08037

|Medford, M.J 08055

Vineiand, NJ 08360

Linden, N.J 67036 i Montgomery, NY 1254

Brookjyn, NY 11232

OF SENIOGR, SERVICES AND EXISTING

Fred Rasmussen VP

David McDonough, President

UNITS WITH THE COUNTY CONTRACT

(856)727-3313

(856} 778-5550

__.|Daniel Orr, Jr., Septor VP, iTina Rannels

Brandon Specior, V.P,

Andrew Hoffer, Pres. Chanie Holtzer

Chaya Goldstein

1(B88) 926-2766

1(609) 458-3689

|(800} 232-6927

|(908)862-7570 (845} 782-6800

SYSTEM NUMBERS CH-01-GC & 16GLCP

(B58)727-4114 Far

(856) 778-7381 - Fax

| {888} 598-1788 - Fax

[{609) 7714-3030 Fax

|(856} 794-8975 - Fax

ESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT PRIGE  TOTAL

. |[908)8G2-8078 - Fax

(845 781-2450

\(718) 705-7705 - Fax

"|UNITPRICE  TOTAL  |UNIT PRICE

TOTAL _ |UMNITPRICE  TOTAL

UNIT FRIGE  TOTAL |UNIT PRICE  TOTAL

_JUNIT PRIGE

TOTAL

~

|Dessert Cups, plastic, 4 oz., 2500/cs

| Soio # PO40 or equal

Annuai estimated quanﬁi_{r.:“ Jes

|$46. 15

_.F1661.40 (57758

$2,793.24

$1548.44

LX)

Dessert Cup Lids, Plasfic, 4 0z,

i$42i50.
1

g1530.00. 1 §43.

$1576.36

Mo Bid

No Bid

2500/cs solo #904P or equal

Anﬂyai esfimated quanfity: 30 cs

s29.90

~ sEmmw

£31.08

— s7asz0 saes0

S735,007 326,38

$791.46

" INo Bid

..o Bid

No Bic_

L

Eoam Gups, 10 oz, 1000/cs darf #

" Annual estimated quanfity; 60 cs

10-B-20 or equal

$54.80

$3.288.00

$41.10 $2,466.00

st

LA

jﬁgg{n cup lids, 1000/cs dart #20 JL

$2,418.60 330507

$1830.00

$2768.60

~ No Bt

ior equal

Annual estimated quantity: 45cs

|$31.75

ot

.. 51.430.55

1§27.28 $1,227.60

T F1,160.55 |§25.34

|Place mats, white 10°X10", 1000/cs

$1.140.30

Mo Bid No Bid

American ¥343 or equé.'

_|Annual estimated quantity: 50 cs

s19.80

"$990.60

$26.93 _ H1,346.60

$71.5¢

£579.00  $9.9

1]

INapkins, white, 187x17", 5000/cs

" §1,123.00

No Bid

No Bid

|F., howard #363 or equal

{Annual estimated quaniity, 26cs

528,90

$747.50

§32.37 80775

7

iPapef towels, bieached, plyfoid

$43.40

JFL085.00 183231

FBOT.75  |824.68 F617.00

Na B¢ No Bid

2400/cs, ft. howard $#206-or equal

Annual esfimated quanfity. 18 cs

8

1$19.40

. 5348.20

i$15.25 §274.50

$14.93 $268.74 |514.90

$265.20 |§15.22 $273.96

$354.06 No Bid

|

| Toilet fissue white, 2 ply 500 sheats

|96/cs gen't paper #612 or egual

|Annual estimated quantity: 10 s

" sr0.00

hi=]

Ptates, Plastic, 9", 500/cs, dart or

$267.80  |$25.50

$255.00 |§32.56  §425.60

$296.60

§290.00

equal

imated quaniffy: 160 cs

Annual e

LJBAET0

7, 752.00

 $4,723.20  1529.95

$4,702.00 1535.24 $5,638.40

NoBid

$51.29

$20.52

200/cs, mobil # THI-010 or egua!

Annual estimated quantiiy: 22 cs

“|sz0.25

$1,863.00

153718 $2,500.56

18715.52 142876 [$10.95

$1635.40 [$14.46 .

11

| 11|Cold Gups, flat bottom, 7 ox,

NoBld

No Bid

12500 cs solo or egual

Annuai estimatec quantity: §cs

 §454.80

§61.76 . §494.08

F706.72 | $49.50

$395.20  ($38.98 7

12

No Bid

Mo Bid

T’s_ﬂy gloves, disposable, medium

1000/cs, impacf-#_ 6W100 or equa-;"

Annuai estimated quantity: 15 cs

sz

315,40 $201.00

$50.25

wd7.86

$84.90

No Bie! §12.34  §200.10

Ne Bid

_ $568.50 185.66




75 |Chix Wipers 14" x 24", 200,C5

Chicopes MUl # 8310 or egual 16 cs §15.90  §156.00 |$23.66 §236.80  |§15.92 $153.20_ $156.00 Nao Bid Mo Bld
—_14 Foly bags, plain "' x 3" x 15", - - . S ) o
T000/cs landis or equal - o - T .
| . lApnual esfimated guantity: 10 cs F24.20 $909.00 [§30.14 .. &307.40 1§15.37 $153.70  |$18.20 §192.00 ‘$1‘335 $7149.40 F178.40 Ne Bid
15 | Bowls, 12 oz, 1000/cs darf # 36 T - o R
1712 or equal - - i . o : .
:Annual estimated quantity: 45 c¢s $2020 _ 5908.00 [$46.06 §2,162.70 1445 §787,50  [§1688  §760.05  |No Bid Ne Big
| 76 | Clear Bags, 16"x14"x36", 250cs . - e —
Landis or equal e . - e e e i o
Anntal estimated guantity;, 30 cs |$21.48 S644.40 | 526,35 $610.50  |s32,38 8971.46  |$20.90 $627.00 | $20.77 £893.16 151920 24340 No Big
77 | Aluminum Trays w/lids 250/cs, pea - . . B T e -
I# 71396P or equal _ - , : : R
;Annual astimated quantify;, 400 cs | §65.80 $27,920.00 |§$117.32 _$46,926.00 154849 $19,396.00.7 551.60 $20,640.00 |354.44 $21,776.00 | No Bid Ko Bie No Bid
| ! :
18 Bags, sandw:’ch, wa;:, 100 cs, B . N -
§"x 7 5/8", aztev or equal . ) R ]
Annual estimated quantity: 15 s §17.60 526400 [§71.28 $207.75  |$42.75 $641.25  |s15.68 523620 | No Bid Ne Big No Bid
1% |Faper plates, piasiic coatsd 6" .
i1000/cs, solo or equal . A IS B T - ——
1Annual esiimated quantity. 25 cs 1$13.05. $326.25 1 §44.66 $1,116.56  |$2629  @73z2s  |s40.90 $1,022.50 | §43.84 $1,095.00 |WoBid  No Bid No Bid
20 |Cups, styrofoam, 1000/cs, dar » - L o
|#8.48 or egual o e S I
[Annuai estimated quantity: 30 cs | $20.00 S870.00 ($27.95  §E39.70 520.32 $609.60 | $22,35 $670.56  [$23.28 $698.40  |No Bi6 Na Bid 1$79.95
1
|
| Drefivery Date _ i 10-14 Days ARO _10-14 Days ARQ 5-7 Days ARQ if in stock 2 bays ARG - Weekiy Delivery, 10 Days ARO 3-5 Days ARG Y Days ARD
- #6-15x17 2ply napkin packed o
| Variations: _ NONE NONE #5-10010" vs 10x14" NONE 3000/CS NONE NONE #9-Only 400/C5
B #6-Priced as 15x17", e N
SM/CS; soltf as 17x17", #10-Dart BOHT1E packed
3000/CT (@526.04 200/CS o )
’ ) #11-Priced as 2660/CS; [#13 Chix Wipes #8507 )
1soid as 2000/CT @70.67 {11.5x24" packed 200/CS
112 -Priced as 1000/CS; :
. | sold asT0O00/C5@I3.50 #14 8x3x75 poiybag .75 mil
B ; h : "7 %16 16x14x36 bags 303716N
- . #13-14x24" vs 11.5424" Clear
#16 Priced as 500/CS; soic
N ; as Z50/CT@16.19 - e
Wil you extend your prices to jocal ] ) T B 1 o
|government entities within the Courty NO ~ NC B YES ves _.NO YES YES _ ho

i THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT SHALL BE FOR TWO YEARS FROM DATE OF AWARD

Bid Specifications sent ta;

1American Pride Paper and
Plasfic

Dave's Cleaning Service

All American Poly

GP Express, fnc.

KSL Supplies inc.

_|Code Blue Emergency Services

Spruce industries, inc.

Educafion Inteffigence

|asp, tie

|Baseg upon the bids ren:efvan‘ ! recommend we award items ‘I 2 3, & and 13 to Del-Vel Chem Company, ftems 4, 15 ang 17 to W.B, Mason; I!ems ﬁ T 9 and 20 fo United Sales USA Corp.

|ltems & ang 18 fo General Chemical and Supply and items 10, 71 and 14 to South Jersey Paper Products; ltem 12 and 18 fo Camden Bag and Paper and ttem 16 to Central Po)y Bag Corp.

. iSincerely,

|Peter Merc;éﬁﬁ, Furchasing




