PD-018-047

Brd Openmg 6/14/16 10: 0am

SPECIFICATIONS AND PROPOSAL FORM

FOR THE SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF

" |PAPER PRODUCTS FOR THE DEPARTMENT

OF SENIOR SERVICES AND EXISTING

Lamden Baq & Paper

114 Gaither Drive
Mt. Laurel, N.f 08054

Fred Rasmussen VP

UNITS WITH THE COUNTY CONTRACT

_ |SYSTEM NUMBERS CK-01-GC & 16GLCP___

(856)727-3313

(856)727-4114 Fax

| VENDOR:
) Genera! Chemical and Supp!y, ine.

VENDOR:

VENDOR:

W.B Masan Co., lne.

858 N. Lenola Road

Moorestown, NJ 0BO5T

David McDornough, President
(856) 778-5550

(856) 778-7381 - Fax

_|(sos) 5e8178E - Fax

151 HeHer Place

Belimawr, N.J 08031

250 Oid Marton Pile

Medford, NJ 08055

Daniel Orr, Jr,, Senior V.P.

{888) 926-2766

Tina Rannels

(609} 458-3683

Del-Vel Chem Company

[(609} 714-3030 Fax

ITEM |DESCRIPTION UNITPRICE___TOTAL__[UNITPRICE ~ TOTAL UNIT PRIGE  TOTAL UNIT PRICE  TOTAL
1|Dessert Cups, plastic, 4 0z, 2600/cs [ 7 N T - T — i
Solo # P04 or equal o I - L o _
|Annual estintated quandity: 36 cs $44.60 $1606.6( ~ NoBid $43.04 $1548.44 $42.50 _$1530.00
7| Desseit Cup Lids, Plasiic, 4 0z., . -

2500/(:5 solo #904F or equal

_|Annuai estimated quantity: 30 cs

Foam Cups, 10 oz, 1000/cs dart it

10-B-20 or ‘equal

$33.30

T§9%9.00|

$2450

“$73m00

''''' Annual esfimated quantify: 60 ¢s $30.00 833400083490  §3084.00 [$40.31 $2,418.60 [$30.50 §1830.00 |
 4|Foam cup lids, 1000/cs darf #20 JL I o
of equal —— . [ R SO S O
_[Annual estimated quantity: 45 cs |$2t20 $954.00 __ %8as7s |822.67 $993.15 $26.79 $1,160.55
5 Place mats, white 10"x10", 1000/cs S I o
American #343 or equal . — ) i
Annual estimated quantity: 60 cs $17.80 $ego00)  NeBid |$11.58 _$579.00 3995 $497.50
, — - . . ] i
6| Napiins, white, 15717, 5000/c5 - . i
ft., howard #363 or equal o _ L . e |
AnnuaI estimated guantity; 25 cs s2r00 $697.50 No Bid $43.40 $1,08500 ($32371  $BOLFS :
7 |Paper towels, bleached, plyfoid I o I
2400/cs, ft. howard #206-or equal I o . e e
_|Annual estimated quantily: 18es ~ |§15.40 $277.20)$16.95 $305.10 $14.93 $268.74 $14.90 $268.20
8| Toilet tissue wiite, 2 ply 500 sheets ) T
96/cs gen't paper #612 or equal L o o _
Annual estimated quantity: 10cs $28.20 $282.00/§27.65 $276.50 |$26.78 $267.80  |$25.50 25500 :
2 |Piates, Plasile, 97, 500/cs, dart or 1 e -
 |Anmual estimated guantity: 160 cs $2800  §4.480.00[52645 $4232.00_[§2952 8472320 82995 $4,792.00
10|Fo Fo.'ding tray, shﬂ!_qw piate hinged | 7777777;77777 o . _______ '
_ |200/cs, mobil # THI-010 or equal S ) NN S o
(Annual estimated quantity: 82 cs $15.88  $1480.9¢ No Bid $15.53  §1428.76  $18.85 183540
11 |Cold Cups, fiaf botlom, 7 oz, I o o

2500 ¢s solo or equal

Annual estimated quanmy Bcs

$44.00

£352.00

NoBld

$86.34 §706.72

|348.90

$394.2

-




__12|Poly gloves, disposable, medium _ "\ " T —
___{1000/cs, impact # 6W100 or equal o L - - I
Annual estimated quantity: 15 c¢s _ |34.88 $73.20 No Bid $3.35 $50.25 $37.90 __ $568.50
13 |Cliix Wipers 14" x 247, 200,CS — , o R
Chicopee Mill # 8310 or equal 10 ¢s $15.90 " $156,00($749.00 $1490.00 _|$15.32 $153.20  |$14.90 3149.00
14 [Poly bags, plain 8" x 3" x 157, B ) -
1000/cs fandis or equal o - ) o o _
- Annual estimated quantity: 10cs .| §15.98 $166.00 . NeBid 21837 $183.70 |$19.20 §192.00 .
15 |Bowls, 12 oz., 1000/cs dart # 36 o R L
. |T1Z or equat S o O S e
Annual estimated quantity: 45¢s 1$28.68 $1,200.60/513.95 $627.75 REI LA L $636.75 $17.60 $787.50
16 |Clear Bags, 16"x14"x36", 250cs S
Landis orequal . . B OV | .
| |Annual estimated quamntity: 30 cs $17.20 $516.00 No Bid §32.38 897140 82090 §6A7.00
17 |Aluminum Trays wilids 250/cs, pea .
# 71390F or equal o - o o o -
Annual estimated quantity: 400 cs $42.60 _ $198400(  Nogid $48.49 $19,396.00  |$51.60 $20,640.00
18 |Bags, sandwich, wax, 1000 s, | —
6% 7 5/8", aztec or equal o o o
woo.|Annual estimated quantity: 16 cs $14.88 $223.20 ....No Bid $13.85 . $207.78 94278 §641.26
_.19 |Paper plates, plastic coated 6 i S
1000/¢s, solo or equal o R L
Annual estimated quaniity: 25 cs $12.50 $312.50|§47.95 §1,198.75 $29.22 . %732.28 $40.90 . $1,022.50
20 | Cups, styrofoamn, 1000/cs, dart 7 o

#1848 or equal

“iAnnual estimated quanfity: 30 cs

$531.00

$2037

. §e0a.6e

gééig 7. T T

THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT SHALL BE FOR

TWO YEARS FROM DATE OF AWARD.

Bid Specifications sentto:

Unipal Corp
Spruce Indusiiies

| Alt Clean Building Services

Prime Vendor

Delivery Date 10 Business Days _10-14 Days ARQ 57 Days ARO If in stock |
- |Varfations: S  NONE o ~ NONE #E6-10x107 vs 10x14" NGNE
fi6-Priced as 15x17", SM/CS;
sold as 17x17", 3000/CT
@$26.04
#11-Priced as 2500/C8; sold
as I000/CT @70.67
- #13 Priced as 1000/CS; sold
o ,, ] as10000/CS@33.60 _
13140247 vs 11.6624"
|l you extend your prices fo local . N
govermment entities within the County YES YES YES YES

Based upon the bids received, I reconunend we award ifems 1, 2, 5, 6, 7, 10, 11, 12,13, 14, 16,17, 18, 19, {c Camden Bay and Paper




and iteims 3, 4, B, 8, 15, 20 to Office Basics as the lowes( responsive responsible bidders.

Sincerely,

Kimberly Larter
Purchasing




