B PD 016-026
Bid Opening 6/14/16 10:00am L -
. |veEnpor: VENDOR: -
~ SUPPLY AND DELIVERY OF Camden Bag & Paper Qifice Basics
PAPER PRODUCTS 114 Galther Drive 22 Creek Circle 3 o
Mt Laurel, NJ 08054 Boothwyn, FA 19061 e
Fred Rasmussen VP Katherine Leighton
|@s6)727-3373 800 541-5855
3 |(856)727-4114 Fax 800 225-4049 Fax i
[TEM __[DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE __TOTAL UNIT PRICE __TOTAL
1 |Dessert Cups, plastic, 4 oz., 2500/cs
Solo # P048 or equal o o
Annual estimated quantity: 36 cs $44.60 $1605.60 No Bid
2| Dessert Cup Lids, Plastic, 4 oz., -
2500/cs solo #904P or equal ) ‘
Annual estimated quantity: 30 ¢cs $33.30 $999.00 NoBid
3 |Foam Cups, 10 oz, 1000/cs dart # o
10-B-20orequal g ,
|Annual estimated quantity: 60 cs §39.00 §2340.00 | $34.90 $2094.00
4 |Foam cup lids, 1000/cs dart #20 JL o |
or equal - e
Annual estimated quantity: 45 cs $21.20 $954.00 $18.35 §825.75
5 |Place mats, white 10"x10", 1000/cs
American #343 or equal o
Annual estimated quantity: 50 ¢cs $17.80 $890.00 No Bid
6§ | Napkins, white, 15"x17", 5000/cs
ft., howard #3863 or equal o ] = B
Annual estimated quantity: 25 ¢s $27.90 $6597.50 No Bid
7| Paper towels, bleached, plyfold
2400/cs, ft. howard #206-or equal o . o
Annual estimated quantity: 18 cs $15.40 $277.20  [$16.95 $305.10
8| Toilet tissue white, 2 ply 500 sheets L
96/cs gen't paper #612 or equal
Annual estimated quantity: 10 cs $28.20 $282.00  |$27.65 $276.50
9 |Plates, Plastic, 9%, 500/cs, dart or
equal
Annual estimated quantity: 160 ¢s $26.00 ~ $4,480.00 $26.456 $4232.00
10 |Folding tray, shallow plate hinged -
200/cs, mobil # THI-010 or equal R
Annual estimated quantity: 92 cs #1588 $1460.96 No Bid o
" 11| Cold Cups, fiat bottom, 7 oz., B
2500 cs solo or equal -
Annual estimated qguantity: 8 cs §$44.00 $352.00 - NoBid




12 | Poly gloves, disposable, medium

1600/cs, Impact # 6W700 or equal

Annual estimated quantity: 15¢s 34,88 $73.20 ~ _NoBid

13 [ Chix Wipers 14" x 24", 200,CS

" Chicopee Mill # 8310 or equal 10 cs $1590  $156.00 [$145.00 " $1490.00

14 |Poly bags, plain 8" x 3" x 15",

1000/¢cs landis or equal

Annual estimated quantity: 10 cs $15.98 _$7166.00 - No Bid

15| Bowls, 12 oz., 1000/cs dart # 36

71Z or equal

Annual estimated quantity: 45 cs $28.68 $1,290.60  |$13.95 §$627.75

16 |Cloar Bags, 16"x14"x36", 250cs

Landis or equal

Annual estimated quantity: 30 cs $17.20 $516.00 No Bid

17 |Aluminum Trays w/ilds 250/cs, pca

# 71390F or equal

Annual estimated guantity: 400 cs $49.60 $19,840.00 No Bid I

18 |Bags, sandwich, wax, 1000 cs,

6"x 7 5/8", aztec or equal

Annual estimated quantity: 15¢s  |$14.68 $223.20 ) No Bid

19 | Paper plataes, plastic coated 6"

1000/cs, solo or equal

|Annual estimated quantify: 25 cs $12.50 $312.50  [347.95 §1,198.75
20 | Cups, styrofoam, 1000/cs, dart
#8JB or equal o e ]
Annual estimated quantity: 30 cs $19.25 §577.50 |$17.70 $531.00
Delivery Date L 10 Business Days
Variatlons: ' NONE NONE

| wi you extend your prices fo local

government entities within the County YES ) YES

THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT SHALL BE FOR TWO YEARS FROM DATE OF AWARD. _

Bid Specifications sent to: Unipak Corp | Al Ciean Building Services
_{Spruce Industries Prime Vendor

Based upon the bids received, | recommend we award items 1, 2, 5, 6, 7, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 16, 17, 18, 19, fo Camden Bag and Paper

and items 3, 4, 8, 9, 15, 20 to Office Basics as the lowest responsive responsible bidders.

Sincerely,

Kimberly Larter

Purchasing




